
INTEROFFICE MEMORANDUM

TO: ELIO LONGO

FROM: NATALIE CARRIGNAN

SUBJECT: BID RESULTS FOR BID #19-018-BOE

DATE: 5/21/19

CC: BUFFY BARRY

EJL 5/24/19

Below are the bid results for bid #19-018-BOE for the purchase of HP Chromebooks. An equivalent alternative bid was submitted. After careful review and testing, I recommend awarding items 1 and 2 to Dell. They are the lowest, responsible bidder. I do not recommend awarding the other items at this time. Please contact me with any questions.

Vendor	Item 1	Item 2	Item 3	Alt 1	Alt 2	Alt 3	Alt 4	Alt 5
aka Comp Solutions	\$ 196,933.44	\$85,244.00	\$ 95,950.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
CDW-G	\$ 148,512.00	\$66,800.00	\$ 70,400.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
JKS Systems	\$ 160,605.12	\$55,972.00	\$ 94,768.00	\$ 160,605.12	\$ 160,605.12	\$ 165,283.52	\$ 68,758.00	\$ 94,768.00
Malor & Co	\$ 155,040.00	\$55,000.00	\$ 65,000.00	\$ 176,800.00	\$ 163,200.00	\$ 155,040.00	\$ 60,000.00	\$ 65,000.00
OM Office Supply	\$ 169,184.00	\$73,100.00	\$ 74,930.00	\$ 169,184.00	\$ 189,856.00	\$ 177,072.00	\$ 74,000.00	\$ 96,800.00
PCMG	\$ 140,352.00	\$63,600.00	\$ 78,902.00	No Bid	\$ 162,112.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 102,662.00
Dell	\$ 130,706.88	\$53,844.00	\$ 63,652.00	No Bid	\$ 142,843.52	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 73,242.00
Dell Bid	Dell 3100	Dell 3100 Touchscreen	Dell 3100 2-in-1		Dell 3100			Dell 3100 2-in-1