INTEROFFICE MEMORANDUM

TO: ELIO LONGO

FROM: NATALIE CARRIGNAN
SUBJECT: BID RESULTS BID #22-001-BOE
DATE: 6/24/2021

CC: MARY YOUNGLING
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Below are the bid results for bid #22-001-BOE for the renewal of the SAN maintenance. [

recommend awarding all bid items to vPrime Tech. They were the overall lowest, responsible
bidder. Please contact me with any questions.

Vendor Item #1 - 2647 | Ttem #2 - 4602 | Ttem #3 - 4772 | ltem #4 - 3881 Total
Bullet Price Group Corp No bid No bid No bid No Bid N/A
Howard Technology $5,615.00 $4,889.00 $2,480.00 $31,241.00 | $44,225.00
International Integrated Solutions $31,268.53 $4.857.28 $2,463.04 $5,577.96 | $44,166.81
vPrime Tech $29,049 40 $4,513.81 $2,289.03 $5,201.68 | $41,053.92




