

**ROCKFORD PUBLIC SCHOOLS**

**Bid: 21-43 Snow Removal**

**Due: Tuesday, June 1, 2021**

**Time: 2:00 pm (6th FL Conference Rm)**

Vendor Name	Block 1	Block 2	Block 3	Block 4	Block 5	Block 6
AA Construction Concrete	\$18,405.00	\$22,260.00	\$21,918.00	\$28,373.00	\$19,606.00	\$27,154.00
Snow Systems	No Bid	No Bid	\$41,449.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Arctic Snow and Ice	\$21,750.00	\$34,291.00	\$34,123.00	\$23,496.00	\$9,623.00	\$19,266.00
LCU Properties	\$34,311.68	\$66,064.74	\$50,636.00	\$54,482.88	\$14,355.00	\$30,180.74

Bid Opening Official: Dane Youngblood

Bid Recording Official: Casey Ramas

\_\_\_\_\_  
 \_\_\_\_\_