
5th Grade Inclement Weather Work – Day 1 

Look at all of the options in the table below. Select any three 
vertical, horizontal, or diagonal boxes in a row to complete. 

Biography Timeline 
Interview a family member 
in your home. Choose 10 

significant events in the life 
of this person. Using these 
events, create a timeline 

listing the dates and 
detailing the events. 
Include pictures and 

illustrations. 	
 

Build a snowman of an 
important person that we 

have learned about in 
social studies this year.  

Some examples include:  
Theodore Roosevelt, Jesse 
Owens, Franklin Roosevelt, 

Louis Armstrong, the 
Wright Brothers, Babe 

Ruth.  Snap a picture of 
your creation and share it 

with your teacher! 

Multiplication Poster 	
   Create a poster for a 

younger student teaching 
them how to multiply a 2-
digit number. List all the 

steps and include an 
example.  	

 

Venn Diagram 	
   Create a Venn Diagram 
or a double bubble map 
comparing multiplication 
and division. You must 

include at least 12 things. 	
 

Snow Cream Ingredients:	
1 cup milk	

1/3 cup granulated sugar	
1 teaspoon vanilla extract	

8 cups clean snow or 
shaved ice 

Use the above recipe to 
answer the following 

questions.   
How much sugar would be 
needed if the recipe was 

tripled?	

Create a Snow Day Poem 
Create a poem about 
today. It could be an 
acrostic poem. For 

example:	
 

Name 3 animals you might 
see in your neighborhood. 
Label them as a vertebrate 
or invertebrate. If they are 

a vertebrate, tell which 
vertebrate group the animal 

would belong to. 
 

Wanted Poster 
Make a WANTED poster 

for a character from a book 
you have read. Include a 
picture or drawing. You 

should also have at least 5 
character traits that would 
help to identify this person.	

 

Journal Entry	
Write a reflection about 

how you feel when you find 
out there is no school 
because of SNOW! 



5th Grade Inclement Weather Work – Day 2 

Look at all of the options in the table below. Select any three 
vertical, horizontal, or diagonal boxes in a row to complete. 

Comic Strip 
Make a comic strip with 3 
characters using different 

examples of figurative 
language. Include at least 3 

examples. 	
 

Compare/Contrast the	
lives of 2 key figures,	

important people, from any 
time period we’ve studied 
so far in 5th Grade. You 
must use at least 3 facts.	

 

Anchor Chart 	
   Create an anchor chart 

poster on your 
favorite problem 

solving strategy. Explain 
why it is your favorite. 

Include all the steps in your 
strategy and a sample 
problem. Show all your 

work.	
 

Menu Problems 	
   Using a restaurant menu, 

create 4 problems and 
solve each problem using 

your problem 
solving strategies. Create a 

problem on addition, 
subtraction, multiplication, 

and division.	
 

Snow Cream Ingredients:	
1 cup milk	
1/3 cup granulated sugar	
1 teaspoon vanilla extract	
8 cups clean snow or 
shaved ice	
 
Use the above recipe to 
answer the following 
questions.	
How much sugar would be 
needed if we cut the recipe 

in half?	

Read All About It! 
Write a newspaper 

headline and a short article 
about the weather 

conditions from last night 
and today. What are the 

predictions for tomorrow?	
 

Word	Search	Create	a	word	
search	puzzle	using	

vocabulary	from	any	time	
period	we’ve	studied	so	far	
in	5th	Grade.	This	puzzle	
must	include	at	least	10	
words.	Use	all	capital	

letters. 

Write a RAP or Song 
Write a song or a rap about 

your day off from school. 
Feature the things you did 
on your snow day. Include 

similes and metaphors.	
 

Journal Entry	
Describe your favorite 

holiday and why it is your 
favorite. 



5th Grade Inclement Weather Work – Day 3 

Look at all of the options in the table below. Select any three 
vertical, horizontal, or diagonal boxes in a row to complete. 

The Machine Ate My 
Homework 

Write a short story about a 
homework machine that 
devoured your snow day 
work. Include at least 5 

sentences using commas 
correctly.	

Draw a map of the inside of 
your house. Show at least 
5 important places to you. 

Look for math around your 
house…maybe an array 

(multiplication), shapes, or 
sharing (division). Describe 
two math situations in your 

house. 

Collage 	
Create a collage 

of landforms that can be 
found around the United 
States.  Be sure to label 

each type of landform that 
you choose.  You must 

include 5 features/
images in the collage.	

 

Snow Cream Ingredients:	
1 cup milk	

1/3 cup granulated sugar	
1 teaspoon vanilla extract	

8 cups clean snow or 
shaved ice	

 
Use the above recipe to 

answer the following 
questions. 	

What could you do if you 
could only collect 4 cups of 

snow?	

Wish You Were Here!   	
Create a post card with a 
picture or drawing on the 

front showing today’s 
setting. On the back divide 

the card in half. On one 
side of the line, write a 

letter from you to a friend 
or relative who lives far 

away. Tell them about your 
snow day. Write their 

address on the other side 
of the line.	

Write a math word problem 
about multiplying whole 

numbers or decimals and 
solve it. 

Read for 20 Minutes and 
Write a Summary 

Choose a book, magazine, 
or newspaper and read for 
20 minutes. Write a good 

summary of the information 
you read.	

 

Microorganisms (both 
helpful and harmful) can be 
found on every surface in 

your house. 	
Describe at least 2 

examples of 
microorganisms at work 

around your house.  
Then, List at least 2 

different ways that you and 
your family can protect 
yourself from harmful 

microorganisms.	


