

BOARD AGENDA REPORT

SAN ANGELO INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

DATE: April 20, 2020

SUBJECT: Approval of Bids for the Child Nutrition Dept. for the 2019-20 School Year

BACKGROUND INFORMATION REASON FOR BOARD CONSIDERATION:

Request for Proposals were received from companies pertaining to the purchase of Equipment for the Child Nutrition Department for the 2019-20 school year.

ADMINISTRATIVE CONSIDERATION/FACTS AND ANSWERS:

As per Board Policy CHC-2 (Local), it is recommended that Equipment for the 2019-20 school year be awarded to the companies listed on the attached page.

Tabulations of bids are attached for reference.

RECOMMENDED BOARD ACTION:

The Administration recommends approval of these bids as presented.

SUBMITTED BY: Michelle Helms, Child Nutrition Director

SUPERVISOR: Dr. George McFarland, Assistant Superintendent of Business & Support Services

Approved for presentation to the Board of Education:

Amount: \$193,280.96

Budgeted **Yes** **No**

Dr. Carl Dethloff

Superintendent of Schools

San Angelo Independent School District
Child Nutrition Services
Michelle Helms, Director
305 Baker, San Angelo, Texas 76903
Phone (325) 659-3615

**Equipment /Serving Lines
2019-20 School Year
RFP #20-9**

Proposals were received from three (3) companies pertaining to the purchase of Equipment for the Child Nutrition Department. Equipment will be awarded to the following companies in the total amount of \$193,280.96

Company	Address	Amount
A-Tex Restaurant Supply	San Angelo, TX	87,975.96
Mission Restaurant Supply	Ft. Worth, TX	73,405.00
Edward Don & Company	San Angelo, TX	31,900.00
	Total	\$193,280.96

San Angelo Independent School District
 Child Nutrition Services
 Michelle Helms, Director
 305 Baker, San Angelo, Texas 76903-7030
 Phone (325) 659-3615 Fax (325) 658-4353

Equipment/Serving Lines
2019-20 School Year
RFP #20-9

Item #	Qty	Item Description	A-Tex Restaurant San Angelo, TX	Douglas Food Stores Bluefield, WV	Edward Don and Company San Angelo, TX	Hohmann Commercial Ref San Angelo, TX	Mission Restaurant Supply Ft. Worth, TX
1	1	Serving Line Campus: Alta Loma	B Atlas Metal Ea 34,200.54	Responded with a NO Bid on all items	B Atlas Metal Ea 35,680.00	Responded with a NO Bid on all items	B Atlas Metal Ea 33,839.00
2	1	Serving Line Campus: Austin	B Atlas Metal Ea 33,394.56		B Atlas Metal Ea 34,900.00		B Atlas Metal Ea 33,066.00
Total Serving Lines			67,595.10		70,580.00		66,905.00
Total Rubric Score			82.50		81.00		83.50
3	1	Walk-in Freezer Campus: Central	B Nor-Lake Ea 22,348.15		B American Panel Ea 24,845.00		B Nor-Lake Ea 27,895.00
4	1	Walk-in Freezer Campus: Glenn	B Nor-Lake Ea 23,390.80		B American Panel Ea 23,987.00		B Nor-Lake Ea 29,114.00
5	1	Walk-in Cooler/Freezer Campus: Bowie	B Nor-Lake Ea 27,372.45		B American Panel Ea 33,989.00		B Nor-Lake Ea 36,917.00
Total Walk-Ins			73,111.40		82,821.00		93,926.00
Total Rubric Score			79.50		77.00		71.50
6	3	Shelving Central Glenn Bowie Total	B Cambro Ea 3,424.74 3,564.14 4,128.28 11,117.16		B Cambro Ea 11,423.00		B Cambro Ea 4,205.00 4,346.00 5,064.00 13,615.00

**Equipment/Serving Lines
2019-20 School Year
RFP #20-9**

Item #	Qty	Item Description	A-Tex Restaurant San Angelo, TX	Douglas Food Stores Bluefield, WV	Edward Don and Company San Angelo, TX	Hohmann Commercial Ref San Angelo, TX	Mission Restaurant Supply Ft. Worth, TX			
7	2	Tilt Skillets, Gas Fannin McGill Total	B Groen M BPM-15GA 16,015.00 16,015.00 32,030.00		B Groen M BPM-15GA 31,900.00		B Groen M BPM-15GA 32,326.00			
8 a	4	Milk Dispensers	B Silver King M SKMAJ1-C3 Ea 2,238.71 TI 8,954.84		B Silver King M SKMAJ1-C4 Ea 2,085.00 TI 8,340.00	B Silver King M SKMAJ2-C4 Ea 2,300.00 TI 9,200.00	B Silver King M SKMAJ3-C4 Ea 2,803.00 TI 11,212.00	B Silver King M SKMAJ1 Ea 1,899.00 TI 7,596.00	B Silver King M SKMAJ2 Ea 2,141.00 TI 8,564.00	B Silver King M SKMAJ3 Ea 2,639.00 TI 10,556.00
8 b	4	Milk Dispensers	B Silver King M SKMAJ2-C3 Ea 2,444.51 TI 9,778.04		B Silver King M SKMAJ2-C3 Ea 2,757.00 TI 11,028.00		B Silver King M SKMAJ2-C3 Ea 2,538.00 TI 10,152.00			
9	500	Bun Pans Full Size 26" L x 18" W x 1" H 12 gauge	B Vollrath M 5315 Ea 24.00 TI 12,000.00		No Bid		B Winco M ALXP-1200 Ea 13.00 TI 6,500.00			
10	20	Ingredient Bins 500 cups capacity 154 pound Flour/Sugar capacity	B Cambro M IBS27148 Ea 187.37 TI 3,747.40		B Cambro M IBS27148 Ea 247.00 TI 4,940.00		B Cambro M IBS27148 Ea 193.00 TI 3,860.00			
11	1,000	Plastic Tumbler 10 oz, Polycarbonate Blue & Green	B Cambro M HT10CW196 Ea 1.33 TI 1,330.00		No Bid		B Cambro M HT10CW196 Ea 1.37 TI 1,370.00			
Total Award			87,975.96		31,900.00		73,405.00			

Awarded
No Award

B= Brand
M= Model
Ea= Individual Unit Price