

ROCKFORD PUBLIC SCHOOLS

Bid: IFB No. 20-13 Auburn H.S. Box Culvert Project

Due: Tuesday, February 11, 2020

Time: 2:00 pm (6th FL Conference Rm)

Vendor Name	Base Bid	Alt. Bid No. 1	Unit Price No. 1/per - CU YD	Unit Price No.2/per - SQ YD	Addendums Received*	Bid Bond Received*	Required Documentation
O'Brien Civil Works	\$91,770.00	No Bid	\$40.00	\$6.00	Y	Y	Y
Sjostrom & Sons, Inc.	\$79,996.19	No Bid	\$50.00	\$15.00	Y	Y	Y
Civil Constructors, Inc.	\$173,350.00	No Bid	\$75.00	\$5.00	Y	Y	Y
Stenstrom	\$85,900.00	No Bid	\$75.00	\$3.50	Y	Y	Y
Martin & Co.	\$107,706.00	No Bid	\$56.00	\$5.50	Y	Y	Y
Alliance Contractors, Inc.	\$105,085.00	No Bid	\$65.00	\$3.50	Y	Y	Y

Bid Opening Official: Dane Youngblood

Bid Recording Official: Casey Ramas

*If Applicable