ROCKFORD PUBLIC SCHOOLS

Bid: 20-18 Erate 2020 Infrastructure

Due: Tuesday, February 18, 2020

Time: 2:00 pm (6th FL Conference Rm)

BIDDER COMPANY NAME IT SAVVY Graybar IP Comm. CDW-G
Addendums Received
Required Documentation

Switching Qty. Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost
Item 1- Cisco Catalyst 9200 48-port PoE+ Switch 289 $3,674.24 $1,061,855.36 No Bid $3,679.00 $1,063,231.00 $2,982.75 $862,014.75
Item 2 -Cisco 9200 Series Power Supply 289 $1,984.35 $573,477.15 No Bid $2,055.00 $593,895.00 $1,291.50 $373,243.50
Item 3 - Cisco DNA Essentials License 289 $565.65 $163,472.85 No Bid $580.00 $167,620.00 $459.20 $132,708.80
Item 4 -Cisco Catalyst 9200 Stack Module 289 $662.88 $191,572.32 No Bid No Bid $538.13 $155,519.57
Item 5 -Cisco Catalyst 24x1/10/25G Switch 10 $10,791.78 $107,917.80 No Bid $11,222.00 $112,220.00 $8,856.00 $88,560.00
Item 6 - Cisco DNA Advantage License 10 $3,585.86 $35,858.60 No Bid $3,688.00 $36,880.00 $2,911.00 $29,110.00
Item 7 - Cisco 9500 Series 4-port Power Supply 10 $1,295.05 $12,950.00 No Bid No Bid $861.00 $8,610.00
Total Cost $2,147,104.08 $1,973,846.00 $1,649,766.62

Uninterrupted Power Supply (UPS)

Item 1 - Eaton 9PK6K UPS 5.4kW -6000 VA 51 $3,435.00 $175,185.00 $2,734.85 $139,477.35 $3,965.00 $202,215.00 $3,638.81 $185,579.31
Total Cost Substitute item -
Grand Total $2,322,289.08 Tripp Lite $2,176,061.00 $1,835,345.93

Bid Opening Official:

Dane Youngblood

Bid Recording Official:

Casey Ramas
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