



<b>ROCKFORD PUBLIC SCHOOLS</b>							
<b>IFB No. 20-47 Interior Renovations at Barbour, Brookview, Gregory &amp; Haskell Schools</b>							
<b>Due: Thursday, April 30, 2020</b>							
<b>Time: 2:00 PM</b>							
<b>Vendor Name</b>	<b>Painting Work - Barbour Portion of Combined Bid</b>	<b>Painting Work - Brookview Portion of Combined Bid</b>	<b>Painting Work - Gregory Portion of Combined Bid</b>	<b>Painting Work - Haskell Portion of Combined Bid</b>	<b>Addendums Received</b>	<b>Bid Bond Received</b>	<b>Required Documentation</b>
Larson & Larson	\$7,553.00	\$110,320.00	\$37,226.00	\$7,747.00			
Executive Painting	\$4,290.00	\$85,385.00	\$42,970.00	\$2,250.00			
Painting 4 U	\$71,860.00	\$50,700.00	\$16,000.00	\$2,700.00			
Benchmark Flooring	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid			
Rockford Carpetland	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid			
Bid Opening Official:	Dane Youngblood						
Bid Recording Official:	Casey Ramas						



<b>ROCKFORD PUBLIC SCHOOLS</b>							
<b>IFB No. 20-24 Interior Renovations at Bloom, Carlson, Fairview &amp; Lewis Lemon Schools</b>							
<b>Due: Tuesday, February 25, 2020</b>							
<b>Time: 2:00 PM</b>							
<b>Vendor Name</b>	<b>Flooring Work - Barbour Portion of Combined Bid</b>	<b>Flooring Work - Brookview Portion of Combined Bid</b>	<b>Flooring Work - Gregory Portion of Combined Bid</b>	<b>Flooring Work - Haskell Portion of Combined Bid</b>	<b>Addendums Received</b>	<b>Bid Bond Received</b>	<b>Required Documentation</b>
Larson & Larson	\$22,488.00	\$297,125.00	\$88,962.00	\$28,200.00			
Executive Painting	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid			
Painting 4 U	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid			
Benchmark Flooring	\$24,200.00	\$289,600.00	\$85,100.00	\$30,000.00			
Rockford Carpetland	\$24,375.00	\$299,120.00	\$110,620.00	\$38,380.00			
Bid Opening Official:	Dane Youngblood						
Bid Recording Official:	Casey Ramas						