

ROCKFORD PUBLIC SCHOOLS
Bid 18-12 Snow and Ice Removal
Due: 10/12/2017
Time: 3:00 pm

Bid Opening Official:
Bid Recording Official:

Nicole Thorn
Martina Padilla

Vendor Name	AA Construction	Lawn Care by Walter	VFI Enterprises	Tovar Enterprises	
Block 1	\$18,765.00	No bid	\$17,875.00	\$16,481.00	
Block 2	\$14,948.00	No bid	No bid	\$13,041.00	
Block 3	\$13,680.00	No bid	\$11,180.00	\$12,548.00	
Block 4	\$8,278.00	\$19,650.00	\$13,540.00	\$11,981.00	
Block 5	\$9,834.00	No bid	\$14,145.00	\$11,420.00	
Block 6	\$10,587.00	No bid	\$14,355.00	\$12,014.00	
Block 7	\$9,329.00	No bid	\$7,575.00	\$10,432.00	
Block 8	\$14,310.00	\$16,400.00	No bid		
Block 9	\$9,475.00	No bid	No bid	\$11,602.00	
Block 10	\$7,365.00	\$7,170.00	No bid	\$4,742.00	
Block 11	\$7,229.00	No bid	No bid	\$7,479.00	
Block 12	\$7,900.00	No bid	\$6,685.00	\$8,113.00	
Block 13	\$8,819.00	No bid	No bid	\$7,781.00	
Block 14	\$5,804.00	No bid	\$4,490.00	\$3,957.00	
Block 15	\$11,326.00	No bid	\$7,830.00	\$8,753.00	
Block 16	\$6,454.00	No bid	\$5,420.00	\$5,639.00	
Block 17	\$8,658.00	No bid	\$7,735.00	\$6,760.00	
Block 18	\$9,121.00	No bid	\$5,175.00	\$7,950.00	
Block 19	\$5,295.00	No bid	\$10,825.00	\$7,320.00	
	\$187,177.00				
Addendum Received	Yes	Yes	Yes	Not recognized	
Bid Bond Received	Yes	Yes	No	Yes	
Required Documentation	Yes			Yes	