

ROCKFORD PUBLIC SCHOOLS
BID 16-11 General Grounds and Lawn Mowing Services
Date:Thursday, September 10, 2015
Time: 10:30 AM

	ADV Enterprise	LCU Properties	Lawn Care By Walter	GRAND TOTAL AWARD		
Block 1	\$29,302.00	\$35,646.00	no bid	\$29,302.00		
Block 2	\$29,328.00	\$44,226.00	no bid	\$29,328.00		
Block 4	\$32,032.00	\$45,786.00	\$84,500.00	\$32,032.00		
Block 5	\$20,020.00	\$23,374.00	no bid	\$20,020.00		
Block 6	\$17,290.00	\$26,364.00	no bid	\$17,290.00		
Block 7	\$12,870.00	\$27,378.00	no bid	\$12,870.00		
Block 8	\$17,524.00	\$24,362.00	no bid	\$17,524.00		
Block 9	\$8,138.00	\$18,694.00	no bid	\$8,138.00		
Block 10	\$9,490.00	\$24,674.00	no bid	\$9,490.00		
Block 11	\$7,020.00	\$15,132.00	no bid	\$7,020.00		
Block 12	\$20,306.00	\$16,848.00	no bid	\$16,848.00		
Block 13	\$10,010.00	\$13,000.00	no bid	\$10,010.00		
Block 15	\$11,310.00	\$18,590.00	no bid	\$11,310.00		
Block 17	\$10,920.00	\$18,278.00	no bid	\$10,920.00		
Block 18	\$19,760.00	\$11,752.00	no bid	\$11,752.00		
TOTAL AWARDED	\$215,254.00	\$28,600.00		\$243,854.00		