

ROCKFORD PUBLIC SCHOOLS

Bid 16-55 Musical Instruments

Due: Monday, May 16, 2016

Time: 11:00 am

<u>Item No.</u>	<u>Qty</u>	<u>UOM</u>	<u>Product Requested</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>SHAR PRODUCTS COMPANY</u>			<u>MUSIC & ARTS CENTERS</u>					
					<u>Unit Cost</u>	<u>Extended Cost</u>	<u>Product Substitutes</u>	<u>Unit Cost</u>	<u>Extended Cost</u>	<u>Unit Cost</u>	<u>Extended Cost</u>	<u>Product Substitutes</u>	<u>Unit Cost</u>
1	1	Ea.	Tama by Kanstul KBT Series	Marching Bb Baritone	No bid	No bid		\$1,614.60	\$1,614.60	\$1,485.00	\$1,485.00	Jupiter Quantum JBR1100M	\$1,250.00
2	8	Box/6	Manhasset	Music Stands	No bid	No bid		\$162.80	\$1,302.40				No bid
3	10	Ea.	Yamaha	Yamaha Headphone w/Mic	No bid	No bid		\$44.00	\$440.00				No bid
4	1	Ea.	Yamaha YMP 204MS	Marching Mellophone	No bid	No bid		\$1,240.60	\$1,240.60	\$1,180.00	\$1,180.00	Jupiter Quantum JMP1100MS	\$1,298.00
5	31	Ea.	Jupiter 700 Series	Flute	No bid	No bid		\$241.80	\$7,495.80	\$225.00	\$6,975.00	Giardinelli GFL300	\$195.00
6	29	Ea.	Jupiter 700 Series	Clarinets	No bid	No bid		\$275.65	\$7,993.85	\$237.00	\$6,873.00	Giardinelli GCL300	\$395.00
7	8	Ea.	Jupiter 700 Series	Alto Sax	No bid	No bid		\$652.80	\$5,222.40	\$516.00	\$4,125.00	Giardinelli GAS300	\$989.00
8	7	Ea.	Jupiter 700 Series	Tenor Sax	No bid	No bid		\$847.30	\$5,931.10	\$600.00	\$4,200.00	Giardinelli GTS300	\$1,475.00
9	15	Ea.	Jupiter 700 Series	Trumpet	No bid	No bid		\$331.20	\$4,968.00	\$288.00	\$4,320.00	Giardinelli GTR300	\$725.00
10	4	Ea.	Jupiter 952RL	Double French Horn	No bid	No bid		\$1,992.65	\$7,970.60	\$1,363.50	\$5,454.00	Eastman EFH463	\$1,295.00
11	12	Ea.	Jupiter JEP700 Series	Euphonium	No bid	No bid		\$1,005.10	\$12,061.20	\$825.00	\$9,900.00	Eastman EEP463	\$749.00
12	6	Ea.	Jupiter	Trombone	No bid	No bid		\$330.75	\$1,984.50	\$300.00	\$1,800.00	Giardinelli GTB300	\$495.00
13	10	Ea.	Jupiter 378 Series 3-valve convertible-silver	3 Valve ¾ Convertible BBb Tuba	No bid	No bid		\$2,610.40	\$26,104.00	\$2,478.60	\$24,786.00	Eastman EBB2315	No bid
14	10	Ea.	Giardinelli	Clarinet Mouthpiece	No bid	No bid		\$15.00	\$150.00				No bid

ROCKFORD PUBLIC SCHOOLS

Bid 16-55 Musical Instruments

Due: Monday, May 16, 2016

Time: 11:00 am

					SHAR PRODUCTS COMPANY			MUSIC & ARTS CENTERS					
15	3	Ea.	Bach	Trumpet Mouthpiece	No bid	No bid		\$42.00	\$126.00	\$21.60	\$64.80	Blessing MPCXXTR	No bid
16	14	Ea.	Rovner	Clarinet ligature	No bid	No bid		\$17.30	\$242.20				No bid
17	7	Ea.	Giardinelli	Alto Sax ligature	No bid	No bid		\$3.60	\$25.20				No bid
18	6	Ea.	Giardinelli	Tenor Sax ligature	No bid	No bid		\$3.60	\$21.60				No bid
19	2	Ea.	Generic	Alto Sax Case Only	No bid	No bid		\$65.17	\$130.34				No bid
20	5	Ea.	Generic	Trumpet Case Only	No bid	No bid		\$47.05	\$235.25				No bid
21	2	Ea.	Generic	Flute Case Only	No bid	No bid		\$22.85	\$45.70				No bid
22	1	Ea.	Generic	French Horn Case Only	No bid	No bid		\$102.40	\$102.40				No bid
23	1	Ea.	Generic	Mellophone Case Only	No bid	No bid		No bid	No bid				No bid
24	1	Ea.	Generic	Piccolo Case Only	No bid	No bid		\$16.17	\$16.17				No bid
25	2	Ea.	Generic	Clarinet Case	No bid	No bid		\$26.90	\$53.80				No bid
26	1	Ea.	LP M245 Matador	Strap-Lock Bongo Stand Standard	No bid	No bid		\$91.35	\$91.35				No bid
27	1	Ea.	Pearl Export Standard	5-Piece Drum Set w/hardware electric blue sparkle	No bid	No bid		\$440.00	\$440.00				No bid
28	1	Pair	Zildjian ZBT	Hi-hat Cymbal Pair 14 in.	No bid	No bid		\$84.80	\$84.80				No bid
29	1	Pair	Zildjian A Series	Medium-Thin Crash Cymbal 16 in.	No bid	No bid		\$145.00	\$145.00				No bid
30	1	Pair	Zildjian Z Series	Custom Dark Ride Cymbal 20 in.	No bid	No bid		\$254.00	\$254.00				No bid
31	1	Ea.	Ludwig LE-102	Temple Block Set Standard	No bid	No bid		\$306.00	\$306.00				No bid
32	1	Ea.	Ludwig LE1351	Stand for LE-102	No bid	No bid		\$61.40	\$61.40				No bid
33	2	Ea.	Toca Synergy	Conga Set w/stand and bongos red	No bid	No bid		\$250.00	\$500.00				No bid
34	1	Ea.	Toca	Sleigh Bells on Handle Standard	No bid	No bid		\$23.50	\$23.50				No bid
35	1	Ea.	LP Pro	Maracas Standard	No bid	No bid		\$15.60	\$15.60				No bid
36	1	Ea.	Ludwig LE-2368	Claves Medium	No bid	No bid		\$9.24	\$9.24				No bid
37	1	Ea.	LP LP243	Super Guiro Standard	No bid	No bid		\$29.20	\$29.20				No bid

ROCKFORD PUBLIC SCHOOLS

Bid 16-55 Musical Instruments

Due: Monday, May 16, 2016

Time: 11:00 am

					SHAR PRODUCTS COMPANY			MUSIC & ARTS CENTERS					
38	1	Ea.	Meinl Professional	Wood Block Natural Large	No bid	No bid		\$16.10	\$16.10				No bid
39	1	Ea.	LP LP206A	Bongo Cowbell Standard	No bid	No bid		\$31.95	\$31.95				No bid
40	1	Ea.	LP LP268 Pro	Cowbell Beater Standard	No bid	No bid		\$8.55	\$8.55				No bid
41	1	Ea.	Ludwig	Triangle 8 in.	No bid	No bid		\$21.95	\$21.95				No bid
42	1	Ea.	LP 24	Bar Wind Chimes Standard	No bid	No bid		\$54.45	\$54.45				No bid
43	1	Ea.	Pearl	Trap Table 24" x 18" Standard	No bid	No bid		\$96.00	\$96.00				No bid
44	12	Pack	EP2	Intermediate Education Pack; stick bag, bolero drum sticks, MS mallets, M6 bell mallets, T3 timpanin mallets	No bid	No bid		\$62.60	\$751.20				No bid
45	2	Pair	Vic Firth TG01	General Bass Drum Mallets TG04 Roller Pair	No bid	No bid		\$31.73	\$63.46				No bid
46	1	Ea.	YG-250DS70	Standard Bells	No bid	No bid		\$582.00	\$582.00	\$452.50	\$452.50	Majestic B31255 bells & MFS25 folding stand	No bid
47	1	Ea.	Wenger 147G002.100	Percussion Workstation	No bid	No bid		No bid	No bid				No bid
48	6	Ea.	Sound Percussion labs	Bell Kit w/rolling cart	No bid	No bid		\$159.00	\$954.00				No bid
49	13	Ea.	Strobel MC-80	¾ Cello outfit	\$638.00	\$8,294.00	Franz Hoffman Amadeus PC1005134	\$416.00	\$5,408.00				No bid
50	2	Ea.	Allora	Soprano Saxophone	No bid	No bid		\$320.00	\$640.00				\$319.00
51	6	Ea.	Innovative Percussion	Snare Drum Sticks	No bid	No bid		\$6.40	\$38.40				No bid

ROCKFORD PUBLIC SCHOOLS

Bid 16-55 Musical Instruments

Due: Monday, May 16, 2016

Time: 11:00 am

					SHAR PRODUCTS COMPANY			MUSIC & ARTS CENTERS						
52	6	Ea.	Vic Firth	Timpani Mallets	No bid	No bid		\$21.20	\$127.20					No bid
53	6	Ea.	Innovative Percussion	Xylo Mallets	No bid	No bid		\$9.20	\$55.20					No bid
54	6	Ea.	Galaxy (Humes and Burg)	Stick Bag	No bid	No bid		\$8.25	\$49.50					No bid
55	2	Ea.	Jupiter student series	Bass Clarinet	No bid	No bid		\$1,247.50	\$2,495.00	\$1,093.50	\$2,187.00	Giardelli GBC301	\$1,249.00	
56	3	Ea.	Yamaha	Snare Stands	No bid	No bid		\$41.80	\$125.40					No bid
57	7	Ea.	Evans	Practice Pads	No bid	No bid		\$12.80	\$89.60					No bid
58	1	Ea.	Pearl	Concert Toms (10/12")	No bid	No bid		\$322.14	\$322.14					No bid
59	1	Ea.	Pearl	Concert Toms (13/14")	No bid	No bid		\$346.13	\$346.13					No bid
60	1	Ea.	Royal Graftonite	Baritone Saxophone Mouthpiece	No bid	No bid		\$14.80	\$14.80					No bid
61	1	Ea.	Jupiter 700 Series	Eb Bari Saxophone	No bid	No bid		\$2,681.00	\$2,681.00	\$2,288.00	\$2,288.00	Giardelli GBS300	\$2,795.00	
62	1	Ea.	Strobel	¾ size String Bass	\$1,148.00	\$1,148.00	Franz Hoffman Amadeus PB1005134	\$928.00	\$928.00					\$1,100.00

TOTAL BID

\$8,974.33

\$26,310.30

Bid Opening Official

Stacie Scott

Total

\$35,284.63

ROCKFORD PUBLIC SCHOOLS

Bid 16-55 Musical Instruments

Due: Monday, May 16, 2016

Time: 11:00 am

<u>Item No.</u>	<u>Qty</u>	<u>UOM</u>	<u>Product Requested</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>K&S MUSIC</u>		<u>Interstate Music</u>			<u>Washington Music Center</u>		
					<u>Extended Cost</u>	<u>Product Substitutes</u>	<u>Unit Cost</u>	<u>Extended Cost</u>	<u>Product Substitutes</u>	<u>Unit Cost</u>	<u>Extended Cost</u>	<u>Product Substitutes</u>
1	1	Ea.	Tama by Kanstul KBT Series	Marching Bb Baritone	\$1,250.00	RS Berkely MAR678 - pg 7	\$1,527.90	\$1,527.90		\$1,975.00	\$1,975.00	
2	8	Box/6	Manhasset	Music Stands	No bid		\$178.90	\$1,431.20		\$165.65	\$1,325.00	
3	10	Ea.	Yamaha	Yamaha Headphone w/Mic	No bid		\$42.90	\$429.00		\$55.00	\$550.00	
4	1	Ea.	Yamaha YMP 204MS	Marching Mellophone	\$1,298.00	RS Berkely MAR679 - pg 7	\$1,238.90	\$1,238.90		\$1,236.00	\$1,236.00	
5	31	Ea.	Jupiter 700 Series	Flute	\$6,045.00	Voltaire VOL702 - pg 10	\$240.74	\$7,462.94		\$242.00	\$7,502.00	
6	29	Ea.	Jupiter 700 Series	Clarinets	\$11,455.00	LaBeau BEAU408 - pg 11	\$520.74	\$15,101.46		\$276.00	\$8,004.00	
7	8	Ea.	Jupiter 700 Series	Alto Sax	\$7,912.00	RS Berkely ALS502 - pg 16	\$677.74	\$5,421.92		\$653.00	\$5,224.00	
8	7	Ea.	Jupiter 700 Series	Tenor Sax	\$10,325.00	RS Berkely TSS533 - pg 16	\$887.74	\$6,214.18		\$846.00	\$5,922.00	
9	15	Ea.	Jupiter 700 Series	Trumpet	\$10,875.00	RS Berkely TP608 - pg 2	\$388.64	\$5,829.60		\$332.00	\$4,980.00	
10	4	Ea.	Jupiter 952RL	Double French Horn	\$5,180.00	RS Berkely FR802 - pg 5	\$1,987.90	\$7,951.60	Discont. Replaced JHR110	\$1,999.00	\$7,996.00	
11	12	Ea.	Jupiter JEP700 Series	Euphonium	\$8,988.00	RS Berkely BAR903 - pg 6	\$1,283.90	\$15,406.80		\$1,016.00	\$12,192.00	
12	6	Ea.	Jupiter	Trombone	\$2,970.00	RS Berkely TB701 - pg 4	\$371.74	\$2,230.44		\$332.00	\$1,992.00	
13	10	Ea.	Jupiter 378 Series 3-valve convertible-silver	3 Valve ¾ Convertible BBb Tuba	No bid		\$1,948.90	\$19,489.00		\$3,158.00	\$31,580.00	
14	10	Ea.	Giardinelli	Clarinet Mouthpiece	No bid		\$8.94	\$89.40	Discont. Sub - US Band	\$10.10	\$101.00	

ROCKFORD PUBLIC SCHOOLS

Bid 16-55 Musical Instruments

Due: Monday, May 16, 2016

Time: 11:00 am

					<u>K&S MUSIC</u>	<u>Interstate Music</u>			<u>Washington Music Center</u>			
15	3	Ea.	Bach	Trumpet Mouthpiece	No bid		\$37.94	\$113.82		\$34.70	\$104.10	
16	14	Ea.	Rovner	Clarinet ligature	No bid		\$14.94	\$209.16		\$14.85	\$207.90	
17	7	Ea.	Giardinelli	Alto Sax ligature	No bid		\$2.94	\$20.58	Grover	\$3.50	\$24.50	
18	6	Ea.	Giardinelli	Tenor Sax ligature	No bid		\$3.44	\$20.64	Grover	\$3.85	\$23.10	
19	2	Ea.	Generic	Alto Sax Case Only	No bid		\$43.94	\$87.88		\$80.00	\$160.00	
20	5	Ea.	Generic	Trumpet Case Only	No bid		\$37.94	\$189.70		\$75.00	\$375.00	
21	2	Ea.	Generic	Flute Case Only	No bid		\$19.44	\$38.88		\$50.00	\$100.00	
22	1	Ea.	Generic	French Horn Case Only	No bid		\$84.90	\$84.90		\$140.00	\$140.00	
23	1	Ea.	Generic	Mellophone Case Only	No bid		\$148.90	\$148.90		No bid	No bid	
24	1	Ea.	Generic	Piccolo Case Only	No bid		\$16.74	\$16.74		No bid	No bid	
25	2	Ea.	Generic	Clarinet Case	No bid		\$29.74	\$59.48		\$50.00	\$100.00	
26	1	Ea.	LP M245 Matador	Strap-Lock Bongo Stand Standard	No bid		\$89.90	\$89.90		\$125.00	\$125.00	
27	1	Ea.	Pearl Export Standard	5-Piece Drum Set w/hardware electric blue sparkle	No bid		\$557.90	\$557.90		\$575.00	\$575.00	
28	1	Pair	Zildjian ZBT	Hi-hat Cymbal Pair 14 in.	No bid		\$81.90	\$81.90		\$90.00	\$90.00	
29	1	Pair	Zildjian A Series	Medium-Thin Crash Cymbal 16 in.	No bid		\$153.90	\$153.90		\$145.00	\$290.00	Unit cost is for 1
30	1	Pair	Zildjian Z Series	Custom Dark Ride Cymbal 20 in.	No bid		\$75.90	\$75.90		\$255.00	\$510.00	Unit cost is for 1
31	1	Ea.	Ludwig LE-102	Temple Block Set Standard	No bid		\$261.90	\$261.90		\$285.00	\$285.00	
32	1	Ea.	Ludwig LE1351	Stand for LE-102	No bid		\$51.94	\$51.94		\$50.00	\$50.00	
33	2	Ea.	Toca Synergy	Conga Set w/stand and bongos red	No bid		\$287.90	\$575.80		\$275.00	\$550.00	
34	1	Ea.	Toca	Sleigh Bells on Handle Standard	No bid		\$20.94	\$20.94		\$35.00	\$35.00	
35	1	Ea.	LP Pro	Maracas Standard	No bid		\$17.94	\$17.94		\$24.00	\$24.00	
36	1	Ea.	Ludwig LE-2368	Claves Medium	No bid		\$9.94	\$9.94		\$7.80	\$7.80	
37	1	Ea.	LP LP243	Super Guiro Standard	No bid		\$33.74	\$33.74		\$40.00	\$40.00	

ROCKFORD PUBLIC SCHOOLS

Bid 16-55 Musical Instruments

Due: Monday, May 16, 2016

Time: 11:00 am

					<u>K&S MUSIC</u>		<u>Interstate Music</u>			<u>Washington Music Center</u>		
38	1	Ea.	Meinl Professional	Wood Block Natural Large	No bid		\$12.74	\$12.74		\$21.00	\$21.00	
39	1	Ea.	LP LP206A	Bongo Cowbell Standard	No bid		\$31.24	\$31.24		\$45.00	\$45.00	
40	1	Ea.	LP LP268 Pro	Cowbell Beater Standard	No bid		\$8.94	\$8.94		\$15.00	\$15.00	
41	1	Ea.	Ludwig	Triangle 8 in.	No bid		\$17.44	\$17.44		\$18.40	\$18.40	
42	1	Ea.	LP 24	Bar Wind Chimes Standard	No bid		\$58.94	\$58.94		No bid	No bid	
43	1	Ea.	Pearl	Trap Table 24" x 18" Standard	No bid		\$104.90	\$104.90		\$95.00	\$95.00	
44	12	Pack	EP2	Intermediate Education Pack; stick bag, bolero drum sticks, MS mallets, M6 bell mallets, T3 timpanin mallets	No bid		\$59.44	\$713.28		\$75.00	\$900.00	
45	2	Pair	Vic Firth TG01	General Bass Drum Mallets TG04 Roller Pair	No bid		\$59.94	\$119.88		\$42.30	\$84.60	
46	1	Ea.	YG-250DS70	Standard Bells	No bid		\$574.90	\$574.90		\$575.00	\$575.00	
47	1	Ea.	Wenger 147G002.100	Percussion Workstation	No bid		No bid	No bid		\$2,606.00	\$2,606.00	
48	6	Ea.	Sound Percussion labs	Bell Kit w/rolling cart	No bid		\$169.90	\$1,019.40	Pearl	\$175.00	\$1,050.00	
49	13	Ea.	Strobel MC-80	¾ Cello outfit	No bid		\$497.90	\$6,472.70	Knilling	No bid	No bid	
50	2	Ea.	Allora	Soprano Saxophone	\$638.00	RS Berkeley BC310 pg. 12	\$398.90	\$797.80	Ravel	No bid	No bid	
51	6	Ea.	Innovative Percussion	Snare Drum Sticks	No bid		\$8.44	\$50.64		\$10.00	\$60.00	

ROCKFORD PUBLIC SCHOOLS

Bid 16-55 Musical Instruments

Due: Monday, May 16, 2016

Time: 11:00 am

					<u>K&S MUSIC</u>		<u>Interstate Music</u>			<u>Washington Music Center</u>		
52	6	Ea.	Vic Firth	Timpani Mallets	No bid		\$20.94	\$125.64		\$27.00	\$162.00	
53	6	Ea.	Innovative Percussion	Xylo Mallets	No bid		\$24.74	\$1,488.44		\$32.00	\$192.00	
54	6	Ea.	Galaxy (Humes and Burg)	Stick Bag	No bid		\$9.74	\$58.44		\$15.00	\$90.00	
55	2	Ea.	Jupiter student series	Bass Clarinet	\$2,498.00	RS Berkeley BC310 pg. 12	\$1,247.90	\$2,495.80		\$1,255.00	\$2,510.00	
56	3	Ea.	Yamaha	Snare Stands	No bid		\$44.94	\$134.82		\$45.00	\$135.00	
57	7	Ea.	Evans	Practice Pads	No bid		\$15.44	\$108.08		\$22.00	\$154.00	
58	1	Ea.	Pearl	Concert Toms (10/12")	No bid		\$324.90	\$324.90		\$320.00	\$320.00	
59	1	Ea.	Pearl	Concert Toms (13/14")	No bid		\$348.90	\$348.90		\$345.00	\$345.00	
60	1	Ea.	Royal Graftonite	Baritone Saxophone Mouthpiece	No bid		\$16.94	\$16.94		\$14.60	\$14.60	
61	1	Ea.	Jupiter 700 Series	Eb Bari Saxophone	\$2,795.00	RS Berkeley BS509 pg. 16	\$2,655.90	\$2,655.90	Discont. - new model	\$2,672.00	\$2,672.00	
62	1	Ea.	Strobel	¾ size String Bass	\$1,100.00	Meisel 8700X	\$1,193.90	\$1,193.90	Knilling	No bid	No bid	

TOTAL BID

\$22,101.00

\$22,029.76

\$4,882.30

Bid Opening Official

Stacie Scott

ROCKFORD PUBLIC SCHOOLS

Bid 16-55 Musical Instruments

Due: Monday, May 16, 2016

Time: 11:00 am

					<u>Universal Melody Services</u>		
<u>Item No.</u>	<u>Qty</u>	<u>UOM</u>	<u>Product Requested</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Unit Cost</u>	<u>Extended Cost</u>	<u>Product Substitutes</u>
1	1	Ea.	Tama by Kanstul KBT Series	Marching Bb Baritone	No bid	No bid	
2	8	Box/6	Manhasset	Music Stands	\$32.00	\$256.00	
3	10	Ea.	Yamaha	Yamaha Headphone w/Mic	No bid	No bid	
4	1	Ea.	Yamaha YMP 204MS	Marching Mellophone	No bid	No bid	
5	31	Ea.	Jupiter 700 Series	Flute	No bid	No bid	
6	29	Ea.	Jupiter 700 Series	Clarinets	No bid	No bid	
7	8	Ea.	Jupiter 700 Series	Alto Sax	No bid	No bid	
8	7	Ea.	Jupiter 700 Series	Tenor Sax	No bid	No bid	
9	15	Ea.	Jupiter 700 Series	Trumpet	No bid	No bid	
10	4	Ea.	Jupiter 952RL	Double French Horn	No bid	No bid	
11	12	Ea.	Jupiter JEP700 Series	Euphonium	No bid	No bid	
12	6	Ea.	Jupiter	Trombone	No bid	No bid	
13	10	Ea.	Jupiter 378 Series 3-valve convertible-silver	3 Valve ¾ Convertible BBb Tuba	No bid	No bid	
14	10	Ea.	Giardinelli	Clarinet Mouthpiece	No bid	No bid	

ROCKFORD PUBLIC SCHOOLS

Bid 16-55 Musical Instruments

Due: Monday, May 16, 2016

Time: 11:00 am

					Universal Melody Services		
15	3	Ea.	Bach	Trumpet Mouthpiece	\$43.40	\$130.20	
16	14	Ea.	Rovner	Clarinet ligature	No bid	No bid	
17	7	Ea.	Giardinelli	Alto Sax ligature	No bid	No bid	
18	6	Ea.	Giardinelli	Tenor Sax ligature	No bid	No bid	
19	2	Ea.	Generic	Alto Sax Case Only	\$74.00	\$148.00	
20	5	Ea.	Generic	Trumpet Case Only	\$74.00	\$370.00	
21	2	Ea.	Generic	Flute Case Only	\$44.00	\$88.00	
22	1	Ea.	Generic	French Horn Case Only	\$156.00	\$156.00	
23	1	Ea.	Generic	Mellophone Case Only	No bid	No bid	
24	1	Ea.	Generic	Piccolo Case Only	\$27.00	\$27.00	
25	2	Ea.	Generic	Clarinet Case	\$52.00	\$104.00	
26	1	Ea.	LP M245 Matador	Strap-Lock Bongo Stand Standard	\$112.00	\$112.00	
27	1	Ea.	Pearl Export Standard	5-Piece Drum Set w/hardware electric blue sparkle	No bid	No bid	
28	1	Pair	Zildjian ZBT	Hi-hat Cymbal Pair 14 in.	No bid	No bid	
29	1	Pair	Zildjian A Series	Medium-Thin Crash Cymbal 16 in.	No bid	No bid	
30	1	Pair	Zildjian Z Series	Custom Dark Ride Cymbal 20 in.	No bid	No bid	
31	1	Ea.	Ludwig LE-102	Temple Block Set Standard	No bid	No bid	
32	1	Ea.	Ludwig LE1351	Stand for LE-102	No bid	No bid	
33	2	Ea.	Toca Synergy	Conga Set w/stand and bongos red	No bid	No bid	
34	1	Ea.	Toca	Sleigh Bells on Handle Standard	No bid	No bid	
35	1	Ea.	LP Pro	Maracas Standard	No bid	No bid	
36	1	Ea.	Ludwig LE-2368	Claves Medium	No bid	No bid	
37	1	Ea.	LP LP243	Super Guiro Standard	\$38.30	\$38.30	

ROCKFORD PUBLIC SCHOOLS

Bid 16-55 Musical Instruments

Due: Monday, May 16, 2016

Time: 11:00 am

					Universal Melody Services		
38	1	Ea.	Meinl Professional	Wood Block Natural Large	No bid	No bid	
39	1	Ea.	LP LP206A	Bongo Cowbell Standard	\$37.41	\$37.41	
40	1	Ea.	LP LP268 Pro	Cowbell Beater Standard	\$9.51	\$9.51	
41	1	Ea.	Ludwig	Triangle 8 in.	No bid	No bid	
42	1	Ea.	LP 24	Bar Wind Chimes Standard	No bid	No bid	
43	1	Ea.	Pearl	Trap Table 24" x 18" Standard	\$112.00	\$112.00	
44	12	Pack	EP2	Intermediate Education Pack; stick bag, bolero drum sticks, MS mallets, M6 bell mallets, T3 timpanin mallets	\$70.72	\$141.44	
45	2	Pair	Vic Firth TG01	General Bass Drum Mallets TG04 Roller Pair	No bid	No bid	
46	1	Ea.	YG-250DS70	Standard Bells	No bid	No bid	
47	1	Ea.	Wenger 147G002.100	Percussion Workstation	No bid	No bid	
48	6	Ea.	Sound Percussion labs	Bell Kit w/rolling cart	No bid	No bid	
49	13	Ea.	Strobel MC-80	¾ Cello outfit	No bid	No bid	
50	2	Ea.	Allora	Soprano Saxophone	No bid	No bid	
51	6	Ea.	Innovative Percussion	Snare Drum Sticks	No bid	No bid	

ROCKFORD PUBLIC SCHOOLS

Bid 16-55 Musical Instruments

Due: Monday, May 16, 2016

Time: 11:00 am

					Universal Melody Services		
52	6	Ea.	Vic Firth	Timpani Mallets	\$23.67	\$142.02	
53	6	Ea.	Innovative Percussion	Xylo Mallets	No bid	No bid	
54	6	Ea.	Galaxy (Humes and Burg)	Stick Bag	No bid	No bid	
55	2	Ea.	Jupiter student series	Bass Clarinet	No bid	No bid	
56	3	Ea.	Yamaha	Snare Stands	No bid	No bid	
57	7	Ea.	Evans	Practice Pads	No bid	No bid	
58	1	Ea.	Pearl	Concert Toms (10/12")	\$383.00	\$383.00	
59	1	Ea.	Pearl	Concert Toms (13/14")	\$407.00	\$407.00	
60	1	Ea.	Royal Graftonite	Baritone Saxophone Mouthpiece	No bid	No bid	
61	1	Ea.	Jupiter 700 Series	Eb Bari Saxophone	No bid	No bid	
62	1	Ea.	Strobel	¾ size String Bass	No bid	No bid	

TOTAL BID

\$256.00

\$84,553.69

Bid Opening Official

Stacie Scott