ROCKFORD PUBLIC SCHOOLS
Bid 16-39 West Middle School HVAC and Electrical Replacement
Due: Tuesday, April 5, 2016

Bid Opening Official

Bid Recording Official

Tamara Pugh

Martina Padilla

Time: 2:00 pm

Total Bids & Total Bids &

Alternates Total with accepted Alternates Total with accepted M&E Addendums Required
Vendor Name Base Bid M Alternate M1 Alternate M2 Alternate M3 Submitted for M alternates M Base Bid E Alternate E2 Alternate E3 Submitted for E alternates E Combined Bid | Bid Bond ived D i
Mechanical Inc $994,900.00 $26,700.00 $190,000.00 $5,600.00 $1,217,200.00 $1,211,600.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Yes Yes Yes
Rockford Structures $1,304,200.00 $48,800.00 $206,900.00 | $10,100.00 $1,570,000.00 $1,559,900.00 $590,800.00 ($5,000.00) $26,000.00 $611,800.00 $616,800.00 1,829,000 Yes Yes Yes
Kelso-Burnett No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $624,585.00 $4,996.00 $29,850.00 $659,431.00 $654,435.00 No Bid Yes Yes Yes
Commercial Mechanical Inc $1,192,000.00 $69,000.00 $195,000.00 | $11,100.00 $1,467,100.00 $1,456,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Yes Yes Yes
Special Power No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $847,907.00 -$6,500.00 $78,508.00 $919,915.00 $926,415.00 No Bid Yes Yes Yes




