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Sixth Form 
In recent years, the College has invested significantly in 
enhancing the Sixth Form experience: the Sixth Form Centre, 
Sixth Form Study Hall and the Careers Department have been 
united in the heart of the original building to striking effect.
All the traditional A Level subjects are offered and the most 
able students will go on to achieve top grades in three, four 
or, just occasionally, five A Levels. At the same time, we offer 
a range of vocational BTEC Subjects, including Business, 
Hospitality and Sport, ensuring all needs and abilities are 
catered for.

The average class size in Year 13 is 11 students. This enables 
teachers to know each student’s needs and to tailor their 
teaching and support accordingly. Support extends outside 
normal lessons, with teachers always willing to provide extra 
tuition and help when needed. The quality of A Level and 
BTEC teaching at Campbell College is excellent. 

Pathways
At Campbell we are focused on the overall journey of each 
individual, from the moment they enter the College to beyond 
their departure. Our goal is to ensure each student maximises 
his opportunities and makes the right choices for his future.
In 2019, 92% of our Sixth Form cohort proceeded to tertiary 
education, with 36% attaining a place in a Russell Group 
Institution. Our students progress into a diverse array 
of careers thanks to a Careers Advisory Service that is 
exceptional. We have also forged a partnership with Queen’s 
University Belfast to create a bespoke Pathway Scholarship 
exclusively for international students attending the College.   

Discover more:  
campbellcollege.co.uk




