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   TEXAS FRAMEWORK: ADVOCACY
Advocacy: The Board promotes the vision

Does Not 
Meet Focus

0 Preparing To 
Focus

1 Approaches 
Focus

3 Meets               
Focus

9 Masters 
Focus

10

The Board does not meet 
focus if any of the following 
conditions are true: 

The Board is preparing to 
focus if all of the following 
conditions are true: 

And...

Board Members have 
hosted a community 
meeting to discuss 
progress toward student 
outcome goals at each 
feeder pattern with low 
performing campuses 
during the previous 
12 month period. This 
is considered an LSG-
related meeting.

The Board has provided 
time during regularly 
scheduled Board-
authorized public 
meetings to recognize 
the accomplishments of 
its students and staff 
regarding progress on 
student outcome goals.

And...

The Board has hosted 
and the Board Members 
have led or co-led at 
least one training on 
Lone Star Governance for 
its community during the 
previous 6 month period.
This is considered an LSG 
training.

The Board has displayed 
and keeps updated the 
status and targets of all 
student outcome goals, 
and GPMs permanently 
and publicly in the room 
in which the Board 
most frequently holds 
regularly scheduled 
Board meetings.

And...

Board Members included 
students in at least 
one of the Lone Star 
Governance trainings 
during the previous 12 
month period.

Prior to being seated, all 
newly selected Board 
Members receive an 
orientation on Lone Star 
Governance from fellow 
Board Members on their 
Board or from a certified 
Lone Star Governance 
Coach.

The Board has not 
arranged for any Board 
Member-led community 
engagement activities 
during the previous 12 
month period beyond 
public comments during 
regularly scheduled 
Board meetings and/
or statutorily required 
hearings.

The Board has not 
publicly communicated 
the Board-adopted 
student outcome goals.

The Board has a two-way 
communication system 
in place where Board 
Members, at least once 
per year, listen for and 
discuss the vision and 
values of their students.

The Board has a two-way 
communication system 
in place where Board 
Members, at least once 
per year, listen for and 
discuss the vision and 
values of their families, 
staff, and community 
members.




