

**MISCELLANEOUS CAMERAS  
 BID NO. 19-031**

Description	Qty.	Adorama	Alegna, Inc.	Aves Audio Visual Systems	B & H Photo	Full Compass	Nvidia/Digital Video Midwest	Tri State Camera	W.B. Hunt Co., Inc.	Wolfe's Camera
Nikon D810-Camera Body Only	1 ea.	No Bid	\$2,145.91	No Bid	\$1,996.95	\$1,996.95	\$1,990.00	<b>\$1,799.00</b>	\$1,950.00	\$1,994.00
Nikon D850-Camera Body Only	2 ea.	5,993.90	\$6,387.02	No Bid	\$5,993.90	\$5,993.90	\$5,800.00	<b>\$4,800.00</b>	\$5,500.00	\$5,978.00
DJI Pocket Osmo Camera with Expansion Kit	2 ea.	<b>\$772.00</b>	\$971.90	No Bid	\$814.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$998.00	\$854.00	\$859.60
Canon EF 75-300mm f/4-5.6 III Lens	10 ea.	\$1,000.00	\$1,933.20	\$1,894.90	\$1,499.00	\$1,932.10	\$1,990.00	<b>\$990.00</b>	\$1,500.00	\$1,395.00
Canon XAII Compact Full HD Comcorder with HDMI	3 ea.	<b>\$3,207.75</b>	\$4,046.76	No Bid	\$3,294.00	\$3,897.00	\$3,897.00	\$3,777.00	\$3,696.00	No Bid
Canon EOS DSLR 80D with 18-55mm Lens	2 ea.	\$2,298.00	\$2,373.84	\$2,413.66	\$2,155.80	\$2,448.08	\$2,298.00	<b>\$1,598.00</b>	\$2,038.00	\$2,276.00
Nikon 70-200mm AF-S Nikkor FL ED VR Lens	2 ea.	\$4,293.90	\$4,313.42	No Bid	\$4,293.90	\$4,293.90	\$4,200.00	<b>\$3,738.00</b>	\$4,040.00	\$4,278.00
Nikon AF Zoom with Nikkor 80-200 mm f/2.8 ED Lens	1 ea.	\$1,221.95	\$1,295.95	No Bid	\$1,221.95	\$1,220.87	\$1,221.00	<b>\$999.00</b>	\$1,125.00	\$1,249.00
AF Fisheye-Nikkor 16mm f/2.8 8D Lens	1 ea.	\$996.95	\$1,055.11	No Bid	\$996.95	No Bid	\$990.00	<b>\$879.00</b>	\$930.00	\$992.00
Canon E05 80D DSLR-Camera Body Only	1 ea.	\$999.00	\$1,024.92	\$1,064.25	\$899.90	\$1,077.03	\$999.00	<b>\$749.00</b>	\$892.00	\$979.90
Sigma 17-50mm f/2.8 EX DC OS HSM Lens for Canon EF	1 ea.	\$369.00	\$376.92	No Bid	\$369.00	\$657.47	\$360.00	\$349.00	<b>\$288.00</b>	\$367.00
Sigma 70-200mm f/2.8 DG OS HSM Sports Lens for Canon EF	1 ea.	<b>\$974.95</b>	\$1,251.72	No Bid	\$1,147.90	\$1,469.40	\$1,250.00	\$1,235.00	\$1,149.00	\$1,248.00
Nikon 300 mm f/2.8G ED-IF 11 AF-S VR-11-Nikkor Lens	1 ea.	\$5,496.95	\$5,828.71	No Bid	\$5,496.95	No Bid	\$5,499.00	<b>\$5,019.00</b>	\$5,020.00	\$5,482.00
Canon EF 24-70mm f/2.8L II USM Lens	1 ea.	\$1,479.95	\$1,705.32	No Bid	\$1,474.90	\$1,893.12	\$1,699.00	<b>\$1,419.00</b>	\$1,431.00	\$1,589.00
Lowepr Camera Bag Protactic BP350 AWII	5 ea.	\$711.25	<b>\$647.75</b>	No Bid	\$745.00	\$943.35	\$875.00	\$1,275.00	\$745.00	\$894.90
<b>Totals</b>		<b>\$4,954.70</b>	<b>\$647.75</b>	0	0	0	0	<b>\$21,990.00</b>	<b>\$288.00</b>	0