

**MUSIC INSTRUMENTS
BID NO. 19-025**

Item	Description	Qty.	Kansas City Piano	Meyer Music	Music & Arts Center	Music & Arts Alt.	R.E.W. Music	Schmitt Music	West Music
1	Cello, 4/4, Case and Bow 4/4 size	6 ea.	No Bid	\$10,837.50	No Bid		\$11,059.08	No Bid	No Bid
2	Viola, 15.5", Case and Bow	3 ea.	No Bid	\$2,411.10	No Bid		\$2,485.50	No Bid	No Bid
3	Violin, 4/4, Case and Bow	3 ea.	No Bid	\$1,986.00	No Bid		\$1,903.86	No Bid	No Bid
4	Bass, 1/2, Case and Bow	1 ea.	No Bid	\$1,861.25	No Bid		\$1,407.91	No Bid	No Bid
5	Saxophone, Tenor	4ea.	No Bid	\$6,352.08	\$6,088.00		\$8,680.32	No Bid	No Bid
6	Sousaphone	3 ea.	No Bid	\$16,124.40	\$13,944.00	\$16,884.00	\$12,766.68	No Bid	No Bid
7	Tuba	1 ea.	No Bid	\$5,244.70	\$5,028.00	\$5,690.00	\$3,598.73	No Bid	No Bid
8	Xylophone, Soprano, Palisono Bars	1 ea.	No Bid	No Bid	\$453.00		\$449.40	No Bid	\$494.70
9	Xylophone, Soprano, Rosewood Bars	2 ea.	No Bid	No Bid	\$652.00		\$644.14	No Bid	\$709.06
10	Xylophone, Alto, Palisono Bars	2 ea.	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,246.00		\$1,235.86	No Bid	\$1,360.42
11	Xylophone, Bass, Rosewood Bars	2 ea.	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,708.00		\$1,692.74	No Bid	\$1,863.36
12	Xylophone, Deep Bass, Fiberglass Bars	1 ea.	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,515.00		\$1,516.73	No Bid	\$1,669.61
13	Mirimba, Concert, 4.3 Octave, Field Frame	1 ea.	No Bid	\$4,082.63	\$3,722.00		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
14	Keyboard, Bench & Dolly, GH3X	1 ea.	\$2,599.00	\$1,821.68	\$2,149.00		No Bid	\$2,585.00	No Bid
15	Keyboard, Bench & Dolly, 88 Keys, GH3X	1 ea.	\$5,278.00	\$7,461.68	\$3,950.00		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
16	Tenor Set, Field Corps, Quint with Case	3 sets	No Bid	\$4,591.59	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
17	Tenor Quints Cover Set-Black (for #16)	3 ea.	No Bid	\$129.48	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
18	Snare Drum, Marching 14"x12", w/ Case	5 ea.	No Bid	\$4,900.00	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
19	Snare Drum Cover 14"x12" (for #18)	5 ea.	No Bid	\$142.10	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
20	Bass Drum, Marching, 16"x14", w/ Case	1 ea.	No Bid	\$722.11	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
20a.	Bass Drum Cover, Marching 16"x14" (for #20)	1 ea.	No Bid	\$37.89	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
21	Bass Drum, Marching, 18"x14", w/ Case	1 ea.	No Bid	\$754.74	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
21a.	Bass Drum cover, Marching, 18" (for #21)	1 ea.	No Bid	\$37.89	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
22	Bass Drum, Marching, 20"x14", w/ Case	1 ea.	No Bid	\$786.32	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
22a.	Bass Drum Cover, Marching, 20", (for #22)	1 ea.	No Bid	\$37.89	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
23	Bass Drum, Marching, 24"x14", w/ Case	1 ea.	No Bid	\$871.58	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
23a.	Bass Drum Cover, Marching, 24", (for #23)	1 ea.	No Bid	\$37.89	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
24	Bass Drum, Marching, 26"x14", w/ Case	1 ea.	No Bid	\$903.16	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
24a.	Bass Drum Cover, Marching 26", (for #24)	1 ea.	No Bid	\$41.05	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
25	Contour Hinge Monopost Petite Multi-Tom Carrier	1 ea.	No Bid	\$350.53	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
26	Contour Hinge Monoposto Petite Snare Carrier	1 ea.	No Bid	\$284.21	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
27	Contour Hinge Monoposto Petite Bass Drum Carrier	1 ea.	No Bid	\$272.37	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Totals		0	\$31,996.65	\$22,452.00	0	\$16,788.82	0	0