
REQUEST FOR 
QUOTATION                REQUISITION   

No.       9429         TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT     

DUE DATE     NO LATER THAN     1140 RANKIN, TROY, MICHIGAN 48083     

7-16-07  3 p.m.   248-823-4052     

      FAX: 248-823-4077 DATE      6-29-07 
   REQUEST FOR QUOTE – NOT AN ORDER  

                    THIS FORM MUST BE UTILIZED WHEN RESPONDING TO THIS REQUEST       
                         BID ENVELOPE ENCLOSED           
                        

  THE RFQ NUMBER MUST APPEAR ON ALL QUOTATIONS AND RELATED CORRESPONDENCE, THIS IS NOT AN ORDER 
                       

Quantity       DESCRIPTION        UNIT PRICE  AMOUNT 

                 

  
 Please supply us with your bid to furnish the Troy School District with SCIENCE 
EQUIPMENT per the attached specifications.        

          

  

Copies of the bid are available at: 
www.troy.k12.mi.us/purchasing/items_out_for_bid.htm 

 
Bid recaps will be available at: 

troy.k12.mi.us/purchasing/index.htm 
        

  FACSIMILE BID IS NOT ACCEPTABLE      
                 

  

Bids will not be accepted if submitted after the deadline specified (local time) in the advertisement to bid or in the information to 
bidders.  The late submission of a bid makes the bid nonrepsonsive and is a material defect which shall not be waived by the  
Board of Education. Delays in the mail will not be considered. All Late bids in the mail will be returned to the bidder unopened. 
      

 

Proposal for the submission of alternatives by vendors will be accepted and reviewed.  However, if any substitution or departure 
is not clearly noted and described, it will be understood that the bid intends to exactly meet the specifications. 
    

 

The Board of Education shall be the sole judge as to whether the proposed goods are “equal” or “approved”.   Quotations must 
be mailed or delivered to the Purchasing Office, 1140 Rankin, Troy, MI 48083 no later than 3 p.m. on the date shown above. 
Michigan State Sales and Use Taxes and Federal Excise Taxes do not apply unless otherwise indicated.  Exemption certificates 
will be furnished when necessary.  This request imposes no obligations on the buyer.  The Board of Education reserves the right 
to accept or reject any or all bids or to split awards by items or to accept bids, which will best serve the Board of Education.    

        

      THIS AREA MUST BE FILLED IN             

DELIVERY TIME PRICES FIRM FOR  NAME OF COMPANY     
TELEPHONE     
NO.    

                 
                  
TERMS       NO. & STREET      FAX #     
                        

FOB 
ALL DELIVERY CHARGES 
MUST    CITY, STATE & ZIP CODE      E-MAIL     

DELIVERED  BE INCLUDED IN PRICES SHOWN                 
CONTACT PERSON (PLEASE PRINT)   SIGNATURE      DATE    
                
                        



AFFIDAVIT OF BIDDER 
 

 The undersigned, the owner or authorized officer of       (the 
“Bidder), pursuant to the familial disclosure requirement provided in the      
(the “School District”) advertisement for construction bids, hereby represent and warrant except 
as provided below, that no familial relationships exist between the over(s) or any employee of 
       and any member of the Board of Education of the School 
District or the Superintendent of the School District. 
 
 List any Familial Relationships: 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
      
 BIDDER: 
 
       
 
  
 By:       
 
 Its:        
 
STATE OF MICHIGAN     ) 
                                             )ss. 
COUNTY OF     ) 
 
This instrument was acknowledged before me on the   day of   , 2007, by  
 
  . 
 
 
         
 
      , Notary Public 
 
      County, Michigan 
 
   My Commission Expires:    
 
   Acting in the County of:    
 



TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT 
BID 9429 SCIENCE EQUIPMENT 

 
 

Qty. Description - TROY HIGH SCHOOL     Unit Price   Total Cost 
 
 
1 

 
Catalog #M2000 – Benz Microscope Optics Center 
 
Motic Digital Camera System 2.0 Mega Pixel with Microscope 
Adapters and Mac/PC software 
 

  

 
 
 
7 

 
Catalog #5121000 – Benz Microscope Optics Center 
 
CXL Labomed Microscope Binocular, 10xwf eyepieces, 4X, 10X, 
40X, 100X, Semi – Plan Objectives, Mechanical Stage Variable 
Halogen Illumination 
 

  

 
 
 

 
                                                       SHIPPING 

  

 
 
 

 
                                                        TOTAL 

  

 
 
 

Qty. Description - ATHENS HIGH SCHOOL    Unit Price   Total Cost 
 
 
 
1 

Catalog #M2000 – Benz Microscope Optics Center 
 
Motic Digital Camera System 2.0 Mega Pixel with Microscope 
Adapters and Mac/PC software 
 

  

 
 
 
7 

Catalog #5121000 – Benz Microscope Optics Center 
 
CXL Labomed Microscope Binocular, 10xwf eyespieces, 4X, 
10X, 40X, 100X, Semi – Plan Objectives, Mechanical Stage 
Variable Halogen Illumination 
 

  

 
 
2 sets 

Catalog #BD-DX – Vernier 
 
ProScope Deluxe Hand Held Microscope with case, stand and 
additional lenses 
 

  



 
Qty. Description - ATHENS HIGH SCHOOL- Continued   Unit Price   Total Cost 
 
 
1 

Catalog #14W9009 – Wards 
 
Autoclave 
 

  

 
 
8 

Catalog #36A5160 – Wards 
 
Dual-Chamber Electrophoresis Chambers 
 

  

 
 
2 

Catalog #36A5112 – Wards 
 
Power Supply 
 

  

 
 
12 

Catalog #15W1725 – Wards 
 
Digital Micropipet 
 

  

 
 
3 
 

Catalog #15W1726 - Wards 
 
Digital Micropipet  
 

  

 
 
1 

Catalog #81W1050 – Wards 
 
Prokaryotic cell model 
 

  

 
 
4 

Catalog #82W3612 – Wards 
 
Advanced Skull 
 

  

 
 
2 

Catalog #82W3710 – Wards 
 
Spinal Column 
 

  

 
 
2 

Catalog #82W3786 – Wards 
 
Plastic Sternum 
 

  

 
 
3 

Catalog #82W3820 – Wards 
 
Hand 
 

  

 
 
3 

Catalog #82W3880 – Wards 
 
Humerous 
 

  

 
 
6 

Catalog #82W3815 – Wards 
 
Clavical 
 

  

 
 
7 

Catalog #82W3782 – Wards 
 
Fibula 
 

  

 
 
5 

Catalog #82W3780 – Wards 
 
Femer 
 

  



Qty. Description - ATHENS HIGH SCHOOL- Continued   Unit Price   Total Cost 
 
 
5 

Catalog #15W6281 – Wards 
 
Ohaus Scout Pro Electric Balance Model SPE 402 
 

  

 
 
1 

Catalog #OB9092 – Flinn Scientific 
 
Analytical Balance 
 

  

 
 
10 

Catalog #AP1087 – Flinn Scientific 
 
Hot Plate/Stirrer 
 

  

 
 
6 

Catalog U12-012 - Onset Computer Corp.  
Hobo U12 Temp/Rh/light external data logger   
 

  

 
 
1 

Catalog BHW-PC - Onset Computer Corp.  
 
Hoboware Pro Software  
 

  

 
 
1 

Catalog P6-8000 - Arbor Scientific 
 
Watt’s Up Meter Measurement 
 

  

 
 
2 

Catalog #AP6356 – Flinn Scientific  
 
Molar Mass By Freeing PT Depression 
 

  

 
 
2 

Catalog #AP9083 – Flinn Scientific 
 
Acid/Base Titrations 
 

  

 
 
2 

Catalog #AP8815 – Flinn Scientific 
 
Oxidation Reduction Titrations 
 

  

 
 
2 

Catalog #AP6453 – Flinn Scientific 
 
Separation & Qual. Determination of Cations and Anions 
 

  

 
 
1 

Catalog #AP9272 – Flinn Scientific 
 
AP Chemistry Flash Cards 
 

  

 
 
1 

Catalog #AP6664 – Flinn Scientific 
 
Net Ionic EQ Flash Cards AP Chem 
 

  

 
 
1 

Catalog #AP6901 – Flinn Scientific 
 
Solubility Rules Chart 
 

  

 
 
2 

Catalog #AP6580 – Flinn Scientific 
 
Periodic Table Labels 
 

  

 
 
1 

Catalog #AP1279 – Flinn Scientific 
 
Weighing Dishes 

  



Qty. Description - ATHENS HIGH SCHOOL- Continued   Unit Price   Total Cost 
 
 
1 

Catalog AP1278 – Flinn Scientific 
 
Weighing Dishes 
 

  

 
 
1 

Catalog #AP8720 – Flinn Scientific 
 
PH Calibration Kit 
 

  

 
 
1 

Catalog #AP5957 – Flinn Scientific 
 
Emission Spectrum Manual 
 

  

 
 
6 

Catalog #4528 – Flinn Scientific 
 
Bottle – Sq. Plastic 
 

  

 
 
2 pkg. 

Catalog #AP1602 – Flinn Scientific 
 
Burner Tubing Connector 
 

  

 
 
 

 
                                                        SHIPPING 

  

 
 
 

 
                                                         TOTAL 

  

 



Co.: Frey Scientific Sargent-Welch Co.: Fisher Science Education Co.:Wards Natural Science Co.: Science Kit, LLC Science Kit Co.: Flinn Scientific
Terms: Net 30 Terms: Net 30 Days Terms: Net 30 Days Ter Wards Order # Terms: Net 30 Days Quote # Terms: Net 30 Days
Firm: 90 Days Firm: Through 12/31/07 Firm: 120 Days Firm707138-115 Firm: until June 30, 20SE71606 Firm: 90 Days

Qty
Troy High School
Catalog #M2000 – Benz Microscope Optics Center

1 Motic Digital Camera System NO BID S48149-FD 687.29     687.29                S94001B 292.50       292.50         NO BID 57900-15 1,230.00     1,230.00     NO BID
2.0 Mega Pixel with Microscope 
Adapters and Mac/PC software

Catalog #5121000 – Benz Microscope Optics Center
7 CXL Labomed Microscope NO BID S/760-26 252.57     1,767.99             NON-CAT T-1903 308.43       2,159.01      NO BID 57441-06 590.00        4,130.00     NO BID

Binocular, 10xwf eyepieces, 4X, 10X, 
40X, 100X, Semi – Plan Objectives,  
Mechanical Stage Variable
Halogen Illumination

SHIPPING -0- -0- -0-
TROY HIGH SCHOOL TOTAL NO BID 2,455.28             2,451.51      NO BID 5,360.00     NO BID

Athens High School
Catalog #M2000 – Benz Microscope Optics Center

1 Motic Digital Camera System NO BID S48149-FD 687.29 687.29                S94001B 292.50       292.50         NO BID 57900-15 1,230.00     1,230.00     NO BID
2.0 Mega Pixel with Microscope or S67919MP $488.51
Adapters and Mac/PC software

Catalog #5121000 – Benz Microscope Optics Center
7 CXL Labomed Microscope NO BID S/760-26 252.57 1,767.99             NON-CAT T-1903 308.43       2,159.01      NO BID 57441-06 590.00        4,130.00     NO BID

Binocular, 10xwf eyepieces, 4X, 10X, SPRING LOADED, OIL IMMESION
40X, 100X, Semi – Plan Objectives,  
Mechanical Stage Variable
Halogen Illumination

Catalog #BD-DX – Vernier
2 sets ProScope Deluxe Hand Held Microscope NO BID NO BID NON-CATALOG B 1,013.70    2,027.40      NO BID NO BID NO BID

with case, stand and additional lenses
BD-DX 

Catalog #14W9009 – Wards
1  Autoclave NO BID 58619-040 5501.16 5,501.16             4,841.67    4,841.67      5,924.00   5,924.00      NO BID NO BID

EXACT NON-CAT #023210410/EMD
Catalog #36A5160 – Wards

8  Dual-Chamber Electrophoresis 15527569 143.20     1,145.60      NO BID S902432ND 162.22       1,297.76      125.88      1,007.04      64164-01 161.10        1,288.80     NO BID
Chambers

Catalog #36A5112 – Wards
2 Power Supply 15527568 199.20     398.40         NO BID S11509E 141.90       283.80         237.19      474.38         64878-00 229.85        459.70        NO BID

Catalog #15W1725 – Wards
12 Digital Micropipet 15562183 143.20     1,718.40      S69792-05 162.36 1,948.32             S902432B 123.13       1,477.56      163.35      1,960.20      6061-00 152.31        1,827.72     NO BID

Catalog #15W1726 - Wards
3 Digital Micropipet 15562090 143.20     429.60         S69500-D 115.5 346.50                S902432D 123.13       369.39         163.35      490.05         60613-02 152.31        456.93        NO BID

Catalog #81W1050 – Wards
1 Prokaryotic cell model NO BID NO BID S94829 306.25       306.25         371.25      371.25         NO BID NO BID

Catalog #82W3612 – Wards
4 Advanced Skull American 3B 153.60     614.40         NO BID S17135 55.85         223.40         180.43      721.72         67934-01 178.57        714.28        NO BID

#A20/9 5 part

Description

TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT
Bid 9429 Science Equipment

Athens and Troy High Schools



Co.: Frey Scientific Sargent-Welch Co.: Fisher Science Education Co.:Wards Natural Science Co.: Science Kit, LLC Science Kit Co.: Flinn Scientific
Terms: Net 30 Terms: Net 30 Days Terms: Net 30 Days Ter Wards Order # Terms: Net 30 Days Quote # Terms: Net 30 Days
Firm: 90 Days Firm: Through 12/31/07 Firm: 120 Days Firm707138-115 Firm: until June 30, 20SE71606 Firm: 90 Days

TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT
Bid 9429 Science Equipment

Athens and Troy High Schools
Catalog #82W3710 – Wards

2 spinal Column American 3B #A58/1 80.00       160.00         female spine w/stand 158.82 317.64                S1713510 70.59         141.18         94.05        188.10         64389-00 125.34        250.68        NO BID
WLH12025 = WLH12040

Athens High School - Continued
Catalog #82W3786 – Wards

2  Plastic Sternum American 3B #A69 16.80       33.60           NO BID ONON-CAT A6 16.15         32.30           19.75        39.50           NO BID NO BID

Catalog #82W3820 – Wards
3 Hand American 3B #A41 50.40       151.20         NO BID NON-CAT A41 44.47         133.41         59.25        177.75         NO BID NO BID

Catalog #82W3880 – Wards
3 Humerous American 3B #45/1L 14.40       43.20           NO BID NC9542766 13.08         39.24           25.15        75.45           NO BID NO BID

Catalog #82W3815 – Wards
6 Clavical American 3B #A35/4L 8.00         48.00           NO BID NON-CAT A45/FL 7.69           46.14           9.41          56.46           NO BID NO BID

Catalog #82W3782 – Wards
7 Fibula American 3B #35/4L 8.80         61.60           NO BID NC9542773 8.46           59.22           10.35        72.45           NO BID NO BID

Catalog #82W3780 – Wards
5 Femer American 3B #A35/1L 23.20       116.00         NO BID NC9542770 21.22         106.10         27.72        138.60         NO BID NO BID

Catalog #15W6281 – Wards
5 #Ohaus Scout Pro Electric Balance 15525771 267.79     1,338.95      S2647-20B 250.66 1,253.30             S67075 251.69       1,258.45      369.60      1,848.00      47191-04 344.62        1,723.10     NO BID

Model SPE 402

Catalog #OB9092 – Flinn Scientific
1 Analytical Balance 15531674 979.96     979.96         NO BID S93500C 1,289.49    1,289.49      NO BID NO BID 1,512.68  1,512.68     

Catalog #AP1087 – Flinn Scientific
10 Hot Plate/Stirrer 15529589  or 322.59     3,225.90      S41059-06A 285.89 2,858.90             S50467CNQ 269.07       2,690.70      NO BID 66728-01 323.05        3,230.50     354.33     3,543.30     

15528338 $271.56 = $2,715.60

Catalog U12-012 - Onset Computer Corp
6 Hobo U12 Temp/Rh/light external data NO BID NO BID NON-CAT U12-01 145.12       870.72         NO BID NO BID NO BID

logger  

Catalog BHW-PC - Onset Computer Corp
1 Hoboware Pro Software NO BID NO BID NC9410626 132.00       132.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID

Catalog P6-8000 - Arbor Scientific
1 Watt’s Up Meter Measurement NO BID NO BID S83174 85.53         85.53           NO BID NO BID NO BID

Catalog #AP6356 – Flinn Scientific 
2 Molar Mass By Freeing PT NO BID NO BID S90739 24.30         48.60           NO BID NO BID 21.56       43.12          

Depression

Catalog #AP9083 – Flinn Scientific
2 Acid/Base Titrations NO BID NO BID S90731 25.88         51.76           NO BID NO BID 23.09       46.18          

Catalog #AP8815 – Flinn Scientific
2 Oxidation Reduction Titrations NO BID NO BID S90738 36.74         73.48           NO BID NO BID 24.84       49.68          

Catalog #AP6453 – Flinn Scientific
2 Separation & Qual. Determination of NO BID NO BID S90734 63.66         127.32         NO BID NO BID 86.42       172.84        

Cations and Anions



Co.: Frey Scientific Sargent-Welch Co.: Fisher Science Education Co.:Wards Natural Science Co.: Science Kit, LLC Science Kit Co.: Flinn Scientific
Terms: Net 30 Terms: Net 30 Days Terms: Net 30 Days Ter Wards Order # Terms: Net 30 Days Quote # Terms: Net 30 Days
Firm: 90 Days Firm: Through 12/31/07 Firm: 120 Days Firm707138-115 Firm: until June 30, 20SE71606 Firm: 90 Days

TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT
Bid 9429 Science Equipment

Athens and Troy High Schools

Catalog #AP9272 – Flinn Scientific
1 AP Chemistry Flash Cards NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 9.27         9.27            

Catalog #AP6664 – Flinn Scientific
1 Net Ionic EQ Flash Cards AP Chem NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 7.11         7.11            

Athens High School - Continued
Catalog #AP6901 – Flinn Scientific

1 Solubility Rules Chart NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 26.96       26.96          

Catalog #AP6580 – Flinn Scientific
2  Periodic Table Labels NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 4.14         8.28            

Catalog #AP1279 – Flinn Scientific
1 Weighing Dishes NO BID S3860-C total of 500 19.44 19.44                  S40293 39.36         39.36           NO BID 64552-03C 51.55          51.55          52.88       52.88          

Catalog AP1278 – Flinn Scientific
1 Weighing Dishes 15583350 14.97       14.97           S3860-B total of 500 9.73 9.73                    S40292 27.88         27.88           NO BID 6455202-C 27.25          27.25          28.40       28.40          

Catalog #AP8720 – Flinn Scientific
1 PH Calibration Kit NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 10.76       10.76          

Catalog #AP5957 – Flinn Scientific
1 Emission Spectrum Manual NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 6.80         6.80            

Catalog #4528 – Flinn Scientific
6 Bottle – Sq. Plastic NO BID S261T 3.72 22.32                  09-923-16C 24/CS 87.49         87.49           NO BID 66061-03  7.68            46.08          4.19         25.14          

1 CASE
Catalog #AP1602 – Flinn Scientific

2 pkg Burner Tubing Connector 15562393 7.53         15.06           S13121-A   each 7.74 92.88                  S49140 12.63         25.26           NO BID 60935-02D 55.86          111.72        71.55       143.10        

SHIPPING N/A -0- -0- -0- -0- -0-
TOTAL 10,494.84    14,825.47           20,644.37    13,544.95    15,548.31   5,686.50     

Nebraska Scientific - No Bid
The Science Source - No Response



Qty
Troy High School
Catalog #M2000 – Benz Microscope Optics Center

1 Motic Digital Camera System 
2.0 Mega Pixel with Microscope 
Adapters and Mac/PC software

Catalog #5121000 – Benz Microscope Optics Center
7 CXL Labomed Microscope 

Binocular, 10xwf eyepieces, 4X, 10X, 
40X, 100X, Semi – Plan Objectives,  
Mechanical Stage Variable
Halogen Illumination

SHIPPING
TROY HIGH SCHOOL TOTAL

Athens High School
Catalog #M2000 – Benz Microscope Optics Center

1 Motic Digital Camera System 
2.0 Mega Pixel with Microscope 
Adapters and Mac/PC software

Catalog #5121000 – Benz Microscope Optics Center
7 CXL Labomed Microscope 

Binocular, 10xwf eyepieces, 4X, 10X, 
40X, 100X, Semi – Plan Objectives,  
Mechanical Stage Variable
Halogen Illumination

Catalog #BD-DX – Vernier
2 sets ProScope Deluxe Hand Held Microscope 

with case, stand and additional lenses
BD-DX 

Catalog #14W9009 – Wards
1  Autoclave

Catalog #36A5160 – Wards
8  Dual-Chamber Electrophoresis 

Chambers

Catalog #36A5112 – Wards
2 Power Supply

Catalog #15W1725 – Wards
12 Digital Micropipet

Catalog #15W1726 - Wards
3 Digital Micropipet 

Catalog #81W1050 – Wards
1 Prokaryotic cell model

Catalog #82W3612 – Wards
4 Advanced Skull

Description

TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT
Bid 9429 Science Equipment

Athens and Troy High Schools

Co.: Bio-Rad Labs Bio-Rad Lab Co.: Sciencelabs Co.: Benz Microscoper Optice Center, In Co.:Carolina Biological Supply Co.: Vernier Software & Tech. Co.: Onset Compute Co.: Arbor Scientific Co.: Cynmar Corp.
Terms: Net 30 Days Quote # Terms: Net 30 Terms: Net 30 Days Terms: Net 30 DayCarolina # Terms: Net 30 Days Quote # Terms: Net 30 Terms: Net 30 Days Terms: Net 30
Firm: 8-31-07 07-25844Bid Firm: 180 Days Firm: 30 Days from bid opening Firm:60 Days 57291SQ 120 Days QT013774 Firm: Firm: 180 Days Firm: 90 Days

NO BID NO BID 700.00     700.00          NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID CSH-17740 659.00         659.00        

NO BID Premiere MJR-03 309.60     2,167.20     Bid with #3120013 399.00     2,793.00       NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID CSH-17736 395.00         2,765.00     
10mm 100 division reticle

-0- FOB DESTINATION -0-
NO BID 2,167.20     3,493.00       NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 3,424.00     

NO BID NO BID 700.00     700.00          NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID CSH-17740 659.00         659.00        

NO BID Premiere MJR-03 309.60     2,167.20     373.00     2,611.00       NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID CSH-17736 395.00         2,765.00     

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 949.00     1,898.00      NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID 701650 5,321.46    5,321.46       NO BID NO BID NO BID 4,195.00      4,195.00     
STU-54733 Luttnauer EZ10

169.00           1,352.00     EDUOTEK 504 160.68     1,285.44     NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

325.00           650.00        NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

159.00           1,908.00     NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 135-34790 113.05         1,356.60     

159.00           477.00        NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 135-34794 113.05         339.15        

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID 24-6952 189.05       756.20          NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID



TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT
Bid 9429 Science Equipment

Athens and Troy High Schools
Catalog #82W3710 – Wards

2 spinal Column

Athens High School - Continued
Catalog #82W3786 – Wards

2  Plastic Sternum

Catalog #82W3820 – Wards
3 Hand

Catalog #82W3880 – Wards
3 Humerous

Catalog #82W3815 – Wards
6 Clavical

Catalog #82W3782 – Wards
7 Fibula

Catalog #82W3780 – Wards
5 Femer

Catalog #15W6281 – Wards
5 #Ohaus Scout Pro Electric Balance 

Model SPE 402

Catalog #OB9092 – Flinn Scientific
1 Analytical Balance

Catalog #AP1087 – Flinn Scientific
10 Hot Plate/Stirrer

Catalog U12-012 - Onset Computer Corp
6 Hobo U12 Temp/Rh/light external data 

logger  

Catalog BHW-PC - Onset Computer Corp
1 Hoboware Pro Software 

Catalog P6-8000 - Arbor Scientific
1 Watt’s Up Meter Measurement

Catalog #AP6356 – Flinn Scientific 
2 Molar Mass By Freeing PT 

Depression

Catalog #AP9083 – Flinn Scientific
2 Acid/Base Titrations

Catalog #AP8815 – Flinn Scientific
2 Oxidation Reduction Titrations

Catalog #AP6453 – Flinn Scientific
2 Separation & Qual. Determination of 

Cations and Anions

Co.: Bio-Rad Labs Bio-Rad Lab Co.: Sciencelabs Co.: Benz Microscoper Optice Center, In Co.:Carolina Biological Supply Co.: Vernier Software & Tech. Co.: Onset Compute Co.: Arbor Scientific Co.: Cynmar Corp.
Terms: Net 30 Days Quote # Terms: Net 30 Terms: Net 30 Days Terms: Net 30 DayCarolina # Terms: Net 30 Days Quote # Terms: Net 30 Terms: Net 30 Days Terms: Net 30
Firm: 8-31-07 07-25844Bid Firm: 180 Days Firm: 30 Days from bid opening Firm:60 Days 57291SQ 120 Days QT013774 Firm: Firm: 180 Days Firm: 90 Days

NO BID 3g Scientific A58/1 72.00       144.00        NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID 3G Sceintific A41 45.36       136.08        NO BID 24-768 72.20         216.60          NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID 24-7612 Discontinued NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID 24-7602 Discontinued NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID 24-7842 Discontinued NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID 24-7802 Discontinued NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID 322.00     1,610.00     OH-SP3402 309.00     1,545.00       70-244 376.32       1,881.60       OHSP-402 409.00     2,045.00      NO BID NO BID OHP-062 336.02         1,680.10     

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID 70-102 394.01       3,940.10       NO BID NO BID NO BID ATH-50169 350.00         3,500.00     
Thermalyne Cemaric Digital

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 119.00  714.00   NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 99.00    99.00     NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 110.00     110.00  NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID



TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT
Bid 9429 Science Equipment

Athens and Troy High Schools

Catalog #AP9272 – Flinn Scientific
1 AP Chemistry Flash Cards

Catalog #AP6664 – Flinn Scientific
1 Net Ionic EQ Flash Cards AP Chem

Athens High School - Continued
Catalog #AP6901 – Flinn Scientific

1 Solubility Rules Chart

Catalog #AP6580 – Flinn Scientific
2  Periodic Table Labels

Catalog #AP1279 – Flinn Scientific
1 Weighing Dishes

Catalog AP1278 – Flinn Scientific
1 Weighing Dishes

Catalog #AP8720 – Flinn Scientific
1 PH Calibration Kit

Catalog #AP5957 – Flinn Scientific
1 Emission Spectrum Manual

Catalog #4528 – Flinn Scientific
6 Bottle – Sq. Plastic

Catalog #AP1602 – Flinn Scientific
2 pkg Burner Tubing Connector

SHIPPING
TOTAL

Nebraska Scientific - No Bid
The Science Source - No Response

Co.: Bio-Rad Labs Bio-Rad Lab Co.: Sciencelabs Co.: Benz Microscoper Optice Center, In Co.:Carolina Biological Supply Co.: Vernier Software & Tech. Co.: Onset Compute Co.: Arbor Scientific Co.: Cynmar Corp.
Terms: Net 30 Days Quote # Terms: Net 30 Terms: Net 30 Days Terms: Net 30 DayCarolina # Terms: Net 30 Days Quote # Terms: Net 30 Terms: Net 30 Days Terms: Net 30
Firm: 8-31-07 07-25844Bid Firm: 180 Days Firm: 30 Days from bid opening Firm:60 Days 57291SQ 120 Days QT013774 Firm: Firm: 180 Days Firm: 90 Days

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID D860   PK/500 39.00       39.00            NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 111-20958 30.40           30.40          

NO BID NO BID LT: D855 - PK/500 22.00       22.00            70-233 26.59         26.59            NO BID NO BID NO BID 111-20957 17.58           17.58          

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Qty of 1 159.00           159.00        
1660507EDU Micropipetor 53.00          

-0- FOB DESTINATION -0- 0.75% 29.57       29.57 14.00     6.00      -0-
4,599.00     5,342.72     4,917.00       12,142.55     3,972.57      827.00   116.00  14,542.83   

Price includes delivery and set up.


