REQUEST FOR
QUOTATION
No. 9428 TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT
DUE DATE NO LATER THAN 1140 RANKIN, TROY, MICHIGAN 48083
7-12-07 3pm. 248-823-4052
FAX: 248-823-4077

REQUISITION

DATE 6-28-07

REQUEST FOR QUOTE — NOT AN ORDER

THIS FORM MUST BE UTILIZED WHEN RESPONDING TO THIS REQUEST
BID ENVELOPE ENCLOSED

THE RFQ NUMBER MUST APPEAR ON ALL QUOTATIONS AND RELATED CORRESPONDENCE, THIS IS NOT AN ORDER

Quantity DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
Please supply us with your bid to furnish the Troy School District with WINTER
ATHLETIC EQUIPMENT for the 2007-2008 school year per the attached specifications.
Copies of the bid are available at:
www.troy.k12.mi.us/purchasing/items_out for_bid.htm
Bid recaps will be available at:
troy.k12.mi.us/purchasing/index.htm
FACSIMILE BID IS NOT ACCEPTABLE

Bids will not be accepted if submitted after the deadline specified (local time) in the advertisement to bid or in the information to

bidders. The late submission of a bid makes the bid nonrepsonsive and is a material defect which shall not be waived by the

Board of Education. Delays in the mail will not be considered. All Late bids in the mail will be returned to the bidder unopened.

Proposal for the submission of alternatives by vendors will be accepted and reviewed. However, if any substitution or departure

is not clearly noted and described, it will be understood that the bid intends to exactly meet the specifications.

The Board of Education shall be the sole judge as to whether the proposed goods are “equal” or “approved”. Quotations must

be mailed or delivered to the Purchasing Office, 1140 Rankin, Troy, MI 48083 no later than 3 p.m. on the date shown above.

Michigan State Sales and Use Taxes and Federal Excise Taxes do not apply unless otherwise indicated. Exemption certificates

will be furnished when necessary. This request imposes no obligations on the buyer. The Board of Education reserves the right

to accept or reject any or all bids or to split awards by items or to accept bids, which will best serve the Board of Education.

THIS AREA MUST BE FILLED IN
TELEPHONE

DELIVERY TIME PRICES FIRM FOR NAME OF COMPANY NO.
TERMS NO. & STREET FAX #

ALL DELIVERY CHARGES
FOB MUST CITY, STATE & ZIP CODE E-MAIL
DELIVERED BE INCLUDED IN PRICES SHOWN
CONTACT PERSON (PLEASE PRINT) SIGNATURE DATE




AFFIDAVIT OF BIDDER

The undersigned, the owner or authorized officer of (the
“Bidder), pursuant to the familial disclosure requirement provided in the
(the “School District”) advertisement for construction bids, hereby represent and warrant except
as provided below, that no familial relationships exist between the over(s) or any employee of

and any member of the Board of Education of the School
District or the Superintendent of the School District.

List any Familial Relationships:

BIDDER:
By:
Its:
STATE OF MICHIGAN )
COUNTY OF ))SS'
This instrument was acknowledged before meonthe _ day of , 2007, by

, Notary Public

County, Michigan

My Commission Expires:

Acting in the County of:



TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT
2007-08 ATHLETICS WINTER BID

DATE: 06/12/07 PAGE 1 OF 4 PAGES

Quan. Description Unit Cost Total

Athens Boys Basketball

3 10”x 14” CDF-1 Bball. Coaches Double Folder (KBA)

2 15 x 18 SNR-60. Slipp Nott Replacement Pad

15 Red/White Practice Jerseys w/numbers. 5-Medium. 10-
Large. Numbers 1-15

12 Spaulding T-1000 Composite Balls

45 Duffle bags/Red w/Athens Boys Basketball. Numbers
10-55

3 Mark V Basketball 20 player Basketball Scorebooks

Athens Girls Volleyball

16 SV-SN Gold Tachikara volleyballs.

1 Equipment Carrier

2 sets | Porter Net Standards

1 Volleyball Net — for system.

16 Red Aliso Hoody Jacket. Embroidery on left side.
Athens Volleyball (Black). Numbers 1-16 on Left Hip.
6-Small. 6-Med. 4-Large.

Athens Wrestling

1 K72. The Monster Mop

3 K72R. Replacement Pads

12 E-41. Traditional Cliff Keen head Gear (Scarlet)

3 SB-7. Cliff Keen Scorebook

12 PL-1950. Life Line Power Jump Ropes

1 KC001C. Mat Cleaner Ken Clean Case/4 gallons

21 9042/9041 Holloway Ralley Jacket w/Jogger pant.
Scarlet and White. REDHAWKS (arched, white, 1inch,




Century Schoolbook font). ATHENS (white, 2 inch,
Century Schoolbook font over and underlined in black).
WRESTLING (reversed arched, white, 1 inch, Century
Schoolbook font) Embroidered on back of Rally Jacket.
A =2%in. on left chest upper half on 45 degree angle.
Vegas Gold bottom half on 45 degree angle Scarlet,
outlined in white, Century Schoolbook font.
Embroidered on front of Rally Jacket. 3-Small. 9-Med.
6-Large. 2-XLarge. 1-XXL.

16 S7917 Cliff Keen Custom Sublimated Team Singlet.
Singlet Body-white, accent strip-scarlet. Trim-scarlett.
3-Small. 6-Medium. 4-Large. 2-XLarge. 1-XXL.

20 Brute Lehigh Singlet. One color neck & arm. Athletic
gold w/red stripes. Front-ATHENS. Font = Courier
New, Color Red, 2 inches. Back - REDHAWKS,
Font=Courier New, Color Red, 1 % inch vertical down
back. 3-Small. 8-Medium. 5-Large. 2-XLarge. 1-
XXLarge. 1-XXXLarge.

Athens Swimming/Diving

4pr Size F. ZRed Zoomers.

9pr Size G. ZRed Zoomers

5pr Size H. ZRed Zoomers

48 #705896-006. Speedo Training Suits. 4=Size 28.
16=Size 30. 16=Size 32. 8=Size 34. 4= Size 36.

8 Blue. S101 Stretchcordz w/paddles

2 Blue S108 Stretchcordz Breaststroke

50 Adult #DS Pull Buoys. 25 Red. 25 Gold

24pr | HAN’s Paddles
12pr | HAN’s Gripper paddles
Athens Gymnastics

1 416-098 TAC/10 Round-off pad 36”x54”x 1 3/8

1 416-663 SC-8.5 x 10 x 8 Skill Cushion

1 416-192 Sting Competition Landing Mat

Troy High Basketball

CDF-1 Coach Double Folder




2 DHTB Super heavy Triner Basketball
12 61-1059 Spaling Top Flite TF-1000
4 Mark V Scorebooks
1 Shotstat
15 BOA2000 10’ Weighted Speed Rope
1 BRL KBA Ballistic Response Ladder 30’
2 SNR-60 Slipp Nott replacement pads
6 Classic Fox 40 Whistle
Troy High Volleyball
3 TM-CAN. TN Net Antennae Collapsible
Troy High Synchronized Swimming
2 #2263009 Sportline 240 Stop Watch (Blue & Green)
6 #04039828 Granite Plastic Clipboard
4 Four Figure markers Made
Troy High Wrestling
12 CK Tornado headgear (Black, Purple, Black)
2 Face Guard (Black)
2 Hair Slicker (Black)
12prs | 0271 Brute Equalizer Kneepads (Black w/light color
inside) 4-Medium. 4-Large. 4-XLarge.
6 MT3 Mat Transporter 31.5 x 26
2Cs WWMT4. Mat Tape 4”
1 BTDFS. S-50-55 LBS. Bulgarian Throwing Dummy
1 BTDFS. M-60-65 Ibs. Bulgarian Throwing Dummy
4 W343H. 2sided, tripod-mounted score clocks 17x16x16
4 2-50510-415 Manila Climbing Rope 18’ L. Ploy Boot.
18x1%
24 7SJC. Adjustable Speed Rope (Jump Rope)




Troy School District High Water Polo

4 MIW500 Mikasa Mini Trainer Ball
1 NESNPR. Sniper Water Plolo Shooting Sieve
12 MIW5500. Mikasa Premier Series Men’s Water Polo
Ball. Black
6 MIW4000 Mikasa Men’s Heavyweight Ball. Black
w/yellow grooves.
1 TCO008. Heavy Duty Ball Locker
3 SRWPS. S & R. Sport Official Water Polo Scorebook
Troy High Men’s Swimming
6 Paragon Aquatics Track Start Competitor with Black
Sand Top (Side Mount — Full Height)
15 Adult. Foam 1 Piece Pull Buoy.
Boulan Park Middle School 8" Grade Volleyball
2 Whistles w/Lanyard
2 Scorebooks
10 SV-5WSC. Tachikara Volleyballs — Purple
1 SV5WH Game Ball
2 MIKBCH. Mikasa Collapsible Hammock Ball Cart.




TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT

Bid 9428 Winter Athletic Equipment Dimmer-Warren Ent., I| Park Athletic Supply Forsport Pyramid School Prod{ Anaconda Sports, Inc. | Bill Fritz Sports Corp. Dee's Sport Shop Inc. Korney Board Aids, Inc.
UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
Qty. Description PRICE COST PRICE COST PRICE COST PRICE COST PRICE COST PRICE COST PRICE COST PRICE COST
Athens Boys Basketball
3 10”x 14” CDF-1 Bball. Coaches Double Folder (KBA) 21.40 64.20 25.00 75.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 19.00 57.00 21.95 65.85
2 15 x 18 SNR-60. Slipp Nott Replacement Pad 32.00 64.00 60.00 120.00 39.00 78.00 NO BID 33.85 67.70 38.00 76.00 NO BID 47.00 94.00
15 Red/White Practice Jerseys w/numbers. 5-Medium. 14.40 216.00 9.99 149.85 13.75 206.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID 7.00 105.00 NO BID
10-Large. Numbers 1-15
12 Spaulding T-1000 Composite Balls 28.50 342.00 35.90 430.80 36.50 438.00 NO BID 29.88 358.56 32.00 384.00 26.00 312.00 NO BID
45 Duffle bags/Red w/Athens Boys Basketball. 11.40 513.00 22.95 1,032.75 20.75 933.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID 9.95 447.75 NO BID
Numbers 10-55
3 Mark V Basketball 20 player Basketball Scorebooks 4.50 13.50 10.00 30.00 5.00 15.00 NO BID 4.75 14.25 NO BID 4.35 13.05 8.50 25.50
TOTAL 1,212.70 1,838.40 1,671.00 NO BID 440.51 460.00 934.80 185.35
Athens Girls Volleyball
16 SV-SN Gold Tachikara volleyballs 36.00 576.00 46.89 750.24 39.00 624.00 | 36.25 580.00 39.45 631.20 35.40 566.40 NO BID 43.95 703.20
1 Equipment Carrier 195.00 195.00 630.00 630.00 NO BID | 139.95 139.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
2 sets Porter Net Standards 1,942.50 3,885.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 Volleyball Net — for system 227.50 227.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
16 Red Aliso Hoody Jacket. Embroidery on left side 36.50 584.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Athens Volleyball (Black). Numbers 1-16 on Left Hip 29.75 476.00
6-Small. 6-Med. 4-Large
TOTAL 5,467.50 1,380.24 624.00 719.95 631.20 566.40 NO BID 703.20
Athens Wrestling
1 K72. The monester Mop 247.00 247.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
3 k72r Replacement Pads 46.00 138.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
12 E-41 Traditional cliff Keen Head Gear (Scarlet) 14.75 177.00 20.89 250.68 NOBID | 14.99 179.88 18.39 220.68 NO BID NO BID NO BID
3 SB-7 Cliff Keen Scorebook 5.00 15.00 6.49 19.47 NO BID 4.99 14.97 4.45 13.35 NO BID NO BID NO BID
12 PL-1950 Life Line Power Jump ropes 5.75 69.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 KCO001C Mat cleaner Ken clean Case/4 gallons 124.00 124.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
21 9042/9041 Holloway Ralley Jacket w/Jogger pant. 94.50 1,984.50 84.89 1,782.69 76.00 1,596.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID 65.00  1,365.00 NO BID

Scarlet and White. REDHAWKS (arched, white, linch,
Century Schoolbook font). ATHENS (white, 2 inch,
Century Schoolbook font over and underlined in black)
WRESTLING (reversed arched, white, 1 inch, Century
Schoolbook font) Embroidered on back of Rally Jacket
A =2%in. on left chest upper half on 45 degree angle
Vegas Gold bottom half on 45 degree angle Scarlet,




TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT

Bid 9428 Winter Athletic Equipment Dimmer-Warren Ent., I| Park Athletic Supply Forsport Pyramid School Prod{ Anaconda Sports, Inc. | Bill Fritz Sports Corp. Dee's Sport Shop Inc. Korney Board Aids, Inc.
UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
Qty. Description PRICE COST PRICE COST PRICE COST PRICE COST PRICE COST PRICE COST PRICE COST PRICE COST
outlined in white, Century Schoolbook font
Embroidered on front of Rally Jacket. 3-Small. 9-Med
6-Large. 2-XLarge. 1-XXL
16 S7917 Cliff Keen Custom Sublimated Team Singlet 56.70 907.20 73.48 1,175.68 NOBID | 79.95 1,279.20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Singlet Body-white, accent strip-scarlet. Trim-scarlett.
3-Small. 6-Medium. 4-Large. 2-XLarge. 1-XXL
20 Brute Lehigh Singlet. One color neck & arm. Athletic 44,90 898.00 53.89 1,077.80 NO BID | 59.95 1,199.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
gold w/red stripes. Front-ATHENS. Font = Courier
New, Color Red, 2 inches. Back - REDHAWKS,
Font=Courier New, Color Red, 1 ¥ inch vertical down
back. 3-Small. 8-Medium. 5-Large. 2-XLarge. 1-
XXLarge. 1-XXXLarge
TOTAL 4,559.70 4,306.32 1,596.00 2,673.05 234.03 NO BID 1,365.00 NO BID
Athens Swimming/Diving
4 pr Size F. ZRed Zoomers 28.50 114.00 34.89 139.56 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
9 pr Size G. ZRed Zoomers 28.50 256.50 34.89 314.01 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
5 pr Size H. ZRed Zoomers 28.50 142.50 34.89 174.45 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
48 pr #705896-006. Speedo Training Suits. 4=Size 28. 23.75 1,140.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
16=Size 30. 16=Size 32. 8=Size 34. 4= Size 36.
8 Blue. S101 Stretchcordz w/paddles NO BID 39.95 319.60 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
2 Blue S108 Stretchcordz Breaststroke NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
50 Adult #DS Pull Buoys. 25 Red. 25 Gold NO BID 7.49 374.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
24 pr HAN’s Paddles 6.95 166.80 6.99 167.76 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
12 pr HAN’s Gripper paddles 11.95 143.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
TOTAL
1,963.20 1,489.88 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Athens Gymnastics
1 416-098 TAC/10 Round-off pad 36”x54"x 1 3/8 250.00 250.00 240.00 240.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID 268.00 268.00 NO BID NO BID
1 416-663 SC-8.5 x 10 x 8 Skill Cushion 635.00 635.00 760.00 760.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID 697.00 697.00 NO BID NO BID
1 416-192 Sting Competition Landing Mat 1,965.00 1,965.00 575.00 575.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID 2,020.00 2,020.00 NO BID NO BID
TOTAL 2,850.00 1,575.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID 2,985.00 NO BID NO BID
Troy High Basketball
3 CDF-1 Coach Double Folder 20.50 61.50 25.00 75.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 19.00 57.00 21.95 65.85
2 DHTB Super heavy Triner Basketball 44.50 89.00 50.00 100.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 42.50 85.00
12 61-1059 Spaling Top Flite TF-1000 28.50 342.00 35.90 430.80 35.95 431.40 NO BID 29.88 358.56 32.00 384.00 26.00 312.00 35.00 420.00




TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT

Bid 9428 Winter Athletic Equipment Dimmer-Warren Ent., I| Park Athletic Supply Forsport Pyramid School Prod{ Anaconda Sports, Inc. | Bill Fritz Sports Corp. Dee's Sport Shop Inc. Korney Board Aids, Inc.
UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
Qty. Description PRICE COST PRICE COST PRICE COST PRICE COST PRICE COST PRICE COST PRICE COST PRICE COST
4 Mark V Scorebooks 4.50 18.00 10.00 40.00 5.00 20.00 NO BID 4.75 19.00 NO BID 4.35 17.40 8.50 34.00
1 Shotstat NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
15 BOA2000 10" Weighted Speed Rope NO BID 11.89 178.35 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 BRL KBA Ballistic Response Ladder 30” 68.50 68.50 75.00 75.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
2 SNR-60 Slipp Nott replacement pads 32.00 64.00 60.00 120.00 39.00 78.00 NO BID 33.85 67.70 38.00 76.00 NO BID 47.00 94.00
6 Classic Fox 40 Whistle 4.50 27.00 5.00 30.00 4.75 28.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 6.50 39.00
TOTAL 670.00 1,049.15 557.90 NO BID 445.26 460.00 386.40 737.85
Troy High Volleyball
3 TM-CAN. TN Net Antennae Collapsible 58.75 176.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
TOTAL 176.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Troy High Synchronized Swimming
2 #2263009 Sportline 240 Stop Watch (Blue & Green) NO BID NO BID NO BID 5.98 11.96 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
6 #04039828 Granite Plastic Clipboard NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
4 Four Figure markers Made NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
TOTAL NO BID NO BID NO BID 11.96 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Troy High Wrestling
12 CK Tornado headgear (Black, Purple, Black) 22.95 275.40 29.49 353.88 NOBID | 20.99 251.88 24.59 295.08 NO BID NO BID NO BID
2 Face Guard (Black) 37.95 75.90 44.89 89.78 NOBID | 38.99 77.98 39.75 79.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID
2 Hair Slicker (Black) 15.50 31.00 18.49 36.98 NOBID | 14.99 29.98 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
12 pr 0271 Brute Equalizer Kneepads (Black w/light color 23.85 286.20 22.89 274.68 NOBID | 19.99 239.88 20.99 251.88 NO BID NO BID NO BID
inside) 4-Medium. 4-Large. 4-XLarge.
6 MT3 Mat Transporter 31.5 x 26 104.00 624.00 114.89 689.34 NO BID | 119.95 719.70 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
2 ¢s WWMT4. Mat Tape 4” 118.50 237.00 205.00 410.00 NO BID | 117.36 234.72 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 BTDFS. S-50-55 LBS. Bulgarian Throwing Dummy NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 BTDFS. M-60-65 Ibs. Bulgarian Throwing Dummy NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
4 W343H. 2sided, tripod-mounted score clocks 17x16x16 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
4 2-50510-415 Manila Climbing Rope 18’ L. Ploy Boot 197.50 790.00 137.89 551.56 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
18x1%
24 7SJC. Adjustable Speed Rope (Jump Rope) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
TOTAL 2,319.50 2,406.22 NO BID 1,554.14 626.46 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Troy School District High Water Polo




TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT

Bid 9428 Winter Athletic Equipment Dimmer-Warren Ent., I| Park Athletic Supply Forsport Pyramid School Prod{ Anaconda Sports, Inc. | Bill Fritz Sports Corp. Dee's Sport Shop Inc. Korney Board Aids, Inc.
UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
Qty. Description PRICE COST PRICE COST PRICE COST PRICE COST PRICE COST PRICE COST PRICE COST PRICE COST
4 MIW500 Mikasa Mini Trainer Ball 6.75 27.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 10.00 40.00 6.00 24.00 NO BID
1 NESNPR. Sniper Water Plolo Shooting Sieve NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
12 MIW5500. Mikasa Premier Series Men’s Water Polo 24.20 290.40 NO BID NOBID | 19.99 239.88 NO BID 26.00 312.00 23.65 283.80 NO BID
Ball. Black
NO BID
6 MIW4000 Mikasa Men’s Heavyweight Ball. Black 24.20 145.20 NO BID NOBID | 17.85 107.10 NO BID 24.00 144.00 19.35 116.10
wi/yellow grooves
1 TCO008. Heavy Duty Ball Locker 235.00 235.00 269.75 269.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID 314.00 314.00 NO BID NO BID
3 SRWPS. S & R. Sport Official Water Polo Scorebook NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
TOTAL 697.60 269.75 NO BID 346.98 NO BID 810.00 423.90 NO BID
Troy High Men’s Swimming
6 Paragon Aquatics Track Start Competitor with Black NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Sand Top (Side Mount — Full Height)
15 Adult. Foam 1 Piece Pull Buoy NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
TOTAL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Boulan Park Middle School 8" Grade Volleyball
2 Whistles w/Lanyard 2.00 4.00 5.00 10.00 4.00 8.00 1.95 3.90 NO BID NO BID NO BID 3.00 6.00
2 Scorebooks 4.75 9.50 6.00 12.00 5.00 10.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
10 SV-5WSC. Tachikara Volleyballs — Purple 24.50 245.00 29.95 299.50 25.75 25750 | 24.25 242.50 25.99 259.90 28.40 284.00 NO BID 33.00 330.00
1 SV5WH Game Ball 36.10 36.10 39.95 39.95 30.25 30.25 | 33.15 33.15 33.85 33.85 36.00 36.00 NO BID 45.95 45.95
2 MIKBCH. Mikasa Collapsible Hammock Ball Cart 104.50 209.00 99.95 199.90 NO BID | 129.95 259.90 NO BID 107.00 214.00 NO BID NO BID
TOTAL 503.60 561.35 305.75 539.45 293.75 534.00 NO BID 381.95
Athens Boys Basketball 1,212.70 1,838.40 1,671.00 440.51 460.00 934.80 185.35
Athens Girls Volleyball 5,467.50 1,380.24 624.00 719.95 631.20 566.40 703.20
Athens Wrestling 4,559.70 4,306.32 1,596.00 2,673.05 234.03 1,365.00
Athens Swimming / Diving 1,963.20 1,489.88
Athens Gymnastics 2,850.00 1,575.00 2,985.00
Troy High Basketball 670.00 1,049.15 557.90 445.26 460.00 386.40 737.85
Troy High Volleyball 176.25
Troy High Synchronized Swimming 11.96
Troy High Wrestling 2,319.50 2,406.22 1,554.14 626.46
Troy High Water Polo| 697.60 269.75 346.98 810.00 423.90
Troy High Men's Swimming
Boulan Park Middle School 8th Grade Volleyball 503.60 561.35 305.75 539.45 293.75 534.00 381.35
20,420.05 14,876.31 4,754.65 5,845.53 2,671.21 5,815.40 3,110.10 2,007.75




TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT
Bid 9428 Winter Athletic Equipment

All American Wrestling Supply

UNIT TOTAL
Qty. Description PRICE COST
Athens Boys Basketball
3 10”x 14” CDF-1 Bball. Coaches Double Folder (KBA) NO BID
2 15 x 18 SNR-60. Slipp Nott Replacement Pad NO BID
15 Red/White Practice Jerseys w/numbers. 5-Medium. NO BID
10-Large. Numbers 1-15
12 Spaulding T-1000 Composite Balls NO BID
45 Duffle bags/Red w/Athens Boys Basketball. NO BID
Numbers 10-55
3 Mark V Basketball 20 player Basketball Scorebooks NO BID
TOTAL NO BID
Athens Girls Volleyball
16 SV-SN Gold Tachikara volleyballs NO BID
1 Equipment Carrier NO BID
2 sets Porter Net Standards NO BID
1 Volleyball Net — for system NO BID
16 Red Aliso Hoody Jacket. Embroidery on left side NO BID
Athens Volleyball (Black). Numbers 1-16 on Left Hip
6-Small. 6-Med. 4-Large
TOTAL NO BID
Athens Wrestling
1 K72. The monester Mop 139.00 139.00
3 k72r Replacement Pads NO BID
12 E-41 Traditional cliff Keen Head Gear (Scarlet) 19.00 228.00
3 SB-7 Cliff Keen Scorebook 5.50 16.50
12 PL-1950 Life Line Power Jump ropes NO BID
1 KC001C Mat cleaner Ken clean Case/4 gallons 125.00 125.00
21 9042/9041 Holloway Ralley Jacket w/Jogger pant. 80.00 1,680.00

Scarlet and White. REDHAWKS (arched, white, linch,
Century Schoolbook font). ATHENS (white, 2 inch,
Century Schoolbook font over and underlined in black)
WRESTLING (reversed arched, white, 1 inch, Century
Schoolbook font) Embroidered on back of Rally Jacket
A =2%in. on left chest upper half on 45 degree angle
Vegas Gold bottom half on 45 degree angle Scarlet,

Riddell Athletic Products - No Bid

Service Sports - No Response

Dollamur Sports Services - No Response
Sportmaster - No Response

Tri County Sports - No Response

Anthem Sports - No Response

Golden Eagle/All American - No Response



TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT
Bid 9428 Winter Athletic Equipment

All American Wrestling Supply

UNIT TOTAL
Qty. Description PRICE COST
outlined in white, Century Schoolbook font
Embroidered on front of Rally Jacket. 3-Small. 9-Med
6-Large. 2-XLarge. 1-XXL
16 S7917 Cliff Keen Custom Sublimated Team Singlet 70.00 1,120.00
Singlet Body-white, accent strip-scarlet. Trim-scarlett.
3-Small. 6-Medium. 4-Large. 2-XLarge. 1-XXL
20 Brute Lehigh Singlet. One color neck & arm. Athletic 60.00 1,200.00
gold w/red stripes. Front-ATHENS. Font = Courier
New, Color Red, 2 inches. Back - REDHAWKS,
Font=Courier New, Color Red, 1 ¥ inch vertical down
back. 3-Small. 8-Medium. 5-Large. 2-XLarge. 1-
XXLarge. 1-XXXLarge
TOTAL 4,508.50
Athens Swimming/Diving
4 pr SizeF.ZRed Zoomers NO BID
9 pr Size G. ZRed Zoomers NO BID
5 pr Size H. ZRed Zoomers NO BID
48 pr #705896-006. Speedo Training Suits. 4=Size 28. NO BID
16=Size 30. 16=Size 32. 8=Size 34. 4= Size 36.
8 Blue. S101 Stretchcordz w/paddles NO BID
2 Blue S108 Stretchcordz Breaststroke NO BID
50 Adult #DS Pull Buoys. 25 Red. 25 Gold NO BID
24  pr HAN’s Paddles NO BID
12 pr HAN’s Gripper paddles NO BID
TOTAL
NO BID
Athens Gymnastics
1 416-098 TAC/10 Round-off pad 36”x54”x 1 3/8 NO BID
1 416-663 SC-8.5 x 10 x 8 Skill Cushion NO BID
1 416-192 Sting Competition Landing Mat NO BID
TOTAL NO BID
Troy High Basketball
3 CDF-1 Coach Double Folder NO BID
2 DHTB Super heavy Triner Basketball NO BID
12 61-1059 Spaling Top Flite TF-1000 NO BID




TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT
Bid 9428 Winter Athletic Equipment

All American Wrestling Supply

UNIT TOTAL
Qty. Description PRICE COST
4 Mark V Scorebooks NO BID
1 Shotstat NO BID
15 BOA2000 10" Weighted Speed Rope NO BID
1 BRL KBA Ballistic Response Ladder 30" NO BID
2 SNR-60 Slipp Nott replacement pads NO BID
6 Classic Fox 40 Whistle NO BID
TOTAL NO BID
Troy High Volleyball
3 TM-CAN. TN Net Antennae Collapsible NO BID
TOTAL NO BID
Troy High Synchronized Swimming
2 #2263009 Sportline 240 Stop Watch (Blue & Green) NO BID
6 #04039828 Granite Plastic Clipboard NO BID
4 Four Figure markers Made NO BID
TOTAL NO BID
Troy High Wrestling
12 CK Tornado headgear (Black, Purple, Black) 29.00 348.00
2 Face Guard (Black) 45.00 90.00
2 Hair Slicker (Black) 15.00 30.00
12 pr 0271 Brute Equalizer Kneepads (Black w/light color NO BID
inside) 4-Medium. 4-Large. 4-XLarge.
6 MT3 Mat Transporter 31.5 x 26 115.00 690.00
2 ¢ WWMTA4. Mat Tape 4” 105.00 210.00
1 BTDFS. S-50-55 LBS. Bulgarian Throwing Dummy 565.00 565.00
1 BTDFS. M-60-65 Ibs. Bulgarian Throwing Dummy 605.00 605.00
4 W343H. 2sided, tripod-mounted score clocks 17x16x16 NO BID
4 2-50510-415 Manila Climbing Rope 18’ L. Ploy Boot NO BID
18x1%
24 7SJC. Adjustable Speed Rope (Jump Rope) NO BID
TOTAL 2,538.00

Troy School District High Water Polo




TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT
Bid 9428 Winter Athletic Equipment

All American Wrestling Supply

UNIT TOTAL
Qty. Description PRICE COST
4 MIW500 Mikasa Mini Trainer Ball NO BID
1 NESNPR. Sniper Water Plolo Shooting Sieve NO BID
12 MIW5500. Mikasa Premier Series Men’s Water Polo NO BID
Ball. Black
NO BID
6 MIW4000 Mikasa Men’s Heavyweight Ball. Black
wi/yellow grooves
1 TC008. Heavy Duty Ball Locker NO BID
3 SRWPS. S & R. Sport Official Water Polo Scorebook NO BID
TOTAL NO BID
Troy High Men’s Swimming
6 Paragon Aquatics Track Start Competitor with Black NO BID
Sand Top (Side Mount — Full Height)
15 Adult. Foam 1 Piece Pull Buoy NO BID
TOTAL NO BID
Boulan Park Middle School 8" Grade Volleyball
2 Whistles w/Lanyard NO BID
2 Scorebooks NO BID
10 SV-5WSC. Tachikara Volleyballs — Purple NO BID
1 SV5WH Game Ball NO BID
2 MIKBCH. Mikasa Collapsible Hammock Ball Cart NO BID
TOTAL NO BID
Athens Boys Basketball
Athens Girls Volleyball
Athens Wrestling 4,508.50
Athens Swimming / Diving
Athens Gymnastics
Troy High Basketball
Troy High Volleyball
Troy High Synchronized Swimming 2,538.00

Troy High Wrestling

Troy High Water Polo

Troy High Men's Swimming

Boulan Park Middle School 8th Grade Volleyball

7,046.50




