REQUEST FOR
QUOTATION
No. 9427 TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT
DUE DATE NO LATER THAN 1140 RANKIN, TROY, MICHIGAN 48083
7-11-07 3pm. 248-823-4052
FAX: 248-823-4077

REQUISITION

DATE 6-27-07

REQUEST FOR QUOTE — NOT AN ORDER

THIS FORM MUST BE UTILIZED WHEN RESPONDING TO THIS REQUEST
BID ENVELOPE ENCLOSED

THE RFQ NUMBER MUST APPEAR ON ALL QUOTATIONS AND RELATED CORRESPONDENCE, THIS IS NOT AN ORDER

Quantity DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
Please supply us with your bid to furnish the Troy School District with TRAINING
SUPPLIES for Athens High School and Troy High School per the attached specifications.
Copies of the bid are available at:
www.troy.k12.mi.us/purchasing/items_out for_bid.htm
Bid recaps will be available at:
troy.k12.mi.us/purchasing/index.htm
FACSIMILE BID IS NOT ACCEPTABLE

Bids will not be accepted if submitted after the deadline specified (local time) in the advertisement to bid or in the information to

bidders. The late submission of a bid makes the bid nonrepsonsive and is a material defect which shall not be waived by the

Board of Education. Delays in the mail will not be considered. All Late bids in the mail will be returned to the bidder unopened.

Proposal for the submission of alternatives by vendors will be accepted and reviewed. However, if any substitution or departure

is not clearly noted and described, it will be understood that the bid intends to exactly meet the specifications.

The Board of Education shall be the sole judge as to whether the proposed goods are “equal” or “approved”. Quotations must

be mailed or delivered to the Purchasing Office, 1140 Rankin, Troy, MI 48083 no later than 3 p.m. on the date shown above.

Michigan State Sales and Use Taxes and Federal Excise Taxes do not apply unless otherwise indicated. Exemption certificates

will be furnished when necessary. This request imposes no obligations on the buyer. The Board of Education reserves the right

to accept or reject any or all bids or to split awards by items or to accept bids, which will best serve the Board of Education.

THIS AREA MUST BE FILLED IN
TELEPHONE

DELIVERY TIME PRICES FIRM FOR NAME OF COMPANY NO.
TERMS NO. & STREET FAX #

ALL DELIVERY CHARGES
FOB MUST CITY, STATE & ZIP CODE E-MAIL
DELIVERED BE INCLUDED IN PRICES SHOWN
CONTACT PERSON (PLEASE PRINT) SIGNATURE DATE




AFFIDAVIT OF BIDDER

The undersigned, the owner or authorized officer of (the
“Bidder), pursuant to the familial disclosure requirement provided in the
(the “School District”) advertisement for construction bids, hereby represent and warrant except
as provided below, that no familial relationships exist between the over(s) or any employee of

and any member of the Board of Education of the School
District or the Superintendent of the School District.

List any Familial Relationships:

BIDDER:
By:
Its:
STATE OF MICHIGAN )
COUNTY OF ))SS'
This instrument was acknowledged before meonthe _ day of , 2007, by

, Notary Public

County, Michigan

My Commission Expires:

Acting in the County of:



6/27/2007

TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT
TRAINING SUPPLIES BID 2007-08

DEPT. ATHENS HIGH TRAINING ROOM SUPPLIES

32044M | COACH ATHLETIC TAPE 1% X 15 YDS 50 CASES
32005M | ZONAS POROUS TAPE 1 X 10 YDS 4 BOXES
32007M | ELASTICON ELASTIC TAPE1 X 22 YD 4 BOXES
84410 AC TAPE 2 X5YDS 10 CASES
94722 PROS CHOICE ATHLETIC STRETCH TAPE2 X 7% | 20 CASES
85580 LEUKOTAPE P 1%2 X 15 YDS 1 CASE
35140 COVER-ROLL 2 X 10 YDS 30 ROLLS
92120 PRO-TRAINER FOAM UNDERWRAP 8 CASES
63555 HEEL & LACE PADS 3 X 3 4 BOXES
5594-83 | WATERPROOF TAPE 1”7 X 10 YDS 1 BOX
12445 BENZOIN TINCTURE 1BOX
72231 JC-4 TRAINERS PRE TAPE 12 CANS
12170C | Q.D.A 2CS
59160 SKIN LUBES5 LB 2 JARS
17470 TAPING BLOCK 3

27506 MEDI RIP 6 BOXES
032027 | CO-FLEX 3 X5YDS 3 BOXES
28003M | ECONO-WRAP 3 X 4% YDS 4 DOZ
28004M | ECONO-WRAP 4 X 4% YDS 6 DOZ
28011M | ECONO-WRAP 6 X 4% YDS 6 DOZ
36330 ECONO-WRAP 6 X 10 YDS 6 DOZ
25027 FLEXICON NON STERILE 3 X 4.1 YDS 4 BOXES




6/27/2007

30003M | MULTI-TRAUMA DRESSING 4

29010M | NON ADHERENT PADS 3 X 4 4 BOXES

35650 2P SKIN 1” SQUARES 4 JARS

21007M | BAND AID SHEER STRIPS % 8 BOXES

21008M | BAND AID SHEER STRIPS 1” 8 BOXES

69575 NEW-SKIN LIQUID BANDAGE 1 0Z 6 BTLS

22204M | BAND AID FLEX-FABRIC KNUCKLE 6 BOXES

34007M | POVIDONE-IONDINE SWABSTICKS 1 BOX

34005M | ALCOHOL PREP PADS BX — 100 1 BOX

21100 DISPENSER BOTTLES 40 OZ 10

36040 | WATERJEL TRIPLE ANTIBIOTIC 1/32 0Z 3 BOXES
PACKETS

36009M | J&J FIRST AID CREAM 1% OZ 60

00036 BACTINE 40Z 60

65230 STIPTIK SWABPOULES 4 BOXES

36026M | HYDROCORTIZONE CREAM 1% 1.5GM 2 BOXES

68570 CALADRYL CLEAR 60Z 12BTL

68450 MEDICAINE INSECT BITE SWABS 3 BOXES

56791M | BODY ARMOR SUNSCREEN TOWELETTES 2 BOXES

54036M | VIONEX TOWELETTES 50/BX 4 BOXES

54057M | ISO-QUIN 4QTS/BX 5 BOXES

36074M | FLEX-ALL 454 MAX STRENTH 7LB 1

52770 SAVE-A-TOOTH 2

70685 CONTACT LENS CASE 6

66655 SENSITIVE EYES SALINE SOL. 40Z 48 BTLS




6/27/2007

ééZOOOM DISPOSABLE EYE CUPS 12BXS/CASE 1 CASE
46022M | APAP XTRA-STRENGTH 500 2 BOXES
46057M | IPRIN 500 4 BOXES
46061 M | DIOTAME TABLETS 500 2 BOXES
43038 DIAMODE 100 1 BOX
35007M | MEDI-LYTE 500 4 BOXES
38460 DEXTROTABS 1000 2 JARS
73720 PLAYMATE ELITE 16 QUART 4

29510C | INSTANT COLD PACKS 4 BOXES
47052M | ICE BAGS 9% X 18 1500/ROLL 3

23627 ICE BAG DISPENSER 1
47007M | COLD SPRAY 40Z 4

48820 HOT PACKS 4

48940 HOT PACK COVERS STANDARD 6

72001C | DURA-STICK Il REUSABLE 2” ELECTRODES 1 BOX
72003C | DURA STICK Il REUSABLE ELECTRODES 2X2 1 BOX
91035 EX BANDS ORANGE 50 FT 2

91036 EX BANDS GREEN 50 FT 2

91037 EX BANDS BLUE 50 FT 2

91038 EX BANDS PLUM 59 FT 2
5570-43 | MEDIC-KIT 5 BPKIJ 1

12273 STETHOSCOPE 1

20312 RI MINI OTOSCOPE/OPHTHALMOSCOPE 1

88110

TUNING FORK C256




6/27/2007

48012 HI-INTENSITY PEN LITES 6 PK 2
21021 ADJUSTABLE STOOL 2
19473 ANSELL MICRO-TOUCH NITRILE MED GLOVES 6 BOXES
19474 ANSELL MICRO-TOUCH NITRILE LARGE 1 BOX
GLOVES
21450 POLY JARS & SCREW LIDS 80Z 12
65610 ACCLAIM FACIAL TISSUE 1 CASE
18771M | SIMPLE GREEN GALLON 3
40405 PRECISE DISINFECTANT CAN 20 OZ 12
40084 BIOHAZARD BAGS 24 X 24 2 CASES
75720 PRO TRAINER SCISSORS 8” 12 PR
72111 HEAVY DUTY BANDAGE SHEERS 8 PR
48030M | PARA MEDIC SHEARS 15 PR
B
75360 NAIL DRILL 1
48009M | RING CUTTER 1
833256 | STAINLESS STEEL INSTURMENT TRAY 1
12600 ROSIN MIXTURE 4.5 0Z 4
17332 REG. NO-GLARE STIPS 144 3
17440 SUN GLARE STICK .150Z
19820 AT SOFT-SIDED KIT EMPTY 3
19260 TUFF KIT EMPTY 6
51001M | CPR MICROSHIELD REG 12
16380 ARM SLING MEDIUM 10
16400 ARM SLING LARGE 10




6/27/2007

30001M | TRIANGULAR BANDAGE 24

00351 RAPD FORM VACUUM ARM SPLINT 1

39500 STAX FINGER SPLING ASSORT 1

40116 FOAM CERVICAL COLLAR MEDIUM 4

40117 FOAM CERVICAL COLLAR LARGE 4

76425 ONE-STEP SPLINTS 4 X 15 2 BOXES
70770 CRUTCHES 507-62” 4 PR
70771 CRUTCHES 42”-54” 4 PR
63507 SUPER FOAM Y% 3 SHTS
63506 SUPER FOAM 3/8 3 SHTS
00300 MOLESKIN 2X25YD 6 ROLLS
60600 FELT HORSESHOE PADS 10/PK 3

63200 FOAM PADS 1/8 100/PK 3

47060 NOSE GUARD 2




6/27/2007

TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT
TRAINING SUPPLIES BID 2007-08

DEPT. TROY HIGH TRAINING ROOM SUPPLIES

32044M | COACH ATHLETIC TAPE 1% X 15 YDS 50 CASES
32005M | ZONAS POROUS TAPE 1 X 10 YDS 4 BOXES
32007M | ELASTICON ELASTIC TAPE1 X 22 YD 4 BOXES
84410 AC TAPE 2 X5YDS 10 CASES
94722 PROS CHOICE ATHLETIC STRETCH TAPE2 X 7% | 20 CASES
85580 LEUKOTAPE P 1%2 X 15 YDS 1 CASE
35140 COVER-ROLL 2 X 10 YDS 30 ROLLS
92120 PRO-TRAINER FOAM UNDERWRAP 8 CASES
63555 HEEL & LACE PADS 3 X 3 4 BOXES
5594-83 | WATERPROOF TAPE 1”7 X 10 YDS 1 BOX
12445 BENZOIN TINCTURE 1BOX
72231 JC-4 TRAINERS PRE TAPE 12 CANS
12170C | Q.D.A 2CS
59160 SKIN LUBES5 LB 2 JARS
17470 TAPING BLOCK 3

27506 MEDI RIP 6 BOXES
032027 | CO-FLEX 3 X5YDS 3 BOXES
28003M | ECONO-WRAP 3 X 4% YDS 4 DOZ
28004M | ECONO-WRAP 4 X 4% YDS 6 DOZ
28011M | ECONO-WRAP 6 X 4% YDS 6 DOZ
36330 ECONO-WRAP 6 X 10 YDS 6 DOZ
25027 FLEXICON NON STERILE 3 X 4.1 YDS 4 BOXES




6/27/2007

30003M | MULTI-TRAUMA DRESSING 4

29010M | NON ADHERENT PADS 3 X 4 4 BOXES

35650 2P SKIN 1” SQUARES 4 JARS

21007M | BAND AID SHEER STRIPS % 8 BOXES

21008M | BAND AID SHEER STRIPS 1” 8 BOXES

69575 NEW-SKIN LIQUID BANDAGE 1 0Z 6 BTLS

22204M | BAND AID FLEX-FABRIC KNUCKLE 6 BOXES

34007M | POVIDONE-IONDINE SWABSTICKS 1 BOX

34005M | ALCOHOL PREP PADS BX — 100 1 BOX

21100 DISPENSER BOTTLES 40 OZ 10

36040 | WATERJEL TRIPLE ANTIBIOTIC 1/32 0Z 3 BOXES
PACKETS

36009M | J&J FIRST AID CREAM 1% OZ 60

00036 BACTINE 40Z 60

65230 STIPTIK SWABPOULES 4 BOXES

36026M | HYDROCORTIZONE CREAM 1% 1.5GM 2 BOXES

68570 CALADRYL CLEAR 60Z 12BTL

68450 MEDICAINE INSECT BITE SWABS 3 BOXES

56791M | BODY ARMOR SUNSCREEN TOWELETTES 2 BOXES

54036M | VIONEX TOWELETTES 50/BX 4 BOXES

54057M | ISO-QUIN 4QTS/BX 5 BOXES

36074M | FLEX-ALL 454 MAX STRENTH 7LB 1

52770 SAVE-A-TOOTH 2

70685 CONTACT LENS CASE 6

66655 SENSITIVE EYES SALINE SOL. 40Z 48 BTLS




6/27/2007

ééZOOOM DISPOSABLE EYE CUPS 12BXS/CASE 1 CASE
46022M | APAP XTRA-STRENGTH 500 2 BOXES
46057M | IPRIN 500 4 BOXES
46061 M | DIOTAME TABLETS 500 2 BOXES
43038 DIAMODE 100 1 BOX
35007M | MEDI-LYTE 500 4 BOXES
38460 DEXTROTABS 1000 2 JARS
73720 PLAYMATE ELITE 16 QUART 4

29510C | INSTANT COLD PACKS 4 BOXES
47052M | ICE BAGS 9% X 18 1500/ROLL 3

23627 ICE BAG DISPENSER 1
47007M | COLD SPRAY 40Z 4

48820 HOT PACKS 4

48940 HOT PACK COVERS STANDARD 6

72001C | DURA-STICK Il REUSABLE 2” ELECTRODES 1 BOX
72003C | DURA STICK Il REUSABLE ELECTRODES 2X2 1 BOX
91035 EX BANDS ORANGE 50 FT 2

91036 EX BANDS GREEN 50 FT 2

91037 EX BANDS BLUE 50 FT 2

91038 EX BANDS PLUM 59 FT 2
5570-43 | MEDIC-KIT 5 BPKIJ 1

12273 STETHOSCOPE 1

20312 RI MINI OTOSCOPE/OPHTHALMOSCOPE 1

88110

TUNING FORK C256




6/27/2007

48012 HI-INTENSITY PEN LITES 6 PK 2
21021 ADJUSTABLE STOOL 2
19473 ANSELL MICRO-TOUCH NITRILE MED GLOVES 6 BOXES
19474 ANSELL MICRO-TOUCH NITRILE LARGE 1 BOX
GLOVES
21450 POLY JARS & SCREW LIDS 80Z 12
65610 ACCLAIM FACIAL TISSUE 1 CASE
18771M | SIMPLE GREEN GALLON 3
40405 PRECISE DISINFECTANT CAN 20 OZ 12
40084 BIOHAZARD BAGS 24 X 24 2 CASES
75720 PRO TRAINER SCISSORS 8” 12 PR
72111 HEAVY DUTY BANDAGE SHEERS 8 PR
48030M | PARA MEDIC SHEARS 15 PR
B
75360 NAIL DRILL 1
48009M | RING CUTTER 1
833256 | STAINLESS STEEL INSTURMENT TRAY 1
12600 ROSIN MIXTURE 4.5 0Z 4
17332 REG. NO-GLARE STIPS 144 3
17440 SUN GLARE STICK .150Z
19820 AT SOFT-SIDED KIT EMPTY 3
19260 TUFF KIT EMPTY 6
51001M | CPR MICROSHIELD REG 12
16380 ARM SLING MEDIUM 10
16400 ARM SLING LARGE 10




6/27/2007

30001M | TRIANGULAR BANDAGE 24

00351 RAPD FORM VACUUM ARM SPLINT 1

39500 STAX FINGER SPLING ASSORT 1

40116 FOAM CERVICAL COLLAR MEDIUM 4

40117 FOAM CERVICAL COLLAR LARGE 4

76425 ONE-STEP SPLINTS 4 X 15 2 BOXES
70770 CRUTCHES 507-62” 4 PR
70771 CRUTCHES 42”-54” 4 PR
63507 SUPER FOAM Y% 3 SHTS
63506 SUPER FOAM 3/8 3 SHTS
00300 MOLESKIN 2X25YD 6 ROLLS
60600 FELT HORSESHOE PADS 10/PK 3

63200 FOAM PADS 1/8 100/PK 3

47060 NOSE GUARD 2




TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT
Bid 9427 Training Supplies Athens/Troy

Qty Dept. Description United Health Supplies MFASCo Health & Safety J and B Medical Supply Inc.
Athens High School
50 cs 32044M COACH ATHLETIC TAPE 1% X 15 YDS J&J5188 32/cs  34.18 1,709.00 | 1060 36.80 1,840.00 35.97 1,798.50
4 bx 32005M ZONAS POROUS TAPE 1 X 10 YDS J&J5104 12/bx  8.70 34.80 | 1120 9.40 37.60 11.28 45.12
4 bx 32007M ELASTICON ELASTIC TAPE 1 X 2% YD 5172 12/bx 12.50 50.00 NO BID 13.53 54.12
10 cs 84410 AC TAPE 2 X5 YDS 24/cs 31.95 319.50 NO BID 36.14 361.40
20 c¢s 94722 PROS CHOICE ATHLETIC STRETCH TAPE 2 X |24/cs 36.95 739.00 NO BID 38.78 775.60
1 cs 85580 LEUKOTAPE P 1% X 15 YDS 30/cs 166.50 166.50 NO BID 212.58 212.58
30 rolls 35140 COVER-ROLL 2 X 10 YDS 6.85 205.50 NO BID 9.08 272.40
8 s 92120 PRO-TRAINER FOAM UNDERWRAP Mueller 48/cs 22.40 179.20 NO BID 30.95 247.60
4 bx 63555 HEEL & LACE PADS 3 X 3 Mueller 2000/bx ~ 11.80 47.20 | Cramer 1077 20.00 80.00 16.25 65.00
1 bx  5594-83 WATERPROOF TAPE 1” X 10 YDS J & J 12/bx 19.95 19.95 NO BID 24.28 24.28
1 bx 12445 BENZOIN TINCTURE NO BID NO BID 20.15 20.15
12 cans 72231 JC-4 TRAINERS PRE TAPE NO BID NO BID NO BID
2 ¢s 12170C Q.D.A Mueller 10 oz. 54.00 108.00 | 8 oz. 1088 88.56 177.12 85.00 170.00
2 jars 59160 SKIN LUBE 5 LB Mueller 15.50 31.00 NO BID 24.87 49.74
3 17470 TAPING BLOCK Econolinee 10.95 32.85 NO BID 13.74 41.22
6 bx 27506 MEDI RIP 2"x5yd 12/bx 17.70 106.20 | 2" 5235 18.25 109.50 21.07 126.42
3 bx 32027 CO-FLEX 3 X5 YDS 24/bx 37.90 113.70 | 5033 33.00 99.00 37.03 111.09
4  dz 28003M ECONO-WRAP 3 X 4% YDS Elastex 10/bx 3.60 14.40 | 7200 - .42 ea. 5.04 20.16 | 10/pk- 6pkics 5.76 23.04
A48 ea
6 dz 28004M ECONO-WRAP 4 X 4% YDS Elastex 10/bx 4.60 27.60 | 7210 - .55 ea. 6.60 39.60 | 10/pk 6/pk/c: 7.68 46.08
.64 ea
6 dz 28011M ECONO-WRAP 6 X 4% YDS Elastex 10/bx 6.20 37.20 | 7220 .93 ea 11.16 66.96 | 10/pk 6 pk/cs 13.32 79.92
1.11lea
6 dz 36330 ECONO-WRAP 6 X 10 YDS Elastex 10/bx 18.00 108.00 | 7195 2.29 ea. 27.48 164.88 | 6 pk/cs 2.44 e: 29.28 175.68
4 bx 25027 FLEXICON NON STERILE 3 X 4.1 YDS 12/pkg 3.70 14.80 | 3356 5.13 20.52 3.76 15.04
4 30003M MULTI-TRAUMA DRESSING 10" x 30" 1.30 5.20 | 5340 1.00 4.00 1.92 7.68
4 bx 29010M NON ADHERENT PADS 3 X 4 Swift 100/pkg 5.30 21.20 | 5615 5.27 21.08 6.95 27.80
4 jars 35650 2ND SKIN 1” SQUARES 200/jar 18.30 73.20 | 7835 Skin on 18.76 75.04 24.16 96.64
skin (200) 1" squares
8 bx  21007M BAND AID SHEER STRIPS ¥ Dynarex 3601 1.09 8.72 | 1966 121 9.68 | Nutramax 2.72 21.76
8 bx  21008M BAND AID SHEER STRIPS 1” Dynarex 3602 1.19 9.52 | 1967 1.45 11.60 | Nutramax 2.94 23.52
6 btls 69575 NEW-SKIN LIQUID BANDAGE 1 0Z 3.85 23.10 NO BID 4.97 29.82
6 btls 22204M BAND AID FLEX-FABRIC KNUCKLE Dynarex 100/bx 2.90 17.40 | 1988 2.82 16.92 | Nutramax 5.95 35.70
1 bx 34007M POVIDONE-IONDINE SWABSTICKS 50/ 3.95 3.95 [ 7935 4.23 423 6.14 6.14
1 bx 34005M ALCOHOL PREP PADS BX — 100 0.89 0.89 | 1305 1.75 1.75 1.94 1.94
10 21100 DISPENSER BOTTLES 40 OZ NO BID NO BID NO BID
36040 WATERJEL TRIPLE ANTIBIOTIC 1/32 0Z Swift 144/bx
3 bx PACKETS 7.95 23.85 | 7605 14.25 42.75 Fougera 20.59 61.77
60 36009M J&J FIRST AID CREAM 1% OZ 2.35 141.00 | 3330 1.28 76.80 3.01 180.60
60 36 BACTINE 40z 3.60 216.00 | 1592 - 5 0z 5.62 337.20 4.46 267.60
4 bx 65230 STIPTIK SWABPOULES 25 pkg. 29.50 118.00 NO BID 39.59 158.36
2 bx 36026M HYDROCORTIZONE CREAM 1% 1.5GM 40/bx 5.75 11.50 | 4078 9.31 18.62 5.92 11.84
12 btls 68570 CALADRYL CLEAR 60Z 4.50 54.00 NO BID 5.57 66.84
3 bx 68450 MEDICAINE INSECT BITE SWABS Sting Kill 10/bx 1.68 5.04 NO BID 3.18 9.54
56791M BODY ARMOR SUNSCREEN TOWELETTES  [Sun-x Spf30 25/bx
2 bx 7.50 15.00 NO BID NO BID
4 bx 54036M VIONEX TOWELETTES 50/BX 6.70 26.80 | 8060 6.58 26.32 8.04 32.16
5 bx  54057M ISO-QUIN 4QTS/BX gallon 26.50 132.50 | 1078 25.76 128.80 NO BID
1 36074M FLEX-ALL 454 MAX STRENTH 7LB 61.90 61.90 NO BID 80.40 80.40
2 52770 SAVE-A-TOOTH E.M.T. 10.80 21.60 | 6302 10.67 21.34 12.25 24.50
6 70685 CONTACT LENS CASE 2.25 13.50 | 6390 121 7.26 2.96 17.76
48 Dtls 66655 SENSITIVE EYES SALINE SOL. 40Z 12 oz. 1.70 81.60 NOBID | 12 0z 3.57 171.36
42000MC DISPOSABLE EYE CUPS 12BXS/CASE N/X 12/pkg
1 cs 2.16 2.16 | 3085 12/pkg 1.71 171 148.11 148.11
46022M APAP XTRA-STRENGTH 500 Aminofex Max
2 bx 250 9.50 19.00 | 1038 10.45 20.90 12.92 25.84
4 bx  46057M IPRIN 500 250 15.95 63.80 | 3095 12.68 50.72 18.50 74.00
2 bx 46061 M DIOTAME TABLETS 500 250 28.95 57.90 | 2525 23.63 47.26 34.00 68.00
1  bx 43038 DIAMODE 100 17.95 17.95 | 2558 13.97 13.97 19.96 19.96
4 bx 35007M MEDI-LYTE 500 Electrolyte 250 9.50 38.00 | 5840 10.52 42.08 16.05 64.20
2 jars 38460 DEXTROTABS 1000 25.90 51.80 NO BID 28.80 57.60
4 73720 PLAYMATE ELITE 16 QUART NO BID NO BID NO BID
29510C INSTANT COLD PACKS TOTAL
Resources
4 bx 4"x6/1/2" 16/cs 5.90 23.60 | 2211 Reg 24/cs  9.50 38.00 11.79 47.16
3 47052M ICE BAGS 9 % X 18 1500/ROLL Mueller 46.50 139.50 | 1109 62.64 187.92 70.00 210.00
1 23627 ICE BAG DISPENSER Mueller 13.50 13.50 NO BID 28.00 28.00
4 47007M COLD SPRAY 40Z Mueller 3.50 14.00 | 2245 1.84 7.36 3.95 15.80
48820 HOT PACKS Chattanoga 10" x
4 12" 7.70 30.80 NO BID 10.14 40.56
6 48940 HOT PACK COVERS STANDARD Chattanooga 9.80 58.80 NO BID 22.50 135.00
1 bx 72001C DURA-STICK Il REUSABLE 2” ELECTRODES |4/pkg 3.90 3.90 NO BID 47.79 47.79
1 bx 72003C DURA STICK Il REUSABLE ELECTRODES 2X2|4/pkg 3.90 3.90 NO BID 47.79 47.79
2 91035 EX BANDS ORANGE 50 FT Rolyan - yds 46.50 93.00 NO BID | Risistaband 39.76 79.52
2 91036 EX BANDS GREEN 50 FT Roylan - yds 54.95 109.90 NO BID | Risistaband 48.87 97.74
2 91037 EX BANDS BLUE 50 FT Roylan - yds 58.50 117.00 NO BID | Risistaband 59.17 118.34
2 91038 EX BANDS PLUM 59 FT Roylan-50yds  64.50 129.00 NO BID | Risistaband 67.97 135.94
1 5570-43 MEDIC-KIT 5 BPKIJ Complete 112.90 112.90 NO BID NO BID
1 12273 STETHOSCOPE Nurse Mabis 3.45 3.45 | 7096 Nurses 421 421 11.87 11.87
1 20312 Rl MINI OTOSCOPE/OPHTHALMOSCOPE #312 195.00 195.00 NO BID NO BID
2 88110 TUNING FORK C256 5.90 11.80 NO BID 7.43 14.86
2 48012 HI-INTENSITY PEN LITES 6 PK Adlite 4.30 8.60 NO BID 7.35 14.70
2 21021 ADJUSTABLE STOOL Grafco 64.00 128.00 NO BID 96.29 192.58
19473 ANSELL MICRO-TOUCH NITRILE MED Powdered -
6 bx GLOVES Uniseal 4.70 28.20 NO BID 7.35 44.10
1 bx 19474 ANSELL MICRO-TOUCH NITRILE LARGE Powdered - 4.70 4.70 NO BID 7.35 7.35
12 21450 POLY JARS & SCREW LIDS 80z 1.09 13.08 NO BID NO BID
65610 ACCLAIM FACIAL TISSUE Tulip 100/bx -
1cs 30/bx/cs 15.95 15.95 NO BID 27.47 27.47




TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT
Bid 9427 Training Supplies Athens/Troy

Qty Dept. Description United Health Supplies MFASCo Health & Safety J and B Medical Supply Inc.
3 18771M SIMPLE GREEN GALLON NO BID NO BID NO BID

12 40405 PRECISE DISINFECTANT CAN 20 OZ 4.40 52.80 4.69 56.28 7.15 85.80

40084 BIOHAZARD BAGS 24 X 24 1000/cs- 50/rl -
2cs 20/cs 38.00 76.00 | (1000) 66.98 133.96 | 12 microns 3.09 6.18
24" x 24" 10 gal.

12 pr 75720 PRO TRAINER SCISSORS 8” 3.30 39.60 NO BID NO BID

8 pr 72111 HEAVY DUTY BANDAGE SHEERS 8-1/4" 2.95 23.60 NO BID 5.50 44.00
Athens High School - Continued
48030MB PARA MEDIC SHEARS 7-1/4"

15 1.35 20.25 | 4382 1.50 22.50 1.65 24.75
1 75360 NAIL DRILL NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 48009M RING CUTTER 6.40 6.40 | 4225 6.76 6.76 4.43 443

833256 STAINLESS STEEL INSTURMENT TRAY Mabis 10" x 6-
1 1/2" x 3" 8.95 8.95 NO BID 48.00 48.00
4 12600 ROSIN MIXTURE 4.5 0Z Cramer 4.95 19.80 NO BID 6.11 24.44
3 17332 REG. NO-GLARE STIPS 144 8.40 25.20 NO BID 10.75 32.25
75 oz 17440 SUN GLARE STICK each 4.75 4.75 NO BID each 3.24 3.24
19820 AT SOFT-SIDED KIT EMPTY Mueller 21" x
3 10" x 12" 65.50 196.50 NO BID 75.00 225.00
19260 TUFF KIT EMPTY 16-1/2" x 7-1/4"
X 7-1/2" Medi kit
6 39.50 237.00 NO BID NO BID

12 51001M CPR MICROSHIELD REG 4.05 48.60 | 5890 4.19 50.28 6.30 75.60

10 16380 ARM SLING MEDIUM Bell Horn 2.00 20.00 NO BID 291 29.10

10 16400 ARM SLING LARGE Bell Horn 2.00 20.00 NO BID 3.27 32.70

24 30001M TRIANGULAR BANDAGE 40" 0.22 5.28 | 7600 0.30 7.20 0.38 9.12
1 351 RAPD FORM VACUUM ARM SPLINT 134.50 134.50 NO BID 140.00 140.00
1 39500 STAX FINGER SPLING ASSORT 30/bx 28.50 28.50 NO BID 82.00 82.00
4 40116 FOAM CERVICAL COLLAR MEDIUM 3.25 13.00 NO BID 5.63 22.52
4 40117 FOAM CERVICAL COLLAR LARGE 3.25 13.00 NO BID 6.14 24.56
2 bx 76425 ONE-STEP SPLINTS 4 X 15 NO BID NO BID | 5/bx 10/cs 57.71 115.42
4 pr 70770 CRUTCHES 50”-62” Frafco 11.95 47.80 NO BID 14.50 58.00
4 pr 70771 CRUTCHES 42”-54” Grafco 11.95 47.80 NO BID 14.07 56.28

63507 SUPER FOAM Y4 1/4 x 21 x 36"
Econoline 29120
3 shts 25.50 76.50 NO BID | Non-Aol 33.11 99.33
Aol $34.00 = $102.00
63506 SUPER FOAM 3/8 3/8 x 21 x 36"
3 shts Econline 29119 32.40 97.20 NO BID | Non -Aol 41.00 123.00
Aol $43.00 = $129.00
6 rolls 300 MOLESKIN 2X25YD Aetna 9.45 56.70 NO BID 14.39 86.34
3 60600 FELT HORSESHOE PADS 10/PK Cramer 8.50 25.50 NO BID 10.51 31.53
3 63200 FOAM PADS 1/8 100/PK Aetna 6.95 20.85 NO BID | 1/8" x 4" x 4" 8.50 8.50
$8.50 for 25
2 47060 NOSE GUARD Mueller 24.50 49.00 NO BID 31.29 62.58
ATHENS TOTAL 8,074.14 4,149.84 9,377.66
Troy High School

50 cs 32044M COACH ATHLETIC TAPE 1% X 15 YDS NO BID | 1060 36.80 1,840.00 35.97 1,798.50
4 bx 32005M ZONAS POROUS TAPE 1 X 10 YDS NO BID | 1120 9.40 37.60 11.28 45.12
4 bx 32007M ELASTICON ELASTIC TAPE 1 X 2% YD NO BID NO BID 13.53 54.12

10 cs 84410 AC TAPE 2 X 5 YDS NO BID NO BID 36.14 361.40

94722 PROS CHOICE ATHLETIC STRETCH TAPE 2 X

20 cs 7% NO BID NO BID 38.78 775.60
lcs 85580 LEUKOTAPE P 1% X 15 YDS NO BID NO BID 212.58 212.58

30 rolls 35140 COVER-ROLL 2 X 10 YDS NO BID NO BID 9.08 272.40
8 cs 92120 PRO-TRAINER FOAM UNDERWRAP NO BID NO BID 30.95 247.60
4 bx 63555 HEEL & LACE PADS 3 X 3 NO BID | Cramer 1077 20.00 80.00 16.25 65.00
1 bx 5594-83 WATERPROOF TAPE 1” X 10 YDS NO BID NO BID 24.28 24.28
1 bx 12445 BENZOIN TINCTURE NO BID NO BID 20.16 20.16

12 cans 72231 JC-4 TRAINERS PRE TAPE NO BID NO BID NO BID
2cs 12170C Q.D.A NO BID | 1088 8 0z 88.56 177.12 85.00 170.00
3 jars 59160 SKIN LUBE 5 LB NO BID NO BID 24.87 74.61
3 17470 TAPING BLOCK NO BID NO BID 13.74 41.22
6 bx 27506 MEDI RIP NO BID | 5235 2" 18.25 109.50 21.07 126.42
3 bx 32027 CO-FLEX 3 X 5 YDS NO BID | 5033 33.00 99.00 37.03 111.09
4 dz 28003M ECONO-WRAP 3 X 4% YDS NO BID | 7200 .42ea 5.40 21.60 | 10/pk- 6pkics 5.76 23.04

48 ea
6 dz 28004M ECONO-WRAP 4 X 4%, YDS NO BID | 7210 .55 ea 6.60 39.60 | 10/pk 6/pk/c: 7.68 46.08
.64 ea
6 dz 28011M ECONO-WRAP 6 X 4 %2 YDS NO BID | 7220 .93 ea 11.16 66.96 | 10/pk 6 pk/ce 13.32 79.92
1.11ea
6 dz 36330 ECONO-WRAP 6 X 10 YDS NO BID | 7195 2.29 ea 27.48 164.88 | 6 pk/cs 2.44 e: 29.28 175.68
4 bx 25027 FLEXICON NON STERILE 3 X 4.1 YDS NO BID | 3356 5.13 20.52 3.76 15.04
4 30003M MULTI-TRAUMA DRESSING NO BID | 5340 1.00 4.00 1.92 7.68
4 bx 29010M NON ADHERENT PADS 3 X 4 NO BID | 5615 5.27 21.08 6.95 27.80
4 jars 35650 2ND SKIN 1” SQUARES NO BID [ 7835 Skinon  18.76 75.04 24.16 96.64
NO BID | Skin (200) 1" Squares
8 bx 21007M BAND AID SHEER STRIPS % NO BID | 1966 1.21 9.68 2.72 21.76
8 bx 21008M BAND AID SHEER STRIPS 17 NO BID | 1967 1.45 11.60 2.94 23.52
6 btls 69575 NEW-SKIN LIQUID BANDAGE 1 0Z NO BID NO BID 4.97 29.82
6 bx 22204M BAND AID FLEX-FABRIC KNUCKLE NO BID | 1988 2.82 16.92 5.95 35.70
1 bx 34007M POVIDONE-IONDINE SWABSTICKS NO BID | 7935 4.23 423 6.14 6.14
1 bx 34005M ALCOHOL PREP PADS BX - 100 NO BID | 1305 1.75 1.75 1.94 1.94
10 21100 DISPENSER BOTTLES 40 OZ NO BID NO BID NO BID
36040 WATERJEL TRIPLE ANTIBIOTIC 1/32 OZ
3 bx PACKETS NO BID [ 7605 14.24 42.72 | Fougera 20.59 61.77

60 36009M J&J FIRST AID CREAM 1Y2 0Z NO BID | 3330 1.28 76.80 3.01 180.60

60 36 BACTINE 40Z NO BID | 1592 5.62 337.20 4.46 267.60
4 bx 65230 STIPTIK SWABPOULES NO BID NO BID 39.59 158.36
2 bx 36026M HYDROCORTIZONE CREAM 1% 1.5GM NO BID | 4078 9.31 18.62 5.92 11.84

12 btls 68570 CALADRYL CLEAR 60Z NO BID NO BID 5.57 66.84
3 bx 68450 MEDICAINE INSECT BITE SWABS NO BID NO BID 3.18 9.54
2 bx 56791M BODY ARMOR SUNSCREEN TOWELETTES NO BID NO BID NO BID




TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT
Bid 9427 Training Supplies Athens/Troy

Qty Dept. Description United Health Supplies MFASCo Health & Safety J and B Medical Supply Inc.
4 bx 54036M VIONEX TOWELETTES 50/BX NO BID | 8060 6.58 26.32 8.04 32.16
5 bx 54057M 1SO-QUIN 4QTS/BX NOBID | 1078 25.76 128.80 NO BID
1 36074M FLEX-ALL 454 MAX STRENTH 7LB NO BID NO BID 80.40 80.40
2 52770 SAVE-A-TOOTH NO BID | 6302 10.67 21.34 12.25 24.50
6 70685 CONTACT LENS CASE NO BID | 6390 121 7.26 2.96 17.76
48 btls 66655 SENSITIVE EYES SALINE SOL. 40Z NO BID NO BID | 12 oz 3.57 171.36
42000MC DISPOSABLE EYE CUPS 12BXS/CASE
1cs NO BID | 3085 12/pkg 171 171 148.11 148.11
2bx  46022M APAP XTRA-STRENGTH 500 NO BID | 1038 10.45 20.90 12.92 25.84
4 bx  46057M IPRIN 500 NO BID | 3095 12.68 50.72 18.50 74.00
2 bx 46061 M DIOTAME TABLETS 500 NO BID | 2525 23.63 47.26 34.00 68.00
1 bx 43038 DIAMODE 100 NO BID | 2558 13.97 13.97 19.56 19.56
4 bx 35007M MEDI-LYTE 500 NO BID | 5840 10.52 42.08 16.05 64.20
2 jars 38460 DEXTROTABS 1000 NO BID NO BID 28.80 57.60
4 73720 PLAYMATE ELITE 16 QUART NO BID NO BID NO BID
Troy High School - Continued
4 bx 29510C INSTANT COLD PACKS NO BID | 2211 Reg 24/b>  9.50 38.00 11.79 47.16
3 47052M  ICE BAGS 9 % X 18 1500/ROLL NO BID | 1109 62.64 187.92 70.00 210.00
1 23627 ICE BAG DISPENSER NO BID NO BID 28.00 28.00
4 47007M COLD SPRAY 40Z NO BID | 2245 1.84 7.36 3.95 15.80
4 48820 HOT PACKS NO BID NO BID 10.14 40.56
6 48940 HOT PACK COVERS STANDARD NO BID NO BID 22.50 135.00
1bx 72001C DURA-STICK Il REUSABLE 2” ELECTRODES NO BID NO BID 47.77 47.77
1bx 72003C DURA STICK Il REUSABLE ELECTRODES 2X2 NO BID NO BID 47.79 47.79
2 91035 EX BANDS ORANGE 50 FT NO BID NO BID 37.76 75.52
2 91036 EX BANDS GREEN 50 FT NO BID NO BID 48.87 97.74
2 91037 EX BANDS BLUE 50 FT NO BID NO BID 59.17 118.34
2 91038 EX BANDS PLUM 59 FT NO BID NO BID 67.97 135.94
1 5570-43 MEDIC-KIT 5 BPKIJ NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 12273 STETHOSCOPE NO BID | Nurses 7096 421 421 11.87 11.87
1 20312 RI MINI OTOSCOPE/OPHTHALMOSCOPE NO BID NO BID NO BID
2 88110 TUNING FORK C256 NO BID NO BID 7.43 14.86
2 48012 HI-INTENSITY PEN LITES 6 PK NO BID NO BID 7.35 14.70
2 21021 ADJUSTABLE STOOL NO BID NO BID 96.29 192.58
19473 ANSELL MICRO-TOUCH NITRILE MED
6 bx GLOVES NO BID NO BID 7.35 44.10
19474 ANSELL MICRO-TOUCH NITRILE LARGE
1 bx GLOVES NO BID NO BID 7.35 7.35
12 21450 POLY JARS & SCREW LIDS 80Z NO BID NO BID NO BID
1lcs 65610 ACCLAIM FACIAL TISSUE NO BID NO BID 22.47 22.47
3 18771M SIMPLE GREEN GALLON NO BID NO BID NO BID
12 40405 PRECISE DISINFECTANT CAN 20 OZ NO BID | 2726 4.69 56.28 7.15 85.80
2¢s 40084 BIOHAZARD BAGS 24 X 24 NO BID | (1000) 66.98 133.96 | 12 Microns 24x: 3.09 6.18
NO BID 10 gal
12 pr 75720 PRO TRAINER SCISSORS 8” NO BID NO BID NO BID
8 pr 72111 HEAVY DUTY BANDAGE SHEERS NO BID NO BID 5.50 44.00
48030MB PARA MEDIC SHEARS
15 pr NO BID | 4282 1.50 22.50 1.65 24.75
1 75360 NAIL DRILL NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 48009M RING CUTTER NO BID | 4225 6.76 6.76 443 443
1 833256 STAINLESS STEEL INSTURMENT TRAY NO BID NO BID 48.00 48.00
4 12600 ROSIN MIXTURE 4.5 0Z NO BID NO BID 6.11 24.44
3 17332 REG. NO-GLARE STIPS 144 NO BID NO BID 10.75 32.25
75 oz 17440 SUN GLARE STICK NO BID NO BID | each 3.24 3.24
3 19820 AT SOFT-SIDED KIT EMPTY NO BID NO BID 75.00 225.00
6 19260 TUFF KIT EMPTY NO BID NO BID NO BID
12 51001M CPR MICROSHIELD REG NO BID | 5890 4.19 50.28 6.30 75.60
10 16380 ARM SLING MEDIUM NO BID NO BID 291 29.10
10 16400 ARM SLING LARGE NO BID NO BID 3.27 32.70
24 30001M TRIANGULAR BANDAGE NO BID NO BID 0.38 9.12
1 351 RAPD FORM VACUUM ARM SPLINT NO BID NO BID 140.00 140.00
1 39500 STAX FINGER SPLING ASSORT NO BID NO BID 82.00 82.00
4 40116 FOAM CERVICAL COLLAR MEDIUM NO BID NO BID 5.63 22.52
4 40117 FOAM CERVICAL COLLAR LARGE NO BID NO BID 6.14 24.56
2 bx 76425 ONE-STEP SPLINTS 4 X 15 NO BID NO BID 57.71 115.42
4 pr 70770 CRUTCHES 507-62” NO BID NO BID 14.50 58.00
4 pr 70771 CRUTCHES 427"-54”" NO BID NO BID 14.07 56.28
3 shts 63507 SUPER FOAM ¥, NO BID NO BID | non-aol 3311 99.33
aol $34.00 = $102.00
3 shts 63506 SUPER FOAM 3/8 NO BID NO BID | non-aol 41.00 123.00
aol $43.00 = $129.00
6 rolls 300 MOLESKIN 2X25YD NO BID NO BID 14.39 86.34
3 60600 FELT HORSESHOE PADS 10/PK NO BID NO BID 10.51 31.53
3 63200 FOAM PADS 1/8 100/PK NO BID NO BID k4"x4" peach 8.50 8.50
$8.50 for 25
2 47060 NOSE GUARD NO BID NO BID 31.29 62.58
TOTAL NO BID 4,144.05 9,393.12

Metro Medical Equipment - Return to Sender - Unable to Forward

Medistat Medical - No Response

Mid Island Medical Supply - No Response

Floey Medical Supply Co. - No Response
Metro Medical Corp. - No Response




TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT
Bid 9427 Training Supplies Athens/Troy

Qty Dept. Description Moore Medical LLC Medco Supply Henry Scheim Inc.
Athens High School
50 cs 32044M COACH ATHLETIC TAPE 1% X 15 YDS 48293 36.00 1,800.00 35.76 1,788.00 | 5550533 34.38 1,719.00
4 bx 32005M ZONAS POROUS TAPE 1 X 10 YDS 08935 9.00 36.00 8.75 35.00 | 5555122 8.76 35.04
4 bx 32007M ELASTICON ELASTIC TAPE 1 X 2% YD 08931 12.90 51.60 12.50 50.00 | 5555165 12.48 49.92
10 cs 84410 AC TAPE 2 X5 YDS 67624 - case 47.17 471.70 32.65 326.50 | 8299161 32.77 327.70
20 cs 94722 PROS CHOICE ATHLETIC STRETCH TAPE 2 X | 59195 - case 37.65 753.00 36.85 737.00 | 7979041 35.58 711.60
1 cs 85580 LEUKOTAPE P 1% X 15 YDS 63325 - case30 166.50 166.50 5.38 5.38 | 9113665 160.80 160.80
30 rolls 35140 COVER-ROLL 2 X 10 YDS 63326 6.80 204.00 7.15 214.50 | 9116375 7.11 213.30
8 «¢s 92120 PRO-TRAINER FOAM UNDERWRAP NO BID 22.20 177.60 | 6815472 21.53 172.24
4 bx 63555 HEEL & LACE PADS 3 X 3 30565 18.48 73.92 11.49 45,96 | 7331905 11.68 46.72
1 bx 5594-83 WATERPROOF TAPE 1” X 10 YDS 08942 20.00 20.00 17.96 17.96 | 5556554 20.74 20.74
1 bx 12445 BENZOIN TINCTURE 77763 7.85 7.85 18.96 18.96 | 1244145 100/bx 18.13 18.13
Swabsticks bx/50
12 cans 72231 JC-4 TRAINERS PRE TAPE NO BID 6.35 76.20 | 1343446 Cramer 5.16 61.92
Tuf-Skin 6 oz
2 ¢s 12170C Q.D.A NO BID 45.02 90.04 | 1340794 66.96 133.92
2 jars 59160 SKIN LUBE 5 LB NO BID 12.85 25.70 | 1343108 19.33 38.66
3 17470 TAPING BLOCK NO BID 11.32 33.96 | 1925554 11.62 34.86
6 bx 27506 MEDI RIP 17452 - 2" x 5 yds 17.45 104.70 18.92 113.52 | 6489088 2x5 12/bx 18.88 113.28
3 bx 32027 CO-FLEX 3 X5 YDS 58270 34.20 102.60 31.46 94.38 | 1001025 24/bx 26.77 80.31
4 dz 28003M ECONO-WRAP 3 X 4% YDS 80873 1.40 5.60 5.04 20.16 | 1047565 10/bx 3.94 15.76
6 dz 28004M ECONO-WRAP 4 X 4% YDS 80874 1.90 11.40 6.60 39.60 [ 1047575 10/bx 4.96 29.76
6 dz 28011M ECONO-WRAP 6 X 4% YDS 80875 1.80 10.80 9.00 54.00 | 1047580 10/bx 6.28 37.68
6 dz 36330 ECONO-WRAP 6 X 10 YDS NO BID 26.64 159.84 | 8293332 24.84 149.04
4 bx 25027 FLEXICON NON STERILE 3 X 4.1 YDS 63365 4.90 19.60 3.69 14.76 | 1048997 HIS 1.22 4.88
4 30003M MULTI-TRAUMA DRESSING 77704 10"x30" 1.05 4.20 1.60 6.40 | 7438027 12"x30" 0.98 3.92
4 bx 29010M NON ADHERENT PADS 3 X 4 10776 5.30 21.20 6.07 24.28 | 1555827 5.84 23.36
4 jars 35650 2ND SKIN 1” SQUARES 53798 18.40 73.60 18.00 72.00 | 6452314 18.62 74.48
8 bx  21007M BAND AID SHEER STRIPS % 68190 Moore 1.38 11.04 3.76 30.08 | 5554970 J&J 2.78 22.24
1008594 HSI $ .98 = $.7.84
8 bx  21008M BAND AID SHEER STRIPS 1” 68189 Moore 1.65 13.20 3.50 28.00 | 5555844 J & J 3.14 25.12
1008594 HIS $1.22 = $9.76
6 Dtls 69575 NEW-SKIN LIQUID BANDAGE 1 0Z 78594 Carebar 2.90 17.40 4.05 24.30 | 2482024 3.92 23.52
6 btls 22204M BAND AID FLEX-FABRIC KNUCKLE 68184 Moore 3.50 21.00 6.50 39.00 | 5552369 J&J 5.84 35.04
1011386 HIS $2.74 = $16.44
1 bx 34007M POVIDONE-IONDINE SWABSTICKS 68549 bx/50 3.40 3.40 4.39 4.39 | 2678499 3.96 3.96
1 bx  34005M ALCOHOL PREP PADS BX - 100 68533 0.70 0.70 0.85 0.85 | 3731717 0.86 0.86
10 21100 DISPENSER BOTTLES 40 OZ NO BID 0.31 3.10 NO BID
36040 WATERJEL TRIPLE ANTIBIOTIC 1/32 0Z
3 bx PACKETS 51317 12.45 37.35 14.15 42.45 | 8915295 12.48 37.44
60 36009M J&J FIRST AID CREAM 1% 0Z 72040 Generic 1.65 99.00 2.55 153.00 | 5550268 243 145.80
60 36 BACTINE 40z 674125 0z 4.60 276.00 3.65 219.00 | 2489950 3.47 208.20
4 bx 65230 STIPTIK SWABPOULES NO BID 29.63 118.52 | 6024952 32.98 131.92
2 bx  36026M HYDROCORTIZONE CREAM 1% 1.5GM 82464 1 gm 1« 5.75 11.50 5.12 10.24 | 1025408 6.32 12.64
12 btls 68570 CALADRYL CLEAR 60Z 45845 Calagel 3.15 37.80 4.69 56.28 | 3210591 4.73 56.76
3 bx 68450 MEDICAINE INSECT BITE SWABS 15991 pkg/10 1.70 5.10 2.64 7.92 | 1004988 2.56 7.68
56791M BODY ARMOR SUNSCREEN TOWELETTES
2 bx NO BID | Discontinued NO BID NO BID
4 bx 54036M VIONEX TOWELETTES 50/BX 35387 6.40 25.60 | 54035 6.60 26.40 | 1765471 6.44 25.76
5 bx  54057M ISO-QUIN 4QTS/BX NO BID 19.42 97.10 | 1340625 12/CS 16 0z 56.76 283.80
1 36074M FLEX-ALL 454 MAX STRENTH 7LB NO BID 66.26 66.26 | 3991152 73.11 73.11
2 52770 SAVE-A-TOOTH 73287 9.60 19.20 9.75 19.50 | 7278983 10.34 20.68
6 70685 CONTACT LENS CASE 66112 bx/12 13.45 13.45 1.25 7.50 | 6929720 2/pk snap top 0.78 4.68
48 btls 66655 SENSITIVE EYES SALINE SOL. 40Z 71199 12 oz 1.10 52.80 | 120z 2.99 143.52 | 122144512 oz 2.87 137.76
42000MC DISPOSABLE EYE CUPS 12BXS/CASE
1 cs 48697 112.80 112.80 122.91 122.91 | 6925698 10/bx 12/bxs/cs 21.84 21.84
46022M APAP XTRA-STRENGTH 500
2 bx 82468 250/pk¢ 9.00 18.00 13.94 27.88 | 3503440 7.26 14.52
4 bx  46057M IPRIN 500 36011 250/pk¢ 12.35 49.40 15.10 60.40 | 6697544 by Dover 9.74 38.96
2 bx 46061 M DIOTAME TABLETS 500 63022 250/pk¢ 21.85 43.70 27.10 54.20 | 1511593 25.92 51.84
1  bx 43038 DIAMODE 100 57570 13.50 13.50 15.08 15.08 | 1519780 15.78 15.78
4 bx  35007M MEDI-LYTE 500 60418 9.85 39.40 11.09 44.36 | 1511327 11.58 46.32
2 jars 38460 DEXTROTABS 1000 NO BID 22.89 45.78 | 1347865 23.96 47.92
4 73720 PLAYMATE ELITE 16 QUART NO BID 18.87 75.48 | 3074981 22.37 89.48
29510C INSTANT COLD PACKS
4 bx 81854 5"x7" 6.00 24.00 6.31 25.24 | 8959673 8.16 32.64
pkg 3 8 percs
3 47052M ICE BAGS 9 % X 18 1500/ROLL 56487 55.00 165.00 50.47 151.41 | 1348882 52.76 158.28
1 23627 ICE BAG DISPENSER NO BID 19.67 19.67 | 8125668 20.36 20.36
4 47007M COLD SPRAY 40Z 74262 1.70 6.80 2.28 9.12 | 1686391 2.34 9.36
48820 HOT PACKS
4 81854 7.76 31.04 4.24 16.96 | 9605425 5.36 21.44
pkg 3 8 percs
6 48940 HOT PACK COVERS STANDARD 70923 cs/24 8.55 8.55 18.24 109.44 | 5664804 14.48 86.88
1 bx 72001C DURA-STICK Il REUSABLE 2” ELECTRODES NO BID 50.41 50.41 | 5661014 39.40 39.40
1 bx 72003C DURA STICK Il REUSABLE ELECTRODES 2X2| 81365 cs/40 74.00 74.00 38.53 38.53 | 5669003 39.40 39.40
2 91035 EX BANDS ORANGE 50 FT NO BID 35.24 70.48 | 2958296 Red can do 50 yds 35.47 70.94
2 91036 EX BANDS GREEN 50 FT NO BID 43.24 86.48 | 2958297 Greencando  38.26 76.52
2 91037 EX BANDS BLUE 50 FT NO BID 52.35 104.70 | 2958298 can do 50 yds ~ 40.98 81.96
2 91038 EX BANDS PLUM 59 FT NO BID 60.35 120.70 [ 2958299 Black cando! 43.72 87.44
1 5570-43 MEDIC-KIT 5 BPKIJ NO BID 100.59 100.59 | 1514677 69.52 69.52
1 12273 STETHOSCOPE 66242 2.80 2.80 6.77 6.77 | 1017618 HIS Spragve Rappa 7.44 7.44
1 20312 RI MINI OTOSCOPE/OPHTHALMOSCOPE 45852 ADC 150.65 150.65 188.88 188.88 NO BID
2 88110 TUNING FORK C256 69647 8.95 17.90 9.28 18.56 | 6359533 6.83 13.66
2 48012 HI-INTENSITY PEN LITES 6 PK 81238 3.90 7.80 4.92 9.84 | 1000592 4.64 9.28
2 21021 ADJUSTABLE STOOL 70637 83.00 166.00 86.40 172.80 | 1229516 90.88 181.76
19473 ANSELL MICRO-TOUCH NITRILE MED
6 bx GLOVES 75921 5.45 32.70 6.00 36.00 | 6857036 5.98 35.88
1 bx 19474 ANSELL MICRO-TOUCH NITRILE LARGE 75922 5.45 5.45 6.00 6.00 | 6858257 5.98 5.98
12 21450 POLY JARS & SCREW LIDS 80z NO BID 0.56 6.72 NO BID
65610 ACCLAIM FACIAL TISSUE
1cs NO BID 24.10 24.10 | 3955769 Marcal 100/bx 30 b 20.18 20.18




TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT
Bid 9427 Training Supplies Athens/Troy

Qty Dept. Description Moore Medical LLC Medco Supply Henry Scheim Inc.
3 18771M SIMPLE GREEN GALLON NO BID | Disc. NO BID NO BID
12 40405 PRECISE DISINFECTANT CAN 20 OZ NO BID 451 54.12 | 1203844 462 55.44
40084 BIOHAZARD BAGS 24 X 24
2cs 55445 4.45 8.90 1.10 2.20 | 1538555 16"x24" 20 rl  23.60 47.20
10 rls/cs
12 pr 75720 PRO TRAINER SCISSORS 8” NO BID 224 26.88 NO BID
8 pr 72111 HEAVY DUTY BANDAGE SHEERS 43739 Supercut 54.50 436.00 9.84 78.72 | 3788958 Clauss type 3.52 28.16
Athens High School - Continued $8.95 shipping fee.
48030MB PARA MEDIC SHEARS
15 42407 2.05 30.75 0.73 10.95 | 9536688 2.08 31.20
1 75360 NAIL DRILL NO BID 9.41 9.41 | 3780328 9.14 9.14
1 48009M RING CUTTER 11702 5.55 5.55 3.83 3.83 | 3782372 4.43 443
833256 STAINLESS STEEL INSTURMENT TRAY
1 71154 8.80 8.80 27.11 27.11 | 1004086 49.68 49.68
4 12600 ROSIN MIXTURE 4.5 0Z NO BID 3.50 14.00 | 1349265 3.86 15.44
3 17332 REG. NO-GLARE STIPS 144 NO BID 8.02 24.06 | 3642279 7.68 23.04
75 oz 17440 SUN GLARE STICK NO BID 2.05 2.05 | 3041190 Mueller 2.03 2.03
19820 AT SOFT-SIDED KIT EMPTY
3 NO BID 60.51 181.53 | 1302179 63.58 190.74
19260 TUFF KIT EMPTY
6 NO BID 24.54 147.24 NO BID
12 51001M CPR MICROSHIELD REG 35472 3.75 45.00 4.05 48.60 | 3729613 3.98 47.76
10 16380 ARM SLING MEDIUM 65312 3.40 34.00 4.00 40.00 | 1203988 2.15 21.50
10 16400 ARM SLING LARGE 65313 3.40 34.00 4.00 40.00 | 1209672 2.15 21.50
24 30001M TRIANGULAR BANDAGE 69397 0.21 5.04 0.20 4.80 | 1209201 0.28 6.72
1 351 RAPD FORM VACUUM ARM SPLINT 69745 Econo-' 15.25 15.25 108.86 108.86 | 1227359 120.18 120.18
1 39500 STAX FINGER SPLING ASSORT 83084 Plastalu 27.15 27.15 67.80 67.80 | 65107865 28.93 28.93
bx/27
4 40116 FOAM CERVICAL COLLAR MEDIUM 73670 narrow 2.20 8.80 471 18.84 | 6670269 4.22 16.88
4 40117 FOAM CERVICAL COLLAR LARGE 73677 narrow 2.20 8.80 NO BID | 6673578 4.22 16.88
2 bx 76425 ONE-STEP SPLINTS 4 X 15 74858 87.85 175.70 | 3324 95.06 190.12 | 6003633 79.23 158.46
4 pr 70770 CRUTCHES 50”-62” 77986 4"6'x 5 14.15 56.60 12.35 49.40 | 1207642 13.28 53.12
4 pr 70771 CRUTCHES 42”-54” 779854." x 4" 14.15 56.60 NO BID | 1208363 13.28 53.12
63507 SUPER FOAM %
3 shts NO BID 27.20 81.60 | 8520957 27.14 81.42
NO BID
63506 SUPER FOAM 3/8
3 shts NO BID 34.40 103.20 | 8522949 34.96 104.88
6 rolls 300 MOLESKIN 2X25YD NO BID 10.07 60.42 | 6815072 7.96 47.76
3 60600 FELT HORSESHOE PADS 10/PK NO BID 7.30 21.90 | 6142874 7.68 23.04
3 63200 FOAM PADS 1/8 100/PK NO BID 18.15 54.45 NO BID
2 47060 NOSE GUARD NO BID 18.55 37.10 | 3648958 22.96 45.92
ATHENS TOTAL 6,509.24 8,667.79 8,233.54
Troy High School
50 cs 32044M COACH ATHLETIC TAPE 1% X 15 YDS NO BID NO BID NO BID
4 bx 32005M ZONAS POROUS TAPE 1 X 10 YDS NO BID NO BID NO BID
4 bx 32007M ELASTICON ELASTIC TAPE 1 X 2% YD NO BID NO BID NO BID
10 cs 84410 AC TAPE 2 X 5 YDS NO BID NO BID NO BID
94722 PROS CHOICE ATHLETIC STRETCH TAPE 2 X
20 cs 7% NO BID NO BID NO BID
lcs 85580 LEUKOTAPE P 1% X 15 YDS NO BID NO BID NO BID
30 rolls 35140 COVER-ROLL 2 X 10 YDS NO BID NO BID NO BID
8 cs 92120 PRO-TRAINER FOAM UNDERWRAP NO BID NO BID NO BID
4 bx 63555 HEEL & LACE PADS 3 X 3 NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 bx 5594-83 WATERPROOF TAPE 1” X 10 YDS NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 bx 12445 BENZOIN TINCTURE NO BID NO BID NO BID
12 cans 72231 JC-4 TRAINERS PRE TAPE NO BID NO BID NO BID
2cs 12170C Q.D.A NO BID NO BID NO BID
3 jars 59160 SKIN LUBE 5 LB NO BID NO BID NO BID
3 17470 TAPING BLOCK NO BID NO BID NO BID
6 bx 27506 MEDI RIP NO BID NO BID NO BID
3 bx 32027 CO-FLEX 3 X5 YDS NO BID NO BID NO BID
4 dz 28003M ECONO-WRAP 3 X 4 % YDS NO BID NO BID NO BID
6 dz 28004M ECONO-WRAP 4 X 4 % YDS NO BID NO BID NO BID
6 dz 28011M ECONO-WRAP 6 X 4 % YDS NO BID NO BID NO BID
6 dz 36330 ECONO-WRAP 6 X 10 YDS NO BID NO BID NO BID
4 bx 25027 FLEXICON NON STERILE 3 X 4.1 YDS NO BID NO BID NO BID
4 30003M MULTI-TRAUMA DRESSING NO BID NO BID NO BID
4 bx 29010M NON ADHERENT PADS 3 X 4 NO BID NO BID NO BID
4 jars 35650 2ND SKIN 1” SQUARES NO BID NO BID NO BID
8 bx 21007M BAND AID SHEER STRIPS % NO BID NO BID NO BID
8 bx 21008M BAND AID SHEER STRIPS 1” NO BID NO BID NO BID
6 btls 69575 NEW-SKIN LIQUID BANDAGE 1 0Z NO BID NO BID NO BID
6 bx 22204M BAND AID FLEX-FABRIC KNUCKLE NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 bx 34007M POVIDONE-IONDINE SWABSTICKS NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 bx 34005M ALCOHOL PREP PADS BX - 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID
10 21100 DISPENSER BOTTLES 40 OZ NO BID NO BID NO BID
36040 WATERJEL TRIPLE ANTIBIOTIC 1/32 0Z
3 bx PACKETS NO BID NO BID NO BID
60 36009M J&J FIRST AID CREAM 1Y, OZ NO BID NO BID NO BID
60 36 BACTINE 40Z NO BID NO BID NO BID
4 bx 65230 STIPTIK SWABPOULES NO BID NO BID NO BID
2 bx 36026M HYDROCORTIZONE CREAM 1% 1.5GM NO BID NO BID NO BID
12 btls 68570 CALADRYL CLEAR 60Z NO BID NO BID NO BID
3 bx 68450 MEDICAINE INSECT BITE SWABS NO BID NO BID NO BID
2 bx 56791M BODY ARMOR SUNSCREEN TOWELETTES NO BID NO BID NO BID




TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT
Bid 9427 Training Supplies Athens/Troy

Qty Dept. Description Moore Medical LLC Medco Supply Henry Scheim Inc.
4 bx 54036M VIONEX TOWELETTES 50/BX NO BID NO BID NO BID
5 bx 54057M ISO-QUIN 4QTS/BX NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 36074M FLEX-ALL 454 MAX STRENTH 7LB NO BID NO BID NO BID
2 52770 SAVE-A-TOOTH NO BID NO BID NO BID
6 70685 CONTACT LENS CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID
48 btls 66655 SENSITIVE EYES SALINE SOL. 40Z NO BID NO BID NO BID
42000MC DISPOSABLE EYE CUPS 12BXS/CASE
1cs NO BID NO BID NO BID
2bx  46022M APAP XTRA-STRENGTH 500 NO BID NO BID NO BID
4 bx  46057M IPRIN 500 NO BID NO BID NO BID
2bx 46061 M DIOTAME TABLETS 500 NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 bx 43038 DIAMODE 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID
4 bx 35007M MEDI-LYTE 500 NO BID NO BID NO BID
2 jars 38460 DEXTROTABS 1000 NO BID NO BID NO BID
4 73720 PLAYMATE ELITE 16 QUART NO BID NO BID NO BID
Troy High School - Continued
4 bx 29510C INSTANT COLD PACKS NO BID NO BID NO BID
3 47052M ICE BAGS 9 % X 18 1500/ROLL NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 23627 ICE BAG DISPENSER NO BID NO BID NO BID
4 47007M COLD SPRAY 40z NO BID NO BID NO BID
4 48820 HOT PACKS NO BID NO BID NO BID
6 48940 HOT PACK COVERS STANDARD NO BID NO BID NO BID
1bx 72001C DURA-STICK Il REUSABLE 2” ELECTRODES NO BID NO BID NO BID
1bx 72003C DURA STICK Il REUSABLE ELECTRODES 2X2 NO BID NO BID NO BID
2 91035 EX BANDS ORANGE 50 FT NO BID NO BID NO BID
2 91036 EX BANDS GREEN 50 FT NO BID NO BID NO BID
2 91037 EX BANDS BLUE 50 FT NO BID NO BID NO BID
2 91038 EX BANDS PLUM 59 FT NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 5570-43 MEDIC-KIT 5 BPKIJ NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 12273 STETHOSCOPE NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 20312 RI MINI OTOSCOPE/OPHTHALMOSCOPE NO BID NO BID NO BID
2 88110 TUNING FORK C256 NO BID NO BID NO BID
2 48012 HI-INTENSITY PEN LITES 6 PK NO BID NO BID NO BID
2 21021 ADJUSTABLE STOOL NO BID NO BID NO BID
19473 ANSELL MICRO-TOUCH NITRILE MED
6 bx GLOVES NO BID NO BID NO BID
19474 ANSELL MICRO-TOUCH NITRILE LARGE
1 bx GLOVES NO BID NO BID NO BID
12 21450 POLY JARS & SCREW LIDS 802 NO BID NO BID NO BID
1lcs 65610 ACCLAIM FACIAL TISSUE NO BID NO BID NO BID
3 18771M SIMPLE GREEN GALLON NO BID NO BID NO BID
12 40405 PRECISE DISINFECTANT CAN 20 OZ NO BID NO BID NO BID
2¢cs 40084 BIOHAZARD BAGS 24 X 24 NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID
12 pr 75720 PRO TRAINER SCISSORS 8~ NO BID NO BID NO BID
8 pr 72111 HEAVY DUTY BANDAGE SHEERS NO BID NO BID NO BID
48030MB PARA MEDIC SHEARS
15 pr NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 75360 NAIL DRILL NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 48009M RING CUTTER NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 833256 STAINLESS STEEL INSTURMENT TRAY NO BID NO BID NO BID
4 12600 ROSIN MIXTURE 4.5 0Z NO BID NO BID NO BID
3 17332 REG. NO-GLARE STIPS 144 NO BID NO BID NO BID
75 oz 17440 SUN GLARE STICK NO BID NO BID NO BID
3 19820 AT SOFT-SIDED KIT EMPTY NO BID NO BID NO BID
6 19260 TUFF KIT EMPTY NO BID NO BID NO BID
12 51001M CPR MICROSHIELD REG NO BID NO BID NO BID
10 16380 ARM SLING MEDIUM NO BID NO BID NO BID
10 16400 ARM SLING LARGE NO BID NO BID NO BID
24 30001M TRIANGULAR BANDAGE NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 351 RAPD FORM VACUUM ARM SPLINT NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 39500 STAX FINGER SPLING ASSORT NO BID NO BID NO BID
4 40116 FOAM CERVICAL COLLAR MEDIUM NO BID NO BID NO BID
4 40117 FOAM CERVICAL COLLAR LARGE NO BID NO BID NO BID
2 bx 76425 ONE-STEP SPLINTS 4 X 15 NO BID NO BID NO BID
4 pr 70770 CRUTCHES 507-62” NO BID NO BID NO BID
4 pr 70771 CRUTCHES 427-54” NO BID NO BID NO BID
3 shts 63507 SUPER FOAM Y4 NO BID NO BID NO BID
3 shts 63506 SUPER FOAM 3/8 NO BID NO BID NO BID
6 rolls 300 MOLESKIN 2X25YD NO BID NO BID NO BID
3 60600 FELT HORSESHOE PADS 10/PK NO BID NO BID NO BID
3 63200 FOAM PADS 1/8 100/PK NO BID NO BID NO BID
2 47060 NOSE GUARD NO BID NO BID NO BID
TOTAL NO BID NO BID NO BID
Freight is F.O.B. destination for
orders over $90.00

Orders under $90.00 will incur a
$8.95 shipping fee.




