

REQUEST FOR QUOTATION	TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT 1140 RANKIN, TROY, MICHIGAN 48083 248-823-4052 FAX: 248-823-4077	REQUISITION
No. 9529		
DUE DATE NO LATER THAN 6-5-08 3 p.m.		DATE 5-19-08

REQUEST FOR QUOTE – NOT AN ORDER

THIS FORM MUST BE UTILIZED WHEN RESPONDING TO THIS REQUEST
 BID ENVELOPE ENCLOSED

THE RFQ NUMBER MUST APPEAR ON ALL QUOTATIONS AND RELATED CORRESPONDENCE, THIS IS NOT AN ORDER

Quantity	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	AMOUNT
	<p>Please supply us with your bid to furnish the Troy School District with TRASH, RECYCLING AND DUMPSTER SERVICE per the attached specifications.</p> <p style="text-align: center;">Copies of the bid are available at: www.troy.k12.mi.us/purchasing/items_out_for_bid.htm</p> <p style="text-align: center;">Bid recaps will be available at: troy.k12.mi.us/purchasing/index.htm</p> <p style="text-align: center;"><u>FACSIMILE BID IS NOT ACCEPTABLE</u></p> <p>Bids will not be accepted if submitted after the deadline specified (local time) in the advertisement to bid or in the information to bidders. The late submission of a bid makes the bid nonrepsonsive and is a material defect which shall not be waived by the Board of Education. Delays in the mail will not be considered. All Late bids in the mail will be returned to the bidder unopened.</p> <p>Proposal for the submission of alternatives by vendors will be accepted and reviewed. However, if any substitution or departure is not clearly noted and described, it will be understood that the bid intends to exactly meet the specifications.</p> <p>The Board of Education shall be the sole judge as to whether the proposed goods are "equal" or "approved". Quotations must be mailed or delivered to the Purchasing Office, 1140 Rankin, Troy, MI 48083 no later than 3 p.m. on the date shown above. Prices must include all taxes, Michigan State Sales and Use Taxes and Federal Excess Taxes do not apply. Exemption certificates will be furnished when necessary. This request imposes no obligations on the buyer. The Board of Education reserves the right to accept or reject any or all bids or to split awards by items or to accept bids, which will best serve the Board of Education.</p>		

THIS AREA MUST BE FILLED IN

DELIVERY TIME	PRICES FIRM FOR	NAME OF COMPANY	TELEPHONE NO.
TERMS		NO. & STREET	FAX #
FOB DELIVERED	ALL DELIVERY CHARGES MUST BE INCLUDED IN PRICES SHOWN	CITY, STATE & ZIP CODE	E-MAIL
CONTACT PERSON (PLEASE PRINT)		SIGNATURE	DATE

TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT BID 9529 WASTE DISPOSAL

The Troy School District is taking bids for trash and recyclable pick-up/disposal for the 2008-2009, 2009-2010 and 2010-2011 school fiscal years. The contract is intended to begin on July 1, 2008 and end on June 30, 2011.

Service Schedule – See the attached sheet for detail listing of district buildings, container sizes and pick-up schedules. All servicing of these locations must occur outside the normal school “high traffic” times (normally 7:00 am to 9:00 am, 11:00 am to 1:00 pm, and 2:00 pm to 4:00 pm) to avoid school buses, parental drop-offs and lunchtime recess. All service must be in compliance with City of Troy ordinances, bidders are solely responsible to verify allowable hours of operation.

Dumpster Placement – Contractor awarded this bid shall make all provisions to place new (or newly refurbished) dumpsters in the size noted at all building locations in time to begin servicing contract on July 1, 2008. Separate color dumpsters are required for all recyclable materials. Dumpsters must be clearly marked “Trash” or “Cardboard Only” as applicable.

Kitchen Oil/Grease Receptacles – Fully enclosed containers for the placement of used cooking oil & grease are requested for placement at locations as specified on the attached listing. Container size should be a approximately ¼ cubic yard. All containers must be fully lockable, tip proof, waterproof, and sufficient to prevent access by rodents, birds, etc.

Recyclable Cardboard: The district is also seeking separate pricing for the recycling of waste cardboard. Cardboard recycling is to be bid separate from trash hauling as the District may opt to award as two individual contracts.

INSPECTION OF SITE

Before submitting a proposal, each bidder shall personally inspect the site of the proposed work to arrive at a clear understanding of the conditions under which the work is to be done. Contact Mr. Kenneth Miller, Director of Operations at 248-823-4067 with questions pertaining to serviceability on this bid.

Bidders shall be held to have compared the premises with the specifications and to have satisfied themselves as to the conditions of the premises and any other conditions affecting the cost of performance of work before delivery of the proposal. No allowance or extra consideration on behalf of the contractor(s) will subsequently be allowed by reason of error, oversight, or failure to reasonably inspect on the part of the bidder and/or contractor(s).

No price allowance or extra consideration on behalf of the contractor will subsequently be allowed by reason of error or oversight on the part of the contractor.

INSURANCE

Satisfactory Workers' Compensation insurance and Public Liability and Property Damage Insurance must be carried and paid for by the contractor who undertakes the work on this contract. Liability coverage must total at least \$1,000,000. Certificates of such insurance shall be filed with the Purchasing Office **BEFORE ANY WORK BEGINS**.

REFERENCES:

References: Bidders are asked to provide minimum of three (3) large scale companies currently being serviced (public school districts preferred) within Southeast Michigan. Bids may be rejected if references are not provided with bid submission.

Company Name		Contact Name
Phone #	Fax #	Email

Company Name		Contact Name
Phone #	Fax #	Email

Company Name		Contact Name
Phone #	Fax #	Email

**TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT
 BID 9529 WASTE DISPOSAL**

	2008-2009	2009-2010	2010-2011
Scheduled Service:			
Trash – Cost Per Cubic Yard	_____	_____	_____
Recyclable – Cost Per Cubic Yard	_____	_____	_____
Kitchen oil/Grease – per container	_____	_____	_____
 Additional Pick-ups:			
Trash – Cost Per Cubic Yard	_____	_____	_____
Recyclable – Cost Per Cubic Yard	_____	_____	_____
Kitchen oil/Grease – per container	_____	_____	_____
 40 Roll-off Container:			
To 1140 Rankin	_____	_____	_____
To all other sites (if needed)	_____	_____	_____

Company: _____

Represented By: _____
 style="text-align: center;">**(Name & Title)**

Address: _____

Phone: _____

Fax: _____

E-Mail _____

Signature: _____

**TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT
BUILDING WASTE LIST**

Name	Can Size	# of Cans	Service	Trash	Recycle
Barnard Elementary School 3601 Forge Dr.	8 YD 6 YD	1- Front Loader 1-Frt Loader Recycle	2 x per week 1 x per week	X	X
Bemis Elementary School 3571 Northfield Parkway	8 YD 6 YD	1-Front Loader 1-Frt Loader Recycle	2 x per week 1 x per week	X	X
Costello Elementary School 1333 Hamman	8 YD 6 YD	1-Front Loader 1-Frt Loader Recycle	2 x per week 1 x per week	X	X
Hamilton Elementary School 5625 Northfield Parkway	8 YD 6 YD	1-Front Loader 1-Frt Loader Recycle	2 x per week 1 x per week	X	X
Hill Elementary School 4600 Forsyth	8 YD 6 YD	1-Front Loader 1-Frt Loader Recycle	2 x per week 1 x per week	X	X
Leonard Elementary School 4401 Tallman	8 YD 6 YD	1-Front Loader 1-Frt Loader Recycle	2 x per week 1 x per week	X	X
Martell Elementary School 5666 Livernois	8 YD 6 YD	1-Front Loader 1-Frt Loader Recycle	2 x per week 1 x per week	X	X
Morse Elementary School 475 Cherry	8 YD 6 YD	1-Front Loader 1-Frt Loader Recycle	2 x per week 1 x per week	X	X
Schroeder Elementary School 3541 Jack Drive	8 YD 6 YD	1-Front Loader 1-Frt Loader Recycle	2 x per week 1 x per week	X	X
Troy Union Elementary School 1340 E. Square Lake Rd.	8 YD 6 YD	1-Front Loader 1-Frt Loader Recycle	2 x per week 1 x per week	X	X
Wass Elementary School 2340 Willard	8 YD 6 YD	1-Front Loader 1-Frt Loader Recycle	2 x per week 1 x per week	X	X
Wattles Elementary School 3555 Ellenboro	8 YD 6 YD	1-Front Loader 1-Frt Loader Recycle	2 x per week 1 x per week	X	X
Baker Middle School 1291 Torpey Grease/Cooking Oil	8 YD 8 YD 1/4 YD	2-Front Loader 1-Frt Loader Recycle	3 x per week 1 x per week as needed	X	X
Boulan Park Middle School 3570 Northfield Parkway Grease/Cooking Oil	8 YD 6 YD 1/4 YD	2-Front Loader 1-Frt Loader Recycle	3 x per week 2 x per week as needed	X	X
Larson Middle School 2222 E. Long Lake Road Grease/Cooking Oil	8 YD 6 YD 1/4 YD	2-Front Loader 1-Frt Loader Recycle	3 x per week 2 x per week as needed	X	X

Name	Can Size	# of Cans	Service	Trash	Recycle
Smith Middle School 5835 Donaldson Grease/Cooking Oil	8 YD 6 YD 1/4 YD	2-Front Loader 1-Frt Loader Recycle	3 x per week 2 x per week as needed	X	X
Athens High School 4333 John R Grease/Cooking Oil	6 YD 6 YD 1/4 YD	4-Front Loader 1-Frt Loader Recycle	5 x per week 2 x per week as needed	X	X
Troy High School 4777 Northfield Parkway Grease/Cooking Oil	8 YD 8 YD 1/4 YD	3-Front Loader 1-Frt Loader Recycle	5 x per week 2 x per week as needed	X	X
International Academy East 1291 Torpey Grease/Cooking Oil	8 YD 8 YD 1/4 YD	2-Front Loader 1-Frt Loader Recycle	2 x per week 1 x per week as needed	X	X
Niles Center 201 W. Square Lake Rd.	8 YD	1-Front Loader	2 x per week	X	
Transportation 120 Hart	6 YD	1-Front Loader	1 x per week	X	
Building & Grounds/Purchasing 1140 Rankin	40 YD	Roll-Off	As needed	X	
Troy Administration 4400 Livernois	6 YD	1-Front Loader	1x per week	X	
Service Building 4420 Livernois	8 YD 8 YD	1-Front Loader 1-Frt Loader Recycle	1 x per week 1 x per week	X	X

**Troy School District
Trash Removal
Bid 9529**

	Capital Waste Inc.			Capital Waste Inc. (Alternate)			Allied Waste Services			Waste Management			
	2008/09	2009/10	2010/11	2008/09	2009/10	2010/11	2008/09	2009/10	2010/11	2008/09	2009/10	2010/11	
Scheduled Service:													
Trash-Cost per Cubic Yard	2.09	2.19	2.26	Combined in one container	1.94	2.02	2.10	1.61*	1.38	1.42	2.97	2.97	2.97
Recyclable-Cost per Cubic Yard	1.79	1.86	1.93		included in above pricing			1.32*	1.15	1.20	2.60	2.60	2.60
Kitchen oil/grease-per container	no bid	no bid	no bid		no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Additional Pick-Ups													
Trash-Cost per Cubic Yard	4.50	4.68	4.87		4.00	4.16	4.33	1.61*	1.38	1.42	10.00	10.00	10.00
Recyclable-Cost Per Cubic Yard	3.50	3.64	3.79		included in above pricing			1.32*	1.15	1.20	10.00	10.00	10.00
Kitchen oil/grease-per container	no bid	no bid	no bid		no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
40 Roll-Off Container:													
To 1140 Rankin	295.00	310.00	325.00		295.00	310.00	325.00	287.64*	250.00	260.00	412.51	412.51	412.51
To all other sites if needed	295.00	310.00	325.00		295.00	310.00	325.00	287.64*	250.00	260.00	412.51	412.51	412.51
								*08/09 Prices include 19.85% FRF. 2009/10 & 2010/11 TBD					
								Haul cost based on 6 ton load. Add'l tonnage \$23/ton 08/09, \$24/ton 09/10, \$25/ton 10/11					

- All Waste - No Response
- Prof Waste Solutions - No Response
- Able Disposal - No Response
- Tringali Sanitation - No Response
- Republic Services - No Response
- Desantis Trucking - No Response
- Runco Waste Industries - No Response