

REQUEST FOR QUOTATION	<p style="text-align: center;"><b>TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT</b></p> <p style="text-align: center;">1140 RANKIN, TROY, MICHIGAN 48083</p> <p style="text-align: center;">248-823-4052</p> <p style="text-align: center;">FAX: 248-823-4077</p>	REQUISITION
No. <b>9530</b>		
DUE DATE <b>6-6-08</b> NO LATER THAN <b>3 p.m.</b>		DATE <b>5-23-08</b>

**REQUEST FOR QUOTE – NOT AN ORDER**

THIS FORM MUST BE UTILIZED WHEN RESPONDING TO THIS REQUEST  
 BID ENVELOPE ENCLOSED

**THE RFQ NUMBER MUST APPEAR ON ALL QUOTATIONS AND RELATED CORRESPONDENCE, THIS IS NOT AN ORDER**

Quantity	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	AMOUNT
	<p>Please supply us with your bid to furnish the Troy School District with <b>Computer and Science Lab Seating</b> per the attached specifications.</p> <p style="text-align: center;">Copies of the bid are available at:  <a href="http://www.troy.k12.mi.us/purchasing/items_out_for_bid.htm">www.troy.k12.mi.us/purchasing/items_out_for_bid.htm</a></p> <p style="text-align: center;">Bid recaps will be available at:  <a href="http://troy.k12.mi.us/purchasing/index.htm">troy.k12.mi.us/purchasing/index.htm</a></p> <p style="text-align: center;"><u>FACSIMILE BID IS NOT ACCEPTABLE</u></p> <p>Bids will not be accepted if submitted after the deadline specified (local time) in the advertisement to bid or in the information to bidders. The late submission of a bid makes the bid nonrepsonsive and is a material defect which shall not be waived by the Board of Education. Delays in the mail will not be considered. All Late bids in the mail will be returned to the bidder unopened.</p> <p>Proposal for the submission of alternatives by vendors will be accepted and reviewed. However, if any substitution or departure is not clearly noted and described, it will be understood that the bid intends to exactly meet the specifications.</p> <p>The Board of Education shall be the sole judge as to whether the proposed goods are "equal" or "approved". Quotations must be mailed or delivered to the Purchasing Office, 1140 Rankin, Troy, MI 48083 no later than 3 p.m. on the date shown above. Michigan State Sales and Use Taxes and Federal Excise Taxes do not apply unless otherwise indicated. Exemption certificates will be furnished when necessary. This request imposes no obligations on the buyer. The Board of Education reserves the right to accept or reject any or all bids or to split awards by items or to accept bids, which will best serve the Board of Education.</p>		

**THIS AREA MUST BE FILLED IN**

DELIVERY TIME	PRICES FIRM FOR	NAME OF COMPANY	TELEPHONE NO.
TERMS		NO. & STREET	FAX #
FOB DELIVERED	ALL DELIVERY CHARGES MUST BE INCLUDED IN PRICES SHOWN	CITY, STATE & ZIP CODE	E-MAIL
CONTACT PERSON (PLEASE PRINT)		SIGNATURE	DATE



**TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT  
BID #9530  
COMPUTER AND SCIENCE LAB SEATING**

The Troy School District is seeking qualified bids for the supply of various seating for several district locations. The following points are integral to this bid, respondents not adhering to these parameters are subject to disqualification.

- All responses will be regarded as bid to specification unless **SPECIFICALLY** indicated on bid response. Any alternates being proposed **MUST** include complete cut sheet. Failure to include cut sheet with bid submission will be grounds for disqualification of entire bid.
- All bidders **MUST** complete the enclosed Familiar Disclosure form and include with bid submission. Bids not containing this form will be automatically disqualified. The Familiar Disclosure form is **NOT** required to be notarized for non-construction bids.
- Bidders are reminded that furniture listed on this bid will not require installation by the awarded vendor, however, inside delivery is required.
- Delivery includes unloading from shipping vehicle and placing into designated school. School personnel will not assist with unloading.
- None of the schools have loading docks, pallet lifts or forklifts. Bidders are specifically reminded that all unloading of purchased items is the sole responsibility of awarded vendor.
- Awarded vendors **MUST** coordinate with shipper to insure that all delivered products can be offloaded in a timely manner.
- Minimum of 48 hours notice is required prior to the delivery of any items awarded on this bid. No delivery of furniture will be accepted during student hours. For deliveries when school is in session, awarded vendors must co-ordinate delivery after 3:00 pm local time with installation **THAT DAY**. For deliveries during non-student days, delivery may be made from 7:30 am until 2:00 pm. Buildings are closed by 2:30 pm on non-student days unless specific prior arrangements have been agreed to by the School District.



## SCHOLARCRAFT 110 SERIES Soft Plastic Swivel Chair

SCHOOL	TOTAL QUANTITY	UNIT COST	UNIT FREIGHT
Barnard Elementary	29		
Bemis Elementary	29		
Costello Elementary	29		
Hamilton Elementary	29		
Hill Elementary	29		
Leonard Elementary	29		
Martell Elementary	29		
Morse Elementary	29		
Schroeder Elementary	29		
Troy Union Elementary	29		
Wass Elementary	29		
Wattles Elementary	29		
Boulan Park Middle	108		
Larson Middle	108		
Smith Middle	77		
International Academy East	45		
Athens High	321		
Troy High	310		
Niles	63		

## National Public Seating Adjustable Stool model# 6230

SCHOOL	TOTAL QUANTITY	UNIT COST	UNIT FREIGHT
Boulan Park Middle	72		
Larson Middle	72		

## HON Model 5905 Teacher Task Stool with foot ring

SCHOOL	TOTAL QUANTITY	UNIT COST	UNIT FREIGHT
Boulan Park Middle	12		
Larson Middle	12		

## **ALTERNATE Delivery of all items to District's warehouse.**

Styles and colors remain the same. District warehouse does have a truck dock, forklift and pallet jack. Hours of delivery are Monday through Friday 7:00 am to 3:00 pm. Depending on freight costs, the district may, at its sole discretion, opt to have all items delivered to this one central location. If this option is selected, District personnel will handle offloading (tailgate delivery only).

<b>ITEM</b>	<b>TOTAL QUANTITY</b>	<b>UNIT COST</b>	<b>TOTAL FREIGHT</b>
Computer Chair	1,380		
Lab Stool	144		
Teacher Stool	12		

<b>TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT</b>										
<b>Computer &amp; Science Lab Seating</b>										
<b>BID 9530</b>										
		<u>E-Quip Co., Inc.</u>			<u>School Specialty, Inc.</u>			<u>School Specialty, Inc.</u>		
<u>School</u>										
<b>Soft Plastic Swivel Chair</b>		<b>Alternate 1: Royal Seating</b>			<b>Alternate 1: Scholarcraft</b>			<b>Alternate 2: Artco Bell</b>		
		<b>Unit</b>			<b>Unit</b>			<b>Unit</b>		
<b>Quantity</b>		<b>Unit Cost</b>	<b>Freight</b>	<b>Total Cost</b>	<b>Unit Cost</b>	<b>Freight</b>	<b>Total</b>	<b>Unit Cost</b>	<b>Freight</b>	<b>Total</b>
Barnard Elementary	29	\$ 62.00	\$ 9.00	\$ 2,059.00	\$ 69.28	\$ 9.82	\$ 2,293.90	\$ 64.27	\$ 10.96	\$ 2,181.67
Bemis Elementary	29	62.00	9.00	2,059.00	69.28	9.82	2,293.90	64.27	10.96	2,181.67
Costello Elementary	29	62.00	9.00	2,059.00	69.28	9.82	2,293.90	64.27	10.96	2,181.67
Hamilton Elementary	29	62.00	9.00	2,059.00	69.28	9.82	2,293.90	64.27	10.96	2,181.67
Hill Elementary	29	62.00	9.00	2,059.00	69.28	9.82	2,293.90	64.27	10.96	2,181.67
Leonard Elementary	29	62.00	9.00	2,059.00	69.28	9.82	2,293.90	64.27	10.96	2,181.67
Martell Elementary	29	62.00	9.00	2,059.00	69.28	9.82	2,293.90	64.27	10.96	2,181.67
Morse Elementary	29	62.00	9.00	2,059.00	69.28	9.82	2,293.90	64.27	10.96	2,181.67
Schroeder Elementary	29	62.00	9.00	2,059.00	69.28	9.82	2,293.90	64.27	10.96	2,181.67
Troy Union Elementary	29	62.00	9.00	2,059.00	69.28	9.82	2,293.90	64.27	10.96	2,181.67
Wass Elementary	29	62.00	9.00	2,059.00	69.28	9.82	2,293.90	64.27	10.96	2,181.67
Wattles Elementary	29	62.00	9.00	2,059.00	69.28	9.82	2,293.90	64.27	10.96	2,181.67
Boulan Park Middle School	108	62.00	9.00	7,668.00	68.86	6.04	8,089.20	64.05	8.92	7,880.76
Larson Middle School	108	62.00	9.00	7,668.00	68.86	6.04	8,089.20	64.05	8.92	7,880.76
Smith Middle School	77	62.00	9.00	5,467.00	68.91	6.53	5,808.88	64.17	10.01	5,711.86
International Academy East	45	62.00	9.00	3,195.00	69.02	7.45	3,441.15	64.23	10.59	3,366.90
Athens High School	321	62.00	9.00	22,791.00	68.64	4.06	23,336.70	63.81	6.79	22,662.60
Troy High School	310	62.00	9.00	22,010.00	68.66	4.20	22,586.60	63.81	6.79	21,886.00
Niles	63	62.00	9.00	4,473.00	69.02	7.45	4,817.61	64.17	7.45	4,512.06
Total				97,980.00			103,696.14			100,080.98
<b>Student Lab Stool</b>		<b>As Specified: NPS #6230</b>			<b>As Specified: NPS #6230</b>			<b>As Specified: NPS #6230</b>		
		<b>Unit</b>			<b>Unit</b>			<b>Unit</b>		
<b>Quantity</b>		<b>Unit Cost</b>	<b>Freight</b>	<b>Total Cost</b>	<b>Unit Cost</b>	<b>Freight</b>	<b>Total Cost</b>	<b>Unit Cost</b>	<b>Freight</b>	<b>Total Cost</b>
Boulan Park Middle School	72	45.00	4.00	3,528.00	24.99	2.08	1,949.04	24.99	2.08	1,949.04
Larson Middle School	72	45.00	4.00	3,528.00	24.99	2.08	1,949.04	24.99	2.08	1,949.04
Total				7,056.00			3,898.08			3,898.08
<b>Teacher Lab Stool</b>		<b>As Specified: HON 5905</b>			<b>As Specified: HON 5905</b>			<b>As Specified: HON 5905</b>		





<b>TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT</b>										
<b>Computer &amp; Science Lab Seat</b>										
<b>BID 9530</b>										
		<u>School Specialty, Inc.</u>			<u>Corporate Express</u>			<u>Great Lakes Furniture &amp; Supply</u>		
<u>School</u>					<u>Soft Plastic Swivel Chair</u>					
<b>Soft Plastic Swivel Chair</b>		<b>Alternate 3: UniFlex 7P90</b>			<b>Alternate 1: HON TS1</b>			<b>As Specified: Scholarcraft</b>		
		<u>Unit</u>	<u>Unit</u>		<u>Unit</u>	<u>Unit</u>		<u>Unit</u>	<u>Unit</u>	
		<u>Cost</u>	<u>Freight</u>	<u>Total</u>	<u>Cost</u>	<u>Freight</u>	<u>Total</u>	<u>Cost</u>	<u>Freight</u>	<u>Total</u>
<u>Quantity</u>										
Barnard Elementary	29	\$ 64.27	\$ 10.96	\$ 2,181.67	\$ 57.10	\$ -	\$ 1,655.90	\$ 74.55	\$ 5.00	\$ 2,306.95
Bemis Elementary	29	64.27	10.96	2,181.67	57.10	-	1,655.90	74.55	5.00	2,306.95
Costello Elementary	29	64.27	10.96	2,181.67	57.10	-	1,655.90	74.55	5.00	2,306.95
Hamilton Elementary	29	64.27	10.96	2,181.67	57.10	-	1,655.90	74.55	5.00	2,306.95
Hill Elementary	29	64.27	10.96	2,181.67	57.10	-	1,655.90	74.55	5.00	2,306.95
Leonard Elementary	29	64.27	10.96	2,181.67	57.10	-	1,655.90	74.55	5.00	2,306.95
Martell Elementary	29	64.27	10.96	2,181.67	57.10	-	1,655.90	74.55	5.00	2,306.95
Morse Elementary	29	64.27	10.96	2,181.67	57.10	-	1,655.90	74.55	5.00	2,306.95
Schroeder Elementary	29	64.27	10.96	2,181.67	57.10	-	1,655.90	74.55	5.00	2,306.95
Troy Union Elementary	29	64.27	10.96	2,181.67	57.10	-	1,655.90	74.55	5.00	2,306.95
Wass Elementary	29	64.27	10.96	2,181.67	57.10	-	1,655.90	74.55	5.00	2,306.95
Wattles Elementary	29	64.27	10.96	2,181.67	57.10	-	1,655.90	74.55	5.00	2,306.95
Boulan Park Middle School	108	64.05	8.92	7,880.76	57.10	-	6,166.80	74.55	5.00	8,591.40
Larson Middle School	108	64.05	8.92	7,880.76	57.10	-	6,166.80	74.55	5.00	8,591.40
Smith Middle School	77	64.17	10.01	5,711.86	57.10	-	4,396.70	74.55	5.00	6,125.35
International Academy East	45	64.23	10.59	3,366.90	57.10	-	2,569.50	74.55	5.00	3,579.75
Athens High School	321	63.81	6.79	22,662.60	57.10	-	18,329.10	74.55	5.00	25,535.55
Troy High School	310	63.81	6.79	21,886.00	57.10	-	17,701.00	74.55	5.00	24,660.50
Niles	63	64.17	7.45	4,512.06	57.10	-	3,597.30	74.55	5.00	5,011.65
Total				100,080.98			78,798.00			109,779.00
<b>Student Lab Stool</b>										
		<b>As Specified: NPS #6230</b>			<b>As Specified: NPS #6230</b>			<b>As Specified: NPS #6230</b>		
		<u>Unit</u>	<u>Unit</u>		<u>Unit</u>	<u>Unit</u>		<u>Unit</u>	<u>Unit</u>	
		<u>Cost</u>	<u>Freight</u>	<u>Total Cost</u>	<u>Cost</u>	<u>Freight</u>	<u>Total Cost</u>	<u>Cost</u>	<u>Freight</u>	<u>Total Cost</u>
<u>Quantity</u>										
Boulan Park Middle School	72	24.99	2.08	1,949.04	27.25	4.25	2,268.00	29.25	4.00	2,394.00
Larson Middle School	72	24.99	2.08	1,949.04	27.25	4.25	2,268.00	29.25	4.00	2,394.00
Total				3,898.08			4,536.00			4,788.00
<b>Teacher Lab Stool</b>										
		<b>As Specified: HON 5905</b>			<b>As Specified: HON 5905</b>			<b>As Specified: HON 5905</b>		

<b>TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT</b>										
<b>Computer &amp; Science Lab Seat</b>										
<b>BID 9530</b>										
<u>School</u>	<u>Quantity</u>	<u>School Specialty, Inc.</u>			<u>Corporate Express</u>			<u>Great Lakes Furniture &amp; Supply</u>		
		<u>Unit Cost</u>	<u>Unit Freight</u>	<u>Total Cost</u>	<u>Soft Plastic Swivel Chair</u>			<u>Unit Cost</u>	<u>Unit Freight</u>	<u>Total Cost</u>
Boulan Park Middle School	12	113.78	10.00	1,485.36	113.80	-	1,365.60	135.25	3.00	1,659.00
Larson Middle School	12	113.78	10.00	1,485.36	113.80	-	1,365.60	135.25	3.00	1,659.00
<b>Total</b>				<b>2,970.72</b>			<b>2,731.20</b>			<b>3,318.00</b>
<b>Total Delivered to Buildings</b>				<b>\$ 106,949.78</b>			<b>\$ 86,065.20</b>			<b>\$ 117,885.00</b>
<b>ALTERNATE: Delivery of all items to Distri</b>										
	<u>Total Quantity</u>	<u>Unit Cost</u>	<u>Total Freight</u>	<u>Total</u>	<u>Unit Cost</u>	<u>Total Freight</u>	<u>Total</u>	<u>Unit Cost</u>	<u>Total Freight</u>	<u>Total</u>
Computer Chair	1,380	63.18	1,559.40	88,747.80	57.10	-	78,798.00	74.55	5,800.00	108,679.00
Lab Stool	144	24.95	250.56	3,843.36	27.25	612.00	4,536.00	29.25	550.00	4,762.00
Teacher Stool	12	113.78	120.00	1,485.36	113.80	-	1,365.60	135.25	50.00	1,673.00
<b>Total Delivered to Warehouse</b>				<b>\$ 94,076.52</b>			<b>\$ 84,699.60</b>			<b>\$ 115,114.00</b>

<b>TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT</b>										
<b>Computer &amp; Science Lab Seat</b>										
<b>BID 9530</b>										
		<u>Commercial Concepts &amp;</u>			<u>J.R. Holcomb &amp; Co.</u>			<u>Learning Consultants, Inc.</u>		
<u>School</u>										
<b>Soft Plastic Swivel Chair</b>		<b>As Specified: Scholarcraft</b>			<b>Alternate 1: Virco</b>			<b>Alternate 1: Academia Furniture</b>		
<u>Quantity</u>		<u>Unit</u>	<u>Unit</u>	<u>Total</u>	<u>Unit</u>	<u>Unit</u>	<u>Total</u>	<u>Unit</u>	<u>Unit</u>	<u>Total</u>
		<u>Cost</u>	<u>Freight</u>		<u>Cost</u>	<u>Freight</u>		<u>Cost</u>	<u>Freight</u>	<u>Total</u>
Barnard Elementary	29	\$ 58.93	\$ 2.50	\$ 1,781.47	No Bid			\$ 47.50	\$ 1.00	\$ 1,406.50
Bemis Elementary	29	58.93	2.50	1,781.47	No Bid			47.50	1.00	1,406.50
Costello Elementary	29	58.93	2.50	1,781.47	No Bid			47.50	1.00	1,406.50
Hamilton Elementary	29	58.93	2.50	1,781.47	No Bid			47.50	1.00	1,406.50
Hill Elementary	29	58.93	2.50	1,781.47	No Bid			47.50	1.00	1,406.50
Leonard Elementary	29	58.93	2.50	1,781.47	No Bid			47.50	1.00	1,406.50
Martell Elementary	29	58.93	2.50	1,781.47	No Bid			47.50	1.00	1,406.50
Morse Elementary	29	58.93	2.50	1,781.47	No Bid			47.50	1.00	1,406.50
Schroeder Elementary	29	58.93	2.50	1,781.47	No Bid			47.50	1.00	1,406.50
Troy Union Elementary	29	58.93	2.50	1,781.47	No Bid			47.50	1.00	1,406.50
Wass Elementary	29	58.93	2.50	1,781.47	No Bid			47.50	1.00	1,406.50
Wattles Elementary	29	58.93	2.50	1,781.47	No Bid			47.50	1.00	1,406.50
Boulan Park Middle School	108	58.93	1.75	6,553.44	No Bid			47.50	1.00	5,238.00
Larson Middle School	108	58.93	1.75	6,553.44	No Bid			47.50	1.00	5,238.00
Smith Middle School	77	58.93		4,537.61	No Bid			47.50	1.00	3,734.50
International Academy East	45	58.93	2.50	2,764.35	No Bid			47.50	1.00	2,182.50
Athens High School	321	58.93	1.25	19,317.78	No Bid			47.50	1.00	15,568.50
Troy High School	310	58.93	1.25	18,655.80	No Bid			47.50	1.00	15,035.00
Niles	63	58.93	2.25	3,854.34	No Bid			47.50	1.00	3,055.50
Total				83,614.40						66,930.00
<b>Student Lab Stool</b>		<b>As Specified: NPS #6230</b>						<b>As Specified: NPS #6230</b>		
<u>Quantity</u>		<u>Unit</u>	<u>Unit</u>	<u>Total Cost</u>	<u>Unit</u>	<u>Unit</u>	<u>Total Cost</u>	<u>Unit</u>	<u>Unit</u>	<u>Total Cost</u>
		<u>Cost</u>	<u>Freight</u>		<u>Cost</u>	<u>Freight</u>		<u>Cost</u>	<u>Freight</u>	<u>Total Cost</u>
Boulan Park Middle School	72	44.83	1.60	3,342.96	No Bid			37.00	4.60	2,995.20
Larson Middle School	72	44.83	1.60	3,342.96	No Bid			37.00	4.60	2,995.20
Total				6,685.92						5,990.40
<b>Teacher Lab Stool</b>		<b>As Specified: HON 5905</b>						<b>As Specified: HON 5905</b>		

<b>TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT</b>										
<b>Computer &amp; Science Lab Seat</b>										
<b>BID 9530</b>										
		<u>Commercial Concepts &amp;</u>			<u>J.R. Holcomb &amp; Co.</u>			<u>Learning Consultants, Inc.</u>		
<u>School</u>										
	<u>Quantity</u>	<u>Unit Cost</u>	<u>Unit Freight</u>	<u>Total Cost</u>	<u>Unit Cost</u>	<u>Unit Freight</u>	<u>Total Cost</u>	<u>Unit Cost</u>	<u>Unit Freight</u>	<u>Total Cost</u>
Boulan Park Middle School	12	123.57	4.30	1,534.44	No Bid			136.00	1.00	1,644.00
Larson Middle School	12	123.57	4.30	1,534.44	No Bid			136.00	1.00	1,644.00
Total				3,068.88						3,288.00
<b>Total Delivered to Buildings</b>				<b>\$ 93,369.20</b>						<b>\$ 76,208.40</b>
<b>ALTERNATE: Delivery of all items to Distri</b>										
	<u>Total Quantity</u>	<u>Unit Cost</u>	<u>Total Freight</u>	<u>Total</u>	<u>Unit Cost</u>	<u>Total Freight</u>	<u>Total</u>	<u>Unit Cost</u>	<u>Total Freight</u>	<u>Total</u>
Computer Chair	1,380	57.93	-	79,943.40	54.88	75,734.40	151,468.80	47.50	1,380.00	66,930.00
Lab Stool	144	43.83	1.15	6,312.67	27.32	4,220.88	8,154.96	37.00	622.40	5,950.40
Teacher Stool	12	123.57	4.30	1,487.14	130.00	1,693.50	3,253.50	136.00	12.00	1,644.00
<b>Total Delivered to Warehouse</b>				<b>\$ 87,743.21</b>			<b>\$ 162,877.26</b>			<b>\$ 74,524.40</b>

<b>TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT</b>										
<b>Computer &amp; Science Lab Seat</b>										
<b>BID 9530</b>										
		<u>Kurtz Bros.</u>			<u>Kurtz Bros.</u>			<u>Great Lakes Furniture Supply.</u>		
<u>School</u>										
<b>Soft Plastic Swivel Chair</b>								<b>Alternate 1: CDF School Furniture</b>		
		<u>Unit</u>	<u>Unit</u>		<u>Unit</u>	<u>Unit</u>		<u>Unit</u>	<u>Unit</u>	
<u>Quantity</u>		<u>Cost</u>	<u>Freight</u>	<u>Total</u>	<u>Cost</u>	<u>Freight</u>	<u>Total</u>	<u>Unit Cost</u>	<u>Freight</u>	<u>Total</u>
Barnard Elementary	29	No Bid			No Bid			\$ 52.70	\$ 2.50	\$ 1,600.80
Bemis Elementary	29	No Bid			No Bid			52.70	2.50	1,600.80
Costello Elementary	29	No Bid			No Bid			52.70	2.50	1,600.80
Hamilton Elementary	29	No Bid			No Bid			52.70	2.50	1,600.80
Hill Elementary	29	No Bid			No Bid			52.70	2.50	1,600.80
Leonard Elementary	29	No Bid			No Bid			52.70	2.50	1,600.80
Martell Elementary	29	No Bid			No Bid			52.70	2.50	1,600.80
Morse Elementary	29	No Bid			No Bid			52.70	2.50	1,600.80
Schroeder Elementary	29	No Bid			No Bid			52.70	2.50	1,600.80
Troy Union Elementary	29	No Bid			No Bid			52.70	2.50	1,600.80
Wass Elementary	29	No Bid			No Bid			52.70	2.50	1,600.80
Wattles Elementary	29	No Bid			No Bid			52.70	2.50	1,600.80
Boulan Park Middle School	108	No Bid			No Bid			52.70	2.50	5,961.60
Larson Middle School	108	No Bid			No Bid			52.70	2.50	5,961.60
Smith Middle School	77	No Bid			No Bid			52.70	2.50	4,250.40
International Academy East	45	No Bid			No Bid			52.70	2.50	2,484.00
Athens High School	321	No Bid			No Bid			52.70	2.50	17,719.20
Troy High School	310	No Bid			No Bid			52.70	2.50	17,112.00
Niles	63	No Bid			No Bid			52.70	2.50	3,477.60
Total										76,176.00
<b>Student Lab Stool</b>										
		<u>Unit</u>	<u>Unit</u>		<u>Unit</u>	<u>Unit</u>		<u>Unit</u>	<u>Unit</u>	
<u>Quantity</u>		<u>Cost</u>	<u>Freight</u>	<u>Total Cost</u>	<u>Cost</u>	<u>Freight</u>	<u>Total Cost</u>	<u>Unit Cost</u>	<u>Freight</u>	<u>Total Cost</u>
Boulan Park Middle School	72	No Bid			No Bid			No Bid		
Larson Middle School	72	No Bid			No Bid			No Bid		
Total										
<b>Teacher Lab Stool</b>										
										Alternate 1: Eurotech #OSS400/DSK500

<b>TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT</b>										
<b>Computer &amp; Science Lab Seat</b>										
<b>BID 9530</b>										
<u>School</u>	<u>Kurtz Bros.</u>				<u>Kurtz Bros.</u>			<u>Great Lakes Furniture Supply.</u>		
	<u>Quantity</u>	<u>Unit Cost</u>	<u>Unit Freight</u>	<u>Total Cost</u>	<u>Unit Cost</u>	<u>Unit Freight</u>	<u>Total Cost</u>	<u>Unit Cost</u>	<u>Unit Freight</u>	<u>Total Cost</u>
Boulan Park Middle School	12	No Bid			No Bid			127.20	4.00	1,574.40
Larson Middle School	12	No Bid			No Bid			127.20	4.00	1,574.40
Total										3,148.80
<b>Total Delivered to Buildings</b>										<b>\$ 79,324.80</b>
<b>ALTERNATE: Delivery of all items to Distr</b>										
	<u>Total Quantity</u>	<u>Unit Cost</u>	<u>Total Freight</u>	<u>Total</u>	<u>Unit Cost</u>	<u>Total Freight</u>	<u>Total</u>	<u>Unit Cost</u>	<u>Total Freight</u>	<u>Total</u>
Computer Chair	1,380	No Bid			No Bid			51.95	1,725.00	73,416.00
Lab Stool	144	36.00	-	5,184.00	40.75	-	5,868.00	No Bid		
Teacher Stool	12	130.00	-	1,560.00	130.00	-	1,560.00	124.20	96.00	1,586.40
<b>Total Delivered to Warehouse</b>				<b>\$ 6,744.00</b>			<b>\$ 7,428.00</b>			<b>\$ 75,002.40</b>

<b>TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT</b>											
<b>Computer &amp; Science Lab Seat</b>											
<b>BID 9530</b>											
<b>Office Express</b>											
<b>Office Express</b>											
<b>Office Express</b>											
<b>School</b>											
<b>Soft Plastic Swivel Chair</b>											
<b>Alternate 1: Smith Systems</b>											
<b>Alternate 2: HON TS1</b>											
<b>Alternate 3: HON G21</b>											
		<u>Unit</u>	<u>Unit</u>				<u>Unit</u>	<u>Unit</u>			
		<u>Cost</u>	<u>Freight</u>	<u>Total Cost</u>	<u>Cost</u>	<u>Freight</u>	<u>Total Cost</u>	<u>Cost</u>	<u>Freight</u>	<u>Total Cost</u>	
		<u>Quantity</u>									
Barnard Elementary	29	\$ 75.10	\$ 4.40	\$ 2,305.50	\$ 59.00	\$ 0.50	\$ 1,725.50	\$ 78.00	\$ 0.50	\$ 2,276.50	
Bemis Elementary	29	75.10	4.40	2,305.50	59.00	0.50	1,725.50	78.00	0.50	2,276.50	
Costello Elementary	29	75.10	4.40	2,305.50	59.00	0.50	1,725.50	78.00	0.50	2,276.50	
Hamilton Elementary	29	75.10	4.40	2,305.50	59.00	0.50	1,725.50	78.00	0.50	2,276.50	
Hill Elementary	29	75.10	4.40	2,305.50	59.00	0.50	1,725.50	78.00	0.50	2,276.50	
Leonard Elementary	29	75.10	4.40	2,305.50	59.00	0.50	1,725.50	78.00	0.50	2,276.50	
Martell Elementary	29	75.10	4.40	2,305.50	59.00	0.50	1,725.50	78.00	0.50	2,276.50	
Morse Elementary	29	75.10	4.40	2,305.50	59.00	0.50	1,725.50	78.00	0.50	2,276.50	
Schroeder Elementary	29	75.10	4.40	2,305.50	59.00	0.50	1,725.50	78.00	0.50	2,276.50	
Troy Union Elementary	29	75.10	4.40	2,305.50	59.00	0.50	1,725.50	78.00	0.50	2,276.50	
Wass Elementary	29	75.10	4.40	2,305.50	59.00	0.50	1,725.50	78.00	0.50	2,276.50	
Wattles Elementary	29	75.10	4.40	2,305.50	59.00	0.50	1,725.50	78.00	0.50	2,276.50	
Boulan Park Middle School	108	75.10	4.40	8,586.00	59.00	0.50	6,426.00	78.00	0.50	8,478.00	
Larson Middle School	108	75.10	4.40	8,586.00	59.00	0.50	6,426.00	78.00	0.50	8,478.00	
Smith Middle School	77	75.10	4.40	6,121.50	59.00	0.50	4,581.50	78.00	0.50	6,044.50	
International Academy East	45	75.10	4.40	3,577.50	59.00	0.50	2,677.50	78.00	0.50	3,532.50	
Athens High School	321	75.10	4.40	25,519.50	59.00	0.50	19,099.50	78.00	0.50	25,198.50	
Troy High School	310	75.10	4.40	24,645.00	59.00	0.50	18,445.00	78.00	0.50	24,335.00	
Niles	63	75.10	4.40	5,008.50	59.00	0.50	3,748.50	78.00	0.50	4,945.50	
Total				109,710.00			82,110.00			108,330.00	
<b>Student Lab Stool</b>											
		<u>Unit</u>	<u>Unit</u>				<u>Unit</u>	<u>Unit</u>			
		<u>Cost</u>	<u>Freight</u>	<u>Total Cost</u>	<u>Cost</u>	<u>Freight</u>	<u>Total Cost</u>	<u>Cost</u>	<u>Freight</u>	<u>Total Cost</u>	
		<u>Quantity</u>									
Boulan Park Middle School	72	No Bid			No Bid			No Bid			
Larson Middle School	72	No Bid			No Bid			No Bid			
Total											
<b>Teacher Lab Stool</b>											
<b>As Specified: HON 5905</b>											
<b>As Specified: HON 5905</b>											
<b>As Specified: HON 5905</b>											

<b>TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT</b>										
<b>Computer &amp; Science Lab Seat</b>										
<b>BID 9530</b>										
<b>Office Express</b>										
<b>Office Express</b>										
<b>Office Express</b>										
<u>School</u>										
	<u>Quantity</u>	<u>Unit Cost</u>	<u>Unit Freight</u>	<u>Total Cost</u>	<u>Unit Cost</u>	<u>Unit Freight</u>	<u>Total Cost</u>	<u>Unit Cost</u>	<u>Unit Freight</u>	<u>Total Cost</u>
Boulan Park Middle School	12	107.00	2.00	1,308.00	107.00	2.00	1,308.00	107.00	2.00	197,508.00
Larson Middle School	12	107.00	2.00	1,308.00	107.00	2.00	1,308.00	107.00	2.00	197,508.00
Total				2,616.00			2,616.00			395,016.00
<b>Total Delivered to Buildings</b>				<b>\$ 112,326.00</b>			<b>\$ 84,726.00</b>			<b>\$ 503,346.00</b>
<b>ALTERNATE: Delivery of all items to Distri</b>										
	<u>Total Quantity</u>	<u>Unit Cost</u>	<u>Total Freight</u>	<u>Total</u>	<u>Unit Cost</u>	<u>Total Freight</u>	<u>Total</u>	<u>Unit Cost</u>	<u>Total Freight</u>	<u>Total</u>
Computer Chair	1,380	75.00	6,000.00	109,500.00	59.00	-	81,420.00	78.00	-	107,640.00
Lab Stool	144	No Bid			No Bid			No Bid		
Teacher Stool	12	107.00	-	1,284.00	107.00	-	1,284.00	107.00	-	1,284.00
<b>Total Delivered to Warehouse</b>				<b>\$ 110,784.00</b>			<b>\$ 82,704.00</b>			<b>\$ 108,924.00</b>



<b>TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT</b>										
<b>Computer &amp; Science Lab Seat</b>										
<b>BID 9530</b>										
		<u>Office Depot</u>			<u>McDonald's &amp; Company</u>			<u>McDonald's &amp; Company</u>		
<u>School</u>										
<b>Soft Plastic Swivel Chair</b>		<b>As Specified: Scholarcraft</b>			<b>Alternate 1: Alumni C-HR-1800GL</b>			<b>Alternate 2: Columbia 1280</b>		
	<u>Quantity</u>	<u>Unit Cost</u>	<u>Unit Freight</u>	<u>Total Cost</u>	<u>Unit Cost</u>	<u>Unit Freight</u>	<u>Total Cost</u>	<u>Unit Cost</u>	<u>Unit Freight</u>	<u>Total Cost</u>
Barnard Elementary	29	\$ 49.35	\$ 7.50	\$ 1,648.65	\$ 70.43	\$ -	\$ 2,042.47	\$ 90.81	\$ -	\$ 2,633.49
Bemis Elementary	29	49.35	7.50	1,648.65	70.43	-	2,042.47	90.81	-	2,633.49
Costello Elementary	29	49.35	7.50	1,648.65	70.43	-	2,042.47	90.81	-	2,633.49
Hamilton Elementary	29	49.35	7.50	1,648.65	70.43	-	2,042.47	90.81	-	2,633.49
Hill Elementary	29	49.35	7.50	1,648.65	70.43	-	2,042.47	90.81	-	2,633.49
Leonard Elementary	29	49.35	7.50	1,648.65	70.43	-	2,042.47	90.81	-	2,633.49
Martell Elementary	29	49.35	7.50	1,648.65	70.43	-	2,042.47	90.81	-	2,633.49
Morse Elementary	29	49.35	7.50	1,648.65	70.43	-	2,042.47	90.81	-	2,633.49
Schroeder Elementary	29	49.35	7.50	1,648.65	70.43	-	2,042.47	90.81	-	2,633.49
Troy Union Elementary	29	49.35	7.50	1,648.65	70.43	-	2,042.47	90.81	-	2,633.49
Wass Elementary	29	49.35	7.50	1,648.65	70.43	-	2,042.47	90.81	-	2,633.49
Wattles Elementary	29	49.35	7.50	1,648.65	70.43	-	2,042.47	90.81	-	2,633.49
Boulan Park Middle School	108	49.35	7.50	6,139.80	70.43	-	7,606.44	90.81	-	9,807.48
Larson Middle School	108	49.35	7.50	6,139.80	70.43	-	7,606.44	90.81	-	9,807.48
Smith Middle School	77	49.35	7.50	4,377.45	70.43	-	5,423.11	90.81	-	6,992.37
International Academy East	45	49.35	7.50	2,558.25	70.43	-	3,169.35	90.81	-	4,086.45
Athens High School	321	49.35	7.50	18,248.85	70.43	-	22,608.03	90.81	-	29,150.01
Troy High School	310	49.35	7.50	17,623.50	70.43	-	21,833.30	90.81	-	28,151.10
Niles	63	49.35	7.50	3,581.55	70.43	-	4,437.09	90.81	-	5,721.03
Total				78,453.00			97,193.40			125,317.80
<b>Student Lab Stool</b>		<b>As Specified: NPS #6230</b>			<b>As Specified: NPS #6230</b>			<b>As Specified: NPS #6230</b>		
	<u>Quantity</u>	<u>Unit Cost</u>	<u>Unit Freight</u>	<u>Total Cost</u>	<u>Unit Cost</u>	<u>Unit Freight</u>	<u>Total Cost</u>	<u>Unit Cost</u>	<u>Unit Freight</u>	<u>Total Cost</u>
Boulan Park Middle School	72	50.00	2.25	3,762.00	33.78	-	2,432.16	33.78	-	2,432.16
Larson Middle School	72	50.00	2.25	3,762.00	33.78	-	2,432.16	33.78	-	2,432.16
Total				7,524.00			4,864.32			4,864.32
<b>Teacher Lab Stool</b>		<b>Alternate 1: 9-5 #1426B2A</b>			<b>Alternate 2: 9-5 #1426B2A</b>					

<b>TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT</b>										
<b>Computer &amp; Science Lab Seat</b>										
<b>BID 9530</b>										
<u>School</u>	<u>Office Depot</u>				<u>McDonald's &amp; Company</u>			<u>McDonald's &amp; Company</u>		
	<u>Quantity</u>	<u>Unit Cost</u>	<u>Unit Freight</u>	<u>Total Cost</u>	<u>Unit Cost</u>	<u>Unit Freight</u>	<u>Total Cost</u>	<u>Unit Cost</u>	<u>Unit Freight</u>	<u>Total Cost</u>
Boulan Park Middle School	12	No Bid			164.59	-	1,975.08	164.59	-	1,975.08
Larson Middle School	12	No Bid			164.59	-	1,975.08	164.59	-	1,975.08
<b>Total</b>							<b>3,950.16</b>			<b>3,950.16</b>
<b>Total Delivered to Buildings</b>				<b>\$ 85,977.00</b>			<b>\$ 106,007.88</b>			<b>\$ 134,132.28</b>
<b>ALTERNATE: Delivery of all items to Distr</b>										
	<b>Total Quantity</b>	<b>Unit Cost</b>	<b>Total Freight</b>	<b>Total</b>	<b>Unit Cost</b>	<b>Total Freight</b>	<b>Total</b>	<b>Unit Cost</b>	<b>Total Freight</b>	<b>Total</b>
Computer Chair	1,380	68,103.00	6,321.00	93,988,461.00	68.63	-	94,709.40	89.96	-	124,144.80
Lab Stool	144	7,200.00	324.00	1,037,124.00	30.95	-	4,456.80	30.95	-	4,456.80
Teacher Stool	12	No Bid			143.15	-	1,717.80	143.15	-	1,717.80
<b>Total Delivered to Warehouse</b>				<b>\$ 95,025,585.00</b>			<b>\$ 100,884.00</b>			<b>\$ 130,319.40</b>