

REQUEST FOR QUOTATION	TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT 1140 RANKIN, TROY, MICHIGAN 48083 248-823-4052 FAX: 248-823-4077	REQUISITION
No. 9521		
DUE DATE NO LATER THAN 5/7/08 3 p.m.		DATE 4/23/08

REQUEST FOR QUOTE - NOT AN ORDER

THIS FORM MUST BE UTILIZED WHEN RESPONDING TO THIS REQUEST
 BID ENVELOPE ENCLOSED

THE RFQ NUMBER MUST APPEAR ON ALL QUOTATIONS AND RELATED CORRESPONDENCE, THIS IS NOT AN ORDER

Quantity	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	AMOUNT
	<p>Please supply us with your bid to furnish the Troy School District with MUSICAL INSTRUMENTS FOR INTERNATIONAL ACADEMY EAST</p> <p style="text-align: center;">Copies of the bid are available at: www.troy.k12.mi.us/purchasing/items_out_for_bid.htm</p> <p style="text-align: center;">Bid recaps will be available at: troy.k12.mi.us/purchasing/index.htm</p> <p style="text-align: center;"><u>FACSIMILE BID IS NOT ACCEPTABLE</u></p> <p>Bids will not be accepted if submitted after the deadline specified (local time) in the advertisement to bid or in the information to bidders. The late submission of a bid makes the bid nonrepsonive and is a material defect which shall not be waived by the Board of Education. Delays in the mail will not be considered. All Late bids in the mail will be returned to the bidder unopened.</p> <p>Proposal for the submission of alternatives by vendors will be accepted and reviewed. However, if any substitution or departure is not clearly noted and described, it will be understood that the bid intends to exactly meet the specifications.</p> <p>The Board of Education shall be the sole judge as to whether the proposed goods are "equal" or "approved". Quotations must be mailed or delivered to the Purchasing Office, 1140 Rankin, Troy, MI 48083 no later than 3 p.m. on the date shown above. Michigan State Sales and Use Taxes and Federal Excise Taxes do not apply unless otherwise indicated. Exemption certificates will be furnished when necessary. This request imposes no obligations on the buyer. The Board of Education reserves the right to accept or reject any or all bids or to split awards by items or to accept bids, which will best serve the Board of Education.</p>		

THIS AREA MUST BE FILLED IN

DELIVERY TIME	PRICES FIRM FOR	NAME OF COMPANY	TELEPHONE NO.
TERMS		NO. & STREET	FAX #
FOB DELIVERED	ALL DELIVERY CHARGES MUST BE INCLUDED IN PRICES SHOWN	CITY, STATE & ZIP CODE	E-MAIL
CONTACT PERSON (PLEASE PRINT)		SIGNATURE	DATE

AFFIDAVIT OF BIDDER

The undersigned, the owner or authorized officer of _____ (the “Bidder), pursuant to the familial disclosure requirement provided in the _____ (the “School District”) advertisement for construction bids, hereby represent and warrant except as provided below, that no familial relationships exist between the over(s) or any employee of _____ and any member of the Board of Education of the School District or the Superintendent of the School District.

List any Familial Relationships:

BIDDER:

By: _____

Its: _____

STATE OF MICHIGAN)
)ss.
COUNTY OF _____)

This instrument was acknowledged before me on the _____ day of _____, 2008, by
_____.

,Notary Public

_____ County, Michigan

My Commission Expires: _____

Acting in the County of: _____

**Troy School District
Bid 9521**

Quantity	Description	Unit Price	Unit Freight Cost
1	Yamaha YTS-475 Tenor Sax		
1	Yamaha TBS-52 Baritone Sax		
1	Fox Bassoon Model 51		
1	Fox Renard 220 Artist Bassoon		
1	Musser M7051 Xylophone, 3 ½ octaves		
3	Holton Farkas – H177 Double Horn (Silver Fixed Bell)		
1	Mirabophone BB flat 1864 Rotary Valve Tuba #MI1864V with Case		
1	Jupiter 4 Valve BB flat Tuba – Model 482L		
2	YEP 321S Silver 4 valve Euphonium		
1	Gemeinhardt 4WSSK Professional Piccolo		
1	Fox Renard Model 330 Oboe		
1	Fox Renard Model 333 Protégé Oboe		
1	Ludwig Symphonic Series 32” Timpani		
2	Selmer 1430P Bb Bass Clarinet		
4	¾ Glasser Composite Bass Bows #110477		
4	4/4 Glasser Composite Cello Bows #110449		
4	4/4 Lewis Kayser Model or Comparable Cello Outfits		
3	4/4 Lewis Model 224 or Comparable BASS Outfits		

All Delivery will be to: Troy School District
International Academy East
1291 Torpey
Troy, MI 48083

TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT												
Bid 9521												
		Shar Products Co.				Washington Music Sales				Northeast Music Inc		
Qty	Description	Alt	Unit Price	Freight	Total	Alt	Unit Price	Freight	Total	Unit Price	Freight	Total
1	Yamaha YTS-475 Tenor Sax				no bid		\$ 1,473.00	inc	\$ 1,473.00	\$ 1,488.00	No Chg	\$ 1,488.00
1	Yamaha YBS-52 Baritone Sax				no bid		3,143.00	inc	3,143.00	3,198.00	No Chg	3,198.00
1	Fox Bassoon 51				no bid		3,295.00	inc	3,295.00			-
1	Fox Bassoon 220				no bid		5,775.00	inc	5,775.00			-
1	Musser M7051 Xylophone				no bid		1,777.00	inc	1,777.00			-
3	Holton Farkas H177 Dbl Horn				no bid		2,192.00	inc	6,576.00	2,469.00	No Chg	7,407.00
1	Mirabophone Tuba MI1864V				no bid	BB-1864V	6,869.00	inc	6,869.00			-
									-			-
1	Jupiter Tuba 482L				no bid		2,669.00	inc	2,669.00			-
2	Euphonium YEP321S				no bid		1,699.00	inc	3,398.00	1,714.00	No Chg	3,428.00
1	Gemeinhardt Piccolo 4WSSK				no bid		1,159.00	inc	1,159.00			-
1	Fox Oboe 330				no bid		2,659.00	inc	2,659.00			-
1	Fox Oboe 333				no bid		2,091.00	inc	2,091.00			-
1	Ludwig Timpani				no bid	LKG732KG	2,331.00	inc	2,331.00			-
2	Selmer Clarinet 1430P				no bid		1,068.00	inc	2,136.00	1,299.00	No Chg	2,598.00
4	Bass Bows 3/4	Presto Carbon Fiber CPB120X	\$ 126.00	\$ -	504	GL25073B	150.00	inc	600.00			
4	Cello bows 4/4	Presto Carbon Fiber CPC120X	78.00	-	312	GL24074	87.00	inc	348.00			
4	Lewis Cello Outfit 4/4	Franz Hoffman Maestro SC2S1 4/4	880.00	-	3520	Roth R204E4H	489.00	inc	1,956.00			
3	Lewis Bass Outfit 4/4	Franz Hoffman Romanian HB120S1 3/4	1,319.00	-	3957	Roth SB900L3CFH	1,199.00	inc	3,597.00			

TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT													
Bid 9521													
		Southwest Strings				Taylor Music				Woodwind & Brasswind			
Qty	Description	Alt	Unit Price	Unit Frt	Total	Alt	Unit Price	Unit Frt	Total	Alt	Unit Price	Unit Frt	Total
1	Yamaha YTS-475 Tenor Sax				no bid				No Bid		\$ 1,540.00	inc	\$ 1,540.00
1	Yamaha YBS-52 Baritone Sax				no bid				No Bid		3,260.00	inc	3,260.00
1	Fox Bassoon 51				no bid		\$ 3,255.00	\$ -	\$ 3,255.00		3,366.00	inc	3,366.00
1	Fox Bassoon 220				no bid		5,711.00	-	5,711.00		5,910.00	inc	5,910.00
1	Musser M7051 Xylophone				no bid		1,888.00	-	1,888.00		2,060.00	inc	2,060.00
3	Holton Farkas H177 Dbl Horn				no bid		2,299.00	-	6,897.00		2,490.00	inc	7,470.00
1	Mirabophone Tuba MI1864V				no bid	S186	5,922.00	-	5,922.00		6,690.00	inc	6,690.00
						1864U	6,222.00	-	6,222.00				
1	Jupiter Tuba 482L				no bid				No Bid		2,620.00	inc	2,620.00
2	Euphonium YEP321S				no bid				No Bid		1,760.00	inc	3,520.00
1	Gemeinhardt Piccolo 4WSSK				no bid		1,288.00	-	1,288.00		1,220.00	inc	1,220.00
1	Fox Oboe 330				no bid		2,644.00	-	2,644.00		2,710.00	inc	2,710.00
1	Fox Oboe 333				no bid		2,077.00	-	2,077.00		2,120.00	inc	2,120.00
1	Ludwig Timpani				no bid	LKG732KG	2,488.00	-	2,488.00	LKG732KG	2,910.00	inc	2,910.00
2	Selmer Clarinet 1430P				no bid		1,133.00	-	2,266.00		1,290.00	inc	2,580.00
4	Bass Bows 3/4	501HFCT	132.00	528.00	2,640.00				No Bid		166.00	inc	664.00
4	Cello bows 4/4	401HCF	96.00	384.00	1,920.00				No Bid		136.00	inc	544.00
4	Lewis Cello Outfit 4/4	Klaus Mueller 210HF	495.00	1,980.00	9,900.00				No Bid				no bid
3	Lewis Bass Outfit 4/4	Klaus Mueller 725HFT	995.00	2,985.00	11,940.00				No Bid				no bid

TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT													
Bid 9521													
		Interstate Music				Anderson Music Co.				Nat'l Educational Music			
Qty	Description	Alt	Unit Price	Unit Frt	Total	Alt	Unit Price	Unit Frt	Total	Alt	Unit Price	Unit Frt	Total
1	Yamaha YTS-475 Tenor Sax		\$ 1,499.00	\$ -	\$ 1,499.00				no bid		\$ 1,481.00	inc	\$ 1,481.00
1	Yamaha YBS-52 Baritone Sax		3,184.00	-	3,184.00				no bid		3,159.00	inc	3,159.00
1	Fox Bassoon 51		3,406.00	-	3,406.00				no bid		3,256.00	inc	3,256.00
1	Fox Bassoon 220		5,760.00	-	5,760.00				no bid		5,753.00	inc	5,753.00
1	Musser M7051 Xylophone		1,950.00	-	1,950.00		\$ 2,395.00	n/c	\$ 2,395.00		1,799.00	inc	1,799.00
3	Holton Farkas H177 Dbl Horn		2,429.00	-	7,287.00		2,695.00	8,085.00	32,340.00		2,218.00	inc	6,654.00
1	Mirabophone Tuba MI1864V	Meinl Weston MW25WC	6,159.00	-	6,159.00				no bid	Yamaha YBB641	4,749.00	inc	4,749.00
1	Jupiter Tuba 482L		2,601.00	-	2,601.00				no bid		2,579.00	inc	2,579.00
2	Euphonium YEP321S		1,723.00	-	3,446.00	King 2280SP	2,195.00				1,709.00	inc	3,418.00
1	Gemeinhardt Piccolo 4WSSK		1,138.00	-	1,138.00		1,495.00				1,159.00	inc	1,159.00
1	Fox Oboe 330		2,643.00	-	2,643.00				no bid		2,644.00	inc	2,644.00
1	Fox Oboe 333		2,070.00	-	2,070.00				no bid		2,069.00	inc	2,069.00
1	Ludwig Timpani		2,560.00	-	2,560.00	Mod. LPK532PG	2,695.00	2,695.00	5,390.00	LKG32LG Grand Symphonic	2,359.00	inc	2,359.00
2	Selmer Clarinet 1430P		1,179.00	-	2,358.00		1,275.00	2,550.00	7,650.00		1,085.00	inc	2,170.00
4	Bass Bows 3/4		129.00	-	516.00		174.00	696.00	3,480.00	Glasser 5000X	525.00	inc	2,100.00
4	Cello bows 4/4		95.00	-	380.00		119.00	476.00	2,380.00	Glasser 4000X	319.00	inc	1,276.00
4	Lewis Cello Outfit 4/4	Brazilwood Strunal European 4/7 WEBH	1,346.00	-	5,384.00	Mod WCB	3,475.00	13,900.00	69,500.00	Int'l Strings Pfretz 360L	444.00	inc	1,776.00
3	Lewis Bass Outfit 4/4	Spruce Strunal European 520 FH	1,652.00	-	4,956.00	Mod WLB8	6,795.00	20,385.00	81,540.00		849.00	inc	2,547.00

TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT

Bid 9521

K & S Music

Qty	Description	Alt	Unit Price	Unit Frt	Total				
1	Yamaha YTS-475 Tenor Sax	Scholastic SCTS40	\$ 799.00	Free	\$ 799.00				
1	Yamaha YBS-52 Baritone Sax	Scholastic BCBS60	2,099.00	Free	2,099.00				
1	Fox Bassoon 51				No Bid			Evola Music - No Bid	
1	Fox Bassoon 220				No Bid			American Music Academy - No Bid	
1	Musser M7051 Xylophone				No Bid			Peripole-Bergerault - No Bid	
3	Holton Farkas H177 Dbl Horn				No Bid				
1	Mirabophone Tuba MI1864V				No Bid				
					No Bid				
1	Jupiter Tuba 482L				No Bid				
2	Euphonium YEP321S				No Bid				
1	Gemeinhardt Piccolo 4WSSK				No Bid				
1	Fox Oboe 330				No Bid				
1	Fox Oboe 333				No Bid				
1	Ludwig Timpani				No Bid				
2	Selmer Clarinet 1430P				No Bid				
4	Bass Bows 3/4				No Bid				
4	Cello bows 4/4				No Bid				
4	Lewis Cello Outfit 4/4				No Bid				
3	Lewis Bass Outfit 4/4				No Bid				