REQUEST FOR
QUOTATION
No. 9449 TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT
DUE DATE NO LATER THAN 1140 RANKIN, TROY, MICHIGAN 48083
8-22-07 3pm. 248-823-4052
FAX: 248-823-4077

REQUISITION

DATE 8-8-07

REQUEST FOR QUOTE — NOT AN ORDER

THIS FORM MUST BE UTILIZED WHEN RESPONDING TO THIS REQUEST
BID ENVELOPE ENCLOSED

THE RFQ NUMBER MUST APPEAR ON ALL QUOTATIONS AND RELATED CORRESPONDENCE, THIS IS NOT AN ORDER

Quantity DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
Please supply us with your bid to furnish the Troy School District with LITERACY
LIBRARY BOOKS per the attached specifications.
Copies of the bid are available at:
www.troy.k12.mi.us/purchasing/items_out for_bid.htm
Bid recaps will be available at:
troy.k12.mi.us/purchasing/index.htm
FACSIMILE BID IS NOT ACCEPTABLE

Bids will not be accepted if submitted after the deadline specified (local time) in the advertisement to bid or in the information to

bidders. The late submission of a bid makes the bid nonrepsonsive and is a material defect which shall not be waived by the

Board of Education. Delays in the mail will not be considered. All Late bids in the mail will be returned to the bidder unopened.

Proposal for the submission of alternatives by vendors will be accepted and reviewed. However, if any substitution or departure

is not clearly noted and described, it will be understood that the bid intends to exactly meet the specifications.

The Board of Education shall be the sole judge as to whether the proposed goods are “equal” or “approved”. Quotations must

be mailed or delivered to the Purchasing Office, 1140 Rankin, Troy, MI 48083 no later than 3 p.m. on the date shown above.

Michigan State Sales and Use Taxes and Federal Excise Taxes do not apply unless otherwise indicated. Exemption certificates

will be furnished when necessary. This request imposes no obligations on the buyer. The Board of Education reserves the right

to accept or reject any or all bids or to split awards by items or to accept bids, which will best serve the Board of Education.

THIS AREA MUST BE FILLED IN
TELEPHONE

DELIVERY TIME PRICES FIRM FOR NAME OF COMPANY NO.
TERMS NO. & STREET FAX #

ALL DELIVERY CHARGES
FOB MUST CITY, STATE & ZIP CODE E-MAIL
DELIVERED BE INCLUDED IN PRICES SHOWN
CONTACT PERSON (PLEASE PRINT) SIGNATURE DATE




AFFIDAVIT OF BIDDER

The undersigned, the owner or authorized officer of (the
“Bidder), pursuant to the familial disclosure requirement provided in the
(the “School District”) advertisement for construction bids, hereby represent and warrant except
as provided below, that no familial relationships exist between the over(s) or any employee of

and any member of the Board of Education of the School
District or the Superintendent of the School District.

List any Familial Relationships:

BIDDER:
By:
Its:
STATE OF MICHIGAN )
COUNTY OF ))SS'
This instrument was acknowledged before meonthe _ day of , 2007, by

, Notary Public

County, Michigan

My Commission Expires:

Acting in the County of:



Troy School District
Bid 9449 L.iteracy Library Books

Vendor/ Unit Total
School Catalog # Description Oty. Price Cost
Costello Steps to Literacy - RNF-601 In the Kitchen - 6 titles 6 each 1
Costello Steps to Literacy - STL-948 World of Colors 1
Costello Steps to Literacy - LIB-285 American Holidays 6
Costello Steps to Literacy - LIB-049 The Continents 6
Costello Steps to Literacy - RNF-604 Colonial America Series 1
Costello Steps to Literacy - WKRC-660 Class Pack - Let's Read About Pets 1
Costello Steps to Literacy - RIG-690 Class Pack Levels N & O 1
Costello Steps to Literacy - GRP-001 Level P - Class Pack 1
Costello Steps to Literacy - PIB-199 Early Emerg Stage 1
Costello Steps to Literacy - LIB-300 Habitats 6
Costello Steps to Literacy - SCI-300 Life Cycles 6
Costello Steps to Literacy - LIB-293 The Moon 6
Costello Steps to Literacy - LIB-295 The Sun 6
Costello Steps to Literacy - CAPC-310 Weather - Class Pack 1
SHIPPING
TOTAL
Vendor/ Unit Total
School Catalog # Description Oty. Price Cost
Costello Newbridge - NBJ 823770 Plants - Set 10 1
Costello Newbridge - NBJ 810157 Popcorn Science 1
Costello Newbridge - NBJ 23791 Citizenship 6
Wattles Newbridge - NAY 821513-06 Let's Pretend - 6 pk 1
Wattles Newbridge - NAY 821506-06 Let's Eat - 6 pk 1
Wattles Newbridge - NAY 821496-06 Keeping Healthy - 6 pk 1
Wattles Newbridge - NAY 821510-06 City, Farm and Sea - 6 pk 1
Wattles Newbridge - NAY 809925 Using Tools - 6 pk 1
Wattles Newbridge - NAY 810114 Needs - 6 pk 1
Wattles Newbridge - NAY 821509-06 Spiders - 6 pk 1
Wattles Newbridge - NAY 810113 My Neighborhood - 6 pk 1
SHIPPING

TOTAL




Troy School District
Bid 9449 L.iteracy Library Books

Vendor/ Unit Total
School Catalog # Description Oty. Price Cost
1-53155 - 3rd Grade - Leveled Readers -
Bemis Houghton Mifflin - 0618-32998-6 set 1
Hamilton Houghton Mifflin - 0618-32998-6 3rd Grade Leveled Readers - 1 set 1
Hamilton Houghton Mifflin - 0618-32999-4 | 4th Grade Leveled Readers - 1 set 1
SHIPPING
TOTAL
Vendor/ Unit Total
School Catalog # Description Oty. Price Cost
Book Club: A Literature Based Curriculum
Wattles Cornucopia - ISBN 1931376077 2" Edition 1
SHIPPING
TOTAL
Vendor/ Unit Total
School Catalog # Description Qty. Price Cost
Wass Scholastic Inc. - 0-590-76996-0 Not Enough Water 1
Wass Scholastic Inc. - 0-590-29976-X How Many Fish 1
Wass Scholastic Inc. - 0-590-27381-7 | Love Mud and Mud Loves Me 1
Wass Scholastic Inc. - 0-590-39794-X What Do Insects Do? 2
Wass Scholastic Inc. - 0-690-15856-2 Who Lives in a Tree 1
Wass Scholastic Inc. - 0-439-11663-5 Little Sister 1
Wass Scholastic Inc. - 0-490-27556-9 Swing, Swing, Swing 1
Wass Scholastic Inc. - 0-590-30747-9 Is It Time? 1
Wass Scholastic Inc. - 0-590-27564-X Don't Be late 1

SHIPPING

TOTAL




Troy School District
Bid 9449 Literacy Library Books

Vendor/ Unit Total
School Catalog # Description Oty. Price Cost
Wattles The Wright Group - BO-7802-0735-1 | Dog and Cat - 6 pk 1
Wattles The Wright Group - BO-7802-1263-0 | Bear Facts - 6 pk 1
Wattles The Wright Group - BO-7802-1260-6 | Munch, Munch, Munch - 6 pk 1
Wattles The Wright Group - BO-7802-6514-9 | Spring - 6 pk 1
Wattles The Wright Group - BO-7802-3773-0 | Breathing Under Water - 6 pk 1
Wattles The Wright Group - BO-7802-6480-0 | Bigger or Smaller - 6 pk 1
Wattles The Wright Group - BO-7802-6479-7 | Camouflage - 6 pk 1
Wattles The Wright Group - BO-7802-6510-6 | Grandpa - 6 pk 1
Wattles The Wright Group - BO-7802-6513-0 | The School Bus - 6 pk 1
Wattles The Wright Group - BO-7802-5674-3 | The Penguins - 6 pk 1
Wattles The Wright Group - BO-7802-6481-9 | Magnets - 6 pk 1
Wattles The Wright Group - BO-7802-3768-4 | The Finger Puppet - 6 pk 1
Wattles The Wright Group - BO-7802-5294-2 | The Barbecue - 6 pk 1
Wattles The Wright Group - BO-7802-3797-8 | The Eggshell Garden - 6 pk 1
Wattles The Wright Group - BO-7802-5293-4 | | Can Fly - 6 pk 1
Wattles The Wright Group - BO-7802-3764-1 | Water - 6 pk 1
Wattles The Wright Group - BO-7802-3791-9 | Tracks - 6 pk 1
Wattles The Wright Group - BO-7802-3766-8 | Snow - 6 pk 1
Wattles The Wright Group - BO-7802-3914-8 | Going To School - 6 pk 1
Wattles The Wright Group - BO-7802-3919-9 | Eating Out - 6 pk 1
Wattles The Wright Group - BO-7802-3916-4 | The Museum - 6 pk 1
Wattles The Wright Group - BO-7802-6507-6 | The Family - 6 pk 1
Wattles The Wright Group - BO-7802-3917-2 | Shopping - 6 pk 1
Wattles The Wright Group - BO-7802-6509-2 | Fall - 6 pk 1

SHIPPING

TOTAL




Troy School District
Bid 9449 Literacy Library Books

Vendor/ Unit Total
School Catalog # Description Oty. Price Cost
Martell Benchmark Education - Ml 7000 Level Books H-I 1
Martell Benchmark Education - PL 82691 | Level Books J-M 1
Martell Benchmark Education - PL 34794 | Solids 1
Martell Benchmark Education - PL 50706 | Measuring Matter 1
Martell Benchmark Education - PL 50749 | Habitats of Africa 1
Martell Benchmark Education - PL 9523 | Why Polar Bears Like Snow 1
Martell Benchmark Education - PL 04119 | Habitat Rescue 1
Martell Benchmark Education - PL 04127 | Animal Behaviorists 1
Martell Benchmark Education - PL 50730 | Habitats of South America 1
Martell Benchmark Education - PL 9493 Math on the Moon 1
Martell Benchmark Education - PL 62204 | Our Solar System: The Sun 1
Martell Benchmark Education - PL 9531 Stormy Weather 1
Martell Benchmark Education - PL 62211 | Our Solar System: The Moon 1
Martell Benchmark Education - PL 9574 Storm Chasers 1
Martell Benchmark Education - PL 9566 Growing a Kitchen Garden 1
Martell Benchmark Education - PL 62235 | The Life Cycle of Trees 1
Martell Benchmark Education - PL 62242 | The Life Cycle of Plants 1
Martell Benchmark Education - PL 04070 | Making Sense of Your Senses 1
Martell Benchmark Education - PL 04062 | Sports Legends 1
Martell Benchmark Education - PL 5096X | Smybols of Our Country 1
Martell Benchmark Education - PL 50978 | Citizens Who Made a Difference 1
Martell Benchmark Education - PL 50935 | Three Ancient Communities 1
Martell Benchmark Education - PL 50943 | The Community of Washington D.C. 1
Martell Benchmark Education - PL 62457 | Daily Life Around the World 1
Martell Benchmark Education - PL 62471 | Deadwood, South Dakota 1
Martell Benchmark Education - PL 62488 | A Whaling Community 1
Martell Benchmark Education - PL 9477 Great Inventions and 1
Martell Benchmark Education - PL 9604 | The Three Little Pigs Wise Up 1
Martell Benchmark Education - PL 9590 Opening Night 1
Martell Benchmark Education - PL 9485 Native American's 1
Martell Benchmark Education - PL 04038 | The Seven Natural Wonders 1

SHIPPING

TOTAL




Troy School District
Bid 9449 Literacy Library Books

Vendor/ Unit Total
School Catalog # Description Oty. Price Cost
Schroeder Righy - 1418926795 Rigby PM Plus - Green Complete Package 1
Rigby PM Plus - Orange Complete
Schroeder Rigby - 1418926817 Package 1
Rigby PM Plus Turquoise Complete
Schroeder Rigby - 1418927015 Package 1
Wattles Rigby - 0-4635-4055-2 Complete Alphabet - Blends & Diagraphs 1
Wattles Rigby - 0-7635-4054-4 Alphabet Starters Set 2
Wattles Rigby - 0-4350-5744-8 | Remember 1
Wattles Rigby - 0-4350-5745-6 Worms 1
Wattles Rigby - 0-7635-0738-5 Koalas 1
Wattles Rigby - 0-735-0787-3 Shopping 1
Wattles Rigby - 0-7635-0743-1 Our Garden 1
Wattles Rigby - 0-4350-5733-2 At The Beach 1
Wattles Rigby - 0-7635-0795-4 When | Pretend 1
Wattles Rigby - 0-7635-0774-1 The Circus Clown 1
Wattles Rigby - 0-7635-0746-6 Here's What | Made 1
Wattles Rigby - 0-7635-0770-9 Woof 1
Wattles Rigby - 0-7635-0734-2 | Can Do It Myself 1
Wattles Rigby - 0-7635-0749-0 Camping 1
Wattles Rigby - 0-7635-04173-CR6 Snowman - 6 pk Set A 1
Wattles Rigby - 0-7635-04246-CR6 Hungry Bear - 6 pk Set B 1
Wattles Rigby - 0-7635-04211-CR6 Dressing Up - 6 pk 1
Wattles Rigby - 0-7635-04262-CR6 The Model - 6 pk 1
Wattles Rigby - 0-7635-04254-CR6 Time For Bed 1
Wattles Rigby - 0-7635-0418-1 Vacations - 6 pk 1
Wattles Rigby - 0-7635-0422x-CR6 Monster Party - 6 pk 1
Wattles Rigby - 0-7635-04297-CR6 Be Quiet - Set C - 6 pk 1
Wattles Rigby - 0-7635-04300-CR6 Tim's Painting - 6 pk 1
Wattles Rigby - 0-7635-0431-9-CR6 The Bath - 6 pk 1
Wattles Rigby - 0-7635-64327-CR6 Dinosaur Party - 6 pk 1
Wattles Rigby - 0-7635-04325-CR6 The Robber - 6 pk 1
Wattles Rigby - 0-7635-04378-CR6 The Amazing Race - 6 pk 1
Wattles Rigby - 0-7635-0728-8 Don't Leave Anything Behind 1
Wattles Rigby - 0-4350-5724-3 Ben The Bold 1
Wattles Rigby - 0-7635-0730-X Filbert The Fly 1
Wattles Rigby - 0-7635-9898-4 Living Together 1
Wattles Rigby - 0-7635-9905-0 Feathered Friends 1




Troy School District
Bid 9449 Literacy Library Books

Vendor/ Unit Total
School Catalog # Description Oty. Price Cost
Wattles Rigby - 0-7635-9891-7 Clown 1
Wattles Rigby - 0-7635-98860-0 Carring Babies 1
Wattles Rigby - 0-7635-9881-X The Cat Show 1
Wattles Rigby - 0-7635-07369 | Spy 1
Wattles Rigby - 07578-10020-CRF Wayne Gretsky 1
Wattles Rigby - 07578-10071-CR6 Soccer 1
Wattles Righby - 14189-25144-CR6 Complete PM Stars Magenta 2-3 package 1
Wattles Rigby - 07578-10098-CR7 Ice Hockey 1
Wattles Rigby - 14189-24768 Bingo & the Ducks 1
Complete PM Platinum Starters: 120
Troy Union Books
+ Teacher Guide
Troy Union Rigby - 14189-26612-CB5 Level Two Package (20 titles, 6 copies) 1
Troy Union Rigby - 14189-10848-CB5 Add-to Pack 1 Copy each Title 1
Troy Union Rigby - 14189-10848-CB5 Add-to Pack 1 Copy each Title 1
Troy Union Rigby - 14189-04279-CB5 Teacher Guide 1
Complete Book Package PM Red Levels
Troy Union 3-5:
144 Books + Teacher Guide

Troy Union Rigby - 14189-26620-CB5 Story books (24 titles/6 copies) 1
Troy Union Rigby - 14189-07804-CB5 Add-to-Pack 1 Copy each Title 1
Troy Union Rigby - 14189-07804-CB5 Add-to-Pack 1 Copy each Title 1
Troy Union Rigby - 14189-04287-CB5 Teacher Guide 1
Wass Rigby - 14189-01857-CR6 A Friend For Little Shite Rabbit 1
Wass Rigby - 14189-01911-CR6 Soccer At The Park 1
Wass Rigby - 07635-97856-CR6 Max Rides His Bike 1
Wass Rigby - 1489-02039-CR6 Sally's Friends 1
Wass Rigby - 07635-97724-CR6 Sam Goes To School 1
Wass Rigby - 14189-01512-CR6 Wake Up, Dad 1
Wass Rigby - 14189-01431-CR6 Merry Go Round 1
Wass Rigby - 14189-0161X-CR6 Bumper Cars 1




Troy School District
Bid 9449 Literacy Library Books

Wass Rigby - 14189-01628-CR6 Hide and Seek 1
Wass Rigby - 14189-0492X-CR6 Snowy Gets A Wash 1
Wass Rigby - 14189-0158X-CR6 A Birthday Cake for Ben 1
Wass Rigby - 14189-01520-CR6 Ben's Teddy Bear 1
Wass Rigby - 14189-01539-CR6 Ben's Treasure Hunt 1
Wass Rigby - 14189-01784-CR6 Ben's Dad 1
Wass Rigby - 14189-02063-CR6 The Best Cake 1
Bemis Rigby - 14189-26426-CB5 PM Gold Levels 21-22
108 Books 18 Titles 6 copies/each 1
Teacher Guide
SHIPPING
TOTAL
Vendor/ Unit Total
School Catalog # Description Qty. Price Cost
Wass Shortbooks - Series 1 First Words - Set 2 - 6 Copies of 23 Titles 1
Wass Shortbooks - Series 2 Companion - Set 6 - 6 Copies of 8 Titles 1
SHIPPING
TOTAL




TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT

BID 9449 LITERACY LIBRARY BOOKS

School
Costello
Costello
Costello
Costello
Costello
Costello
Costello
Costello
Costello
Costello
Costello
Costello
Costello
Costello

School
Costello
Costello
Costello
Wattles
Wattles
Wattles
Wattles
Wattles
Wattles
Wattles
Wattles

School
Bemis
Hamilton
Hamilton

School
Wattles

Vendor/

Catalog #
Steps to Literacy - RNF-601
Steps to Literacy - STL-948
Steps to Literacy - LIB-285
Steps to Literacy - LIB-049
Steps to Literacy - RNF-604
Steps to Literacy - WKRC-660
Steps to Literacy - RIG-690
Steps to Literacy - GRP-001
Steps to Literacy - PIB-199
Steps to Literacy - LIB-300
Steps to Literacy - SCI-300
Steps to Literacy - LIB-293
Steps to Literacy - LIB-294
Steps to Literacy - CAPC-310

Vendor/

Catalog #
Newbridge - NBJ 823770
Newbridge - NBJ 810157
Newbridge - NBJ 23791
Newbridge - NAY 821513-06
Newbridge - NAY 821506-06
Newbridge - NAY 821496-06
Newbridge - NAY 821510-06
Newbridge - NAY 809925
Newbridge - NAY 810114
Newbridge - NAY 821509-06
Newbridge - NAY 810113

Vendor/
Catalog #

Houghton Mifflin - 0618-32998-6
Houghton Mifflin - 0618-32998-6
Houghton Mifflin - 0618-32999-4

Vendor/
Catalog #

Cornucopia - ISBN 1931376077

Description

In the Kitchen - 6 titles 6 each
World of Colors

American Holidays

The Continents

Colonial America Series

Class Pack - Let's Read About Pets

Class Pack Levels N & O
Level P - Class Pack
Early Emerg Stage
Habitats

Life Cycles

The Moon

The Sun

Weather - Class Pack

Description_
Plants - Set 10

Popcorn Science
Citizenship

Let's Pretend - 6 pk

Let's Eat - 6 pk

Keeping Healthy - 6 pk
City, Farm and Sea - 6 pk
Using Tools - 6 pk

Needs - 6 pk

Spiders - 6 pk

My Neighborhood - 6 pk

Description_

SHIPPING
TOTAL

SHIPPING
TOTAL

1-53155 - 3rd Grade - Leveled Readers - set

3rd Grade Leveled Readers - 1 set
4th Grade Leveled Readers - 1 set

Description_

SHIPPING
TOTAL

Book Club: A Literature Based Curriculum

SHIPPING
TOTAL

HCD@CD@HHHHH@CDHHE

HHHHHD—‘HH@D—‘HE

H»—\ng

Sundance/Newbridge

Educational Publishing
Terms: Net 30

Firm:

Unit Total

Price Cost
NO BID

Unit Total

Price Cost
109.00 109.00
30.00 30.00
21.25 127.50
41.70 41.70
41.70 41.70
41.70 41.70
41.70 41.70
25.00 25.00
24.00 24.00
41.70 41.70
24.00 24.00
54.80
602.80

Unit Total

Price Cost
NO BID

Unit Total

Price Cost
NO BID

Benchmark Education

Terms: Net 30
Firm:

Unit
Price

Unit
Price

Total
Cost

NO BID

Total
Cost

Total
Cost

Total
Cost

Rigby, a division of

Harcourt Inc.

Terms: Net 30 Days
Firm until 9-30-07

Unit Total
Price Cost
NO BID
Unit Total
Price Cost
NO BID
Unit Total
Price Cost
NO BID
Unit Total
Price Cost
NO BID

Scholastic Inc.

Terms: Net 30 Day Terms: Net 30

Firm: 8-31-08
Unit Total
Price Cost

NO BID
Unit Total
Price Cost
NO BID
Unit Total
Price Cost
NO BID
Unit Total
Price Cost
NO BID

The Short Books, Inc.

Firm: until 12-07

Unit
Price

Unit
Price

Unit
Price

Unit
Price

Total
Cost

NO BID

Total
Cost

NO BID

Total
Cost

NO BID

Total
Cost

NO BID

Steps To Literacy

Terms: Net 30
Firm: 180 Days

Unit Total

Price Cost
145.90 145.90
20.95 125.70
40.90 245.40
169.00 169.00
207.95 207.95
296.95 296.95
222.95 222.95
38.95 38.95
40.95 245.70
33.95 203.70
138.50 138.50
Free
2,040.70

Unit Total

Price Cost
NO BID

Unit Total

Price Cost
NO BID

Unit Total

Price Cost
NO BID




TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT

BID 9449 LITERACY LIBRARY BOOKS

School
Wass
Wass
Wass
Wass
Wass
Wass
Wass
Wass
Wass

School
Wattles
Wattles
Wattles
Wattles
Wattles
Wattles
Wattles
Wattles
Wattles
Wattles
Wattles
Wattles
Wattles
Wattles
Wattles
Wattles
Wattles
Wattles
Wattles
Wattles
Wattles
Wattles
Wattles
Wattles

School
Martell

Vendor/

Catalog #
Scholastic Inc. - 0-590-76996-0
Scholastic Inc. - 0-590-29976-X
Scholastic Inc. - 0-590-27381-7
Scholastic Inc. - 0-590-39794-X
Scholastic Inc. - 0-690-15856-2
Scholastic Inc. - 0-439-11663-5
Scholastic Inc. - 0-490-27556-9
Scholastic Inc. - 0-590-30747-9
Scholastic Inc. - 0-590-27564-X

Vendor/
Catalog #
The Wright Group - BO-7802-0735-1
The Wright Group - BO-7802-1263-0
The Wright Group - BO-7802-1260-6
The Wright Group - BO-7802-6514-9
The Wright Group - BO-7802-3773-0
The Wright Group - BO-7802-6480-0
The Wright Group - BO-7802-6479-7
The Wright Group - BO-7802-6510-6
The Wright Group - BO-7802-6513-0
The Wright Group - BO-7802-5674-3
The Wright Group - BO-7802-6481-9
The Wright Group - BO-7802-3768-4
The Wright Group - BO-7802-5294-2
The Wright Group - BO-7802-3797-8
The Wright Group - BO-7802-5293-4
The Wright Group - BO-7802-3764-1
The Wright Group - BO-7802-3791-9
The Wright Group - BO-7802-3766-8
The Wright Group - BO-7802-3914-8
The Wright Group - BO-7802-3919-9
The Wright Group - BO-7802-3916-4
The Wright Group - BO-7802-6507-6
The Wright Group - BO-7802-3917-2
The Wright Group - BO-7802-6509-2

Vendor/

Catalog #
Benchmark Education - Ml 7000

Description

Not Enough Water

How Many Fish

| Love Mud and Mud Loves Me
What Do Insects Do?

Who Lives in a Tree

Little Sister

Swing, Swing, Swing

Is It Time?

Don't Be late

Description

Dog and Cat - 6 pk

Bear Facts - 6 pk

Munch, Munch, Munch - 6 pk
Spring - 6 pk

Breathing Under Water - 6 pk
Bigger or Smaller - 6 pk
Camouflage - 6 pk
Grandpa - 6 pk

The School Bus - 6 pk

The Penguins - 6 pk
Magnets - 6 pk

The Finger Puppet - 6 pk
The Barbecue - 6 pk

The Eggshell Garden - 6 pk
| Can Fly - 6 pk

Water - 6 pk

Tracks - 6 pk

Snow - 6 pk

Going To School - 6 pk
Eating Out - 6 pk

The Museum - 6 pk

The Family - 6 pk

Shopping - 6 pk

Fall - 6 pk

Description_
Level Books H-I

SHIPPING
TOTAL

SHIPPING
TOTAL

HHHD—‘HI\)HD—‘HE

Hl—‘HHHHHHHHHHHHHHHHHHHHHHE

~E

Sundance/Newbridge

Educational Publishing

Terms: Net 30
Firm:

Total
Cost

Benchmark Education

Terms: Net 30
Firm:

Unit
Price

1,495.00

Total
Cost

Total
Cost
1,495.00

Rigby, a division of

Harcourt Inc.

Terms: Net 30 Days
Firm until 9-30-07

Unit Total
Price Cost
NO BID
Unit Total
Price Cost
NO BID
Unit Total
Price Cost

Scholastic Inc.

Terms: Net 30 Day Terms: Net 30

Firm: 8-31-08
Unit Total
Price  Cost
3.95 3.95
3.95 3.95
2.95 2.95
3.25 6.50
4.33 4.33
3.50 3.50
2.95 2.95
2.95 2.95
4.50 4.50
3.23
38.81
Unit Total
Price Cost
NO BID
Unit Total
Price  Cost

The Short Books, Inc.

Firm: until 12-07

Unit
Price

Unit
Price

Unit
Price

Total
Cost

NO BID

Total
Cost

NO BID

Total
Cost

Steps To Literacy

Terms: Net 30
Firm: 180 Days

Unit
Price

Unit
Price

Unit
Price

Total
Cost

NO BID

Total
Cost




TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT

BID 9449 LITERACY LIBRARY BOOKS

Sundance/Newbridge

Educational Publishing
Terms: Net 30

Benchmark Education
Terms: Net 30

Rigby, a division of

Harcourt Inc.

Terms: Net 30 Days

Scholastic Inc.

Terms: Net 30 Day Terms: Net 30

The Short Books, Inc.

Steps To Literacy

Terms: Net 30

Firm: Firm: Firm until 9-30-07 Firm: 8-31-08 Firm: until 12-07 Firm: 180 Days
Martell Benchmark Education - PL 82691 Level Books J-M 1 - 1,085.00 1,085.00 - - - -
Martell Benchmark Education - PL 34794 Solids 1 - 38.00 38.00 - - - -
Martell Benchmark Education - PL 50706 Measuring Matter 1 - 38.00 38.00 - - - -
Martell Benchmark Education - PL 50749 Habitats of Africa 1 - 38.00 38.00 - - - -
Martell Benchmark Education - PL 9523 Why Polar Bears Like Snow 1 - 38.00 38.00 - - - -
Martell Benchmark Education - PL 04119 Habitat Rescue 1 - 38.00 38.00 - - - -
Martell Benchmark Education - PL 04127 Animal Behaviorists 1 - 38.00 38.00 - - - -
Martell Benchmark Education - PL 50730 Habitats of South America 1 - 38.00 38.00 - - - -
Martell Benchmark Education - PL 9493 Math on the Moon 1 - 38.00 38.00 - - - -
Martell Benchmark Education - PL 62204 Our Solar System: The Sun 1 - 38.00 38.00 - - - -
Martell Benchmark Education - PL 9531 Stormy Weather 1 - 38.00 38.00 - - - -
Martell Benchmark Education - PL 62211 Our Solar System: The Moon 1 - 38.00 38.00 - - - -
Martell Benchmark Education - PL 9574 Storm Chasers 1 - 38.00 38.00 - - - -
Martell Benchmark Education - PL 9566 Growing a Kitchen Garden 1 - 38.00 38.00 - - - -
Martell Benchmark Education - PL 62235 The Life Cycle of Trees 1 - 38.00 38.00 - - - -
Martell Benchmark Education - PL 62242 The Life Cycle of Plants 1 - 38.00 38.00 - - - -
Martell Benchmark Education - PL 04070 Making Sense of Your Senses 1 - 38.00 38.00 - - - -
Martell Benchmark Education - PL 04062 Sports Legends 1 - 38.00 38.00 - - - -
Martell Benchmark Education - PL 5096X Smybols of Our Country 1 - 38.00 38.00 - - - -
Martell Benchmark Education - PL 50978 Citizens Who Made a Difference 1 - 38.00 38.00 - - - -
Martell Benchmark Education - PL 50935 Three Ancient Communities 1 - 38.00 38.00 - - - -
Martell Benchmark Education - PL 50943 The Community of Washington D.C. 1 - 38.00 38.00 - - - -
Martell Benchmark Education - PL 62457 Daily Life Around the World 1 - 38.00 38.00 - - - -
Martell Benchmark Education - PL 62471 Deadwood, South Dakota 1 - 38.00 38.00 - - - -
Martell Benchmark Eductaion - PL 62488 A Whaling Community 1 - 38.00 38.00 - - - -
Martell Benchmark Education - PL 9477 Great Inventions and 1 - 38.00 38.00 - - - -
Martell  Benchmark Education - PL 9604 The Three Little Pigs Wise Up 1 - 38.00 38.00 - - - -
Martell  Benchmark Education - PL 9590 Opening Night 1 - 38.00 38.00 - - - -
Martell  Benchmark Education - PL 9485 Native American's 1 - 38.00 38.00 - - - -
Martell  Benchmark Education - PL 04038 The Seven Natural Wonders 1 - 38.00 38.00 - - - -
294.56
NO BID 3,976.56 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Vendor/ Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit  Total Unit Total Unit Total

School Catalog # Description Qty. Price Cost Price Cost Price Cost Price Cost Price Cost Price Cost
Schroede Rigby - 1418926795 Rigby PM Plus - Green Complete Package 1 - - 1,085.70 1,085.70 - - -
Schroede Rigby - 1418926817 Rigby PM Plus - Orange Complete Package 1 - - 1,040.60 1,040.60 - - -
Schroede Rigby - 1418927015 Rigby PM Plus Turquoise Complete Package 1 - - 1,040.60 1,040.60 - - -
Wattles Rigby - 0-4635-4055-2 Complete Alphabet - Blends & Diagraphs 1 - - $0.00 - - -
Wattles Rigby - 0-7635-4054-4 Alphabet Starters Set 2 - - 134.20 268.40 - - -
Wattles Rigby - 0-4350-5744-8 | Remember 1 - - $0.00 - - -
Wattles Rigby - 0-4350-5745-6 Worms 1 - - $0.00 - - -
Wattles Rigby - 0-7635-0738-5 Koalas 1 - - 35.75 35.75 - - -
Wattles Rigby - 0-735-0787-3 Shopping 1 - - 35.75 35.75 - - -
Wattles Rigby - 0-7635-0743-1 Our Garden 1 - - 35.75 35.75 - - -
Wattles Rigby - 0-4350-5733-2 At The Beach 1 - - $0.00 - - -
Wattles Rigby - 0-7635-0795-4 When | Pretend 1 - - 35.75 35.75 - - -
Wattles Rigby - 0-7635-0774-1 The Circus Clown 1 - - 35.75 35.75 - - -
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Wattles
Wattles
Wattles
Wattles
Wattles
Wattles
Wattles
Wattles
Wattles
Wattles
Wattles
Wattles
Wattles
Wattles
Wattles
Wattles
Wattles
Wattles
Wattles
Wattles
Wattles
Wattles
Wattles
Wattles
Wattles
Wattles
Wattles
Wattles
Wattles
Wattles
Wattles

Rigby - 0-7635-0746-6
Rigby - 0-7635-0770-9
Rigby - 0-7635-0734-2
Rigby - 0-7635-0749-0
Rigby - 0-7635-04173-CR6
Rigby - 0-7635-04246-CR6
Rigby - 0-7635-04211-CR6
Rigby - 0-7635-04262-CR6
Rigby - 0-7635-04254-CR6
Rigby - 0-7635-0418-1
Rigby - 0-7635-0422x-CR6
Rigby - 0-7635-04297-CR6
Rigby - 0-7635-04300-CR6
Rigby - 0-7635-0431-9-CR6
Rigby - 0-7635-64327-CR6
Rigby - 0-7635-04325-CR6
Rigby - 0-7635-04378-CR6
Rigby - 0-7635-0728-8
Rigby - 0-4350-5724-3
Rigby - 0-7635-0730-X
Rigby - 0-7635-9898-4
Rigby - 0-7635-9905-0
Rigby - 0-7635-9891-7
Rigby - 0-7635-98860-0
Rigby - 0-7635-9881-X
Rigby - 0-7635-07369
Rigby - 07578-10020-CRF
Rigby - 07578-10071-CR6
Rigby - 14189-25144-CR6
Rigby - 07578-10098-CR7
Rigby - 14189-24768

Troy Union

Troy Unio Rigby - 14189-26612-CB5
Troy Unio Rigby - 14189-10848-CB5
Troy Unio Rigby - 14189-10848-CB5
Troy Unio Rigby - 14189-04279-CB5

Troy Union

Troy Unio Rigby - 14189-26620-CB5
Troy Unio Rigby - 14189-07804-CB5
Troy Unio Rigby - 14189-07804-CB5
Troy Unio Rigby - 14189-04287-CB5

Wass
Wass
Wass
Wass

Rigby - 14189-01857-CR6
Rigby - 14189-01911-CR6
Rigby - 07635-97856-CR6
Rigby - 1489-02039-CR6

Here's What | Made

Woof

| Can Do It Myself

Camping

Snowman - 6 pk Set A

Hungry Bear - 6 pk Set B

Dressing Up - 6 pk

The Model - 6 pk

Time For Bed

Vacations - 6 pk

Monster Party - 6 pk

Be Quiet - Set C - 6 pk

Tim's Painting - 6 pk

The Bath - 6 pk

Dinosaur Party - 6 pk

The Robber - 6 pk

The Amazing Race - 6 pk

Don't Leave Anything Behind

Ben The Bold

Filbert The Fly

Living Together

Feathered Friends

Clown

Carring Babies

The Cat Show

| Spy

Wayne Gretsky

Soccer

Complete PM Stars Magenta 2-3 package

Ice Hockey

Bingo & the Ducks

Complete PM Platinum Starters: 120 Books
+ Teacher Guide
Level Two Package (20 titles, 6 copies)
Add-to Pack 1 Copy each Title
Add-to Pack 1 Copy each Title
Teacher Guide

Complete Book Package PM Red Levels 3-5:

144 Books + Teacher Guide
Story books (24 titles/6 copies)
Add-to-Pack 1 Copy each Title
Add-to-Pack 1 Copy each Title

Teacher Guide

A Friend For Little Shite Rabbit

Soccer At The Park

Max Rides His Bike

Sally's Friends
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Sundance/Newbridge

Educational Publishing
Terms: Net 30
Firm:

Benchmark Education

Terms: Net 30
Firm:

Rigby, a division of

Harcourt Inc.

Terms: Net 30 Days
Firm until 9-30-07

35.75
35.75
35.75
35.75

35.75

35.75
33.55
33.55
33.55
33.55
33.55
35.75
42.85
42.85
324.50
42.85
35.15
624.80

107.80
107.80
46.15

741.40
130.90
130.90
46.15
32.45
32.45
33.55
32.45

35.75
35.75
35.75
35.75
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
35.75
$0.00
35.75
33.55
33.55
33.55
33.55
33.55
35.75
42.85
42.85
324.50
42.85
35.15
624.80

107.80
107.80
46.15

741.40
130.90
130.90
46.15
32.45
32.45
33.55
32.45

Scholastic Inc.

The Short Books, Inc.

Terms: Net 30 Day Terms: Net 30

Firm: 8-31-08

Firm: until 12-07

Steps To Literacy

Terms: Net 30
Firm: 180 Days
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Wass
Wass
Wass
Wass
Wass
Wass
Wass
Wass
Wass
Wass
Wass
Bemis

Wass
Wass

Rigby - 07635-97724-CR6 Sam Goes To School

Rigby - 14189-01512-CR6 Wake Up, Dad
Rigby - 14189-01431-CR6 Merry Go Round
Rigby - 14189-0161X-CR6 Bumper Cars
Rigby - 14189-01628-CR6 Hide and Seek

Rigby - 14189-0492X-CR6
Rigby - 14189-0158X-CR6
Rigby - 14189-01520-CR6 Ben's Teddy Bear
Rigby - 14189-01539-CR6 Ben's Treasure Hunt
Rigby - 14189-01784-CR6 Ben's Dad
Rigby - 14189-02063-CR6 The Best Cake
Rigby - 14189-26426-CB5 PM Gold Levels 21-22
108 Books 18 Titles 6 copies/each
Teacher Guide

Snowy Gets A Wash
A Birthday Cake for Ben

SHIPPING
TOTAL

Shortbooks - Series 1
Shorbooks - Series 2

First Words - Set 2 - 6 Copies of 23 Titles
Companion - Set 6 - 6 Copies of 8 Titles
SHIPPING
TOTAL

Wright Group/McGraw-Hill - No Response

Gale Group/Thomson Gale - No Response

Groiler - Scholastic Library Publishing - No Response
Perma-Bound - No Response

Folett Library Resources - No Bid

Ingram Library Services - No Bid

Baker & Taylor - No Bid

Houghton Mifflin CO - Bid Incomplete

Harcourt Achieve - Bid Incomplete

Cornicopia - Bid Incomplete
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Sundance/Newbridge

Educational Publishing

Terms: Net 30
Firm:

NO BID

NO BID

Benchmark Education

Terms: Net 30
Firm:

Rigby, a division of

Harcourt Inc.

Terms: Net 30 Days
Firm until 9-30-07

33.55
32.45
32.45
32.45
32.45
32.45
32.45
32.45
32.45
32.45
32.45

723.80

33.55
32.45
32.45
32.45
32.45
32.45
32.45
32.45
32.45
32.45
32.45

723.80

N/A
7,668.90

NO BID

Scholastic Inc.

NO BID

NO BID

Terms: Net 30 Day Terms: Net 30
Firm: 8-31-08

The Short Books, Inc.

Firm: until 12-07

26.16
116.63

NO BID

26.16
116.63

142.79

Steps To Literacy

Terms: Net 30
Firm: 180 Days

NO BID

NO BID




