REQUEST FOR
QUOTATION
No. 9550 TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT
DUE DATE NO LATER THAN 1140 RANKIN, TROY, MICHIGAN 48083
7124/08 3pm. 248-823-4052
FAX: 248-823-4077

REQUISITION

DATE 7/9/08

REQUEST FOR QUOTE — NOT AN ORDER

THIS FORM MUST BE UTILIZED WHEN RESPONDING TO THIS REQUEST
BID ENVELOPE ENCLOSED

THE RFQ NUMBER MUST APPEAR ON ALL QUOTATIONS AND RELATED CORRESPONDENCE, THIS IS NOT AN ORDER

Quantity

DESCRIPTION

UNIT PRICE

AMOUNT

Please supply us with your bid to furnish the Troy School District with
Science Supplies for the International Academy East.

Copies of the bid are available at:
www.troy.k12.mi.us/purchasing/items_out for bid.htm

Bid recaps will be available at:
troy.k12.mi.us/purchasing/index.htm

FACSIMILE BID IS NOT ACCEPTABLE

Bids will not be accepted if submitted after the deadline specified (local time) in the advertisement to bid or in the information to
bidders. The late submission of a bid makes the bid nonrepsonsive and is a material defect which shall not be waived by the
Board of Education. Delays in the mail will not be considered. All Late bids in the mail will be returned to the bidder unopened.

Proposal for the submission of alternatives by vendors will be accepted and reviewed. However, if any substitution or departure
is not clearly noted and described, it will be understood that the bid intends to exactly meet the specifications.

The Board of Education shall be the sole judge as to whether the proposed goods are “equal” or “approved”. Quotations must
be mailed or delivered to the Purchasing Office, 1140 Rankin, Troy, Ml 48083 no later than 3 p.m. on the date shown above.
Michigan State Sales and Use Taxes and Federal Excise Taxes do not apply unless otherwise indicated. Exemption certificates
will be furnished when necessary. This request imposes no obligations on the buyer. The Board of Education reserves the right
to accept or reject any or all bids or to split awards by items or to accept bids, which will best serve the Board of Education.

THIS AREA MUST BE FILLED IN

DELIVERY TIME

PRICES FIRM FOR NAME OF COMPANY

TELEPHONE
NO.

TERMS

NO. & STREET

FAX #

FOB
DELIVERED

ALL DELIVERY CHARGES
MUST CITY, STATE & ZIP CODE

BE INCLUDED IN PRICES SHOWN

E-MAIL

CONTACT PERSON (PLEASE PRINT) SIGNATURE

DATE



http://www.troy.k12.mi.us/purchasing/items_out_for_bid.htm

Note: All bidders are specifically reminded that a completed Affidavit of Bidder
(Familial Disclosure) MUST be completed and submitted with the bid response.
Failure to include a completed copy will be grounds for disqualification of bid.
The Affidavit of Bidder is required to be notarized for construction bids only. All
others only require completion and signature.

AFFIDAVIT OF BIDDER

The undersigned, the owner or authorized officer of
(the “Bidder), pursuant to the familial disclosure requirement provided in the
(the *“School District”) advertisement for construction bids, hereby
represent and warrant except as provided below, that no familial relationships exist
between the over(s) or any employee of
and any member of the Board of Education of the
School District or the Superintendent of the School District.

List any Familial Relationships:

BIDDER:
By:
Its:
STATE OF MICHIGAN )
COUNTY OF ))SS'
This instrument was acknowledged before meonthe _ day of , 2008,

by

,Notary Public

County, Michigan

My Commission Expires:

Acting in the County of:




TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT
SCIENCE SUPPLIES - IAE

Bid 9550

Flinn Item #

GP1005
GP1010
GP1020
GP1030
GP1040
AP8203
AP8201
AP1019
AP8346
GP2050
GP2054
AP2296
AP5102
GP5075
AP8338
AP1087
AP2222
AP8872
AP6396
AP6211
GP6067
GP6020
AP4417
APS5328
AP1366
OB2096
AP1718
AP8850

Description

Beaker, Borosilicate Glass 50ml 12/pkg.

Beaker, Borosilicate Glass 100ml 12/pkg.

Beaker, Borosilicate Glass 250ml 12/pkg.

Beaker, Borosilicate Glass 600ml| 6/pkg.

Beaker, Borosilicate Glass 1000ml 6/pkg.

Brush, Beaker 3/pkg.

Brush, Test Tube, Nylon 3/4" diameter 12/pkg.

Tirrill Burner, Natural

Flint Lighter 6/pkg.

Cylinder, Borosilicate Glass, Economy Choice 10 ml 12/pkg.
Cylinder, Borosilicate Glass, Economy Choice 50ml 12/pkg.
Cylinder, Polymethylpentene 50 mL 18/pkg

Medicine Dropper 12/pkg.

Stirring Rods, Glass 10/pkg.

Scoop without Handle 12/pkg.

Magnetic Stirrer/Hot Plate, Flinn 7.7"

Rubber Stoppers Size 0 63/lb

Ever-Safe Thermometers -20 to 110C Partial immersion depth
Timers, Student

Timer, Overhead

Test Tubes without Rims 18 x 150 mm 72/pkg.

Test Tubes with Rims 16 x 150mm  72/pkg.

Test Tube Rack, Economy Choice

Test Tube Basket 6x6x6

Hot Plate, Single Temperature

Flinn Scientific Electronic Balance .01 readability
Beral-Type Pipets Thin Stem 20/pkg.

Super Jumbo Beral-Type Pipets 20/pkg.

Oty

2 pkag.
2 pkag.
2 pkag.
3 pkag.
1 pkg.
3 pkag.
1 pkg.

2 pkg.
1 pkg.
1 pkg.
1pkg.
3 pkag.
3 pkag.
1 pkg.

11b.
2 pkag.
1pkg.

1 pkg.
1 pkg.
15

4 pkg.
3 pkag.

Alternate

Unit Cost Total




Flinn Item #
AP1501
GP3040
AP2227
AP2222
AP1113
AP8218
ML1381
AB1175
ML1377
MS5040
ML1035
ML1163
ML1261
AB1264
AP3202
AP1122
AB1042
AP7131
AP7132
AP3306
AP7080
AP4684
A0246
S0075
S0148
H0057
10010
G0037
S0282
D0015
AB1232
B0228
FB1225
B0051
AP5885

Description Qty
Parafilm 4" 125 ft 1
Flask, Erlenmeyer, Borosilicate Glass 125mL 12/pkg. 2 pkg.
Size 5 Rubber Stoppers 24/Ib. 11b.
Size 0 Rubber Stoppers 63/Ib. 2 Ibs.
Beaker Tongs w/protective sleeves 15
Test Tube Clamp without finger grips 3/pkg. 8 pkag.
Microscope Slides, Glass Best Quality 72/pkg. 4 pkgs.
Lens Paper 4" x 6" 50sheets/book 1 book
Cover Slips, Plastic 100/pkg. 5 pkg.
High School Compound Scopes, Flinn Economy Choice 15
Paramecium Caudatum w.m. 15
Allium (Onion slides) 15
Whitefish Mitosis 15
Culture Dish 41/2" x 13/4" 20
Funnel, Utility, Polyethylene 41/4" diameter 12/pkg. 1 pkg.
Weighing Paper, Moisture-Resistant Non-Absorbent 4x4" 500sheet/p 1 pkg.
Probe and Seeker 18
Apron, Rubberized 27" x 42"  12/pkg 2 pkgs.
Apron, Rubberized 36" x 42"  12/pkg. 2 pkgs.
Goggles, Chemical Splash, Standard Vented Goggle 40
Gloves, Nitrile, Disposable, Powder-Free 2
Ruler, Metric/English, Opaque 12" 10/pkg. 2pkgs.

Aniline Blue Staining Solution 100mL
Sodium Hydroxide 500g

Sodium Hydroxide Solution 500mL 1M
Hydrochloric Acid Solution 1000mL 1M
lodine Solution, Lugol's 500mL

Gelatin 150g Granular Laboratory Grade
Starch, Corn 2kg

Dextrose, Granular 2kg

Dialysis Tubing 33mm flat width 30meters in length
Bromthymol Blue Indicator Solution 1000mL
ABO/Rh Simulated Blood Typing Kit

Biuret Test Solution 500mL

Genesis Water Distiller

RPRRPRRPRPRRPRRPRRENRREN

Alternate

Unit Cost Total




Vernier ltem #

LABPRO
LP

TMP-BTA

CO2-BTA

Description

LabPro Interface
Logger Pro 3 Software

Stainless Steel Temperature Probe TMP-BTA (For LabQuest,

LabPro, Go! Link, CBL 2™, and CBL

CO, Gas Sensor CO2-BTA (For LabQuest, LabPro, Go! Link, and

CBL 2™)

Shipping Charge to:
International Academy East
1291 Torpey Dr

Troy, Ml 48083

TOTAL

Company Name:

15

15

10

Address:

City: State:

Phone:

Zip:

Alternate

Unit Cost Total




TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT
SCIENCE SUPPLIES - IAE

Bid 9550
NASCO Flinn Scientific Basic Science Supplies Benz Optics Center
Flinn Item
Qty Unit i Description Alternate Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Alternate Unit Cost  Total Alternate Unit Cost  Total
2 12/pkg GP1005 Beaker, Borosilicate Glass 50ml SB42606M 25.20 50.40 30.60 61.20 340045 18.00 36.00 V1510 20.04 40.08
2 12/pkg  GP1010 Beaker, Borosilicate Glass 100ml SB42607M 25.68 51.36 32.40 64.80 340046 19.20 38.40 V15100 25.80 51.60
2 12/pkg  GP1020 Beaker, Borosilicate Glass 250ml SB42609M 25.80 51.60 29.64 59.28 340048 24.60 49.20 V15250 25.08 50.16
3 6/pkg GP1030 Beaker, Borosilicate Glass 600m| SB42611M 19.50 58.50 21.24 63.72 334574 20.70 62.10 V15600 22.62 67.86
1 6/pkg GP1040 Beaker, Borosilicate Glass 1000ml SB42612M 35.88 35.88 41.10 41.10 334576 36.30 36.30 V151000 36.84 36.84
3 3/pkg AP8203 Brush, Beaker SB08103M 4.26 12.78 21.42 64.26 370442 5.85 17.55 3036-16 6.87 20.61
1 12/pkg  AP8201 Brush, Test Tube, Nylon 3/4" diam SB16144M 4.67 4.67 18.48 18.48 350030 6.65 6.65 3012 6.99 6.99
10 ea AP1019 Tirrill Burner, Natural SB07242M 14.52 145.20 18.67 186.70 312015 22.95 229.50 no bid
2 6/pkg AP8346 Flint Lighter 6/pkg. SB16654M 7.44 14.88 12.48 24.96 312045 10.80 21.60 no bid
1 12/pkg  GP2050 Cylinder, Borosilicate Glass, 10ml no bid 76.68 76.68 315070 28.80 28.80 V2310 75.48 75.48
1 12/pkg  GP2054 Cylinder, Borosilicate Glass, 50ml no bid 96.12 96.12 315072 36.60 36.60 no bid
1 18/pkg  AP2296 Cylinder, Polymethylpentene 50 mL no bid 95.94 95.94 no bid US1572 79.00 79.00
3 12/pkg  AP5102 Medicine Dropper SA01161M 1.63 4.89 2.64 7.92 340005 2.10 6.30 5469 1.60 4.80
3 10/pkg  GP5075 Stirring Rods, Glass SB15199M 1.65 4.95 3.10 9.30 370444 3.10 9.30 L190A 1.80 5.40
1 12/pkg  AP8338 Scoop without Handle SB08211M no bid 18.00 18.00 350050 8.95 8.95 5100 8.20 8.20
1 ea AP1087 Magnetic Stirrer/Hot Plate, Flinn 7.7" no bid 354.33 354.33 no bid no bid
1 63/Ib AP2222 Rubber Stoppers Size 0 S08490M 3.71 3.71 9.81 9.81 316020 4.55 4.55 PL603 3.99 3.99
Ever-Safe Thermometers -20 to 110C
2 pkg AP8872 Partial immersion depth SB23912M 57.12 114.24 104.04 208.08 no bid E37 13.00 26.00
1 pkg AP6396 Timers, Student TB17891M 48.11 48.11 70.16 70.16 no bid C2189 44.00 44.00
1 ea AP6211 Timer, Overhead TB17257M 28.13 28.13 44 .96 44 .96 no bid no bid
1 72/pkg  GP6067 Test Tubes w/o Rims 18 x 150 mm no bid 41.76 41.76 no bid no bid
1 72/pkg GP6020  Test Tubes with Rims 16 x 150mm no bid 37.44 37.44 no bid no bid
15 ea AP4417 Test Tube Rack, Economy Choice SB0O1890M 1.68 25.20 5.62 84.30 no bid A8029 2.89 43.35
1 ea AP5328 Test Tube Basket 6x6x6 no bid 15.75 15.75 no bid no bid

15 ea AP1366 Hot Plate, Single Temperature SA02301M 106.51  1,597.65 124.74 1,871.10 no bid no bid




TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT
SCIENCE SUPPLIES - IAE

Bid 9550
NASCO Flinn Scientific Basic Science Supplies Benz Optics Center
Flinn Item
Qty Unit # Description Alternate = Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Alternate Unit Cost Total Alternate Unit Cost Total
Flinn Scientific Electronic Balance .01
5 ea 0OB2096 readability no bid 211.99 1,059.95 370633 285.00 1,425.00 VIC-212 179.00 895.00
4 20/pkg  AP1718 Beral-Type Pipets Thin Stem no bid 1.44 5.76 no bid no bid
3 20/pkg  AP8850 Super Jumbo Beral-Type Pipets no bid 1.84 5.52 no bid no bid
1 ea AP1501 Parafilm 4" 125 ft SB39419M 13.93 13.93 16.92 16.92 - no bid
Flask, Erlenmeyer, Borosilicate Glass
2 12/pkg GP3040  125mL SB42601M 24.60 49.20 49.20 98.40 370484 28.20 56.40 V18125 33.60 67.20
1 24/Ib AP2227 Size 5 Rubber Stoppers S08495M 3.71 3.71 9.81 9.81 316005 4.55 4.55 PL608 3.99 3.99
2 63/lb AP2222 Size 0 Rubber Stoppers S08490M 3.71 7.42 9.81 19.62 316020 4.55 9.10 PL603 3.99 7.98
15 ea AP1113 Beaker Tongs w/protective sleeves SA04392M 1.79 26.85 5.76 86.40 350015 2.50 37.50 PS042 2.29 34.35
8 3/pkg AP8218 Test Tube Clamp w/o finger grips SA04398M 1.47 11.76 3.81 30.48 313020 2.10 16.80 L505 1.80 14.40
4 72/pkg  ML1381 Microscope Slides, Glass Best Quality SA04463M 211 8.44 7.60 30.40 319055 2.55 10.20 no bid
1 50 shts/bk AB1175 Lens Paper 4" x 6" SA08888M 0.71 0.71 1.04 1.04 360050 0.85 0.85 20120 0.52 0.52
5 100/pkg ML1377 Cover Slips, Plastic S08349M 1.72 8.60 2.74 13.70 - 2085 1.89 9.45
High School Compound Scopes, Flinn Nat'l 134-
15 ea MS5040  Economy no bid 323.19 4,847.85 112204 329.00 4,935.00 CLED 230.00  3,450.00
15 ea ML1035 Paramecium Caudatum w.m. SL10093M 4.38 65.70 8.68 130.20 no bid 35753 6.30 94.50
15 ea ML1163 Allium (Onion slides) SL10119M 3.40 51.00 6.03 90.45 no bid 30124 4.50 67.50
15 ea ML1261 Whitefish Mitosis no bid 11.83 177.45 no bid 74815 12.10 181.50
20 ea AB1264 Culture Dish 41/2" x 13/4" SB06964M 4.58 91.60 6.52 130.40 370475 6.45 129.00 no bid
Funnel, Utility, Polyethylene 41/4"
1 12/pkg  AP3202 diameter no bid 18.48 18.48 315062 11.40 11.40 no bid
Weighing Paper, Moisture-Resistant Non-
1 500/pkg AP1122 Absorbent 4x4" no bid 10.85 10.85 no bid 20145 5.29 5.29
18 ea AB1042 Probe and Seeker SB07838M 0.51 9.18 2.00 36.00 330050 1.35 24.30 6800 0.79 14.22
2 12/pkg  AP7131 Apron, Rubberized 27" x 42" SB37273M 41.40 82.80 129.12 258.24 319011 70.20 140.40 no bid
2 12/pkg  AP7132 Apron, Rubberized 36" x 42" SB37274M 44.16 88.32 165.60 331.20 319012 84.60 169.20 no bid
Goggles, Chemical Splash, Standard
40 ea AP3306 Vented Goggle SB06969M 1.78 71.20 5.80 232.00 315080 2.50 100.00 E898 2.49 99.60
2 ea AP7080 Gloves, Nitrile, Disposable, Powder-Free no bid 13.77 27.54 no bid 50484 7.80 15.60
2 10/pkg  AP4684 Ruler, Metric/English, Opaque 12" TB16265M 2.50 5.00 7.40 14.80 311585 4.20 8.40 no bid

2 ea A0246 Aniline Blue Staining Solution 100mL no bid 6.84 13.68 no bid no bid




TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT
SCIENCE SUPPLIES - IAE

Bid 9550
NASCO Flinn Scientific Basic Science Supplies Benz Optics Center
Flinn Item
Qty Unit # Description Alternate = Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Alternate Unit Cost Total Alternate Unit Cost Total
1 ea S0075 Sodium Hydroxide 500g KMO00729M 20.65 20.65 9.41 9.41 no bid no bid
1 ea S0148 Sodium Hydroxide 500mL 1M SB17031M 4.66 4.66 5.40 5.40 no bid no bid
1 ea HO057 Hydrochloric Acid 1000mL 1M no bid 8.28 8.28 no bid no bid
2 ea 10010 lodine Solution, Lugol's 500mL no bid 8.96 17.92 no bid no bid
1 ea G0037 Gelatin 150g Granular Lab Grade SA09536M 5.79 5.79 7.20 7.20 no bid no bid
1 ea S0282 Starch, Corn 2kg no bid 19.67 19.67 no bid no bid
1 ea D0015 Dextrose, Granular 2kg no bid 19.31 19.31 no bid no bid
Dialysis Tubing 33mm flat width
1 ea AB1232 30meters long no bid 38.52 38.52 no bid no bid
Bromthymol Blue Indicator Solution
1 ea B0228 1000mL SA09401M 7.27 7.27 8.01 8.01 no bid no bid
1 ea FB1225 ABO/Rh Simulated Blood Typing Kit no bid 30.69 30.69 no bid no bid
1 ea B0051 Biuret Test Solution 500mL KM00786M 18.98 18.98 5.76 5.76 no bid no bid
1 ea AP5885 Genesis Water Distiller no bid no bid no bid no bid
Vernier
Qty Item #
15 ea LABPRO LabPro Interface no bid no bid no bid no bid
1 ea LP Logger Pro 3 Software no bid no bid no bid no bid
BTA (For LabQuest, LabPro, Go! Link,
15 ea TMP-BTA CBL 2™, and CBL no bid no bid no bid no bid
CO, Gas Sensor CO2-BTA (For
LabQuest, LabPro, Go! Link, and CBL
10 ea CO2-BTA 2™) no bid no bid no bid no bid

TOTAL 2,904.92 11,493.46 7,669.90 5,525.46

Arbor Scientific: No Bid

Bio Corporation: No Bid

School Specialty: No Response

Pasco Scientific: No Response
Educational Innovations: No Response




TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT
SCIENCE SUPPLIES - IAE

Bid 9550
oty Unit
2 12/pkg
2 12/pkg
2 12/pkg
3 6/pkg
1 6/pkg
3 3/pkg
1 12/pkg
10 ea
2 6/pkg
1 12/pkg
1 12/pkg
1 18/pkg
3 12/pkg
3 10/pkg
1 12/pkg
1 ea
1 63/Ib
2 pkg
1 pkyg
1 ea
1 72/pkg
1 72/pkg
15 ea
1 ea
15 ea

Flinn ltem

#

GP1005

GP1010

GP1020

GP1030

GP1040
AP8203
AP8201
AP1019
AP8346

GP2050

GP2054

AP2296
AP5102
GP5075
AP8338
AP1087

AP2222

AP8872
AP6396
AP6211

GP6067
GP6020
AP4417
AP5328
AP1366

Description

Beaker, Borosilicate Glass 50mi
Beaker, Borosilicate Glass 100ml
Beaker, Borosilicate Glass 250ml
Beaker, Borosilicate Glass 600ml
Beaker, Borosilicate Glass 1000m|
Brush, Beaker

Brush, Test Tube, Nylon 3/4" diam
Tirrill Burner, Natural

Flint Lighter 6/pkg.

Cylinder, Borosilicate Glass, 10ml
Cylinder, Borosilicate Glass, 50ml
Cylinder, Polymethylpentene 50 mL
Medicine Dropper

Stirring Rods, Glass

Scoop without Handle

Magnetic Stirrer/Hot Plate, Flinn 7.7"

Rubber Stoppers Size 0

Ever-Safe Thermometers -20 to 110C

Partial immersion depth
Timers, Student
Timer, Overhead

Test Tubes w/o Rims 18 x 150 mm
Test Tubes with Rims 16 x 150mm
Test Tube Rack, Economy Choice
Test Tube Basket 6x6x6

Hot Plate, Single Temperature

Alternate

115-33045
115-33047
115-33051
115-33055
115-33057
120-30174
120-30040
120-30834
120-30906
115-20351
115-20355
150-23179
132-24130
116-23499
120-31034
ATH-50169
124-33602

096-01950
098-01921

ATH-50155

Cynmar Corp

Unit Cost

34.00
35.90
35.00
25.50
49.40
7.11
9.60
20.42
10.50
57.00
88.80
88.20
2.09
3.80
10.80
365.75
4.27

67.20
57.00

128.25

Total

68.00

71.80

70.00

76.50

49.40
21.33
9.60
204.20
21.00

57.00

88.80

88.20
6.27
11.40
10.80
365.75

4.27

134.40
57.00
no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid
1,923.75

Alternate

S76100D
S76100E
S76100G
S76100J

S76100K
S30408/ea
S95354
S49107
S41878A

S318861/ea
S318881/ea

S32812
S79383
S63449 72/pk
14357Q 6/pk
S68089

S50082A

S63343/ea
S65330
S65331

S63300
S63289
S478441H
S478471
$50412Q

Fisher Science Ed

Unit Cost

21.73
25.42
20.09
14.73
31.53
4.06
13.20
16.88
19.89
7.21
8.54
61.09
6.19

20.91
17.25

304.36

8.57

3.92
49.96
36.00

38.84
33.91

5.27
16.16
98.22

Total

43.46
50.84
40.18
44.19

31.53
36.54
13.20
168.80
39.78

86.52
102.48

61.09
18.57
20.91
34.50
304.36

8.57

94.08
49.96
36.00

38.84
33.91
79.05
16.16
1,473.30

Ward's Natural Science

Alternate Unit Cost

17-4010

17-4020

17-4040

17-4080
15-9105
15-0606
15-0683

17-3564

15-8460

17-3717
17-0630
18-4231

32.88

34.80

24.00

44.82
10.56
20.55
13.29

79.44

6.30

36.00
41.04
4.87

Total

65.76

69.60

48.00
no bid

44.82

no bid
10.56
205.50
26.58

79.44
no bid

no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid

6.30

no bid
no bid
no bid

36.00
41.04
73.05




TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT
SCIENCE SUPPLIES - IAE

Bid 9550
Qty Unit

5 ea

4 20/pkg
3 20/pkg
1 ea

2 12/pkg
1 24/lb
2 63/lb
15 ea

8 3/pkg
4 72/pkg
1 50 shts/bk
5 100/pkg
15 ea
15 ea
15 ea
15 ea
20 ea

1 12/pkg
1 500/pkg
18 ea

2 12/pkg
2 12/pkg
40 ea

2 ea

2 10/pkg
2 ea

Flinn ltem

#

0B2096
AP1718
AP8850
AP1501

GP3040

AP2227

AP2222
AP1113
AP8218
ML1381
AB1175
ML1377

MS5040
ML1035
ML1163
ML1261

AB1264
AP3202
AP1122
AB1042
AP7131
AP7132
AP3306
AP7080

AP4684
A0246

Description

Flinn Scientific Electronic Balance .01
readability

Beral-Type Pipets Thin Stem

Super Jumbo Beral-Type Pipets
Parafilm 4" 125 ft

Flask, Erlenmeyer, Borosilicate Glass
125mL

Size 5 Rubber Stoppers

Size 0 Rubber Stoppers

Beaker Tongs w/protective sleeves
Test Tube Clamp w/o finger grips
Microscope Slides, Glass Best Quality
Lens Paper 4" x 6"

Cover Slips, Plastic

High School Compound Scopes, Flinn
Economy

Paramecium Caudatum w.m.

Allium (Onion slides)

Whitefish Mitosis

Culture Dish 41/2" x 13/4"

Funnel, Utility, Polyethylene 41/4"
diameter

Weighing Paper, Moisture-Resistant Non-
Absorbent 4x4"

Probe and Seeker

Apron, Rubberized 27" x 42"

Apron, Rubberized 36" x 42"

Goggles, Chemical Splash, Standard
Vented Goggle

Gloves, Nitrile, Disposable, Powder-Free
Ruler, Metric/English, Opaque 12"
Aniline Blue Staining Solution 100mL

Alternate

ACL-16160

120-31081

115-33093

124-33607

124-33602
120-30769
120-30557
130-21107
180-50256
130-21262

CSH-48055

41/2"x2
1/2" 115-
28201

111-20984
092-03142
180-50204
180-50203

180-11214

180-50878
086-03487

Cynmar Corp

Unit Cost

179.55

16.10
44.95
4.27

4.27
3.08
2.55
4.27
1.33
2.37

182.00

5.79

6.65
0.90
51.60
54.00

5.32

7.55
5.30

Total

897.75
no bid
no bid
16.10

89.90

4.27

8.54
46.20
20.40
17.08

1.33
11.85

2,730.00
no bid
no bid
no bid

115.80
no bid

6.65
16.20
103.20
108.00
212.80
15.10

10.60
no bid

Fisher Science Ed

Alternate

S94792C
S304672 500/pk
S304673 500/pk
S37440

S$76106C
S50080G

S50082A
S50275
S49062
S17466
S47605
S17525B

$96028
S11015
S10662
S11465

S31473 12/pk
S34566
S402881
S17380
S475612/ea
S475621/ea

S47615

1913015970
S40641P

Unit Cost

176.28
14.84
14.80
14.68

23.37

8.57

8.57
4.80
1.23
4.31
6.77
271

237.21
2.57
4.24
8.71

42.86

20.30

8.20

1.49

4.22

5.03

1.33

16.63
4.47

Total

881.40
14.84
14.80
14.68

46.74
8.57

17.14
72.00
29.52
8.62
6.77
13.55

3,558.15
38.55
63.60

130.65

85.72
20.30
8.20
26.82
101.28
120.72
53.20
33.26

8.94
no bid

Ward's Natural Science

Alternate Unit Cost

15-8465

15-8460
15-0761

14-3501
15-8250
14-3555

92-0421
91-7042
93-2240

6.30

6.30
4.87

14.49
0.93
2.63

4.24
4.19
7.74

Total

no bid
no bid
6.30

12.60
73.05

no bid
57.96
0.93
13.15

no bid
63.60
62.85
116.10

no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid

no bid
no bid




TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT
SCIENCE SUPPLIES - IAE

Bid 9550
oty Unit
1 ea
1 ea
1 ea
2 ea
1 ea
1 ea
1 ea
1 ea
1 ea
1 ea
1 ea
1 ea
oty
15 ea
1 ea
15 ea
10 ea

Flinn ltem

#

S0075
S0148
HO0057
10010

G0037
S0282
D0015

AB1232

B0228

FB1225

B0OO51
AP5885

Vernier

ltem #

LABPRO
LP

TMP-BTA

CO2-BTA

Description

Sodium Hydroxide 500g

Sodium Hydroxide 500mL 1M
Hydrochloric Acid 1000mL 1M

lodine Solution, Lugol's
Gelatin 150g Granular Lab Grade

Starch, Corn 2kg

Dextrose, Granular 2kg

500mL

Dialysis Tubing 33mm flat width

30meters long

Bromthymol Blue Indicator Solution

1000mL

ABO/Rh Simulated Blood Typing Kit

Biuret Test Solution 500mL

Genesis Water Distiller

LabPro Interface
Logger Pro 3 Software

BTA (For LabQuest,'LabPro, Go! Link,

CBL 2™, and CBL

CO, Gas Sensor CO2-BTA (For
LabQuest, LabPro, Go! Link, and CBL

2TM)

TOTAL

Arbor Scientific: No Bid
Bio Corporation: No Bid

School Specialty: No Response
Pasco Scientific: No Response

Educational Innovations: No Response

Alternate

150-21430

Cynmar Corp

Unit Cost

32.06

Total

no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid

32.06

no bid

no bid
no bid
no bid

no bid
no bid

no bid

no bid

7,803.30

Fisher Science Ed

Alternate Unit Cost

Ward's Natural Science

Total Alternate Unit Cost Total

S78605 8.65
S719932 6.27
S93259 9.21
S800231 16.78
S789311 34.24
S734181/ea 11.44
S413003A 43.96
S718891 10@100ml 3.44
S19660 35.22
S93405 5.78
NC9733548 247.66
NC9756032 201.38
S65514 33.10
S23142 284.22

8.65 no bid

6.27 no bid

9.21 no bid

no bid no bid

16.78 no bid

34.24 no bid

22.88 no bid

43.96 no bid

34.40 no bid

35.22 no bid

5.78 no bid

no bid no bid
3,714.90 16-9992 220.00 3,300.00
201.38 14-5111 179.00 179.00
496.50 16-9989 29.00 435.00
2,842.20 14-5102 249.00 2,490.00
15,777.21 7,517.19




TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT
SCIENCE SUPPLIES - IAE

Bid 9550
oty Unit
2 12/pkg
2 12/pkg
2 12/pkg
3 6/pkg
1 6/pkg
3 3/pkg
1 12/pkg
10 ea
2 6/pkg
1 12/pkg
1 12/pkg
1 18/pkg
3 12/pkg
3 10/pkg
1 12/pkg
1 ea
1 63/Ib
2 pkg
1 pkyg
1 ea
1 72/pkg
1 72/pkg
15 ea
1 ea
15 ea

Flinn ltem

#

GP1005

GP1010

GP1020

GP1030

GP1040
AP8203
AP8201
AP1019
AP8346

GP2050

GP2054

AP2296
AP5102
GP5075
AP8338
AP1087

AP2222

AP8872
AP6396
AP6211

GP6067
GP6020
AP4417
AP5328
AP1366

Description

Beaker, Borosilicate Glass 50mi
Beaker, Borosilicate Glass 100ml
Beaker, Borosilicate Glass 250ml
Beaker, Borosilicate Glass 600ml
Beaker, Borosilicate Glass 1000m|
Brush, Beaker

Brush, Test Tube, Nylon 3/4" diam
Tirrill Burner, Natural

Flint Lighter 6/pkg.

Cylinder, Borosilicate Glass, 10ml
Cylinder, Borosilicate Glass, 50ml
Cylinder, Polymethylpentene 50 mL
Medicine Dropper

Stirring Rods, Glass

Scoop without Handle

Magnetic Stirrer/Hot Plate, Flinn 7.7"

Rubber Stoppers Size 0

Ever-Safe Thermometers -20 to 110C

Partial immersion depth
Timers, Student
Timer, Overhead

Test Tubes w/o Rims 18 x 150 mm
Test Tubes with Rims 16 x 150mm
Test Tube Rack, Economy Choice
Test Tube Basket 6x6x6

Hot Plate, Single Temperature

Vernier Software

Unit Cost Total

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid

no bid

no bid
no bid
no bid

no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid

Alternate

Frey Scientific

Unit Cost

593967 25.87

593970 27.36

593976 26.47

593982 19.55

594045 36.86

574034 10.59

560101 8.12

585213 15.76

561124 8.34
15-529636-21 168.58
15-529638-21 185.62
594216 29.52

569723 0.99

525527 1.98

573126 7.94
15-528338-21 301.99
560752 3.78

1017384 18.84

531794 50.36
15-572537-21 18.28
593463 31.87

32.87

581385 2.93

581394 7.44
15-528334-21 95.84

Science Kit LLC

Total Alternate = Unit Cost Total

51.74 1735-03G 11.76 23.52
54.72 1735-04G 14.40 28.80
52.94 1735-06G 19.20 38.40
58.65 1735-08D 11.16 33.48
36.86 1735-10D 20.10 20.10
31.77 60765-00Q 14.55 43.65
8.12 60760-01G 9.96 9.96
157.60 60925-00 16.97 169.70
16.68 62260-12 7.45 14.90
168.58 1735-57G 32.52 32.52
185.62 1735-59G 39.72 39.72
29.52 61368-07J 35.46 35.46
2.97 62405-12 1.85 5.55
5.94 61965-08F 1.70 5.10
7.94 62930-01G 5.88 5.88
301.99 66728-01 337.23 337.23
3.78 62855-20 3.77 3.77
37.68 1757-88G 161.52 323.04
50.36 46185-01A 64.52 64.52
18.28 46404-00 41.54 41.54
31.87 1737-17P 30.96 30.96
32.87 1737-04P 16.56 16.56
43.95 27422-00 2.09 31.35
7.44 -
1,437.60 66353-00 135.45 2,031.75




TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT
SCIENCE SUPPLIES - IAE

Bid 9550
oty Unit

5 ea

4 20/pkg
3 20/pkg
1 ea

2 12/pkg
1 24/lb
2 63/lb
15 ea

8 3/pkg
4 72/pkg
1 50 shts/bk
5 100/pkg
15 ea
15 ea
15 ea
15 ea
20 ea

1 12/pkg
1 500/pkg
18 ea

2 12/pkg
2 12/pkg
40 ea

2 ea

2 10/pkg
2 ea

Flinn ltem

#

0B2096
AP1718
AP8850
AP1501

GP3040

AP2227

AP2222
AP1113
AP8218
ML1381
AB1175
ML1377

MS5040
ML1035
ML1163
ML1261

AB1264
AP3202
AP1122
AB1042
AP7131
AP7132
AP3306
AP7080

AP4684
A0246

Description

Flinn Scientific Electronic Balance .01
readability

Beral-Type Pipets Thin Stem

Super Jumbo Beral-Type Pipets
Parafilm 4" 125 ft

Flask, Erlenmeyer, Borosilicate Glass
125mL

Size 5 Rubber Stoppers

Size 0 Rubber Stoppers

Beaker Tongs w/protective sleeves
Test Tube Clamp w/o finger grips
Microscope Slides, Glass Best Quality
Lens Paper 4" x 6"

Cover Slips, Plastic

High School Compound Scopes, Flinn
Economy

Paramecium Caudatum w.m.

Allium (Onion slides)

Whitefish Mitosis

Culture Dish 41/2" x 13/4"
Funnel, Utility, Polyethylene 41/4"
diameter

Weighing Paper, Moisture-Resistant Non-

Absorbent 4x4"

Probe and Seeker

Apron, Rubberized 27" x 42"

Apron, Rubberized 36" x 42"
Goggles, Chemical Splash, Standard
Vented Goggle

Gloves, Nitrile, Disposable, Powder-Free

Ruler, Metric/English, Opaque 12"
Aniline Blue Staining Solution 100mL

Vernier Software

Unit Cost

Total

no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid

no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid

no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid

no bid
no bid

Frey Scientific

Alternate

15-531642-21
585795 100/pk

592818
594018
560797
560752
563630

568490 6/pk
571694
569909
569906

563299

590820
594309

589353
583140

596229

1016980
15-081888-21/ea

Unit Cost

157.38
16.14

13.57
35.67
3.78
3.78
2.99
2.82
2.31
0.48
2.60

269.97

4.99

19.92

5.32
0.78

4.58

7.27
0.21

Total

786.90
16.14

no bid
13.57

71.34
3.78

7.56
44.85
11.28

9.24

0.48
13.00

4,049.55
no bid
no bid
no bid

99.80

19.92

5.32
14.04

183.20

1454
4.20

Alternate

1759-62
65728-00

68746-00
1736-11G
62855-05

62855-20
63410-00
63230-00Q
62510-01
62230-00
62473-00

55845-00
69136-03
69122-07
69168-02
61448-02
61871-076
61535-00
60175-00G
60175-00G
62011-01

17045-00F
94818-02B

Unit Cost

238.66
2.52

14.89

19.92

3.77

3.77
1.86
1.56
2.49
0.68
2.29

261.80

5.26

6.23

9.42

5.85

24.36

0.86

72.36

72.36

1.37

4.90
22.32

Science Kit LLC

Total

1,193.30
10.08

no bid
14.89

39.84
3.77

7.54
27.90
12.48

9.96

0.68
11.45

3,927.00
78.90
93.45

141.30
117.00
24.36
15.48
144.72
144.72
54.80

9.80
44.64




TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT
SCIENCE SUPPLIES - IAE
Bid 9550

Vernier Software

Elinn Item
Oty Unit # Description Unit Cost

1 ea S0075 Sodium Hydroxide 500g
1 ea S0148 Sodium Hydroxide 500mL 1M
1 ea HO0057 Hydrochloric Acid 1000mL 1M
2 ea 10010 lodine Solution, Lugol's 500mL
1 ea G0037 Gelatin 150g Granular Lab Grade
1 ea S0282 Starch, Corn 2kg
1 ea D0015 Dextrose, Granular 2kg
Dialysis Tubing 33mm flat width

1 ea AB1232 30meters long
Bromthymol Blue Indicator Solution
1 ea B0228 1000mL
1 ea FB1225 ABO/Rh Simulated Blood Typing Kit
1 ea B0051 Biuret Test Solution 500mL
1 ea AP5885 Genesis Water Distiller
Vernier
Qty Item #
15 ea LABPRO LabPro Interface 213.40
1 ea LP Logger Pro 3 Software 179.00
BTA (For LabQuest, LabPro, Go! Link,
15 ea TMP-BTA CBL 2™, and CBL 28.13

CO, Gas Sensor CO2-BTA (For
LabQuest, LabPro, Go! Link, and CBL
10 ea CO2-BTA 2™) 241.53

TOTAL

Arbor Scientific: No Bid

Bio Corporation: No Bid

School Specialty: No Response

Pasco Scientific: No Response
Educational Innovations: No Response

Total

no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid
no bid
no bid

3,201.00
179.00

421.95

2,415.30

6,217.25

Frey Scientific

Alternate Unit Cost

580164 11.95
580194 15.95
578694 14.95
578847 7.96
580359 22.24
578112 9.52
585468 48.99
578061 7.95
15-529618-21 317.73

Total
11.95
15.95
14.95

7.96

22.24

9.52

48.99
7.95
317.73

8,661.42

Alternate

97076-06
97080-06
97036-07
97048-06
94551-04A
81460-03B
94559-06B

61417-13

94470-06A

45654-00
97012-06
65688-02

1751-69
1752-71

1751-66

1752-75

Science Kit LLC

Unit Cost

10.74
7.85
9.18
5.52

11.60

16.80

21.48

24.75

5.96

32.77
9.15
407.69

220.00
179.00

29.00

249.00

Total

10.74
7.85
9.18

11.04

11.60

16.80

21.48

24.75

5.96

32.77
9.15
407.69

3,300.00
179.00

435.00

2,490.00

16,488.53




TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT
SCIENCE SUPPLIES - IAE

Bid 9550
oty Unit
2 12/pkg
2 12/pkg
2 12/pkg
3 6/pkg
1 6/pkg
3 3/pkg
1 12/pkg
10 ea
2 6/pkg
1 12/pkg
1 12/pkg
1 18/pkg
3 12/pkg
3 10/pkg
1 12/pkg
1 ea
1 63/Ib
2 pkg
1 pkyg
1 ea
1 72/pkg
1 72/pkg
15 ea
1 ea
15 ea

Flinn ltem

#

GP1005

GP1010

GP1020

GP1030

GP1040
AP8203
AP8201
AP1019
AP8346

GP2050

GP2054

AP2296
AP5102
GP5075
AP8338
AP1087

AP2222

AP8872
AP6396
AP6211

GP6067
GP6020
AP4417
AP5328
AP1366

Description

Beaker, Borosilicate Glass 50mi
Beaker, Borosilicate Glass 100ml
Beaker, Borosilicate Glass 250ml
Beaker, Borosilicate Glass 600ml
Beaker, Borosilicate Glass 1000m|
Brush, Beaker

Brush, Test Tube, Nylon 3/4" diam
Tirrill Burner, Natural

Flint Lighter 6/pkg.

Cylinder, Borosilicate Glass, 10ml
Cylinder, Borosilicate Glass, 50ml
Cylinder, Polymethylpentene 50 mL
Medicine Dropper

Stirring Rods, Glass

Scoop without Handle

Magnetic Stirrer/Hot Plate, Flinn 7.7"

Rubber Stoppers Size 0

Ever-Safe Thermometers -20 to 110C

Partial immersion depth
Timers, Student
Timer, Overhead

Test Tubes w/o Rims 18 x 150 mm
Test Tubes with Rims 16 x 150mm
Test Tube Rack, Economy Choice
Test Tube Basket 6x6x6

Hot Plate, Single Temperature

Carolina Biological

Alternate Unit Cost

72-1220

72-1221

97-4213

72-1227
70-6100
70-6062
70-6665
70-6630

72-2214
73-6913
71-1303
70-2851
70-1025

71-2401

74-5440
70-2676

73-0016
73-0014
73-1876
73-1943

3.09

3.37

3.04

8.31
7.55
1.57
23.61
2.37

5.75
3.47
4.04
1.42
401.90

10.07

8.31
30.68

48.21
40.37

7.36
17.05

Total

6.18

6.74

6.08

no bid

8.31
22.65
1.57
236.10
4.74

no bid

no bid

5.75
10.41
12.12

1.42

401.90

10.07

16.62
30.68

48.21
40.37
110.40
17.05

no bid

Sargent Welch

Alternate

Unit Cost

S1735-03 9.69
S1735-04 10.70
S4675-K 23.71
S4675-M 17.51
S4675-P 33.01
S9815/ea 1.73
S9990 5.96
S12285 12.48
S13095 1.30
S1735-37/ea 2.62
S1735-59/ea 3.20
S24638-17D/ea 1.80
S69695 1.86
S40097-CC 2/pk 1.73
S75290-A 6/pk 5.36
S41059-06A 301.99
S73305-B 5.62
S80008-B 169.84
S77448 32.26
S79535-K 28.54
S79515-F 27.09
S79110-30 1.97
S41056-50 101.66

Total

19.38
21.40
47.42
52.53

33.01
15.57
5.96
124.80
2.60

31.44
38.40

32.40
5.58
5.19

10.72

301.99

5.62

339.68
32.26
no bid

28.54
27.09
29.55

no bid
1,524.90

Alternate

MyChron I
Teach Timer

EAI Education

Unit Cost

47.5
33.75

Total

47.50
33.75




TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT
SCIENCE SUPPLIES - IAE
Bid 9550

Flinn ltem
# Description

2
|C
3

Flinn Scientific Electronic Balance .01
readability

Beral-Type Pipets Thin Stem

Super Jumbo Beral-Type Pipets
Parafilm 4" 125 ft

Flask, Erlenmeyer, Borosilicate Glass

5 ea 0OB2096
4 20/pkg  AP1718
3 20/pkg  AP8850
1 ea AP1501

2 12/pkg  GP3040  125mL
1 24/lb AP2227 Size 5 Rubber Stoppers
2 63/lb AP2222 Size 0 Rubber Stoppers
15 ea AP1113 Beaker Tongs wi/protective sleeves
3/pkg AP8218 Test Tube Clamp w/o finger grips
ML1381 Microscope Slides, Glass Best Quality

50 shts/bk AB1175

8

4 72/pkg
1 Lens Paper 4" x 6"
5

100/pkg ML1377 Cover Slips, Plastic
High School Compound Scopes, Flinn
15 ea MS5040 Economy
15 ea ML1035 Paramecium Caudatum w.m.
15 ea ML1163 Allium (Onion slides)
15 ea ML1261 Whitefish Mitosis
20 ea AB1264 Culture Dish 41/2" x 13/4"
Funnel, Utility, Polyethylene 41/4"
1 12/pkg  AP3202 diameter
Weighing Paper, Moisture-Resistant Non-
1 500/pkg AP1122 Absorbent 4x4"
18 ea AB1042 Probe and Seeker
2 12/pkg  AP7131 Apron, Rubberized 27" x 42"
2 12/pkg  AP7132 Apron, Rubberized 36" x 42"
Goggles, Chemical Splash, Standard
40 ea AP3306 Vented Goggle
2 ea AP7080 Gloves, Nitrile, Disposable, Powder-Free
2 10/pkg  AP4684 Ruler, Metric/English, Opaque 12"
2 ea A0246 Aniline Blue Staining Solution 100mL

Carolina Biological

Alternate Unit Cost

21-5600
72-6686
71-2406
71-2401
70-2900
63-1920

63-4005
63-2900

29-6962

74-1004

73-3022

70-2322
62-7400
70-6252
70-6254

64-6710
70-6337

70-2603
84-4753

20.85
3.75
10.07
10.07
1.42
6.60

1.00
3.32

2.94

6.60

24.65

7.93
1.85
11.35
16.62

8.79
17.05

5.75
18.00

Total

no bid

no bid

no bid
20.85

7.50

10.07

20.14

no bid
11.36
26.40
1.00
16.60

no bid
44.10

no bid

no bid

132.00
24.65
7.93
33.30
22.70
33.24
351.60
34.10

11.50
36.00

Alternate

S2647-10B

S69684-33A 100/pk

S65710-A
S34105-D
S73305-G

S73305B
S82105
S19565/ea
S58775
S44325 72/pk
S58771

S48249-31L
WI156091
WI34661
WI159981

S26156-B

30253-129 4/pk

S65223-05B
S26905
S955-B/ea
S955-Alea

S40380-03B
S40289-C

WI10149Q
C94818-02

Sargent Welch

Unit Cost

182.85
2.35

16.14

31.95

5.19

5.62
1.77
0.42
11.75
0.48
1.73

195.71
8.39
5.93

10.84

5.09
16.37
5.28
0.60
3.58
3.38
1.10
5.45

11.76
7.22

Total

914.25
2.35

no bid
16.14

63.90
5.19

11.24
26.55
10.08
47.00
0.48
8.65

2,935.65
125.85
88.95
162.60

101.80
49.11
5.28
10.80
85.92
81.12
44.00
10.90

23.52
14.44

Alternate

EAI 532081

EAIl Education

2.48

Unit Cost

Total

4.96




TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT
SCIENCE SUPPLIES - IAE

Bid 9550
Carolina Biological Sargent Welch EAI Education
Flinn Item
Qty Unit # Description Alternate Unit Cost Total Alternate Unit Cost Total Alternate Unit Cost Total
1 ea S0075 Sodium Hydroxide 500g 88-9470 18.16 18.16 C97076-06 7.42 7.42
1 ea S0148 Sodium Hydroxide 500mL 1M 88-9571 6.60 6.60 C97080-07 4.68 4.68
1 ea HO0057 Hydrochloric Acid 1000mL 1M 86-7843 16.45 16.45 C97036-07 5.41 5.41
2 ea 10010 lodine Solution, Lugol's  500mL 87-2795 10.40 20.80 C97048-06 7.14 14.28
1 ea G0037 Gelatin 150g Granular Lab Grade no bid C94551-06 16.70 16.70
1 ea S0282 Starch, Corn 2kg no bid ca4771T 8.32 8.32
1 ea D0015 Dextrose, Granular 2kg 85-7452 28.02 28.02 C94559-06 6.95 6.95
Dialysis Tubing 33mm flat width
1 ea AB1232 30meters long 68-4219 42.27 42.27 S25275-A2 22.62 22.62
Bromthymol Blue Indicator Solution
1 ea B0228 1000mL no bid C94470-06 3.86 3.86
1 ea FB1225 ABO/Rh Simulated Blood Typing Kit 70-0101 no bid WI54859 42.86 42.86
1 ea B0051 Biuret Test Solution 500mL 84-8213 28.45 28.45 C97012-06 5.37 5.37
1 ea AP5885 Genesis Water Distiller 14.55 14.55 no bid
Vernier
Qty Item #
15 ea LABPRO LabPro Interface no bid S1752-69 220.09 3,301.35 EAI 74305 2105 3,157.50
1 ea LP Logger Pro 3 Software no bid S1752-71 179.09 179.09 EAO 74095-021 173.9 173.90
BTA (For LabQuest, LabPro, Go! Link,
15 ea TMP-BTA CBL 2™, and CBL no bid S1751-66 29.09 436.35 EAI 74418 28.43 426.45
CO, Gas Sensor CO2-BTA (For
LabQuest, LabPro, Go! Link, and CBL
10 ea CO2-BTA 2™) no bid S13272-K 249.09 2,490.90 EAI 74337 239.99 2,399.90

TOTAL 2,017.71 14,127.96 6,243.96

Arbor Scientific: No Bid

Bio Corporation: No Bid

School Specialty: No Response

Pasco Scientific: No Response
Educational Innovations: No Response




TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT
SCIENCE SUPPLIES - IAE

Bid 9550
Sciencelabs.com
Flinn Item
Qty Unit # Description Alternate  Unit Cost Total
QWC10204-
2 12/pkg GP1005 Beaker, Borosilicate Glass 50ml 12 14.40 28.80
QWC10205-
2 12/pkg GP1010  Beaker, Borosilicate Glass 100ml 12 15.12 30.24
QWC10208-
2 12/pkg  GP1020 Beaker, Borosilicate Glass 250ml 12 17.74 35.48
QWC10212-
3 6/pkg GP1030 Beaker, Borosilicate Glass 600ml 6 15.22 45.66
QWC10214-
1 6/pkg GP1040 Beaker, Borosilicate Glass 1000ml 6 26.10 26.10
3 3/pkg AP8203 Brush, Beaker QLB-13 3.44 10.32
1 12/pkg  AP8201 Brush, Test Tube, Nylon 3/4" diam QA2080-12 5.88 5.88
10 ea AP1019 Tirrill Burner, Natural
2 6/pkg AP8346 Flint Lighter 6/pkg.
QUNCY3022
1 12/pkg  GP2050  Cylinder, Borosilicate Glass, 10ml 46 57.91 57.91
QUNCY3022
1 12/pkg  GP2054  Cylinder, Borosilicate Glass, 50ml 50 75.27 75.27
1 18/pkg  AP2296 Cylinder, Polymethylpentene 50 mL QUNB80033 31.61 31.61
3 12/pkg  AP5102 Medicine Dropper Q97-4301 1.29 3.87
3 10/pkg  GP5075 Stirring Rods, Glass Q97-3200 241 7.23
1 12/pkg  AP8338 Scoop without Handle QA2084-01 5.78 5.78
1 ea AP1087 Magnetic Stirrer/Hot Plate, Flinn 7.7"
QUNRSTO-
1 63/lb AP2222 Rubber Stoppers Size 0 S 3.40 3.40
Ever-Safe Thermometers -20 to 110C
2 pkg AP8872 Partial immersion depth Q97-3137 12.10 24.20
1 pkg AP6396 Timers, Student 7-1397 24.00 24.00
1 ea AP6211 Timer, Overhead
QUNTT9820-
1 72Ipkg  GP6067 Test Tubes w/o Rims 18 x 150 mm G 22.32 22.32
1 72/pkg GP6020  Test Tubes with Rims 16 x 150mm
15 ea AP4417 Test Tube Rack, Economy Choice QA2035-01 1.29 19.35
1 ea AP5328 Test Tube Basket 6x6x6
15 ea AP1366 Hot Plate, Single Temperature
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Flinn ltem
# Description Alternate Unit Cost Total

2
|C
3

Flinn Scientific Electronic Balance .01
5 ea OB2096 readability
4 20/pkg  AP1718 Beral-Type Pipets Thin Stem
3 20/pkg  AP8850 Super Jumbo Beral-Type Pipets
1 ea AP1501 Parafilm 4" 125 ft
Flask, Erlenmeyer, Borosilicate Glass QUNFG5100:

2 12/pkg GP3040  125mL 125 19.83 39.66
QUNRSTO05-

1 24/Ib AP2227 Size 5 Rubber Stoppers S 3.40 3.40
QUNRSTO-

2 63/Ib AP2222 Size 0 Rubber Stoppers S 3.40 6.80

15 ea AP1113 Beaker Tongs w/protective sleeves 7-G72 2.04 30.60

8 3/pkg AP8218 Test Tube Clamp w/o finger grips QA2030-02 1.17 9.36

4 72/pkg  ML1381 Microscope Slides, Glass Best Quality QA9119-00 1.84 7.36

1 50 shts/bk AB1175 Lens Paper 4" x 6" QMAS50 0.40 0.40

5 100/pkg ML1377 Cover Slips, Plastic

High School Compound Scopes, Flinn QWPA100L

15 ea MS5040 Economy ED 186.65 2,799.75

15 ea ML1035 Paramecium Caudatum w.m. QA91-1013 1.60 24.00

15 ea ML1163 Allium (Onion slides) QA91-4001 2.60 39.00

15 ea ML1261 Whitefish Mitosis

20 ea AB1264 Culture Dish 41/2" x 13/4"

Funnel, Utility, Polyethylene 41/4"
1 12/pkg  AP3202 diameter
Weighing Paper, Moisture-Resistant Non-

1 500/pkg AP1122 Absorbent 4x4"

18 ea AB1042 Probe and Seeker

2 12/pkg  AP7131 Apron, Rubberized 27" x 42" QWAP2742 39.60 79.20

2 12/pkg  AP7132 Apron, Rubberized 36" x 42" QWP3642 41.09 82.18
Goggles, Chemical Splash, Standard

40 ea AP3306 Vented Goggle Q97-2001 1.14 45.60

2 ea AP7080 Gloves, Nitrile, Disposable, Powder-Free  QwW1004I 6.64 13.28

2 10/pkg  AP4684 Ruler, Metric/English, Opaque 12"
2 ea A0246 Aniline Blue Staining Solution 100mL
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1 ea S0075 Sodium Hydroxide 500g
1 ea S0148 Sodium Hydroxide 500mL 1M
1 ea HO0057 Hydrochloric Acid 1000mL 1M
2 ea 10010 lodine Solution, Lugol's 500mL
1 ea G0037 Gelatin 150g Granular Lab Grade
1 ea S0282 Starch, Corn 2kg
1 ea D0015 Dextrose, Granular 2kg
Dialysis Tubing 33mm flat width

1 ea AB1232 30meters long
Bromthymol Blue Indicator Solution
1 ea B0228 1000mL
NEOSCI G2-
1 ea FB1225 ABO/Rh Simulated Blood Typing Kit 20-2113 37.16 37.16
1 ea B0051 Biuret Test Solution 500mL
1 ea AP5885 Genesis Water Distiller
Vernier
Qty Item #
15 ea LABPRO LabPro Interface
1 ea LP Logger Pro 3 Software
BTA (For LabQuest, LabPro, Go! Link,
15 ea TMP-BTA CBL 2™, and CBL
CO, Gas Sensor CO2-BTA (For
LabQuest, LabPro, Go! Link, and CBL
10 ea CO2-BTA 2™)
TOTAL 3,675.17

Arbor Scientific: No Bid

Bio Corporation: No Bid

School Specialty: No Response

Pasco Scientific: No Response
Educational Innovations: No Response
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