REQUEST FOR
QUOTATION
No. 9547 TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT
DUE DATE NO LATER THAN 1140 RANKIN, TROY, MICHIGAN 48083
7-10-08 3p.m. 248-823-4052
FAX: 248-823-4077

REQUISITION

DATE 6-23-08

REQUEST FOR QUOTE — NOT AN ORDER

THIS FORM MUST BE UTILIZED WHEN RESPONDING TO THIS REQUEST
BID ENVELOPE ENCLOSED

THE RFQ NUMBER MUST APPEAR ON ALL QUOTATIONS AND RELATED CORRESPONDENCE, THIS IS NOT AN ORDER

Quantity

DESCRIPTION

UNIT PRICE

AMOUNT

Please supply us with your bid to furnish the Troy School District with asphalt paving
and asphalt crack repair.

Copies of the bid are available at:
www.troy.k12.mi.us/purchasing/items_out_for bid.htm

Bid recaps will be available at:
troy.k12.mi.us/purchasing/index.htm

FACSIMILE BID IS NOT ACCEPTABLE

Bids will not be accepted if submitted after the deadline specified (local time) in the advertisement to bid or in the information to
bidders. The late submission of a bid makes the bid nonrepsonsive and is a material defect which shall not be waived by the
Board of Education. Delays in the mail will not be considered. All Late bids in the mail will be returned to the bidder unopened.

Proposal for the submission of alternatives by vendors will be accepted and reviewed. However, if any substitution or departure
is not clearly noted and described, it will be understood that the bid intends to exactly meet the specifications.

The Board of Education shall be the sole judge as to whether the proposed goods are “equal” or “approved”. Quotations must
be mailed or delivered to the Purchasing Office, 1140 Rankin, Troy, MI 48083 no later than 3 p.m. on the date shown above.
Michigan State Sales and Use Taxes and Federal Excise Taxes do not apply unless otherwise indicated. Exemption certificates
will be furnished when necessary. This request imposes no obligations on the buyer. The Board of Education reserves the right
to accept or reject any or all bids or to split awards by items or to accept bids, which will best serve the Board of Education.

THIS AREA MUST BE FILLED IN

DELIVERY TIME

PRICES FIRM FOR NAME OF COMPANY

TELEPHONE
NO.

TERMS

NO. & STREET

FAX #

FOB
DELIVERED

ALL DELIVERY CHARGES
MUST CITY, STATE & ZIP CODE

BE INCLUDED IN PRICES SHOWN

E-MAIL

CONTACT PERSON (PLEASE PRINT) SIGNATURE

DATE




Note: All bidders are specifically reminded that a completed Affidavit of Bidder
(Familial Disclosure) MUST be completed and submitted with the bid response.
Failure to include a completed copy will be grounds for disqualification of bid.
The Affidavit of Bidder is required to be notarized for construction bids only. All
others only require completion and signature.

AFFIDAVIT OF BIDDER

The undersigned, the owner or authorized officer of
(the “Bidder), pursuant to the familial disclosure requirement provided in the
(the *“School District”) advertisement for construction bids, hereby
represent and warrant except as provided below, that no familial relationships exist
between the over(s) or any employee of
and any member of the Board of Education of the
School District or the Superintendent of the School District.

List any Familial Relationships:

BIDDER:
By:
Its:
STATE OF MICHIGAN )
COUNTY OF ))ss'
This instrument was acknowledged before meonthe _ day of , 2008,

by

,Notary Public

County, Michigan

My Commission Expires:

Acting in the County of:




ADVERTISEMENT TO BID

The Troy School District is seeking qualified bids for the removal and replacement of the asphalt parking lot at
Boulan Park Middle School and asphalt crack repair throughout the district. Bid proposals will be received by Troy
School District, 1140 Rankin, Troy, Ml 48083 delivery or mail, to the attention of Frank Lams by 3:00 p.m. local time
on Monday, June 30, 2008. (The clock used for receiving bids is located at the Rankin office in the main office area).
Proposals must be sealed with Bidder's name on the outside of the envelope and designated as follows:

Sealed Proposal
Parking Lot Paving & Asphalt Crack Repair 9547
Contractor Name, Address, Phone Number

Proposals shall be based on the requirements set forth in this bid package specification. Any resultant contract shall
be based on these specifications.

Accepted Bidders will be required, as a condition precedent to award of Contract, to furnish in the amount of 100% of
the contract price, satisfactory Performance Bond and Payment Bond and Certificates of Insurance as required.

Unless otherwise specifically set forth, this Project is subject to state sales and/or use taxes and Bidder is required to
include such taxes in its Bid Proposal.

Bid Proposals will be publicly opened immediately following receipt of bids by the Troy School District and evaluated
by Owner with awards subsequently made by Troy School District.

The Owner shall not open, consider or accept a Bid Proposal that is received after the date and time specified
for bid submission in this Advertisement for Bids.

Bidding Documents will be available for examination and distribution on or after Monday, June 23, 2008. Examination
made be made at the following locations:

e Troy School District, 1140 Rankin, Troy, Ml 48083

e Construction Association of Michigan, 43636 Woodward Ave., Bloomfield, Ml 48302

e F.W. Dodge, 21415 Civic Center Drive, Suite 115, Southfield, Ml 48076

A pre-bid conference (ATTENDANCE STRONGLY ENCOURAGED) and site tour will be held at the Boulan Park
Middle School lot, 3570 Northfield Parkway, Troy MI 48084 on Monday, June 30, 2008 at 9:00 a.m. All Bidders
should plan to attend the pre-bid conference. Troy School District is not responsible for providing information to those
who do not attend the pre-bid conference.

Bid Proposals shall be on forms furnished by Troy School District. Bidders will be required to submit with their Bid
Proposals, a notarized Familial Relationship Disclosure Form, a Bid Security by a qualified surety authorized to do
business in the State of Michigan where the Project is located, an OSHA Form 300 for the most recent completed
year, their worker's compensation Experience Modification Rate (EMR) factor and any other information required in the
Instructions to Bidders. Bidders shall not withdraw Bid Proposals for a period of ninety (90) days after date for receipt
of Bid Proposals.

The right to accept or reject any or all Bid Proposals, either in whole or in part, to waive any informalities or
irregularities therein and to award the contract to other than the low bidder is reserved by Troy School District.

All Bid Proposals shall be accompanied by the sworn and notarized statement disclosing any familial relationship that
exists between the owner or any employee of the Bidder and any member of the School Board or the superintendent
of the School District. Bid proposals that do not include this sworn and notarized disclosure statement will not be
considered accepted.

The successful bidder and its subordinate parties shall comply with the Prevailing Wage Requirements for all work as
required by the State of Michigan Public Act 166 Dated 1965 As Amended.

End of Advertisement



BID SECURITY

A. Bid security in the form of a bid bond issued by a qualified surety, certified check or
cashier’s check in the amount of five percent (5%) of the Base Bid amount will be
required at the time of submission of the Bid Proposal. Bid bonds shall b e duly
executed by the bidder, as principal and by a surety that is properly licensed and
authorized to do business in the state in which the Work is to be performed. All sureties
providing bonds for this Project must be listed in the latest version of the Department of
Treasury’s Circular 570, entitled “Companies Holding Certificates of Authority as
Acceptable Sureties on Federal bonds and as Acceptable Reinsuring Companies”, with
the bond amount less than or equal to the underwriting limitation, and/or have an A.M.
best rating of A- or better.

B. Bid bond shall pledge that the Bidder, with the understanding that if its Bid Proposal is
accepted, will enter into the Agreement with Troy School District for any of the Bid
Category(ies) accepted from its Bid Proposal and will, if required, furnish performance
and payment bonds covering the faithful performance of the Agreement and the
payment of all obligations arising there under. The attorney-in-fact, who signs the surety
bond, must submit along with the bond, a certified and effectively dated copy of his/her
power of attorney.

C. Bid bond form AIA Document A310 is approved for use on this Project.

D. The bid security obligees shall be Troy School District and the amount of the bid
security shall become their property in the event that the Bidder fails, within Sixty (60)
days of notice of award or receipt of the Agreement form, to execute the Agreement, and
deliver the performance and payment bonds as described. In such case, the bid security
shall be forfeited to Troy School District as liquidated damages, not as a penalty.

E. The Owner will have the right to retain the bid security(ies) of Bidders to whom an award
is being considered until either (a) the Agreement has been executed and bonds, if
required, have been furnished, or (b) the specified time has elapsed so that Bid
Proposals may be withdrawn, or (c) all Bid Proposals have been rejected.

F. Bid security will be returned to the successful bidders after the Agreement has been
executed, and acceptance of required performance and payment bonds. The bid
security of Bidders that are not under consideration for award of the Agreement will be
returned to those Bidders.

SUBMISSION OF BIDS

A. All copies of the Bid Proposal, the bid security and any other documents required to be
submitted with the Bid Proposal shall be enclosed in a sealed opaque envelope. The
envelope shall be addressed to the party receiving the bids and shall be identified with
the Project name, the bidder's name and address, if applicable, the designated portion of
the Work for which the Bid Proposal is submitted. If the Bid Proposal is sent by mail, the
sealed envelope shall be enclosed in a separate mailing envelope with the notation
“SEALED BID ENCLOSED” on the face of the envelope.

B. Bid Proposals shall be deposited at the designated location prior to the time and date for
receipt of Bid Proposals indicated in the Advertisement to Bid, or any extension thereof



made by Addendum. Bid Proposals received after the date and time for receipt of bids
will be returned unopened.

C. The Bidder shall assume full responsibility for timely delivery at the location designated
for receipt of Bid Proposals.

D. Oral, telephonic, facsimile, emailed or telegraphic Bid Proposals or bid securities are
invalid and will not receive consideration.

E. Bid Proposals will only be accepted for individual Bid Categories. Bidders are required
to bid an entire Bid Category. Bidders may bid more than one Bid Category. Combined
bids covering several Bid Categories may not be accepted unless separate bid amounts
are listed for each Bid Category making up the combined bid amount. The amount for a
combined bid, however, need not be equal in amount to the total of the individual
category bids.

MODIFICATION OR WITHDRAWAL OF BID PROPOSAL

A. A Bid Proposal may not be modified, withdrawn or canceled by the Bidder after the
stipulated time period and date designated for the receipt of Bid Proposals, and each
Bidder so agrees in submitting its Bid.

B. Prior to the time and date designated for receipt of Bid Proposals, any Bid Proposal
submitted may be modified or withdrawn by notice to the party receiving Bid Proposals
at the place designated for their receipt. Such notice shall be in writing over the
signature of the Bidder.

C. Withdrawn Bid Proposals may be submitted up to the time designated for the receipt of
bids provided that they are then fully in conformance with these Instructions to Bidders.

D. Bid security under B. or C., above shall be in an amount for the Base Bid as modified or
resubmitted.

CONSIDERATION OF BIDS

OPENING OF BIDS
A. Bid Proposals received on time will be open publicly.

B. Bid Proposals shall be held open and irrevocable for Forty-five (45) days after the
receipt of bids.

REJECTION OF BIDS

A. Troy School District shall have the right to reject any or all bid Proposals and to reject
a Bid Proposal not accompanied by the required bid security or by other information
required by the Bidding Documents, or to reject a Bid Proposal which is in any way
incomplete or irregular.

B. Bid Proposals are considered irregular and may be rejected for any of the following
reasons unless otherwise provided by law:

1. If Bid Proposal Form furnished is not used or is altered.



2. If there are unauthorized additions, qualified or conditional Bid Proposals, or
irregularities of any kind which may make the Bid Proposal incomplete, indefinite,
or ambiguous as to its meaning.

3. If Bidder adds any provisions reserving right to accept or reject any award, or
enter into the Agreement pursuant to an award.

4. If Unit or Lump Sum prices or Alternates contained in the Bid Proposal are
obviously unbalanced either in excess of, or below, reasonable cost analysis
values.

5. If Bidder fails to complete the Bid Proposal Form where information is requested
so the Bid Proposal form cannot be properly evaluated.

6. Bidder is deemed to not be the Lowest Responsive, Responsible Bidder by
definition and prevailing statutes.

7. Bidder does not submit with its Bid Proposal a sworn and notarized statement of

Familial Disclosure.

ACCEPTANCE OF BID (AWARD)

A.

It is the intent of the Troy School District to award the Agreement to the Lowest
Responsive and Responsible Bidder provided the Bid Proposal has been submitted in
accordance with the requirements of the bidding Documents and does not exceed the
funds available. Troy School District shall have the right to waive any informality or
irregularity in any bid Proposal received and to accept Bid Proposals which, in its
judgment, are in its own best interest which includes not awarding to the low bidder.
Troy School District reserves the right to reject any bid Proposal in its sole discretion
except where otherwise provided by law.

Troy School District shall have the right to accept any Alternates in any order or
combination and to determine the low bidder on the basis of the sum of the Base Bid,
Voluntary Alternates and Alternates accepted.

Troy School District reserves the right to award this bid on an individual site
basis. Bidders are encouraged to bid all work at all sites, however, no
disqualification will be made on bids which opt to bid on less than all sites
providing that the submitted bid is complete on a per site basis.

INSURANCE REQUIREMENTS

As a condition of performing work under the Agreement, Contractor will keep in force, at all
times during performance of the Work, policies of insurance covering all Basic Insurance
Requirements and any applicable Supplemental Insurance Requirements. The
requirements identified below are minimum requirements. If the Agreement or other
Contract Documents impose additional or higher standards, contractor shall meet those as
well. Where a Controlled Insurance Program (“CIP”) is specified in the Contract
Documents, these insurance requirements shall not apply to coverage supplied by the
CIP, but shall apply to coverage which Contractor is required to carry outside the scope of
the CIP.

Basic Insurance Requirements

Workers’ Compensation covering Contractor’s statutory obligations in the State(s) in which
the Work is to be performed or Federal statutory obligations, if applicable to the Project
and Employers’ Liability insurance with limits of liability of $1,000,000 per accident. Where



applicable, a US Longshore and Harborworker's Compensation Act endorsement must be
included.

If Contractor employs the services of leased employees for the Work or for a portion of the
Work, it will be required to submit evidence, to the satisfaction of the Troy School District,
that such leased employees are fully covered by the minimum limits of Workers’
Compensation and Employers’ Liability Insurance. Such evidence shall include, but not be
limited to, submission of the applicable leasing agreement.

Automobile Liability insurance with the limit of $1,000,000 per accident covering
Contractor’s owned, non-owned and hired automobiles.

Commercial General Liability Insurance written on the 1988 ISO OCCURRENCE policy
form or subsequent versions with the limits of liability as follows:

General Aggregate $2,000,000
Products-Completed Operations Aggregate $2,000.000
Personal/Advertising Injury $2,000,000
Each Occurrence $2,000.000

This coverage shall include coverage for premises-operations, independent contractors’
protective products and completed operations, personal injury and broad form property
damage (including coverage for explosion, collapse, and underground hazards), and
Contractual Liability protection with respect to Contractor’s indemnification obligations
under the Contract Documents. Products-completed operations coverage must be
maintained for at least two years after final completion of the Project.

General Provisions
Every policy must be written by an insurance company licensed in the state of Michigan
and is reasonably acceptable to the Troy School District.

For Employer’s Liability, Commercial General Liability and Automobile Liability may be
attained by a combination of an underlying policy with an umbrella or excess liability

policy.

The Troy School District shall be endorsed as additional insureds on Contractor’s liability
insurance (including general liability, excess liability, automobile liability and pollution
liability, where applicable, with respect to liability arising out of activities performed by or
on behalf of Contractor. The coverage provided by the additional insured endorsement
shall be at least as broad as the Insurance Service Office, Inc.’s Additional insured, Form
B CG 2010 11 85 or CG 20 26 11 85. Forms that do not provide additional insured status
for completed operations will not be accepted.

Contractor will furnish, before any work is started, certificates of insurance showing the
required coverage Receipt by Troy School District of a non-conforming certificate of
insurance without objection, or Troy School District's failure to collect a certificate of
insurance, shall not waive or alter Contractor’s duty to comply with the insurance
requirements. Modifications to these insurance will not be effective unless made in a
writing executed by an authorized representative of the Troy School District. Upon written
request by Troy School District, contractor will provide copies of its insurance policies.

Evidence of the required insurance is to be provided to Troy School District on ACORD
Certificate Form 25-S and must indicate:



Any coverage exclusions or deviations from the 1988 ISO commercial general liability form
or subsequent versions;

Best's rating for each insurance carrier at A minus VII or better;

That the issuing insurance company will provide thirty (30) days written notice of
cancellation to the certificate holder and the words “endeavor to” and “but failure to mail
such notice shall impose no obligation or liability of any kind upon the company, its agents
or representatives” do not apply or have been removed;

That additional insured endorsements have been provided as required under the Contract
Documents;

and
Any deductibles over $10,000 applicable to any coverage.

All coverage must be primary and not excess over or contributory with any other valid,
applicable and collectible insurance in force for Troy School District, or other insureds.

Contractor will provide full coverage for all of Contractor’s equipment, property and tools
used in the Work.

Contractor shall waive, and shall require (by endorsement or otherwise) its insurers
providing the coverage required by these insurance requirements to waive, subrogation
rights against Troy School District, and all other additional insureds for losses and
damages incurred and/or paid under the insurance policies required by these insurance
requirements or other insurance applicable to Contractor or its Subordinate Parties, and
will include this same requirement in contracts with its Subordinate Parties. If the policies
of insurance referred to in this paragraph require an endorsement to provide for continued
coverage where there is a waiver of subrogation, the owners of each policies will cause
them to be so endorsed.

Contractor will send or fax a copy of these insurance requirements to its agent when an
insurance certificate is requested to assure that the policies comply with the insurance
requirements.

If Contractor requires its Subordinate Parties to provide additional insured endorsements
in favor of Contractor, those endorsements shall be extended to Troy School District and
all other required additional insureds.

Contractor’s duty to provide the insurance coverage set forth in these insurance
requirements is a severable obligation from Contractor’s indemnification obligations under
the Contract Documents. Nothing in these insurance requirements shall be deemed to
limit Contractor’s liability under the Agreement.



Troy School District
Paving and Resurfacing Bid
2008

The 2008 Troy School District Paving Bid is set up in three Phases.

1. Sealcoating and crack filling of walking paths at 10 Elementary sites
to be done in July of 2008.

2. Resurfacing of the Boulan Middle School South Parking Lot
including the entrance and exit to be done in August of 2008.

3. New asphalt Magic Squares to be done in July 2008 (size and location
to be determined).



Il. BOULAN PARK MIDDLE SCHOOL PARKING LOT (65,000 S.F.)

1. Pulverize existing parking lot.

2. Rebuild top vertical foot of four catch basins.

3. Allowance for 13.500 s.f. of 12 inch undercut with a
1” x 3” crushed concrete to be included in price.

4. Grade and compact lot to provide for positive drainage.

5. Haul excess spoils off site.

6. Install 3” 3C hot mix asphalt.

7. Power clean leveling course.

8. Install tack coat.

9. Install 2” 36A wearing hot mix asphalt.

10. Install 2,500 lineal feet of 6” asphalt curb.
11. Stripe lot per original.

COST: $

NOTE: MAXIMUM TRUCK LOAD OF 54,000 POUNDS ALLOWED FOR
IMPORTING AND/OR EXPORTING OF MATERIALS.

I1. UNITS

A. NEW ASPHALT (MAGIC SQUARES)
1. Saw cut as necessary.
2. Excavate area to a depth of 13 inches and legally dispose of
this material.
Install Mirafi geo grid fabric on subgrade.
Install and compact 10 inches of 21AA crushed limestone.
Install 2” 3C hot mix asphalt.
Power clean leveling course.
Apply tack coat.
Install 1.5 36A wearing course.

NG~ W

COST: $ s.f.

B. NEW ASPHALT CURB
1. Power clean area to receive asphalt curb.
2. Apply tack coat.
3. Install 6” asphalt curb.

COST: $ 1.




SEAL

SCHOOLS SQ. FT.

Barnard 10,870 s.f.
Bemis 8,064 s.f.
Costello 17,749 s 1.
Hamilton 8,568 s.f.
Hill 8,658 s.f.
Leonard 8,127 s.f.
Martell 12,204 s f.
Morse 8,432 s 1.
Schroeder 8,820 s.f.
Troy Union 9,450 s.f.

Five Ton Skin Patching

GRAND TOTAL FOR SEALCOATING, CRACKFILLING
AND ASPHALT SKIN PATCHING

T
s
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m

S < N R - B - N < S - B R - A <

CRACKFILL

2,200 L.f.
1,650 I.f.
1,100 L.f.
500 L.f.
300 L.f.
250 L.f.
3,300 I.f.
300 L.f.
1,000 L.f.

1,100 L.f.

e < N R - B - S < N - B R - A =




l. SPECIFICATIONS FOR SEALCOATING AND CRACKFILLING
OF WALK PATHS AT TEN SCHOOLS

1.

2.

o~ w

Apply weed killer on any vegetation one week prior to any
construction.
Clean entire area with high pressure power washer. Allow surface
to dry for 24 hours.
Power clean cracks using 90 pounds compressed air.
Install hot tar crack filler.
Apply one application of oxi bond primer over entire surface at a
rate of .005 gallons per square yard.
Apply three coats of seal pave pavemens sealer at a rate of 1.1
gallons per square yard as follows:

a. 100 gallons seal-pave

b. 30 gallons potable water

c. 300 pounds 70 mesh silica sand

d. .5 gallons sp enhancer
Allow each coat to dry for 12-24 hours between applications.

NOTE: ALLOW FOR FIVE TONS OF ASPHALT SKIN PATCHING ON
MISCELLANEOUS HOLES.



Michigan Department of Labor & Economic Growth
Wage & Hour Division 9

PO Box 30476 Vabor s Economic Growth
Lansing , MI 48909-7976
JENNIFER M. GRANHOLM 517.335.0400 KEITH W. COOLEY
GOVERNOR DIRECTOR

www.michigan.gov/wagehour

Informational Sheet: Prevailing Wages on State Projects
General Information Regarding Fringe Benefits

Certain fringe benefits may be credited toward the payment of the Prevailing Wage Rate:

o If afringe benefit is paid directly to a construction mechanic
o If a fringe benefit contribution or payment is made on behalf of a construction mechanic
o If a fringe benefit, which may be provided to a construction mechanic, is pursuant to a written contract
or policy
o If a fringe benefit is paid into a fund, for a construction mechanic
When a fringe benefit is not paid by an hourly rate, the hourly credit will be calculated based on the annual
value of the fringe benefit divided by 2080 hours per year (52 weeks @ 40 hours per week).

The following is an example of the types of fringe benefits allowed and how an hourly credit is calculated:

Vacation 40 hours X $14.00 per hour = $560/2080 = $.27
Dental insurance $31.07 monthly premium X 12 mos. = $372.84 /2080 = $.18
Vision insurance $5.38 monthly premium X 12 mos. = $64.56/2080 = $.03
Health insurance $230.00 monthly premium X 12 mos. = $2,760.00/2080 = $1.33
Life insurance $27.04 monthly premium X 12 mos. = $324.48/2080 = $.16
Tuition $500.00 annual cost/2080 = $.24
Bonus o 4 quarterly bonus/year x $250 = $1000.00/2080 = $.48
401k Employer Contribution $2000.00 total annual contribution/2080 = $.96
Total Hourly Credit $3.65
Other examples of the types of fringe benefits allowed:
= Sick pay
= Holiday pay

= Accidental Death & Dismemberment insurance premiums
The following are examples of items that will not be credited toward the payment of the Prevailing Wage Rate

0 Legally required payments, such as:
= Unemployment Insurance payments
= Workers’ Compensation Insurance payments
= FICA (Social Security contributions, Medicare contributions)

0 Reimbursable expenses, such as:

Clothing allowance or reimbursement
Uniform allowance or reimbursement

Gas allowance or reimbursement

Travel time or payment

Meals or lodging allowance or reimbursement
Per diem allowance or payment

o Other payments to or on behalf of a construction mechanic that are not wages or fringe benefits, such
as:
» Industry advancement funds
= Financial or material loans

WHD-9917 (08/07) Page 1 of 1




STATE OF MICHIGAN

JENNIFER M. GRANHOLM DEPARTMENT OF LABOR & ECONOMIC GROWTH KEITH W. COOLEY
GOVERNOR LANSING DIRECTOR

REQUIREMENTS OF THE PREVAILING WAGES ON STATE PROJECTS ACT, PUBLIC ACT 166 OF 1965

The Michigan Department of Labor & Economic Growth determines prevailing rates pursuant to the Prevailing Wages on State
Projects Act, Public Act 166 of 1965, as amended. The purpose of establishing prevailing rates is to provide minimum rates of
pay that must be paid to workers on construction projects for which the state or a school district is the contracting agent and
which is financed or financially supported by the state. By law, prevailing rates are compiled from the rates contained in
collectively bargained agreements which cover the locations of the state projects. The official prevailing rates provide an hourly
rate which includes wage and fringe benefit totals for designated construction mechanic classifications. The overtime rates also
include wage and fringe benefit totals. Please pay special attention to the overtime and premium pay requirements. Prevailing
wage is satisfied when wages plus fringe benefits paid to a worker are equal to or greater than the required rate.

State of Michigan responsibilities under the law:

e The department establishes the prevailing rate for each classification of construction mechanic requested by a
contracting agent prior to contracts being let out for bid on a state project.

Contracting agent responsibilities under the law:

e If a contract is not awarded or construction does not start within 90 days of the date of the issuance of rates, a re-
determination of rates must be requested by the contracting agent.

e Rates for classifications needed but not provided on the Prevailing Rate Schedule, must be obtained prior to contracts
being let out for bid on a state project.

¢ The contracting agent, by written notice to the contractor and the sureties of the contractor known to the contracting
agent, may terminate the contractor's right to proceed with that part of the contract, for which less than the prevailing
rates have been or will be paid, and may proceed to complete the contract by separate agreement with another
contractor or otherwise, and the original contractor and his sureties shall be liable to the contracting agent for any
excess costs occasioned thereby.

Contractor responsibilities under the law:

e Every contractor and subcontractor shall keep posted on the construction site, in a conspicuous place, a copy of all
prevailing rates prescribed in a contract.

e Every contractor and subcontractor shall keep certified payrolls, as used in the industry, of each and every construction
mechanic, and verification of such certified payroll in writing by either a representative or auditor/certified accountant at
the end of such a certified payroll. These records should include the occupation and indicate the hours worked on each
project for each classification and the actual wages and benefits paid. This record shall be available for reasonable
inspection by the contracting agent or the department.

e Each contractor or subcontractor is separately liable for the payment of the prevailing rate to its employees.

e The prime contractor is responsible for advising all subcontractors of the requirement to pay the prevailing rate prior to
commencement of work.

e The prime contractor is secondarily liable for payment of prevailing rates that are not paid by a subcontractor.

« A construction mechanic shall only be paid the apprentice rate if registered with the United States Department of Labor,
Bureau of Apprenticeship and Training and the rate is included in the contract.

Enforcement:

A person who has information of an alleged prevailing wage violation on a state project may file a complaint with the Wage &
Hour Division. The department will investigate and attempt to resolve the complaint informally. During the course of an
investigation, if the requested records and posting certification are not made available in compliance with Section 5 of Act 166,
the investigation will be concluded and a referral to the Office of Attorney General for civil action will be made. The Office of
Attorney General will pursue costs and fees associated with a lawsuit if filing is necessary to obtain records.

A violation of Act 166 may result in the contractor's name being added to the Prevailing Wage Act Violators List published on
the division’s website, updated monthly. This list includes the names and addresses of contractors and subcontractors the
division has found in violation of Act 166 based on complaints from individuals and third parties. The Prevailing Wage Act
Violators List is intended to inform contracting agents of contractors that have violated Act 166 for use in determining who
should receive state-funded projects.

WAGE & HOUR DIVISION
P.O. BOX 30476 « LANSING, MICHIGAN 48909-7976
www.michigan.gov/wagehour e (517) 335-0400 e FAX (517) 335-0077
WHD-9918 (04/08)
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WAGE & HOUR DIVISION

2007 MICHIGAN PREVAILING WAGE RATE SCHEDULE
for Parking Lot, ROAD, HIGHWAY, BRIDGE & AIRPORT CONSTRUCTION
Issue Date: 06/18/2008
Contract must be awarded by: 09/16/2008
PW #899 Troy School District Boulan Park Middle School Site Paving

Construction Mechanic Classification T?r:silgg':e On;il-r&?fgl‘?ate Ti[r)noeugfte Overtime Code
CARPENTERS
Zone 1l $44.25 $62.85 $81.44 HHHHHHDDY
Apprentices
0- 6 months $23.42 $31.60 $39.78 HHHHHHDDY
7-12 months $27.52 $37.75 $47.98 HHHHHHDDY
Year 2 $31.23 $43.32 $55.40 HHHHHHDDY
Year 3 $34.95 $48.90 $62.85 HHHHHHDDY
Year 4 $38.67 $54.48 $70.29 HHHHHHDDY
Zone 2 $36.51 $49.72 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Apprentices
1* Year $25.94 $33.87 NONE HHHHHHHHY
2" Year $28.58 $37.83 NONE HHHHHHHHY
3" Year $31.23 $41.80 NONE HHHHHHHHY
4" Year $32.55 $43.78 NONE HHHHHHHHY
CEMENT MASONS
Zone 1l $35.98 $49.32 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Apprentices
Year 1 $23.50 $30.60 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Year 2 $27.63 $36.80 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Year 3 $31.77 $43.01 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Zone 2 $34.48 $47.07 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Apprentices
Year 1 $22.67 $29.36 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Year 2 $26.62 $35.28 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Year 3 $30.59 $41.24 NONE HHHHHHHHY




2007 Michigan Prevailing Wage Rate Schedule for Parking Lot, Road, Highway, Bridge & Airport Construction

Issue Date: 06/18/2008

Contract must be awarded by: 09/16/2008
PW #899 Troy School District Boulan Park Middle School Site Paving

OPERATING ENGINEERS

Zone 1 CLASS | $43.47 $57.28 NONE HHHHHHHHY
CLASS II $36.74 $47.18 NONE HHHHHHHHY
CLASS Il - GREASE TRUCK $38.04 $49.13 NONE HHHHHHHHY
CLASS Il $36.18 $46.34 NONE HHHHHHHHY
CLASS IV $36.01 $46.09 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Zone 2 CLASS | $43.47 $57.28 NONE HHHHHHHHY
CLASS II $36.59 $46.96 NONE HHHHHHHHY
CLASS Il - GREASE TRUCK $37.89 $48.91 NONE HHHHHHHHY
CLASS Il $36.03 $46.12 NONE HHHHHHHHY
CLASS IV $35.71 $45.64 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Apprentices (Zones 1 & 2)
1% 6 Month Period $35.19 $44.85 NONE HHHHHHHHY
2™ 6 Month Period $36.57 $46.92 NONE HHHHHHHHY
3" 6 Month Period $37.95 $48.99 NONE HHHHHHHHY
4™ 6 Month Period $39.33 $51.06 NONE HHHHHHHHY
5" 6 Month Period $40.71 $53.14 NONE HHHHHHHHY
6" 6 Month Period $42.09 $55.21 NONE HHHHHHHHY
LABORERS
CLASS 1 Zone 1 $32.51 $44.02 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Apprentice 0-1,000 work hours $27.27 $36.16 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Apprentice 1,001-2,000 work hours $28.32 $37.73 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Apprentice 2,001-3,000 work hours $29.36 $39.30 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Apprentice 3,001-4,000 work hours $31.46 $42.45 NONE HHHHHHHHY
CLASS 1 Zone 2 $30.71 $41.35 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Apprentice 0-1,000 work hours $25.91 $34.14 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Apprentice 1,001-2,000 work hours $26.87 $35.58 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Apprentice 2,001-3,000 work hours $27.83 $37.02 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Apprentice 3,001-4,000 work hours $29.75 $39.90 NONE HHHHHHHHY
CLASS 1 Zones 3 & 4 $29.96 $40.22 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Apprentice 0-1,000 work hours $25.34 $33.29 NONE HHHHHHHHY




2007 Michigan Prevailing Wage Rate Schedule for Parking Lot, Road, Highway, Bridge & Airport Construction 3
Issue Date: 06/18/2008 Contract must be awarded by: 09/16/2008
PW #899 Troy School District Boulan Park Middle School Site Paving

LABORERS continued

Apprentice 1,001-2,000 work hours $26.27 $34.68 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Apprentice 2,001-3,000 work hours $27.19 $36.06 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Apprentice 3,001-4,000 work hours $29.04 $38.84 NONE HHHHHHHHY
CLASS 2 Zone 1 $32.64 $44.22 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Apprentice 0-1,000 work hours $27.37 $36.30 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Apprentice 1,001-2,000 work hours $28.42 $37.89 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Apprentice 2,001-3,000 work hours $29.48 $39.47 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Apprentice 3,001-4,000 work hours $31.59 $42.63 NONE HHHHHHHHY
CLASS 2 Zone 2 $30.91 $41.65 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Apprentice 0-1,000 work hours $26.06 $34.36 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Apprentice 1,001-2,000 work hours $27.03 $35.82 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Apprentice 2,001-3,000 work hours $28.00 $37.28 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Apprentice 3,001-4,000 work hours $29.94 $40.19 NONE HHHHHHHHY
CLASS 2 Zones 3 & 4 $30.17 $40.54 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Apprentice 0-1,000 work hours $25.50 $33.53 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Apprentice 1,001-2,000 work hours $26.43 $34.93 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Apprentice 2,001-3,000 work hours $27.37 $36.33 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Apprentice 3,001-4,000 work hours $29.24 $39.13 NONE HHHHHHHHY
CLASS 3 Zone 1 $32.82 $44.49 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Apprentice 0-1,000 work hours $27.50 $36.51 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Apprentice 1,001-2,000 work hours $28.56 $38.10 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Apprentice 2,001-3,000 work hours $29.63 $39.70 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Apprentice 3,001-4,000 work hours $31.76 $42.89 NONE HHHHHHHHY
CLASS 3 Zone 2 $31.15 $42.01 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Apprentice 0-1,000 work hours $26.24 $34.63 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Apprentice 1,001-2,000 work hours $27.22 $36.11 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Apprentice 2,001-3,000 work hours $28.20 $37.58 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Apprentice 3,001-4,000 work hours $30.17 $40.53 NONE HHHHHHHHY
CLASS 3 Zones 3 & 4 $30.46 $40.97 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Apprentice 0-1,000 work hours $25.72 $33.86 NONE HHHHHHHHY
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LABORERS continued

Apprentice 1,001-2,000 work hours $26.67 $35.28 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Apprentice 2,001-3,000 work hours $27.61 $36.70 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Apprentice 3,001-4,000 work hours $29.51 $39.55 NONE HHHHHHHHY
CLASS 4 Zone 1 $32.90 $44.61 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Apprentice 0-1,000 work hours $27.56 $36.60 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Apprentice 1,001-2,000 work hours $28.63 $38.20 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Apprentice 2,001-3,000 work hours $29.70 $39.80 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Apprentice 3,001-4,000 work hours $31.83 $43.00 NONE HHHHHHHHY
CLASS 4 Zone 2 $31.50 $42.53 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Apprentice 0-1,000 work hours $26.50 $35.03 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Apprentice 1,001-2,000 work hours $27.50 $36.53 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Apprentice 2,001-3,000 work hours $28.50 $38.03 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Apprentice 3,001-4,000 work hours $30.50 $41.03 NONE HHHHHHHHY
CLASS 4 Zones 3& 4 $30.90 $41.63 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Apprentice 0-1,000 work hours $26.05 $34.35 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Apprentice 1,001-2,000 work hours $27.02 $35.81 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Apprentice 2,001-3,000 work hours $27.99 $37.26 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Apprentice 3,001-4,000 work hours $29.93 $40.17 NONE HHHHHHHHY
CLASS 5 Zone 1 $33.11 $44.92 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Apprentice 0-1,000 work hours $27.72 $36.83 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Apprentice 1,001-2,000 work hours $28.80 $38.45 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Apprentice 2,001-3,000 work hours $29.87 $40.07 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Apprentice 3,001-4,000 work hours $32.03 $43.30 NONE HHHHHHHHY
CLASS 5 Zone 2 $31.37 $42.34 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Apprentice 0-1,000 work hours $26.40 $34.88 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Apprentice 1,001-2,000 work hours $27.39 $36.37 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Apprentice 2,001-3,000 work hours $28.39 $37.86 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Apprentice 3,001-4,000 work hours $30.38 $40.84 NONE HHHHHHHHY
CLASS 5 Zones 3& 4 $30.52 $41.06 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Apprentice 0-1,000 work hours $25.76 $33.92 NONE HHHHHHHHY




2007 Michigan Prevailing Wage Rate Schedule for Parking Lot, Road, Highway, Bridge & Airport Construction

Issue Date: 06/18/2008

Contract must be awarded by: 09/16/2008
PW #899 Troy School District Boulan Park Middle School Site Paving

LABORERS continued

Apprentice 1,001-2,000 work hours $26.71 $35.35 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Apprentice 2,001-3,000 work hours $27.67 $36.78 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Apprentice 3,001-4,000 work hours $29.57 $39.63 NONE HHHHHHHHY
CLASS 6 Zone 1 $33.41 $45.37 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Apprentice 0-1,000 work hours $27.94 $37.17 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Apprentice 1,001-2,000 work hours $29.04 $38.81 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Apprentice 2,001-3,000 work hours $30.13 $40.45 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Apprentice 3,001-4,000 work hours $32.32 $43.73 NONE HHHHHHHHY
CLASS 6 Zone 2 $31.71 $42.85 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Apprentice 0-1,000 work hours $26.66 $35.26 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Apprentice 1,001-2,000 work hours $27.67 $36.78 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Apprentice 2,001-3,000 work hours $28.68 $38.30 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Apprentice 3,001-4,000 work hours $30.70 $41.33 NONE HHHHHHHHY
CLASS 6 Zones 3 & 4 $30.95 $41.71 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Apprentice 0-1,000 work hours $26.09 $34.41 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Apprentice 1,001-2,000 work hours $27.06 $35.87 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Apprentice 2,001-3,000 work hours $28.03 $37.33 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Apprentice 3,001-4,000 work hours $29.98 $40.25 NONE HHHHHHHHY
CLASS 7 Concrete Specialist Zone 1 $34.48 $46.98 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Apprentice 0-1,000 work hours $28.75 $38.37 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Apprentice 1,001-2,000 work hours $29.89 $40.09 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Apprentice 2,001-3,000 work hours $31.04 $41.81 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Apprentice 3,001-4,000 work hours $33.33 $45.25 NONE HHHHHHHHY
CLASS 7 Concrete Specialist Zones 2, 3, & 4 $34.28 $46.70 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Apprentice 0-1,000 work hours $28.58 $38.15 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Apprentice 1,001-2,000 work hours $29.72 $39.86 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Apprentice 2,001-3,000 work hours $30.86 $41.57 NONE HHHHHHHHY
Apprentice 3,001-4,000 work hours $33.14 $44.99 NONE HHHHHHHHY




2007 Michigan Prevailing Wage Rate Schedule for Parking Lot, Road, Highway, Bridge & Airport Construction
Issue Date: 06/18/2008 Contract must be awarded by: 09/16/2008

PW #899 Troy School District Boulan Park Middle School Site Paving

TRUCK DRIVERS

Zone l
Driver of all trucks of 8 cubic yard capacity or $34.76 $36.44 NONE HHHHHHHHY
less
Driver of trucks of 8 cubic yard capacity or $34.86 $36.59 NONE HHHHHHHHY
over
Driver of euclid type equ|pment $35.01 $36.81 NONE HHHHHHHRY
Zone 2
Driver of all trucks of 8 cubic yard capacity or $34.66 $36.29 NONE HHHHHHHHY
less
Driver of all trucks of 8 cubic yard capacity or $34.76 $36.44 NONE HHHHHHHHY
over

$34.91 $36.66 NONE HHHHHHHRY

Driver of euclid type equipment

Effective Date: June 27, 2007 Revised 7/10/07
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CARPENTERS
Wayne, Oakland, Macomb, Sanilac, St. Clair, Monroe, and the following townships of Livingston County:

Zone 1 Brighton, Deerfield, Genoa, Hartland, Oceola and Tyrone

Zone 2  The entire state except those counties and townships listed in Zone 1

CEMENT MASONS

Zonel Genesee, Oakland, Macomb, Monroe, Washtenaw, Wayne, Livingston and Saginaw Counties

Zone 2  Alcona, Alger, Allegan, Alpena, Antrim, Arenac, Baraga, Barry, Bay, Berrien, Benzie, Branch, Calhoun,

Cass, Charlevoix, Cheboygan, Chippewa, Clare, Clinton, Crawford, Delta, Dickinson, Eaton, Emmet,
Gladwin, Gogebic, Grand Traverse, Gratiot, Hillsdale, Houghton, Huron, Ingham, lonia, losco, Iron,
Isabella, Jackson, Kalamazoo, Kalkaska, Kent, Keweenaw, Lake, Lapeer, Leelanau, Lenawee, Luce,
Mackinac, Manistee, Marquette, Mason, Mecosta, Menominee, Midland, Missaukee, Montcalm,
Montmorency, Muskegon, Newaygo, Oceana, Ogemaw, Ontonagon, Osceola, Oscoda, Otsego, Ottawa,
Presque Isle, Roscommon, Sanilac, Schoolcraft, Shiawassee, St. Clair, St. Joseph, Tuscola, Van Buren,

and Wexford Counties

OPERATING ENGINEERS

Zonel Genesee, Oakland, Macomb, Monroe, Washtenaw and Wayne Counties
Zone 2 The entire state except those counties listed in Zone 1

OPERATING ENGINEERS CLASSIFICATION DESCRIPTIONS

Class | Asphalt Paver (self-propelled) Paver Operator (5 bags or more)
Asphalt Planer (self-propelled) Pump Operator (6" discharge or over, gas,
Asphalt Plant Operator diesel powered, or generator of 300 amp or larger)
Auto-Grader Pile Driving Operator
Blade Grader Operator Roto Mill
Batch Plant (concrete-central mix) Roller Operator (Asphalt)
Backhoe (with over 3/8 yard bucket) Side Boom Tractor (type D-4, equivalent or larger)
Bulldozer Operator Slip Form Paver
Concrete Pump 3" and over Self-Propelled or Tractor Drawn Scraper
Conveyor Loader Operator (euclid type) Slurry Machine (asphalt)
Crane Operator Swinging Boom Truck (over |2 ton capacity)
Dragline Operator Shouldering or Gravel Distributing Machine Operator
Elevating Grader Operator (self-propelled)
End-loader Operator (1 yard capacity or over) Shovel Operator
Finishing Machine Operator (asphalt) Tractor Operator
Gradall Operator (and similar type machines) Trenching Machine Operator
Hoisting Engineer Tube Finisher (slip form paving)
Hydro demolisher (water blaster) Farm type tractor with attached pan
Locomotive Operator
Mechanic

Class Il  Sweeper (wayne type & similar equipment) Backhoe (with 3/8 yard bucket or less)

Class Il

Screening Plant Operator
Washing Plant Operator
Crusher Operator
Vacuum Truck Operator
Grease Truck

Side Boom Tractor
(smaller than D-4 type or equivalent)
Batch Plant (concrete-dry mix)
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PW #899 Troy School District Boulan Park Middle School Site Paving

OPERATING ENGINEERS CLASSIFICATION DESCRIPTIONS - continued

Class lll  Air Compressor Operator (600 cfm or more)
Air Compressor (2 or more, less than 600 cfm)
Concrete Breaker
Tractor Operator (farm type with attachments)
Wagon Drill Operator
Class IV  Boiler Fireman Concrete Pump Under 3"
Oiler
Skid Steer
End-loader Operator (under 1 yard capacity)
Fireman Roller Operator (other than asphalt)
Mechanic's Helper Curing Equipment Operator (self-propelled)
Trencher (service) Concrete Saw Operator (Over 40 HP)
Flexplane Operator Power Bin Operator
Cleftplane Operator Plant Drier Operator (asphalt)
Grader Operator Self-propelled Vibratory Compaction Equipment (6’ wide or over)
Fine-Grade or Form (concrete) Guard Post Driver Operator
Finishing Machine Operator (concrete) All Mulching Equipment
Boom or Winch Hoist Truck Operator Farm Type Tractor Operator
Stump Remover Mesh Installer (self-propelled)
End Dumps
LABORERS
Zone 1 Genesee, Macomb, Monroe, Oakland, Washtenaw and Wayne
Zone 2  Allegan, Barry, Bay, Berrien, Branch, Calhoun, Cass, Clinton, Eaton, Gratiot, Hillsdale, Huron, Ingham,
Jackson, Kalamazoo, Lapeer, Lenawee, Livingston, Midland, Muskegon, Saginaw, Sanilac, Shiawassee,
St. Clair, St. Joseph, Tuscola, and Van Buren
Zone 3  Alcona, Alpena, Antrim, Arenac, Benzie, Charlevoix, Cheboygan, Clare, Crawford, Emmet, Gladwin, Grand
Traverse, lonia, losco, Isabella, Kalkaska, Kent, Lake, Leelanau, Manistee, Mason, Mecosta, Missaukee,
Montcalm, Montmorency, Newaygo, Oceana, Ogemaw, Osceola, Oscoda, Otsego, Ottawa, Presque Isle,
Roscommon, and Wexford
Zone 4  Alger, Baraga, Chippewa, Delta, Dickinson, Gogebic, Houghton, Iron, Keweenaw, Luce, Mackinac,

Marquette, Menominee, Ontonagon, and Schoolcraft

LABORERS CLASSIFICATION DESCRIPTIONS

Class 1

Class 2

Asphalt Shoveler or Loader, Asphalt Raker Tender, Asphalt Plant Misc., Railroad Track and Trestle
Laborer, Burlap Man, Carpenter's Tender, Top Man, Yard Man, Guard Rail Builder's Tender, Earth
Retention Barrier and Wall and Mechanically Stabilized Earthen Wall Installers Tender, Highway and
Median Barrier Installer's Tender (including Sound, Retaining and Crash Barrier), Fence Erector's Tender,
Dumper (wagon, truck, etc.) Joint Filling Labor, Misc., Unskilled Labor, Sprinkler Labor, Form Setting
Labor, Form Stripper, Pavement Reinforcing, Handling and Placing (e.g. wire mesh, steel mats, dowel
bars, etc.) Mason's or Bricklayer's Tender on Manholes, Manhole Builder, Headwalls, etc., Waterproofing
(other than buildings), Seal Coating and Slurry Mix, Shoring, Underpinning, Bridge Painting, etc. (spray,
roller and brush) Sandblasting, Pressure Grouting, and Bridge Pin and Hanger Removal, Material
Recycling Laborer, Horizontal Paver (brick, concrete, clay, stone and asphalt) Ground Stabilization and
Modification Laborer, Grouting, Waterblasting, Sign Installer and remote control operated equipment.

Mix Operator (less than 5 sacks), Air or Electric Tool Operator (jack hammer, etc.), Spreader, Boxman (asphalt,
stone, gravel, etc.), Concrete Paddler, Power Chain Saw Operator, Paving Batch Truck Dumper, Tunnel
Mucker (highway work only), Concrete Saw Operator (under 40 H.P.), Dry Pack Machine and Roto-Mill
Grounds Person.
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LABORERS CLASSIFICATION DESCRIPTIONS - continued

Class 3

Class 4
Class 5
Class 6

Class 7

Tunnel Miner (highway work only), Finishers Tender, Guard Rail Builder, Highway and Median Barrier Installer,
Fence Erector, Bottom Man, Powder Man, Wagon Dirill and Air Track Operators, Curb and Side Rail Setters'
Tender, Diamond & Core Dirills, Earth Retention Barriers, Walls and Mechanically Stabilized Earthen Wall
Installer (including sound, retaining and crash batrrier), grade checker and certified welder.

Asphalt Raker
Pipe Layers, Oxy-gun
Line-Form Setter for Curb or Pavement and asphalt screed checker/screw man on asphalt paving machines.

Concrete Specialist, finishing and troweling, of cast in place or precast concrete by any and all methods.

TRUCK DRIVERS

Zone 1l

Zone 2

Genesee, Oakland, Macomb, Monroe, Livingston, Washtenaw and Wayne Counties

The entire state except those counties listed in Zone 1



OVERTIME PROVISIONS FOR MICHIGAN PREVAILING WAGE RATE SCHEDULE

1. Overtime is represented as a nine character code. Each character represents a certain period of time
after the first 8 hours Monday thru Friday.

Monday thru Friday Saturday Sunday & Holidays
First 8 Hours 4
9" Hour 1 5 8
10™ Hour 2 6
Over 10 hours 3 7

Overtime for Monday thru Friday after 8 hours:

the 1% character is for time worked in the 9™ hour (8.1 -9 hours)

the 2™ character is for time worked in the 10" hour (9.1 - 10 hours)

the 3" character is for time worked beyond the 10" hour (10.1 and beyond)

Overtime on Saturday:

the 4" character is for time worked in the first 8 hours on Saturday (O - 8 hours)
the 5™ character is for time worked in the 9" hour on Saturday (8.1 - 9 hours)
the 6" character is for time worked in the 10" hour (9.1 - 10 hours)

the 7" character is for time worked beyond the 10" hour (10.01 and beyond)

Overtime on Sunday & Holidays
the 8" character is for time worked on Sunday or on a holiday

4 Ten hour days @ Regular Time
the last character indicates if an optional 4-day 10-hour per day workweek can be worked between
Monday and Friday without paying overtime after 8 hours worked.

Overtime Indicators Used in the Overtime Provision:

H -means TIME AND ONE-HALF due

D -means DOUBLE PAY due

Y -means YES an optional 4-day 10-hour per day workweek can be worked without paying
overtime after 8 hours worked

N -means NO optional 4-day 10-hour per day workweek can be worked without paying overtime
after 8 hours worked

EXAMPLES:

HHHHHHDDY - This example shows that the 1% rate must be used for time worked after 8 hours
Monday thru Friday (characters 1 - 3)and for all hours worked on Saturday, (characters 4 - 6),
except hours worked after 10 hours on Saturday (7th character). Work done after 10 hours must be
paid at the double time rate. Work done on Sunday or holidays must be paid double time (character
8). The Y (character 9) indicates that 4 ten-hour days is an acceptable alternative workweek at
regular pay.

HHHHHHHHY means that the 1% rate must be used for time worked after 8 hours worked Monday
thru Friday (characters 1-3); and for any hours worked on Saturdays, Sundays or holidays
(characters 4-8). The Y (character 9) indicates that 4 ten-hour days is an acceptable alternative
workweek at regular pay.

(REV 10/26/07RB)




Troy School District

Asphalt Paving
Bid 9547

Description

Boulan Park

Parking Lot 65,000 S.F.

Barnard
Seal 10,870 S.F.
Crack fill 2,200 L.F.

Bemis
Seal 8,064 S.F.
Crack fill 1,650 L.F.

Costello
Seal 17,749 S.F.
Crack fill 1,100 L.F.

Hamilton
Seal 8,568 S.F.
Crack fill 500 L.F.

Hill
Seal 8,658 S.F.
Crack fill 300 L.F.

Leonard
Seal 8,127 S.F.
Crack fill 250 L.F.

Martell
Seal 12,204 S.F.
Crack fill 3,300 L.F.

Morse
Seal 8,432 S.F.
Crack fill 300 L.F.

Schroeder
Seal 8,820 S.F.
Crack fill 1,000 L.F.

Flynn Paving Asphalt Cadillac Florence
Co. ABC Paving Co. Specialists Asphalt Cement Co.
$ 145,236.00 $147,575.00 $193,706.00 $239,518.00 $168,600.00
Alternate
869.60 1,710.00 5,700.00 6,090.00 5,935.00 no bid
1,320.00 3,360.00 3,575.00 3,690.00 no bid
2,189.60 9,060.00 9,665.00 9,625.00
645.12 1,525.00 4,230.00 4,515.00 4,532.00 no bid
990.00 2,520.00 2,680.00 2,893.00 no bid
1,635.12 6,750.00 7,195.00 7,425.00
1,419.92 2,925.00 9,320.00 9,940.00 9,375.00 no bid
660.00 1,675.00 1,786.00 1,995.00 no bid
2,079.92 10,995.00 11,726.00 11,370.00
685.44 1,350.00 4,500.00 4,798.00 4,784.00 no bid
300.00 1,260.00 1,344.00 1,700.00 no bid
985.44 5,760.00 6,142.00 6,484.00
692.64 1,360.00 4,545.00 4,850.00 4,829.00 no bid
180.00 1,260.00 1,344.00 1,700.00 no bid
872.64 5,805.00 6,194.00 6,529.00
650.16 1,280.00 4,270.00 4,550.00 4,564.00 no bid
150.00 1,260.00 1,344.00 1,700.00 no bid
800.16 5,530.00 5,894.00 6,264.00
976.32 1,925.00 6,400.00 6,835.00 6,602.00 no bid
1,980.00 5,025.00 5,360.00 5,285.00 no bid
2,956.32 11,425.00 12,195.00 11,887.00
674.56 1,330.00 4,430.00 4,725.00 4,716.00 no bid
180.00 1,260.00 1,344.00 1,700.00 no bid
854.56 5,690.00 6,069.00 6,416.00
705.60 1,390.00 4,630.00 4,940.00 4,910.00 no bid
____600.00 1,675.00 1,787.00 1,995.00 no bid
1,305.60 6,305.00 6,727.00 6,905.00




Troy School District
Asphalt Paving

Bid 9547
Flynn Paving Asphalt Cadillac Florence
Co. ABC Paving Co. Specialists Asphalt Cement Co.
Description
Troy Union
Seal 9,450 S.F. 756.00 1,490.00 4,960.00 5,292.00 5,225.00 no bid
Crack fill 1,100 L.F. 660.00 1,675.00 1,787.00 1,995.00 no bid
1,416.00 6,635.00 7,079.00 7,220.00
Five Ton Skin Patching 1,800.00 2,520.00 2,520.00 2,700.00 4,000.00 no bid
TOTAL FOR SEAL COATING,
CRACK FILLING AND ASPHALT
SKIN PATCHING $ 16,895.36 $ 2,520.00 $ 76,475.00 $ 81,586.00 $ 84,125.00 no bid

Note: Alternate is bid for
standard sealcoating method
New Asphalt Magic Squares

Cost per S.F. 6.28 6.60 7.00 25.00 no bid
New Asphalt Curb
Cost per L.F. 5.00 5.00 4.00 6.00 no bid

Nagle Paving: No Response

Hutch Paving Inc: No Response

Michigan Paving & Materials: No Response
Rite-Way Asphalt Inc.: No Response

Great Lakes Paving: No Response
Cranbrook Pavement Corp.: No Response

Quality Asphalt Paving: No Response
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