REQUEST FOR
QUOTATION
No. 9539 TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT
DUE DATE NO LATER THAN 1140 RANKIN, TROY, MICHIGAN 48083
7/9/08 3p.m. 248-823-4052
FAX: 248-823-4077

REQUISITION

DATE 6/19/08

REQUEST FOR QUOTE — NOT AN ORDER

THIS FORM MUST BE UTILIZED WHEN RESPONDING TO THIS REQUEST
BID ENVELOPE ENCLOSED

THE RFQ NUMBER MUST APPEAR ON ALL QUOTATIONS AND RELATED CORRESPONDENCE, THIS IS NOT AN ORDER

Quantity

DESCRIPTION

UNIT PRICE

AMOUNT

Please supply us with your bid to furnish the Troy School District with \WWinter
ATHLETIC EQUIPMENT for the 2008/09 School Year

Copies of the bid are available at:
www.troy.k12.mi.us/purchasing/items_out for bid.htm

Bid recaps will be available at:
troy.k12.mi.us/purchasing/index.htm

FACSIMILE BID IS NOT ACCEPTABLE

Bids will not be accepted if submitted after the deadline specified (local time) in the advertisement to bid or in the information to
bidders. The late submission of a bid makes the bid nonrepsonsive and is a material defect which shall not be waived by the
Board of Education. Delays in the mail will not be considered. All Late bids in the mail will be returned to the bidder unopened.

Proposal for the submission of alternatives by vendors will be accepted and reviewed. However, if any substitution or departure
is not clearly noted and described, it will be understood that the hid intends to exactly meet the specifications.

The Board of Education shall be the sole judge as to whether the proposed goods are “equal” or “approved”. Quotations must
be mailed or delivered to the Purchasing Office, 1140 Rankin, Troy, MI 48083 no later than 3 p.m. on the date shown above.
Michigan State Sales and Use Taxes and Federal Excise Taxes do not apply unless otherwise indicated. Exemption certificates
will be furnished when necessary. This request imposes no obligations on the buyer. The Board of Education reserves the right

to accept or reject any or all bids or to split awards by items or to accept bids, which will best serve the Board of Education.

THIS AREA MUST BE FILLED IN

DELIVERY TIME

PRICES FIRM FOR NAME OF COMPANY

TELEPHONE
NO.

TERMS

NO. & STREET

FAX #

FOB
DELIVERED

ALL DELIVERY CHARGES
MUST CITY, STATE & ZIP CODE

BE INCLUDED IN PRICES SHOWN

E-MAIL

CONTACT PERSON (PLEASE PRINT) SIGNATURE

DATE



http://www.troy.k12.mi.us/purchasing/items_out_for_bid.htm

Note: All bidders are specifically reminded that a completed Affidavit of Bidder
(Familial Disclosure) MUST be completed and submitted with the bid response.
Failure to include a completed copy will be grounds for disqualification of bid.
The Affidavit of Bidder is required to be notarized for construction bids only. All
others only require completion and signature.

AFFIDAVIT OF BIDDER

The undersigned, the owner or authorized officer of
(the “Bidder), pursuant to the familial disclosure requirement provided in the
(the *“School District”) advertisement for construction bids, hereby
represent and warrant except as provided below, that no familial relationships exist
between the over(s) or any employee of
and any member of the Board of Education of the
School District or the Superintendent of the School District.

List any Familial Relationships:

BIDDER:
By:
Its:
STATE OF MICHIGAN )
COUNTY OF ))SS'
This instrument was acknowledged before meonthe _ day of , 2008,

by

,Notary Public

County, Michigan

My Commission Expires:

Acting in the County of:




TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT

2008-09 ATHLETICS WINTER BID #9539

Qty.

Description

Alternate

Unit Cost

Total

Athens Boys Basketball

12

64-4968. Men’'s TF-1000 ZK Pro Basketballs 10 x 14"

SNR-60 Slip Not Replacement Pads. 15"x18”

Mark V Basketball Scorebook.

15

Reversible Red/White Practice Jerseys w/numbers on both
sides. Numbers 1-5, 5-10, 20-23.

Athens Girls Basketball

15

73072XK. Away Jerseys. Russell Performance Racer Back
Jersey. Red. Color 1TH. Front Lettering Placement #7
screened on “ATHENS” (4”inch). Number (6inch). Back
Lettering Placement #6 full back. Sizes 2-Small #'s 5,11. 8-
Medium #'s 3,4,10,12,14,20,33,23. 4-Large #'s 15,24,41,42.
1-XLarge #35.

15

73172XK. Shorts. Color TRW. Front Placement #18
screened on: Block A (white standard size). Sizes 2-Small.
8-Medium. 4-Large. 1-XlLarge.

15

73072XK. Home Jerseys. Russell Performance Racer
Back Jersey. White. Color 3WT. Front Lettering Placement
#7 screened on “ATHENS” (4inch) Number (6inch). Back
Lettering Placement #6 full back. Sizes 2-Small #'s 5,11. 8-
Medium #'s 3,4,10,12,14,20,33,23. 4-Large #'s 15,24,41,42.
1-XLarge #35.

15

73172XK. Short. Color WTR. Front Placement #18
screened on: Block A.(True Red standard size). Sizes 2-
Small. 8-Medium. 4-Large. 1-XLarge

Slip Knot Refill

12

TF-1000. Spalding Basketballs. Size 28.5. (ZK Micor Fiber
composite construction).




Athens Girls Basketball - CONTINUED

15 Reversible Red & White Practice Jerseys. Screened on
front both sides “ATHENS BASKETBALL”. Numbers on
back, both sides #1-15. Sizes 2-Small #'s 1,2. 7-Medium
#s3,4,5,6,7,8,9. 4-Large #'s 10,11,12,13. 2-Xlarge #'s
14,15.

Athens Gymnastics
1 416-785 AAIl Vault Runway — 1 3/8”
16 NIU1048 Nike Team Training Il Medium Duffel. Red/Gray.
Athens Wrestling
15 0239BLBL. Quad Ill. Brute Headgear. Red/Black
30 pr | 0262SC. Brute. Knee pads. Red. Solid Lycra. 10-Small.
10-Medium. 10-Large.

26 L7943J. Cliffkleen Singlet. Lycra. White. Ink Color Red.
14B-Red Screened Hawk on back. 2" Redhawks on Left
Leg. Sizes 5-Small, 6-Medium, 7-Large, 4-Xlarge, 4-
XXLarge.

26 YT620. Asics Cirro Jacket. Red w/White trim. Left Front
Lettering: Troy Athens — Bridge Style. Wrestling — Reverse
Bridge Style. Back “REDHAWKS?” Letter style — “Machine”.
Sizes — 5-Small, 6-Medium, 7-Large, 4-XLarge, 4-XXLarge.

26 YB622. Asics Cirro Pant. Red/White trim. Sizes — 5-Small,
6-Medium, 7-Large, 4-XLarge, 4-XXLarge.

15 ZR491SC. Asics Chico Duffle Bag. Scarlet

Troy High School Girls Basketball
3 15 Player Basketball Scorebooks.
2 1-05679-179. 7’ Vinyl Extension Jump Ropes (2sets of 6).




Troy High Girls Basketball - CONTINUED

2 1-05681-179. 8’ Vinyl Extension Jump Ropes (2sets of 6).

2 1-05678-179. 9’ Vinyl Extension Jump Ropes (2sets of 6).

1 1-26166-179. Half Cones — 48 piece pack.

5 1-09632-179. Accusplit 53 E Stopwatch.

5 Whistles

20 Long Sleeve Black Warm up shirts.

Troy High School Synchronized Swim

12 7200000 - 01 Speedo Black Medalist Warm ups Jackets &
Pants. Double White Stripe down arm and leg, hood &
double front pocket jacket. Embroidered on right chest &
right upper leg. “Troy High Synchro” under a picture of a
synchro girl. 4-XSmall, 8-Small.

12 Black Equipment Bags.

50 SP-XZ Pin. Synchro Pin from Hasty Awards.

Troy High School Boys Basketball

50 Reversible Scrimmage Jerseys. #'s 1-50. Sizes 6-Medium,
20-Large, 24-XLarge.

12 TF-1000-61-1059. Top Flite Basketballs.

6 VPM-1. 9.5 x 15.5 Playmakers.

6 K-451. Bold Line Pens

1 SNR-60. Slipp Nott Pads.

4 Mark V Scorebooks

12 MGC 6” Mini Cones

Roll A Bin




Troy High School Wrestling

12 235. Brute Quad Il Ear guard (HG) or comparable.
Black/Grey

2 FG3. Face Guard (Black)

12prs | ZD712. Asics Gel Reversible kneepads. Black/White.
Sizes — 2-Small, 4-Medium, 4-Large, 2-XLarge.

2cs WWMT4. 4” Mat Tape.

4 W343H. 3-Sided, Tripod-Mounted Score Clocks.
17"x16"x16".

12 Holloway Flagship Jacket. Black/Scarlet. White Lettering
“TC Wrestling” on Front. “Troy” on back. Sizes — 2-Small,
4-Medium, 4-Large, 2-XLarge

12 Holloway Jogger Pant. Black. 2-Small, 4-Medium, 4-Large,
2-XLarge.

Baker Middle School Boys’ Basketball

2 Whistles

2 Lanyards

2 Big Red Basketball Scorebooks. 20 Player.

12 TF-1000. Men’s Basketballs. Spalding ZK Microfiber
Composite

Boulan Park Middle Boys Basketball

1 SNB-P Slipp Nott Base & Pad




Larson Middle School Boys Basketball

6 Pure Shot — Korney Board. 1 Left Hand. 5 Right Hand.
6 TF-1000. Basketballs.
Larson Boys Basketball - CONTINUED
2 Korney Board Aids. Bandit Shooting Aid.
1 TB102 Korney Board Master Toss Back.
6 Regular Classic Fox Whistles.
50 Scrimmage Vests. Reversible. Navy Blue/White. 10-Small,

15-Medium, 15-Large, 10-XLarge. Numbered 1-50.

Smith Middle School Volleyball

SVSWH Tachakara Game Balls.




Troy School District

BID 9539 ATHLETIC WINTER EQUIPMENT BID Aluminum
Ridell Athletic Equip. Sport Supply Group Cannon Sports Inc.
UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT COST
QTY  Unit DESCRIPTION Alternate ltem#  PRICE COST PRICE COST | Alternate Item # PRICE COST | Alternate ltem# PRICE

Athens Boys Basketball

12 ea 64-4968. Men's TF-1000 ZK Pro Basketballs 10 x 14 No Bid No Bid | |BSNicp pp 107 LBTFIKPRM 39.28 471.36 | Spalding 04172 33.73 404.76
2  ea SNR-60 Slip Not Replacement Pads. 15"x18" No Bid NoBid | Bsnicppp12z  Slip Nott 1187342 38.87 77.74 No Bid
3 ea Mark V Basketball Scorebook. MAMCV
Ridell Asmarks 5.00 15.00 No Bid | bsnicp pp 120 MSMANKSK 4.77 14.31 | Peterson Mark 191201 4.12 12.36

3 Alternate bid
15 ea Reversible Red/White Practice Jerseys w/numbers on both sides.

Numbers 1-5, 5-10, 20-23. Ridell PKR 17.30 259.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
1 Shipping and delivery on above items charges

Athens Girls Basketball
15 73072XK. Away Jerseys. Russell Performance Racer Back Jersey.
Red. Color 1TH. Front Lettering Placement #7 screened on “ATHENS”
(4"inch). Number (6inch). Back Lettering Placement #6 full back. Sizes
2-Small #'s 5,11. 8-Medium #'s 3,4,10,12,14,20,33,23. 4-Large #'s

15,24,41,42. 1-XLarge #35. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
15 73172XK. Shorts. Color TRW. Front Placement #18 screened on:

Block A (white standard size). Sizes 2-Small. 8-Medium. 4-Large. 1-

XLarge. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
15 73072XK. Home Jerseys. Russell Performance Racer Back Jersey.

White. Color 3WT. Front Lettering Placement #7 screened on
“ATHENS” (4inch) Number (6inch). Back Lettering Placement #6 full
back. Sizes 2-Small #'s 5,11. 8-Medium #'s 3,4,10,12,14,20,33,23. 4-

Large #'s 15,24,41,42. 1-XLarge #35. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
15 73172XK. Short. Color WTR. Front Placement #18 screened on: Block

A.(True Red standard size). Sizes 2-Small. 8-Medium. 4-Large. 1-

XLarge No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2 ea Slip Knot Refill Slip Nott Refill

No Bid No Bid BSNIcp pp 122 1187342 38.87 77.74 No Bid

12 ea TF-1000. Spalding Basketballs. Size 28.5. (ZK Micor Fiber composite Spalding

construction). No Bid No Bid BSNIcp pp 107 LIETFIKPRW 39.28 471.36 | Spalding 04076 28.56 342.72
12 ea Additional bid amount for above item.
15 Reversible Red & White Practice Jerseys. Screened on front both sides

“ATHENS BASKETBALL". Numbers on back, both sides #1-15. Sizes 2-

Small #s 1,2. 7-Medium #'s 3,4,5,6,7,8,9. 4-Large #'s 10,11,12,13. 2-

Xlarge #'s 14,15. Riddell PKRW 15.70 235.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
1 Shipping and delivery on above items charges

Athens Gymnastics

1 416-785 AAIl Vault Runway — 1 3/8” No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
16 NIU1048 Nike Team Training Il Medium Duffel. Red/Gray. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1 Shipping and delivery on above items charges

Athens Wrestling




Troy School District

BID 9539 ATHLETIC WINTER EQUIPMENT BID Aluminum
Ridell Athletic Equip. Sport Supply Group Cannon Sports Inc.
UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT COST

QTY  Unit DESCRIPTION Alternate Item # PRICE COST PRICE COST Alternate Item # PRICE COST Alternate ltem# PRICE
15 0239BLBL. Quad Ill. Brute Headgear. Red/Black No Bid No Bid No Bid R
30 pr 0262SC. Brute. Knee pads. Red. Solid Lycra. 10-Small. 10-Medium.

10-Large. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
26 L7943J. Cliffkleen Singlet. Lycra. White. Ink Color Red. 14B-Red

Screened Hawk on back. 2” Redhawks on Left Leg. Sizes 5-Small, 6-

Medium, 7-Large, 4-Xlarge, 4-XXLarge. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
26 YT620. Asics Cirro Jacket. Red w/White trim. Left Front Lettering: Troy

Athens — Bridge Style. Wrestling — Reverse Bridge Style. Back
“REDHAWKS?" Letter style — “Machine”. Sizes — 5-Small, 6-Medium, 7-

Large, 4-XLarge, 4-XXLarge. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
26 YB622. Asics Cirro Pant. Red/White trim. Sizes — 5-Small, 6-Medium, 7-
Large, 4-XLarge, 4-XXLarge. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
15 ZR491SC. Asics Chico Duffle Bag. Scarlet
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1 Shipping and delivery on above items charges

Troy High School Girls Basketball

3 ea 15 Player Basketball Scorebooks. Gamecraft BK28
Riddell Asmark5 5.00 15.00 4.00 12.00 BSNicp pp 102 Ban  MS65KBOK 2.87 8.61 Loucks P941 3.04 9.12
2 set6 1-05679-179. 7' Vinyl Extension Jump Ropes (2sets of 6). No Bid No Bid | uUSGAMES 1040159 5.88 11.76 No Bid
2 setl6 1-05681-179. 8’ Vinyl Extension Jump Ropes (2sets of 6). No Bid No Bid I us caves 1040166 6.12 12.24 No Bid
2 set6 1-05678-179. 8 Vinyl Estension Jump Ropes (2sets of 6) No Bid No Bid | uUSGAMES 1040173 6.24 12.48 No Bid
1 ea 1-26166-179. Half Cones — 48 piece pack. Gamecraft
No Bid 24.60 24.60 1040890093295 18.19 18.19 No Bid
5 1-09632-179. Accusplit 53 E Stopwatch. BSNcp pp253 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
5 ea Whistles No Bid No Bid | Fox40 MSWHIF02 3.26 1630 | GTL7Lppsz 13028 1.32 6.60
Additional bid amount for above item.
20 Long Sleeve Black Warm up shirts.
Ridell (print extra)  KWJSI 26.60 532.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
20 Alternate 1
20 Alternate 2
20 Alternate 3
1 Shipping and delivery on above items charges
Troy High School Synchronized Swim
12 7200000 - 01 Speedo Black Medalist Warm ups Jackets & Pants.
Double White Stripe down arm and leg, hood & double front pocket
jacket. Embroidered on right chest & right upper leg. “Troy High
Synchro” under a picture of a synchro girl. 4-XSmall, 8-Small.
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12 Black Equipment Bags.
Ridell (print extra) 27575 21.63 259.56 No Bid No Bid No Bid

50 SP-XZ Pin. Synchro Pin from Hasty Awards. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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Troy School District

BID 9539 ATHLETIC WINTER EQUIPMENT BID

Aluminum

Athletic Equip.

Sport Supply Group

Cannon Sports Inc.

Ridell
UNIT TOTAL
DESCRIPTION Alternate Item # PRICE COST
Shipping and delivery on above items charges
Troy High School Boys Basketball
Reversible Scrimmage Jerseys. #'s 1-50. Sizes 6-Medium, 20-Large, 24-
XLarge. Ridell PKR 17.30 865.00
alternate
TF-1000-61-1059. Top Flite Basketballs.
No Bid
VPM-1. 9.5 x 15.5 Playmakers. No Bid
K-451. Bold Line Pens No Bid
SNR-60. Slipp Nott Pads. No Bid
Mark V Scorebooks Ridell Asmark5 5.00 20.00
alternate
MGC 6” Mini Cones No Bid
Roll A Bin No Bid
Shipping and delivery on above items charges
Troy High School Wrestling
235. Brute Quad Il Ear guard (HG) or comparable. Black/Grey
No Bid
Additional bid amount for above item.
FG3. Face Guard (Black) No Bid
ZD712. Asics Gel Reversible kneepads. Black/White. Sizes — 2-Small,
4-Medium, 4-Large, 2-XLarge. No Bid
WWMT4. 4” Mat Tape.
No Bid
W343H. 3-Sided, Tripod-Mounted Score Clocks. 17"x16"x16". No Bid
Holloway Flagship Jacket. Black/Scarlet. White Lettering “TC Wrestling”
on Front. “Troy” on back. Sizes — 2-Small, 4-Medium, 4-Large, 2-XLarge
No Bid
Holloway Jogger Pant. Black. 2-Small, 4-Medium, 4-Large, 2-XLarge.
No Bid
Shipping and delivery on above items charges
Baker Middle School Boys' Basketball
Whistles
No Bid
Alternate Whistles
Lanyards
No Bid

Alternate Lanyards

UNIT

PRICE

TOTAL

COST

No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Alternate

BSN cp

BSN cp pp120

BSN cp pp121

BNS cp pp 312

BSN cp pp 235

BNS cp pp 253

Item #

LBTF100WC
12350302

Slipp Nott 1187342
MSMARKGEK

MSCONE64

Gamecraft 6406xxxx

Fox 40 black
MSWHIFOX

UNIT

PRICE

34.77
7.87

38.87

4.77

2.68

117.12

TOTAL

COST

No Bid

417.24
47.22
No Bid
38.87

19.08

32.16
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

234.24
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

6.52

No Bid

Alternate

Spalding pp25 04075

KRA pp 38 13133

Peterson Mank ' 191201

Keen FG3

32A
CSlpp 118 Cate

CSl pp 42 13028

1345-
CSl pp 42 1350

Item #

UNIT

PRICE

28.56
9.78

4.12

37.26

145.60

1.32

0.23

COST

No Bid

342.72

58.68
No Bid
No Bid

16.48

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

74.52

No Bid

291.20
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

0.46
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Troy School District

BID 9539 ATHLETIC WINTER EQUIPMENT BID

DESCRIPTION

Big Red Basketball Scorebooks. 20 Player.
TF-1000. Men's Basketballs. Spalding ZK Microfiber Composite

Alternate

Boulan Park Middle Boys Basketball
SNB-P Slipp Nott Base & Pad

Larson Middle School Boys Basketball
Pure Shot — Korney Board. 1 Left Hand. 5 Right Hand.
TF-1000 Basketballs

Korney Board Aids. Bandit Shooting Aid.
TB102 Korney Board Master Toss Back.
Regular Classic Fox Whistles.

alternate item

Scrimmage Vests. Reversible. Navy Blue/White. 10-Small, 15-Medium,
15-Large, 10-XLarge. Numbered 1-50.
alternate item

Shipping and delivery on above items charges

Smith Middle School Volleyball
SVSWH Tachakara Game Balls.

TOTALS

Aluminum
Ridell Athletic Equip. Sport Supply Group Cannon Sports Inc.
UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT COST
Alternate ltem#  PRICE COST PRICE COST Alternate Item # PRICE COST Alternate ltem# PRICE
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Spalding Spalding pp 25
No Bid No Bid BSN cp pp 107 LBTFIKRPM 39.28 471.36 | (285) 07076 28.56 342.72
No Bid No Bid BSN cp pp 107 Slipp Nott 1187335 83.77 83.77 No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Spalding Spalding pp 25
No Bid Bsn cp pp 107 LBTF1000WC 34.77 208.62 = (289) 04076 28.56 171.36
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid BNS cp pp253 Fox 40 MSWHIFOX 3.26 19.56 Fox40pp42 1357 2.61 15.66
Ridell PKR 17.30 865.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tachakara pg
112 6127 34.13 204.78
Tachakara
No Bid No Bid BSN cp pp 223 TACSV5WH 42.28 253.68
3,066.56 36.60 3,024.41 2,296.78




Troy School District

BID 9539 ATHLETIC WINTER EQUIPMENT BID

Longstretch Anaconda S & S Worldwide Flaghouse
UNIT TOTAL PRICE COST UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
QTY  Unit DESCRIPTION Alternate Item # PRICE COST| Alternate Item # Alternate Item # PRICE COST Alternate Item # PRICE COST
Athens Boys Basketball
12 ea 64-4968. Men's TF-1000 ZK Pro Basketballs 10 x 14" No Bid | Anaconda M6-4000PC-NF  19.89 238.68 W8317002 36.76 441.12 | pp23 15794 42.08 504.96
2 ea SNR-60 Slip Not Replacement Pads. 15"x18” No Bid 35.45 70.90 No Bid No Bid
3 ea Mark V Basketball Scorebook. Athletic
No Bid No Bid Specialties W4489 4.14 12.42 Cramer pp28 11637 231 6.93
3 Alternate bid
15 ea Reversible Red/White Practice Jerseys w/numbers on both sides. Vale 1043xs- YRMJ/BB
Numbers 1-5, 5-10, 20-23. X pp59 14.50 217.50 14.25 213.75 No Bid No Bid
1 Shipping and delivery on above items charges
Athens Girls Basketball
15 73072XK. Away Jerseys. Russell Performance Racer Back Jersey.
Red. Color 1TH. Front Lettering Placement #7 screened on “ATHENS”
(4"inch). Number (6inch). Back Lettering Placement #6 full back. Sizes
2-Small #'s 5,11. 8-Medium #'s 3,4,10,12,14,20,33,23. 4-Large #'s
15,24,41,42. 1-XLarge #35. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
15 73172XK. Shorts. Color TRW. Front Placement #18 screened on:
Block A (white standard size). Sizes 2-Small. 8-Medium. 4-Large. 1-
XLarge. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
15 73072XK. Home Jerseys. Russell Performance Racer Back Jersey.
White. Color 3WT. Front Lettering Placement #7 screened on
“ATHENS” (4inch) Number (6inch). Back Lettering Placement #6 full
back. Sizes 2-Small #'s 5,11. 8-Medium #'s 3,4,10,12,14,20,33,23. 4-
Large #'s 15,24,41,42. 1-XLarge #35. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
15 73172XK. Short. Color WTR. Front Placement #18 screened on: Block
A.(True Red standard size). Sizes 2-Small. 8-Medium. 4-Large. 1-
XLarge No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2 ea Slip Knot Refill
No Bid 35.45 70.90 No Bid No Bid
12 ea TF-1000. Spalding Basketballs. Size 28.5. (ZK Micor Fiber composite
construction). No Bid Anadonda M6-4000PC-NF 19.89 238.68 W8317002 35.76 429.12 Pp 23 15798 42.08 504.96
12 ea Additional bid amount for above item.
15 Reversible Red & White Practice Jerseys. Screened on front both sides
“ATHENS BASKETBALL". Numbers on back, both sides #1-15. Sizes 2-
Small #s 1,2. 7-Medium #'s 3,4,5,6,7,8,9. 4-Large #'s 10,11,12,13. 2- Badger 8978 xs
Xlarge #'s 14,15. 2xl BA8978 17.75 266.25 15.09 226.35 No Bid No Bid
1 Shipping and delivery on above items charges
Athens Gymnastics
1 416-785 AAIl Vault Runway — 1 3/8” No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
16 NIU1048 Nike Team Training Il Medium Duffel. Red/Gray. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

1 Shipping and delivery on above items charges

Athens Wrestling
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Troy School District

BID 9539 ATHLETIC WINTER EQUIPMENT BID

Longstretch Anaconda S & S Worldwide Flaghouse
UNIT TOTAL PRICE COST UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
DESCRIPTION Alternate Item # PRICE COST| Alternate Iltem # Alternate Item # PRICE COST Alternate Item # PRICE COST
0239BLBL. Quad Ill. Brute Headgear. Red/Black No Bid 15.49 232.35 No Bid No Bid
0262SC. Brute. Knee pads. Red. Solid Lycra. 10-Small. 10-Medium.
10-Large. No Bid 24.89 746.70 No Bid No Bid
L7943J. Cliffkleen Singlet. Lycra. White. Ink Color Red. 14B-Red
Screened Hawk on back. 2” Redhawks on Left Leg. Sizes 5-Small, 6-
Medium, 7-Large, 4-Xlarge, 4-XXLarge. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
YT620. Asics Cirro Jacket. Red w/White trim. Left Front Lettering: Troy
Athens — Bridge Style. Wrestling — Reverse Bridge Style. Back
“REDHAWKS?" Letter style — “Machine”. Sizes — 5-Small, 6-Medium, 7-
Large, 4-XLarge, 4-XXLarge. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
YB622. Asics Cirro Pant. Red/White trim. Sizes — 5-Small, 6-Medium, 7-
Large, 4-XLarge, 4-XXLarge. No Bid 19.49 506.74 No Bid No Bid
ZR491SC. Asics Chico Duffle Bag. Scarlet
No Bid 16.75 251.25 No Bid No Bid
Shipping and delivery on above items charges
Troy High School Girls Basketball
15 Player Basketball Scorebooks. Athletic
No Bid 2.75 8.25 Specialties W4489 4.14 12.42 No Bid
1-05679-179. 7 Vinyl Extension Jump Ropes (2sets of 6). No Bid No Bid NoBid | SOLDEACH so7 4322 ppl79 5.82 11.64
1-05681-179. 8 Vinyl Extension Jump Ropes (2sets of ). No Bid No Bid No Bid | soLDEACH $1.077 4324 ppl79 6.42 12.84
1-05678-179. 8 Vinyl Estension Jump Ropes (2sets of 6) No Bid No Bid NoBid | soLDEAcHstiz  4331ppl79 6.72 13.44
1-26166-179. Half Cones — 48 piece pack.
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1-09632-179. Accusplit 53 E Stopwatch. BSNcp pp253 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Whistles No Bid No Bid | STS W5896007  0.28 1.40 | selectColorpp27a  Fox 40 8351 421 21.05
Additional bid amount for above item.
Long Sleeve Black Warm up shirts.
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Alternate 1
Alternate 2
Alternate 3
Shipping and delivery on above items charges
Troy High School Synchronized Swim
7200000 - 01 Speedo Black Medalist Warm ups Jackets & Pants.
Double White Stripe down arm and leg, hood & double front pocket
jacket. Embroidered on right chest & right upper leg. “Troy High
Synchro” under a picture of a synchro girl. 4-XSmall, 8-Small.
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Black Equipment Bags.
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
SP-XZ Pin. Synchro Pin from Hasty Awards. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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Troy School District

BID 9539 ATHLETIC WINTER EQUIPMENT BID

Longstretch Anaconda S & S Worldwide Flaghouse
UNIT TOTAL PRICE COST UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
DESCRIPTION Alternate Item # PRICE COST| Alternate Iltem # Alternate Item # PRICE COST Alternate Item # PRICE COST
Shipping and delivery on above items charges
Troy High School Boys Basketball
Reversible Scrimmage Jerseys. #'s 1-50. Sizes 6-Medium, 20-Large, 24-
XLarge. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
alternate
TF-1000-61-1059. Top Flite Basketballs.
No Bid | Anaconda MG-4000-PC-NF  20.89 250.68 W562001 32.09 385.08 | Pp23 7251 39.26 471.12
VPM-1. 9.5 x 15.5 Playmakers. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
K-451. Bold Line Pens No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
SNR-60. Slipp Nott Pads. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Athletic
Mark V Scorebooks No Bid No Bid | Specialties W4489 4.14 16.56 = Cramerpp 28 11627 231 9.24
alternate
MGC 6" Mini Cones No Bid No Bid No Bid Pp 283 150 1.67 20.04
Roll A Bin No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Shipping and delivery on above items charges
Troy High School Wrestling
235. Brute Quad Il Ear guard (HG) or comparable. Black/Grey
No Bid 15.49 185.88 No Bid No Bid
Additional bid amount for above item.
FG3. Face Guard (Black) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ZD712. Asics Gel Reversible kneepads. Black/White. Sizes — 2-Small,
4-Medium, 4-Large, 2-XLarge. No Bid 17.70 212.40 No Bid No Bid
WWMTA4. 4" Mat Tape.
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
W343H. 3-Sided, Tripod-Mounted Score Clocks. 17"x16"x16". No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Holloway Flagship Jacket. Black/Scarlet. White Lettering “TC Wrestling”
on Front. “Troy” on back. Sizes — 2-Small, 4-Medium, 4-Large, 2-XLarge
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Holloway Jogger Pant. Black. 2-Small, 4-Medium, 4-Large, 2-XLarge.
No Bid 24.45 293.40 No Bid No Bid
Shipping and delivery on above items charges
Baker Middle School Boys' Basketball
Whistles
No Bid No Bid STS W5896007 0.28 0.56 Select Color pp 274 Fox 40 8351 421 8.42
Alternate Whistles
Lanyards
No Bid No Bid | sTs W5897007 0.28 0.56 = Asst Colorspp294  Fox 40 293 2.23 4.46

Alternate Lanyards




Troy School District

BID 9539 ATHLETIC WINTER EQUIPMENT BID

Longstretch Anaconda S & S Worldwide Flaghouse
UNIT TOTAL PRICE COST UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
QTY  Unit DESCRIPTION Alternate Item # PRICE COST| Alternate Item # Alternate Item # PRICE COST Alternate Item # PRICE COST
2 Big Red Basketball Scorebooks. 20 Player. No Bid No Bid | sTs W4489 4.14 8.28 No Bid
12 ea TF-1000. Men's Basketballs. Spalding ZK Microfiber Composite
No Bid | Anaconda MG4000-PC-NF =~ 19.89 238.68 | Spalding W8917001 35.76 429.12 | pp23 7251 39.26 471.12
12 ea Alternate
Boulan Park Middle Boys Basketball
1 ea SNB-P Slipp Nott Base & Pad No Bid 83.50 83.50 No Bid No Bid
Larson Middle School Boys Basketball
6 ea Pure Shot — Korney Board. 1 Left Hand. 5 Right Hand. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6 ea TF-1000 Basketballs
No Bid | Anaconda MG4000-PC-NF  19.89 119.34 W5626001 32.09 192.54 | zK microfibercomp 725 pp23 39.26 235.56
2 Korney Board Aids. Bandit Shooting Aid. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1 TB102 Korney Board Master Toss Back. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6 e Regular Classic Fox Whistles. No Bid No Bid w2988 3.74 22.44 | Selectcolors pp274 8351 421 25.26
6 ea alternate item
50 ea Scrimmage Vests. Reversible. Navy Blue/White. 10-Small, 15-Medium, =\, vers BA8478/BB
15-Large, 10-XLarge. Numbered 1-50. front/back pp59 17.50 875.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
50 ea alternateitem
1 Shipping and delivery on above items charges
Smith Middle School Volleyball
6 ea SVSWH Tachakara Game Balls.
No Bid 33.69 202.14 No Bid No Bid

TOTALS 1,358.75 4,390.57 1,951.62 2,321.04
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Troy School District

BID 9539 ATHLETIC WINTER EQUIPMENT BID

Pyramid Park Athletic Supply Ts4U
UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
DESCRIPTION Alternate ltem# PRICE COST Alternate ltem# PRICE COST Alternate Item # PRICE COST
Athens Boys Basketball
64-4968. Men’s TF-1000 ZK Pro Basketballs 10 x 14” No Bid 37.98 455.76 35.45 425.40
SNR-60 Slip Not Replacement Pads. 15"x18” No Bid 54.89 109.78 No Bid
Mark V Basketball Scorebook.
No Bid 5.89 17.67 Champion 2.95 8.85
Alternate bid Mark v 6.74 20.22
Reversible Red/White Practice Jerseys w/numbers on both sides.
Numbers 1-5, 5-10, 20-23. No Bid | One color #s 15.89 238.35 No Bid
Shipping and delivery on above items charges
Athens Girls Basketball
73072XK. Away Jerseys. Russell Performance Racer Back Jersey.
Red. Color 1TH. Front Lettering Placement #7 screened on “ATHENS”
(4"inch). Number (6inch). Back Lettering Placement #6 full back. Sizes
2-Small #'s 5,11. 8-Medium #'s 3,4,10,12,14,20,33,23. 4-Large #'s
15,24,41,42. 1—XLarge #35. No Bid One color lettering 42.89 643.35 No Bid
73172XK. Shorts. Color TRW. Front Placement #18 screened on:
Block A (white standard size). Sizes 2-Small. 8-Medium. 4-Large. 1-
XLarge. No Bid 36.89 553.35 No Bid
73072XK. Home Jerseys. Russell Performance Racer Back Jersey.
White. Color 3WT. Front Lettering Placement #7 screened on
“ATHENS” (4inch) Number (6inch). Back Lettering Placement #6 full
back. Sizes 2-Small #'s 5,11. 8-Medium #'s 3,4,10,12,14,20,33,23. 4-
Large #'s 15,24,41,42. 1-XLarge #35. No Bid | | One color lettering 42.89 643.35 No Bid
73172XK. Short. Color WTR. Front Placement #18 screened on: Block
A.(True Red standard size). Sizes 2-Small. 8-Medium. 4-Large. 1-
XlLarge No Bid 36.89 553.35 No Bid
Slip Knot Refill
No Bid 54.89 109.78 No Bid
TF-1000. Spalding Basketballs. Size 28.5. (ZK Micor Fiber composite
construction). No Bid 37.89 454.68 35.45 425.40
Additional bid amount for above item.
Reversible Red & White Practice Jerseys. Screened on front both sides
“ATHENS BASKETBALL". Numbers on back, both sides #1-15. Sizes 2-
Small #s 1,2. 7-Medium #'s 3,4,5,6,7,8,9. 4-Large #'s 10,11,12,13. 2-
Xlarge #'s 14,15. No Bid | One color lettering 19.89 298.35 No Bid
Shipping and delivery on above items charges
Athens Gymnastics
416-785 AAIl Vault Runway — 1 3/8” No Bid 889.89 889.89 No Bid
NIU1048 Nike Team Training Il Medium Duffel. Red/Gray. No Bid No Bid No Bid

Shipping and delivery on above items charges

Athens Wrestling

Item #

Bloomfield Sports Shop

UNIT

PRICE

TOTAL

COST

No Bid
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Troy School District

BID 9539 ATHLETIC WINTER EQUIPMENT BID

DESCRIPTION

0239BLBL. Quad Ill. Brute Headgear. Red/Black

0262SC. Brute. Knee pads. Red. Solid Lycra. 10-Small. 10-Medium.

10-Large.

L7943J. Cliffkleen Singlet. Lycra. White. Ink Color Red. 14B-Red
Screened Hawk on back. 2” Redhawks on Left Leg. Sizes 5-Small, 6-

Medium, 7-Large, 4-Xlarge, 4-XXLarge.

YT620. Asics Cirro Jacket. Red w/White trim. Left Front Lettering: Troy
Athens — Bridge Style. Wrestling — Reverse Bridge Style. Back
“REDHAWKS?" Letter style — “Machine”. Sizes — 5-Small, 6-Medium, 7-

Large, 4-XLarge, 4-XXLarge.

YB622. Asics Cirro Pant. Red/White trim. Sizes — 5-Small, 6-Medium, 7-

Large, 4-XLarge, 4-XXLarge.
ZR491SC. Asics Chico Duffle Bag. Scarlet

Shipping and delivery on above items charges

Troy High School Girls Basketball

15 Player Basketball Scorebooks.

1-05679-179. 7’ Vinyl Extension Jump Ropes (2sets of 6).
1-05681-179. 8' Vinyl Extension Jump Ropes (2sets of 6).
1-05678-179. 8' Vinyl Estension Jump Ropes (2sets of 6)
1-26166-179. Half Cones — 48 piece pack.

1-09632-179. Accusplit 53 E Stopwatch. BSNcp pp253
Whistles

Additional bid amount for above item.
Long Sleeve Black Warm up shirts.

Alternate 1
Alternate 2
Alternate 3
Shipping and delivery on above items charges

Troy High School Synchronized Swim

7200000 - 01 Speedo Black Medalist Warm ups Jackets & Pants.
Double White Stripe down arm and leg, hood & double front pocket
jacket. Embroidered on right chest & right upper leg. “Troy High
Synchro” under a picture of a synchro girl. 4-XSmall, 8-Small.

Black Equipment Bags.

SP-XZ Pin. Synchro Pin from Hasty Awards.

Pyramid Park Athletic Supply Ts4U
UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
Alternate Iltem# PRICE COST | Alternate Item # PRICE COST | Alternate Item # PRICE CosT
14.99 224.85 19.89 298.35 No Bid
22.98 689.40 29.39 881.70 No Bid
49.95 1,298.70 59.89 1,557.14 No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
Champion BB1 2.99 8.97 5.89 17.67 Champion 2.95 8.85
Ajusta length jump
Champion SP47-6 4.99 9.98 No Bid rope 7-9' 12.05 24.10
Ajusta length jump
Champion SPR8-6 5.99 11.98 No Bid rope 7-9' 12.05 24.10
Ajusta length jump
Champion SPR9-6 6.99 13.98 No Bid rope 7-9' 12.05 24.10
Crazy Cones 2/25
No Bid 39.95 39.95 sets w/carrier 17.20 17.20
Number
correction #3$3E 10.98 54.90 No Bid No Bid
Fox40 Black OR
Champion 501 0.45 2.25 4.95 24.75 color 3.85 19.25
Spectrum pealess 2.80 14.00
No Bid No Bid Mens Eagle Y s-xl 7.75 155.00
As-xl 8.75 175.00
A xxl 10.25 205.00
A xxxI 12.00 240.00
No Bid No Bid No Bid
Champion MB21-
(24"x36" BLACK 4.95 59.40 No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid

Item #

Bloomfield Sports Shop

UNIT

PRICE

18.85

28.60

TOTAL

COST

282.75

858.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
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Troy School District

BID 9539 ATHLETIC WINTER EQUIPMENT BID

Pyramid Park Athletic Supply Ts4U
UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
DESCRIPTION Alternate ltem# PRICE COST Alternate ltem# PRICE COST Alternate Item # PRICE COST
Shipping and delivery on above items charges
Troy High School Boys Basketball
Reversible Scrimmage Jerseys. #'s 1-50. Sizes 6-Medium, 20-Large, 24-
XLarge. No Bid 15.89 794.50 No Bid
alternate
TF-1000-61-1059. Top Flite Basketballs.
No Bid 34.89 418.68 = TF1000WC 31.90 382.80
VPM-1. 9.5 x 15.5 Playmakers. No Bid 18.89 113.34 No Bid
K-451. Bold Line Pens No Bid 3.95 23.70 No Bid
SNR-60. Slipp Nott Pads. No Bid 54.89 54.89 No Bid
Mark V Scorebooks No Bid 5.89 23.56 | Champion 2.85 11.40
alternate Mark V 6.74 26.96
o 6" Spectrum Poly
MGC 6" Mini Cones Champion  C6 3.45 41.40 3.89 46.68 | | Cones 2.40 28.80
Roll A Bin No Bid TC306  389.89 389.89 No Bid
Shipping and delivery on above items charges
Troy High School Wrestling
235. Brute Quad Il Ear guard (HG) or comparable. Black/Grey
14.99 179.88 17.89 214.68 No Bid
Additional bid amount for above item.
FG3. Face Guard (Black) Clift Keen 47.95 95.90 44.89 89.78 No Bid
ZD712. Asics Gel Reversible kneepads. Black/White. Sizes — 2-Small,
4-Medium, 4-Large, 2-XLarge. No Bid | Keen Blk/Kelly LK69 34.89 418.68 No Bid
WWMTA4. 4" Mat Tape.
119.76 239.52 | Champion A168 79.89 159.78 | Case/72 288.50 577.00
W343H. 3-Sided, Tripod-Mounted Score Clocks. 17"x16"x16". No Bid No Bid No Bid
Holloway Flagship Jacket. Black/Scarlet. White Lettering “TC Wrestling”
on Front. “Troy” on back. Sizes — 2-Small, 4-Medium, 4-Large, 2-XLarge
No Bid 59.25 711.00 No Bid
Holloway Jogger Pant. Black. 2-Small, 4-Medium, 4-Large, 2-XLarge.
No Bid 26.25 315.00 No Bid
Shipping and delivery on above items charges
Baker Middle School Boys' Basketball
Whistles Fox 40 Colors OR
Champion 501 0.45 0.90 4.95 9.90 | Black 3.85 7.70
Alternate Whistles Spectrum pealess 280 5.60
Lanyards
Champion 126BK 0.33 0.66 2.95 5.90 | | Regular 0.38 0.76
Alternate Lanyards Breakaway 0.59 1.18

Bloomfield Sports Shop

Item #

Quad 1110239 (Quad Il
stopped prod)

Brute 4" x 84"

UNIT

PRICE

18.85

90.72

TOTAL

COST

No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

226.20
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Troy School District

BID 9539 ATHLETIC WINTER EQUIPMENT BID

Pyramid Park Athletic Supply Ts4U
UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
DESCRIPTION Alternate ltem# PRICE COST Alternate ltem# PRICE COST Alternate Item # PRICE COST
Big Red Basketball Scorebooks. 20 Player. No Bid 7.95 15.90 No Bid
TF-1000. Men's Basketballs. Spalding ZK Microfiber Composite
No Bid 37.89 454.68 35.45 425.40
Alternate
Boulan Park Middle Boys Basketball
SNB-P Slipp Nott Base & Pad No Bid 119.89 119.89 No Bid
Larson Middle School Boys Basketball
Pure Shot — Korney Board. 1 Left Hand. 5 Right Hand. No Bid 15.00 90.00 No Bid
TF-1000 Basketballs
No Bid 34.89 209.34 31.90 191.40
Korney Board Aids. Bandit Shooting Aid. No Bid 49.89 99.78 No Bid
TB102 Korney Board Master Toss Back. No Bid 409.89 409.89 No Bid
. . Fox 40 Colors OR
Regular Classic Fox Whistles. No Bid 6.95 4170 | Black 385 23.10
alternate item Spectrum pealess 2.80 16.80
Scrimmage Vests. Reversible. Navy Blue/White. 10-Small, 15-Medium,
15-Large, 10-XLarge. Numbered 1-50. No Bid 15.89 794.50 No Bid
alternate item
Shipping and delivery on above items charges
Smith Middle School Volleyball
SVSWH Tachakara Game Balls.
31.99 191.94 41.89 251.34 No Bid
TOTALS 3,124.61 14,064.20 3,485.37

Item #

Bloomfield Sports Shop
UNIT TOTAL

PRICE COST

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

1,548.39
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Troy School District

BID 9539 ATHLETIC WINTER EQUIPMENT BID

Forsports Dimmer-Warren Dee's Sport Shop, Inc.
UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
DESCRIPTION Alternate Item # PRICE COST Alternate Item # PRICE COST Alternate Item # PRICE COST
Athens Boys Basketball
64-4968. Men’s TF-1000 ZK Pro Basketballs 10 x 14” 34.95 419.40 32.45 389.40 ZK PRO 29.20 350.40
SNR-60 Slip Not Replacement Pads. 15"x18" Trac Mate 24" x 17" 51.00 102.00 29.75 59.50
Mark V Basketball Scorebook.
4.60 13.80 4.50 13.50
Alternate bid -
Reversible Red/White Practice Jerseys w/numbers on both sides.
Numbers 1-5, 5-10, 20-23. 8.50 127.50 10.40 156.00 Martin Rtazo 8.95 134.25
Shipping and delivery on above items charges
Athens Girls Basketball -
73072XK. Away Jerseys. Russell Performance Racer Back Jersey.
Red. Color 1TH. Front Lettering Placement #7 screened on “ATHENS”
(4"inch). Number (6inch). Back Lettering Placement #6 full back. Sizes
2-Small #'s 5,11. 8-Medium #'s 3,4,10,12,14,20,33,23. 4-Large #'s
15,24,41,42. 1-XLarge #35. 39.75 596.25 36.90 553.50 No Bid
73172XK. Shorts. Color TRW. Front Placement #18 screened on:
Block A (white standard size). Sizes 2-Small. 8-Medium. 4-Large. 1-
XLarge. 34.00 510.00 33.00 495.00 No Bid
73072XK. Home Jerseys. Russell Performance Racer Back Jersey.
White. Color 3WT. Front Lettering Placement #7 screened on
“ATHENS” (4inch) Number (6inch). Back Lettering Placement #6 full
back. Sizes 2-Small #'s 5,11. 8-Medium #'s 3,4,10,12,14,20,33,23. 4-
Large #s 15,24,41,42. 1-XLarge #35. 39.75 596.25 36.90 553.50 No Bid
73172XK. Short. Color WTR. Front Placement #18 screened on: Block
A.(True Red standard size). Sizes 2-Small. 8-Medium. 4-Large. 1-
XlLarge 34.00 510.00 36.90 553.50 No Bid
Slip Knot Refill
Trac Mate 24" x 17" 51.00 102.00 29.75 59.50 No Bid
TF-1000. Spalding Basketballs. Size 28.5. (ZK Micor Fiber composite
construction). 34.95 419.40 32.45 389.40 | ZKPRO 644989  29.20 350.40
Additional bid amount for above item. TF1000 611059  26.20 314.40
Reversible Red & White Practice Jerseys. Screened on front both sides
“ATHENS BASKETBALL". Numbers on back, both sides #1-15. Sizes 2-
Small #s 1,2. 7-Medium #'s 3,4,5,6,7,8,9. 4-Large #'s 10,11,12,13. 2-
Xlarge #'s 14,15. 11.25 168.75 13.75 206.25 Martin Rtazo 12.5 187.50
Shipping and delivery on above items charges
Athens Gymnastics -
416-785 AAI Vault Runway — 1 3/8" No Bid 860.00 860.00 No Bid
NIU1048 Nike Team Training Il Medium Duffel. Red/Gray. No Bid No Bid No Bid

Shipping and delivery on above items charges

Athens Wrestling
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Troy School District

BID 9539 ATHLETIC WINTER EQUIPMENT BID

DESCRIPTION

0239BLBL. Quad Ill. Brute Headgear. Red/Black

0262SC. Brute. Knee pads. Red. Solid Lycra. 10-Small. 10-Medium.

10-Large.

L7943J. Cliffkleen Singlet. Lycra. White. Ink Color Red. 14B-Red
Screened Hawk on back. 2” Redhawks on Left Leg. Sizes 5-Small, 6-

Medium, 7-Large, 4-Xlarge, 4-XXLarge.

YT620. Asics Cirro Jacket. Red w/White trim. Left Front Lettering: Troy
Athens — Bridge Style. Wrestling — Reverse Bridge Style. Back
“REDHAWKS?" Letter style — “Machine”. Sizes — 5-Small, 6-Medium, 7-

Large, 4-XLarge, 4-XXLarge.

YB622. Asics Cirro Pant. Red/White trim. Sizes — 5-Small, 6-Medium, 7-

Large, 4-XLarge, 4-XXLarge.
ZR491SC. Asics Chico Duffle Bag. Scarlet

Shipping and delivery on above items charges

Troy High School Girls Basketball

15 Player Basketball Scorebooks.

1-05679-179. 7’ Vinyl Extension Jump Ropes (2sets of 6).
1-05681-179. 8' Vinyl Extension Jump Ropes (2sets of 6).
1-05678-179. 8' Vinyl Estension Jump Ropes (2sets of 6)
1-26166-179. Half Cones — 48 piece pack.

1-09632-179. Accusplit 53 E Stopwatch. BSNcp pp253
Whistles

Additional bid amount for above item.
Long Sleeve Black Warm up shirts.

Alternate 1
Alternate 2
Alternate 3
Shipping and delivery on above items charges

Troy High School Synchronized Swim

7200000 - 01 Speedo Black Medalist Warm ups Jackets & Pants.
Double White Stripe down arm and leg, hood & double front pocket
jacket. Embroidered on right chest & right upper leg. “Troy High
Synchro” under a picture of a synchro girl. 4-XSmall, 8-Small.

Black Equipment Bags.

SP-XZ Pin. Synchro Pin from Hasty Awards.

Forsports Dimmer-Warren Dee's Sport Shop, Inc.
UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
Alternate Item # PRICE COST Alternate Item # PRICE COST Alternate Item # PRICE COST
No Bid 17.40 261.00 No Bid
No Bid 24.50 735.00 No Bid
No Bid 28.95 752.70 No Bid
42.00  1,092.00 39.20 1,019.20 No Bid
21.00 546.00 24.70 642.20 No Bid
No prod for 08,
suggests Asics small
17.75 266.25 | duffle ZR821 24.50 367.50 No Bid
4.60 13.80 4.50 13.50 No Bid
($1.85 ea rope) 11.10 22.20 No Bid No Bid
SR8 ($1.95 ea) 11.70 23.40 No Bid No Bid
SR9 ($2.20 ea) 12.60 25.20 No Bid No Bid
PC3 28.80 28.80 No Bid No Bid
No Bid 9.45 47.25 No Bid
Acme 660 2.00 10.00 0.80 4.00 No Bid
- No Bid
Russell - Dozen 13.00 260.00 Wickered Shirt 788 10.75 215.00 No Bid
- No Bid
- No Bid
- No Bid
As wanted...see
No Bid attached 69.50 834.00 No Bid
Reach 622 16.00 192.00 9.85 118.20 Carline 5525 24x12x12 12.00 144.00
No Bid No Bid No Bid
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Troy School District

BID 9539 ATHLETIC WINTER EQUIPMENT BID

DESCRIPTION

Shipping and delivery on above items charges

Troy High School Boys Basketball

Reversible Scrimmage Jerseys. #'s 1-50. Sizes 6-Medium, 20-Large, 24-

XLarge.
alternate

TF-1000-61-1059. Top Flite Basketballs.

VPM-1. 9.5 x 15.5 Playmakers.

K-451. Bold Line Pens

SNR-60. Slipp Nott Pads.

Mark V Scorebooks

alternate

MGC 6” Mini Cones

Roll A Bin

Shipping and delivery on above items charges

Troy High School Wrestling
235. Brute Quad Il Ear guard (HG) or comparable. Black/Grey

Additional bid amount for above item.
FG3. Face Guard (Black)

ZD712. Asics Gel Reversible kneepads. Black/White. Sizes — 2-Small,
4-Medium, 4-Large, 2-XLarge.
WWMTA4. 4" Mat Tape.

W343H. 3-Sided, Tripod-Mounted Score Clocks. 17"x16"x16".

Holloway Flagship Jacket. Black/Scarlet. White Lettering “TC Wrestling”
on Front. “Troy” on back. Sizes — 2-Small, 4-Medium, 4-Large, 2-XLarge
Holloway Jogger Pant. Black. 2-Small, 4-Medium, 4-Large, 2-XLarge.

Shipping and delivery on above items charges

Baker Middle School Boys’ Basketball

Whistles

Alternate Whistles
Lanyards

Alternate Lanyards

Forsports Dimmer-Warren Dee's Sport Shop, Inc.
UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
Alternate Item # PRICE COST Alternate Item # PRICE COST Alternate Item # PRICE COST
Numbers one side 8.10 405.00 7.75 387.50 HS2-SIAR numbers on one side 8.95 447.50
Martine Rtazo 7.75 387.50
2KPro 34.95 419.40 29.25 351.00 No Bid
No Bid 13.75 82.50 No Bid
No Bid 1.90 11.40 No Bid
Trac Mate 51.00 51.00 29.75 29.75 No Bid
4.60 18.40 4.50 18.00 No Bid
- No Bid
0.55 6.60 3.80 45.60 No Bid
No Bid 556.00 556.00 No Bid
No Bid 11.40 136.80 No Bid
17.40 208.80 No Bid
No Bid 38.50 77.00 No Bid
8.10 97.20 22.75 273.00 No Bid
102.00 204.00 118.00 236.00 No Bid
No Bid 2,694.00 10,776.00 No Bid

900B Flagship

43.00 516.00 41.20 494.40 embroidered 39.00 468.00
22.00 264.00 23.75 285.00 9041 Jegger 22.00 264.00
2.00 4.00 0.80 1.60 No Bid
- No Bid
1.75 3.50 0.80 1.60 No Bid

No Bid




Troy School District

BID 9539 ATHLETIC WINTER EQUIPMENT BID

Forsports Dimmer-Warren Dee's Sport Shop, Inc.
UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
QTY Unit DESCRIPTION Alternate Item # PRICE COST Alternate Iltem # PRICE COST Alternate Item # PRICE COST
2 Big Red Basketball Scorebooks. 20 Player. 5.00 10.00 4.50 9.00 No Bid
12 ea TF-1000. Men's Basketballs. Spalding ZK Microfiber Composite
35.95 431.40 32.45 389.40 61-1059 26.20 314.40
Top Flite 1000 (same as
12 ea Alternate Larson) 29.25 351.00 -
Boulan Park Middle Boys Basketball
1 ea SNB-P Slipp Nott Base & Pad Trac Mate 148.95 148.95 51.00 51.00 No Bid
Larson Middle School Boys Basketball
6 ea Pure Shot — Korney Board. 1 Left Hand. 5 Right Hand. No Bid 11.40 68.40 10.25 61.50
6 ea TF-1000 Basketballs
34.95 209.70 29.25 175.50 | Spalding 61-1059 26.20 157.20
2 Korney Board Aids. Bandit Shooting Aid. No Bid 38.75 77.50 38.00 76.00
1 TB102 Korney Board Master Toss Back. No Bid 431.00 431.00 395.00 395.00
6 ea Regular Classic Fox Whistles. 275 375 22.50 No Bid
6 ea alternate item R _ R
50 ea Scrimmage Vests. Reversible. Navy Blue/White. 10-Small, 15-Medium,
15-Large, 10-XLarge. Numbered 1-50. Numbers on one side 8.10 405.00 7.75 387.50 | Martin Rtazo  numbers on one side 7.75 387.50
50 ea alternate item Martin Rtazo  number on two side 8.95 447.50
1 Shipping and delivery on above items charges
Smith Middle School Volleyball
6 ea SVSWH Tachakara Game Balls.
31.05 186.30 29.95 179.70 No Bid
TOTALS 9,428.20 25,413.05 4,887.05
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Troy School District

BID 9539 ATHLETIC WINTER EQUIPMENT BID

Service Sports

Signature Sports

DESCRIPTION Alternate

Athens Boys Basketball
64-4968. Men’s TF-1000 ZK Pro Basketballs 10 x 14”
SNR-60 Slip Not Replacement Pads. 15"x18”
Mark V Basketball Scorebook.

Alternate bid

Reversible Red/White Practice Jerseys w/numbers on both sides.
Numbers 1-5, 5-10, 20-23. Alleson
Shipping and delivery on above items charges

Athens Girls Basketball
73072XK. Away Jerseys. Russell Performance Racer Back Jersey.
Red. Color 1TH. Front Lettering Placement #7 screened on “ATHENS”
(4"inch). Number (6inch). Back Lettering Placement #6 full back. Sizes
2-Small #'s 5,11. 8-Medium #'s 3,4,10,12,14,20,33,23. 4-Large #'s
15,24,41,42. 1-XLarge #35.
73172XK. Shorts. Color TRW. Front Placement #18 screened on:
Block A (white standard size). Sizes 2-Small. 8-Medium. 4-Large. 1-
XLarge.
73072XK. Home Jerseys. Russell Performance Racer Back Jersey.
White. Color 3WT. Front Lettering Placement #7 screened on
“ATHENS” (4inch) Number (6inch). Back Lettering Placement #6 full
back. Sizes 2-Small #'s 5,11. 8-Medium #'s 3,4,10,12,14,20,33,23. 4-
Large #'s 15,24,41,42. 1-XLarge #35.
73172XK. Short. Color WTR. Front Placement #18 screened on: Block
A.(True Red standard size). Sizes 2-Small. 8-Medium. 4-Large. 1-
XLarge
Slip Knot Refill

TF-1000. Spalding Basketballs. Size 28.5. (ZK Micor Fiber composite
construction).
Additional bid amount for above item.
Reversible Red & White Practice Jerseys. Screened on front both sides
“ATHENS BASKETBALL". Numbers on back, both sides #1-15. Sizes 2-
Small #s 1,2. 7-Medium #'s 3,4,5,6,7,8,9. 4-Large #'s 10,11,12,13. 2-
Xlarge #'s 14,15. Allseon
Shipping and delivery on above items charges

Athens Gymnastics
416-785 AAIl Vault Runway — 1 3/8”
NIU1048 Nike Team Training Il Medium Duffel. Red/Gray.
Shipping and delivery on above items charges

Athens Wrestling

Item #

#570R #'s on back only!

one-color print

one-color print

one-color print

one-color print

#570RN 1-color print

UNIT

PRICE

33.90
35.75

4.50

12.00

39.90

35.75

39.90

35.75

35.75

33.90

18.80

TOTAL

COST

406.80
71.50

13.50

180.00

598.50

536.25

598.50

536.25

71.50

406.80

282.00

No Bid
No Bid

UNIT

Item # PRICE

4.95

9.50
10.00

One color bid 40.70

36.50

One color bid 40.70

36.50

13.00
15.00

23.80
6.00

TOTAL

COST

No Bid
No Bid

14.85

142.50
10.00

610.50

547.50

610.50

547.50

No Bid

No Bid

195.00
15.00

No Bid
380.80
6.00




QTY Unit
15
30 P
26
26
26
15
1
3 ea
2  set/é
2 setlé
2 | set/6
1 ea
5
5 ea
20
20
20
20
1
12
12
50

Troy School District

BID 9539 ATHLETIC WINTER EQUIPMENT BID

Service Sports

Signature Sports

DESCRIPTION Alternate

0239BLBL. Quad Ill. Brute Headgear. Red/Black

0262SC. Brute. Knee pads. Red. Solid Lycra. 10-Small. 10-Medium.
10-Large.

L7943J. Cliffkleen Singlet. Lycra. White. Ink Color Red. 14B-Red
Screened Hawk on back. 2” Redhawks on Left Leg. Sizes 5-Small, 6-
Medium, 7-Large, 4-Xlarge, 4-XXLarge.

YT620. Asics Cirro Jacket. Red w/White trim. Left Front Lettering: Troy
Athens — Bridge Style. Wrestling — Reverse Bridge Style. Back
“REDHAWKS?" Letter style — “Machine”. Sizes — 5-Small, 6-Medium, 7-
Large, 4-XLarge, 4-XXLarge.

YB622. Asics Cirro Pant. Red/White trim. Sizes — 5-Small, 6-Medium, 7-
Large, 4-XLarge, 4-XXLarge.

ZR491SC. Asics Chico Duffle Bag. Scarlet

Shipping and delivery on above items charges

Troy High School Girls Basketball
15 Player Basketball Scorebooks.

Mark V
1-05679-179. 7’ Vinyl Extension Jump Ropes (2sets of 6).
1-05681-179. 8' Vinyl Extension Jump Ropes (2sets of 6).
1-05678-179. 8' Vinyl Estension Jump Ropes (2sets of 6)
1-26166-179. Half Cones — 48 piece pack.
Martin

1-09632-179. Accusplit 53 E Stopwatch. BSNcp pp253
Whistles

Additional bid amount for above item.
Long Sleeve Black Warm up shirts.

Alternate 1
Alternate 2
Alternate 3
Shipping and delivery on above items charges

Troy High School Synchronized Swim
7200000 - 01 Speedo Black Medalist Warm ups Jackets & Pants.
Double White Stripe down arm and leg, hood & double front pocket
jacket. Embroidered on right chest & right upper leg. “Troy High
Synchro” under a picture of a synchro girl. 4-XSmall, 8-Small.

Black Equipment Bags.

SP-XZ Pin. Synchro Pin from Hasty Awards.

Item #

1-color print front &
back

no print

no print

#SFC6 yellow or
orange

Black plastic

No print 19"x9.5"x9.5"

UNIT

PRICE

20.50

29.90

37.40

42.50

25.75

21.40

4.50

30.90

2.00

10.50

TOTAL

COST

307.50

897.00

972.40

1,105.00

669.50

321.00

13.50
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

30.90
No Bid
10.00

No Bid

No Bid

126.00
No Bid

UNIT

Item # PRICE

16.75

13.25

39.00

All embroidery 41.00

29.30

New Style ZR921 22.90

10.00
4.95

Nike 4s dri-fit tee
w/logo on front 21.40
6.00
18.00

TOTAL

COST

251.25

397.50

1,014.00

1,066.00

761.80

343.50
10.00

14.85
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

428.00

No Bid

216.00
No Bid
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Troy School District

BID 9539 ATHLETIC WINTER EQUIPMENT BID

DESCRIPTION

Shipping and delivery on above items charges

Troy High School Boys Basketball
Reversible Scrimmage Jerseys. #'s 1-50. Sizes 6-Medium, 20-Large, 24-
XLarge.
alternate

TF-1000-61-1059. Top Flite Basketballs.

VPM-1. 9.5 x 15.5 Playmakers.

K-451. Bold Line Pens

SNR-60. Slipp Nott Pads.

Mark V Scorebooks

alternate

MGC 6” Mini Cones

Roll A Bin

Shipping and delivery on above items charges

Troy High School Wrestling
235. Brute Quad Il Ear guard (HG) or comparable. Black/Grey

Additional bid amount for above item.
FG3. Face Guard (Black)

ZD712. Asics Gel Reversible kneepads. Black/White. Sizes — 2-Small,
4-Medium, 4-Large, 2-XLarge.
WWMTA4. 4" Mat Tape.

W343H. 3-Sided, Tripod-Mounted Score Clocks. 17"x16"x16".

Holloway Flagship Jacket. Black/Scarlet. White Lettering “TC Wrestling”
on Front. “Troy” on back. Sizes — 2-Small, 4-Medium, 4-Large, 2-XLarge
Holloway Jogger Pant. Black. 2-Small, 4-Medium, 4-Large, 2-XLarge.

Shipping and delivery on above items charges

Baker Middle School Boys’ Basketball

Whistles

Alternate Whistles
Lanyards

Alternate Lanyards

Service Sports

Signature Sports

Alternate

Alleson

Korney

Korney

Brute

UNIT

Item # PRICE

#570R #s both backs
only 12.90

33.90
13.50
Package of 4 pens 6.75
Replacement pads 35.75

4.50

3.90
495.00

Quad Il #0239 20.50

46.25

22.90

141.60

#9043 47.40

#9041 No Print 26.90

Black plastic 2.00

1.00

TOTAL

COST

645.00

406.80
81.00
40.50
35.75

18.00

46.80
495.00

246.00

46.35

274.80

283.20
No Bid

568.80

322.80

4.00

2.00

Iltem #

All embroidery

UNIT

PRICE

6.00

9.50

6.00

16.75

38.00

13.00

47.00

24.50
15.00

TOTAL

COST

6.00

475.00

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

19.80
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
6.00

201.00

76.00

156.00

No Bid
No Bid

564.00

294.00
15.00

No Bid

No Bid
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Troy School District

BID 9539 ATHLETIC WINTER EQUIPMENT BID

DESCRIPTION

Big Red Basketball Scorebooks. 20 Player.
TF-1000. Men's Basketballs. Spalding ZK Microfiber Composite

Alternate

Boulan Park Middle Boys Basketball
SNB-P Slipp Nott Base & Pad

Larson Middle School Boys Basketball
Pure Shot — Korney Board. 1 Left Hand. 5 Right Hand.
TF-1000 Basketballs

Korney Board Aids. Bandit Shooting Aid.
TB102 Korney Board Master Toss Back.
Regular Classic Fox Whistles.

alternate item

Scrimmage Vests. Reversible. Navy Blue/White. 10-Small, 15-Medium,
15-Large, 10-XLarge. Numbered 1-50.
alternate item

Shipping and delivery on above items charges

Smith Middle School Volleyball
SVSWH Tachakara Game Balls.

TOTALS

Service Sports

Signature Sports

Alternate

Alleson

UNIT

Item # PRICE

#5035 4.75

33.90

82.25

9.90

33.90
39.75
290.00

6.25

#570R #s both backs
only 12.90

SUSWH 32.75

TOTAL

COST

9.50

406.80

82.25

59.40

203.40
79.50
290.00

37.50

645.00

196.50

13,681.05

UNIT

Item # PRICE

6.00

TOTAL

COST

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

475.00

6.00

No Bid

9,882.85
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	       TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT
	    1140 RANKIN, TROY, MICHIGAN 48083
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	Athens Boys Basketball




