REQUEST FOR
QUOTATION

No.

9613 TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT

DUE DATE

6/5/09

O LATER THAN 1140 RANKIN, TROY, MICHIGAN 48083
3p.m. 248-823-4052

FAX: 248-823-4077

DATE

5/22/09

REQUEST FOR QUOTE — NOT AN ORDER

THIS FORM MUST BE UTILIZED WHEN RESPONDING TO THIS REQUEST
BID ENVELOPE ENCLOSED

THE RFQ NUMBER MUST APPEAR ON ALL QUOTATIONS AND RELATED CORRESPONDENCE, THIS IS NOT AN ORDER

Quantity

DESCRIPTION

UNIT PRICE

AMOUNT

Please supply us with your bid to furnish the Troy School District with MUSICAL
INSTRUMENTS

Copies of the bid are available at:
www.troy.k12.mi.us/purchasing/items_out_for_bid.htm (left column)
Bid recaps will be available at:

www.troy.k12.mi.us/purchasing/items_out_for_bid.htm (right column)

FACSIMILE BID IS NOT ACCEPTABLE

Bids will not be accepted if submitted after the deadline specified (local time) in the advertisement to bid or in the information to
bidders. The late submission of a bid makes the bid nonrepsonsive and is a material defect which shall not be waived by the
Board of Education. Delays in the mail will not be considered. All Late bids in the mail will be returned to the bidder unopened.

Proposal for the submission of alternatives by vendors will be accepted and reviewed. However, if any substitution or departure
is not clearly noted and described, it will be understood that the bid intends to exactly meet the specifications.

The Board of Education shall be the sole judge as to whether the proposed goods are “equal” or “approved”. Quotations must
be mailed or delivered to the Purchasing Office, 1140 Rankin, Troy, MI 48083 no later than 3 p.m. on the date shown above.
Michigan State Sales and Use Taxes and Federal Excise Taxes do not apply unless otherwise indicated. Exemption certificates
will be furnished when necessary. This request imposes no obligations on the buyer. The Board of Education reserves the right
to accept or reject any or all bids or to split awards by items or to accept bids, which will best serve the Board of Education.

THIS AREA MUST BE FILLED IN

DELIVERY TIME

TELEPHONE
PRICES FIRM FOR NAME OF COMPANY NO.

TERMS

NO. & STREET FAX #

FOB
DELIVERED

ALL DELIVERY CHARGES

MUST CITY, STATE & ZIP CODE E-MAIL

BE INCLUDED IN PRICES SHOWN

CONTACT PERSON (PLEASE PRINT) SIGNATURE DATE




Note: All bidders are specifically reminded that a completed Affidavit of Bidder
(Familial Disclosure) MUST be completed and submitted with the bid response.
Failure to include a completed copy will be grounds for disqualification of bid.
The Affidavit of Bidder is required to be notarized for construction bids only. All
others only require completion and signature.

AFFIDAVIT OF BIDDER

The undersigned, the owner or authorized officer of
(the “Bidder), pursuant to the familial disclosure requirement provided in the
(the *“School District”) advertisement for construction bids, hereby
represent and warrant except as provided below, that no familial relationships exist
between the over(s) or any employee of
and any member of the Board of Education of the
School District or the Superintendent of the School District.

List any Familial Relationships:

BIDDER:
By:
Its:
STATE OF MICHIGAN )
COUNTY OF ))SS'
This instrument was acknowledged before meonthe _ day of , 20009,

by

,Notary Public

County, Michigan

My Commission Expires:

Acting in the County of:




Troy School District
Musical Instruments

Bid 9613
QTY DESCRIPTION SHIP TO UNIT UNIT
COST FREIGHT
3 pair | Sabian B8 Band Cymbals 16” 4420 Livernois
Troy, Ml 48098
3 pair | Sabian B8 Band Cymbals 18" 4420 Livernois
Troy, Ml 48098
3 Selmer 1430LP Plastic Bass 4420 Livernois
Clarinet Troy, Ml 48098
1 Musser M8055 Vibraphone w/All 4420 Livernois
Terrain Cart w/motor Troy, MI 48098
1 Wenger Percussion Cabinet Athens H.S.
w/accessories, Evening Tigris 4333 John R.

Color Scheme

Troy, M1 48085

**ALL ITEMS MUST BE DELIVERED BY JUNE 30, 2009.**
NO EXCEPTIONS.

Troy School District will have no financial obligation for items received after above specified date.

Company:

Address:

City:

State:

Zip:




Troy School District
Musical Instruments
Bid 9613
Interstate Music National Ed. Music Co. Midwest Musical Import Wenger Corp. Music is Elementary
Qty Description Alt Unit Cost | Unit Frt Total Unit Cost | Unit Frt Total Unit Cost | Unit Frt Total Unit Cost | Unit Frt Total Unit Cost |  Unit Frt Total
3 Sabian B8 Band Cymbals 16" Cym 41622 104.00 - 312.00 no bid 119.00 incl 357.00 no bid 125.95 377.85 1,511.40
3 Sabian B8 Band Cymbals 18" Cym 41822 121.00 - 363.00 no bid 146.00 @ incl 438.00 no bid 137.95 413.85 1,655.40
Selmer 1430LP Plastic Bass
3 Clarinet 1,181.00 - 3,543.00 1,103.00 | 3,309.00 | 13,236.00 no bid no bid 1,225.00 | 3,675.00 | 14,700.00
Musser M8055 Vibraphone w/All
1 Terrain Cart w/motor 3,745.00 - 3,745.00 3,388.00  3,388.00 6,776.00 3,647.00 incl 3,647.00 no bid no bid
Wenger Percussion Cabinet
1 wi/accessories no bid no bid no bid 1,479.00 207.00  1,686.00 no bid
Evola Music: No Response
Peripole Bergerault: No Bid
Shar Products: No Bid




Troy School District
Musical Instruments
Bid 9613
The Woodwind & Brasswind Taylor Music Inc. Washington Music Center Anderson Music Co.
Qty Description Note: Unit Cost | Unit Frt Total Alt | Unit Cost Unit Frt Total Alt Unit Cost | Unit Frt Total Unit Cost | Unit Frt Total
41622 - 30
3 Sabian B8 Band Cymbals 16" in stock 135.00 405.00 1,620.00 41622  122.00 366.00 1,464.00  day dlvry 112.00  336.00 = 1,344.00 135.00 405.00 1,620.00
41822 - 30
3 Sabian B8 Band Cymbals 18" in stock 148.00 444.00 1,776.00 41822  139.00 417.00 1,668.00  day dlvry 130.00 = 390.00 = 1,560.00 165.00 495.00 1,980.00
Selmer 1430LP Plastic Bass
3 Clarinet notinstock | 1,298.00 | 3,894.00 | 15,576.00 1,155.00 = 3,465.00  13,860.00 3wkdivry | 1,092.00 - 3,276.00 1,440.00 | 4,320.00 | 17,280.00
Musser M8055 Vibraphone w/All
1 Terrain Cart w/motor 2 in stock 4,250.00 incl 4,250.00 3,577.00 3,577.00  7,154.00 3wkdlvry | 3,591.00 - 3,591.00 4,450.00 | 4,450.00  8,900.00
Wenger Percussion Cabinet 147G001 -
1 wi/accessories no bid no bid 45 day divry  2,154.00 - 2,154.00 no bid




Troy School District
Musical Instruments
Bid 9613
Northeast Music Inc.
Qty Description Unit Cost | Unit Frt Total
3 Sabian B8 Band Cymbals 16" no bid
3 Sabian B8 Band Cymbals 18" no bid
Selmer 1430LP Plastic Bass
3 |Clarinet 1,677.00 | 5,031.00 = 20,124.00
Musser M8055 Vibraphone w/All
1 Terrain Cart w/motor no bid

Wenger Percussion Cabinet
w/accessories

no bid




