REQUEST FOR
QUOTATION

9615 TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT

No.
CEoAE MO LATER THAN 1140 RANKIN, TROY, MICHIGAN 48083
FAX: 248-823-4077 DATE  §/24/09
REQUEST FOR QUOTE — NOT AN ORDER
THIS FORM MUST BE UTILIZED WHEN RESPONDING TO THIS REQUEST
BID ENVELOPE ENCLOSED
THE RFQ NUMBER MUST APPEAR ON ALL QUOTATIONS AND RELATED CORRESPONDENCE, THIS IS NOT AN ORDER
Quantity DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
Please supply us with your bid to furnish the Troy School District with MEDIA CENTER
BOOKS FOR 2009/10, 2010/11 AND 2011/12.
Copies of the bid are available at:
www.troy.k12.mi.us/purchasing/items_out_for_bid.htm (left column)
Bid recaps will be available at:
www.troy.k12.mi.us/purchasing/items_out_for_bid.htm (right column)

FACSIMILE BID IS NOT ACCEPTABLE

Bids will not be accepted if submitted after the deadline specified (local time) in the advertisement to bid or in the information to

bidders. The late submission of a bid makes the bid nonrepsonsive and is a material defect which shall not be waived by the

Board of Education. Delays in the mail will not be considered. All Late bids in the mail will be returned to the bidder unopened.

Proposal for the submission of alternatives by vendors will be accepted and reviewed. However, if any substitution or departure

is not clearly noted and described, it will be understood that the bid intends to exactly meet the specifications.

The Board of Education shall be the sole judge as to whether the proposed goods are “equal” or “approved”. Quotations must

be mailed or delivered to the Purchasing Office, 1140 Rankin, Troy, MI 48083 no later than 3 p.m. on the date shown above.

Michigan State Sales and Use Taxes and Federal Excise Taxes do not apply unless otherwise indicated. Exemption certificates

will be furnished when necessary. This request imposes no obligations on the buyer. The Board of Education reserves the right

to accept or reject any or all bids or to split awards by items or to accept bids, which will best serve the Board of Education.

THIS AREA MUST BE FILLED IN
TELEPHONE

DELIVERY TIME PRICES FIRM FOR NAME OF COMPANY NO.
TERMS NO. & STREET FAX #

ALL DELIVERY CHARGES
FOB MUST CITY, STATE & ZIP CODE E-MAIL
DELIVERED BE INCLUDED IN PRICES SHOWN
CONTACT PERSON (PLEASE PRINT) SIGNATURE DATE




Note: All bidders are specifically reminded that a completed Affidavit of Bidder
(Familial Disclosure) MUST be completed and submitted with the bid response.
Failure to include a completed copy will be grounds for disqualification of bid.
The Affidavit of Bidder is required to be notarized for construction bids only. All
others only require completion and signature.

AFFIDAVIT OF BIDDER

The undersigned, the owner or authorized officer of
(the “Bidder), pursuant to the familial disclosure requirement provided in the
(the *“School District”) advertisement for construction bids, hereby
represent and warrant except as provided below, that no familial relationships exist
between the over(s) or any employee of
and any member of the Board of Education of the
School District or the Superintendent of the School District.

List any Familial Relationships:

BIDDER:
By:
Its:
STATE OF MICHIGAN )
COUNTY OF ))SS'
This instrument was acknowledged before meonthe _ day of , 20009,

by

,Notary Public

County, Michigan

My Commission Expires:

Acting in the County of:




TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT
MEDIA CENTER BOOKS
BID 9615

The Troy School District is seeking qualified vendors to provide media center books for its Elementary
school program (grades K through 5) for the 2009/10, 2010/11 and 2011/12 school years.

Potential bidders will be asked to provide pricing on the attached sample listing as well as reply to
several questions to allow the District to ascertain vendor’s ability to provide products under this bid.
Non-response to any of the required questions may result in disqualification of respondent’s bid.

IN ADDITION TO PROVIDING INDIVIDUAL PRICING ON THE SAMPLE LISTING, BIDDERS SHALL
INDICATE A GUARANTEED PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT OFF BASE PRICE FOR ALL TITLES TO
BE PURCHASED BY TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT THROUGH JUNE 30, 2012. CLEARLY INDICATE
HOW THIS DISTRICT-SPECIFIC DISCOUNT WILL IMPACT OVERALL COST.

Bidders who have questions about this bid may submit questions to bids@troy.k12.mi.us before 4:00
p.m. Eastern Daylight Time on Wednesday, July 1, 2009. Questions will be logged at that time and
answered via Addendum ONLY no later than 2:00 p.m. Wednesday, July 8, 2009 at
http://www.troy.k12.mi.us/purchasing/items_out for_bid.htm. Bidders are responsible for reviewing
the web site prior to final bid submission and for ensuring that their bid complies with changes
made via addenda, if any.

The following specifications will pertain to this bid:

BID/PERFORMANCE SPECIFICATIONS

Price alone shall not be a factor in the award of the bid. Other factors to be considered are the
reliability of the bidder, quality of the supplies and services, conformity with specifications,
satisfaction of delivery dates, fill rates and adherence in providing information.

Please initial next to each statement to indicate compliance. Each
statement with which bidder cannot comply shall be accompanied by a
written explanation on a separate page.

1. Vendor shall not charge shipping for books, CD-ROMs and audio visual
materials.

2. Vendor will provide a 95-100% fill rate within 20 days ARO. If a backorder is
necessary, it would be shipped within 60 days ARO.

3. Prices quoted on “Typing Service” will be guaranteed for 60 days.

4. Vendor will provide complete/enhanced MARC records for 100% of all books,
CD-ROMSs, and audiovisual materials.

5. Every MARC record will contain shelflist information including but not limited to:

reading level, interest level, review sources, full annotation, complete Library of

Congress subject heading and added entries.

Vendor can supply complete information in the 949 tag. (Dynix)

Vendor will send a MARC record for titles received in the order only. MARC

records will not contain titles that were not shipped.

No


mailto:bids@troy.k12.mi.us
http://www.troy.k12.mi.us/purchasing/items_out_for_bid.htm

8. Vendor can supply Accelerated Reader book titles, standard and custom test
disks and A/R processing to include the 526 tag, info label and spine label. The
AR Information Label will contain the author, reading level, point value and quiz
number.

9. Vendor can designate (with a symbol) which titles on a printout are for the
Accelerated Reader/Reading Counts program.

10. Vendor will provide their available titles on the Internet. Online inventory will be
updated weekly. Vendor will have the ability to track orders on-line from start to
finish by looking at the current status, as well as the history.

11. Internet electronic ordering system must allow for true collection development
and must include the following searching parameters: keyword, reading level,
and interest level, review source, A/R, Reading Counts, number of pages, State
Standards, State Lists, Award Winners, etc.

12. Vendor will provide direct online access to current review sources from one of the
following sources: School Library Journal, Booklist or Kirkus.

13. Vendor will provide training for on-line ordering and collection development
systems at no charge to the school district.

14. Vendor will provide a cataloging and processing service that can be individually
tailored to specifically meet the needs of each individual campus.

15. Vendor will not have a minimum order requirement or handling/restocking
charge.

16. If the specified binding choice is not provided, the material will be replaced or
refunded at no cost.

17. Vendor will provide lists of titles that have received recommendations and/or
awards including State Standards, State Lists and Awards, apart from the regular
catalog.

18. K-12 libraries should be at least 75% of the vendor’s business.

Additional Information Requirements (Please respond to each
guestion. Non-response to these questions may disqualify
respondent’s bid)

1. What is the procedure for obtaining priority titles?

2. What percentage of your business is to retail? % To school libraries? %
To public libraries? %

3. Specify any additional costs for processing of books with the following NOTE: A
response of 0 indicates available at no cost. If not available from bidder, respond
with “N/A”
attached spine labels
attached barcodes
hot spine stamping
Kapco covers on paperbacks
laminated and attached dust jackets
reading program MARC tag and/or label

@ B BB BB



4. Indicate the percentage of titles and volumes carried in your warehouse stock
suitable for K-12 students.
% Trade
% Publisher Library
% Other hardcover

Bidder acknowledges receipt of and response to the following addenda:

Addendum # Dated

Addendum # Dated

Addendum # Dated

Company

Address

City State Zip

Phone Fax

Email




TITLE

DRAW 50 CARS, TRUCKS, AND MOTORCYCLES
CHAINS

ANDALITE'S GIFT

INVENTION

DEER FAMILY (NOT BOUND MAGAZINE)
STELLALUNA
HURRICANE AND TORNADO (REV. ED.)
HOW TO DRAW PEOPLE

BLUE SKIES, FRENCH FRIES
GRACE FOR PRESIDENT

HUNDRED DRESSES

FRAGILE THINGS

CHECK IT OUT THE BOOK ABOUT LIBRARIES
PLANETS (2008 ED.)

MR. MESSY

STAR OF FEAR, STAR OF HOPE

STORY OF THE DETROIT PISTONS
CRAZY LIKE A FOX

| SPY GOLD CHALLENGER

BRISINGR

THUNDER CAKE

EVE OF THE EMPEROR PENGUIN
GREAT LAKES GHOST SHIPS
UNWILLING UMPIRE

TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT
BID 9615
ELEMENTARY TITLES

AUTHOR BEST BINDING TYPE

HC, PB, LIBRARY,
PRE-BOUND, (LIST
OTHER)

AMES
ANDERSON
APPLEGATE
BENDER

BIEL
CANNON
CHALLONER
COURT
DELTON
DIPUCCHIO
ESTES
GAIMAN
GIBBONS
GIBBONS
HARGREAVES
HOESTLANDT
LEBOUTILLIER
LEEDY
MARZOLLO
PAOLINI
POLACCO
POPE

RAND

ROY

AVAILABILITY

IN-STOCK, B/O,
SPECIAL ORDER,
(LIST OTHER)

PRICE

ISBN




TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT

BID 9615
ELEMENTARY TITLES
TITLE AUTHOR BEST BINDING TYPE AVAILABILITY PRICE ISBN
HC, PB, LIBRARY, IN-STOCK, B/O,
PRE-BOUND, (LIST SPECIAL ORDER,
OTHER) (LIST OTHER)
VAMPIRE'S VACATION ROY
WHITE HOUSE WHITE OUT ROY
GHOST IN THE FIRST ROW WARNER
SECRET OF THE MASK WARNER
SNAKES (NOT BOUND MAGAZINE) WEXO
GUINNESS WORLD BOOK 2009
CHIPPER'S CRAZY CARNIVAL RAND
HOOT (sound recording) HIAASSEN
COMPANY:
ADDRESS:
CITY STATE ZIP
PHONE FAX




TITLE

CHAINS

ANDALITE'S GIFT

INVENTION

IMMIGRATION
HURRICANE AND TORNADO (REV. ED.)
HUNDRED DRESSES

FRAGILE THINGS

CULTURE IN NEW ZEALAND
CULTURE IN NORTH & SOUTH KOREA
CIVIL WARS IN AFRICA

STORY OF THE DETROIT PISTONS
FAMOUS BRIDGES OF THE WORLD
HITLER'S SHADOW WAR
STALINGRAD

REVOLUTION AND GENOCIDE
CALIFORNIA GOLD RUSH
BRISINGR

MYTHOLOGY

ENCYCLOPEDIA OF WARS (3 VOL)
EVE OF THE EMPEROR PENGUIN
GREAT LAKES GHOST SHIPS
SAUDI ROYAL FAMILY

POPE JOHN PAUL I

TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT

BID 9615

SECONDARY TITLES

AUTHOR

ANDERSON
APPLEGATE
BENDER
BROOKS
CHALLONER
ESTES
GAIMAN
GUILE
GUILE
HABEEB
LEBOUTILLIER
MAXWELL
MCKALE
MCNEESE
MELSON
O'DONNELL
PAOLINI
PHILIP
PHILLIPS
POPE

RAND

REED
RENEHAN

BEST BINDING
TYPE

HC, PB, LIBRARY,

PRE-BOUND, (LIST

OTHER)

AVAILABILITY PRICE

IN-STOCK,
B/O, SPECIAL
ORDER, (LIST
OTHER)

ISBN




TITLE

TREATY OF PARIS

HOW TO CLONE A SHEEP

UNWILLING UMPIRE

VAMPIRE'S VACATION

WHITE HOUSE WHITE OUT

CUBA

FRUITS BASKET VOL. 15

GHOST IN THE FIRST ROW

SECRET OF THE MASK

PEOPLE'S TYCOON: HENRY FORD & THE
AMERICA CENTURY

HOLOCAUST

DRUNK DRIVING: AN OPPOSING VIEWPOINTS
GUIDE

GUINNESS WORLD BOOK 2009

OXFORD BEGINNER'S CHINESE DICTIONARY
PRAEGER HANDBOOK ON STRESS AND COPING
(2 VOL)

U-X-L- ENCYCLOPEDIA OF BIOMES (3VOL.)
U-X-L- ENCYCLOPEDIA OF DISEASES AND
DISORDERS

AMERICAN CIVIL WAR REFERENCE LIBRARY
AMERICAN DECADES

TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT

BID 9615

SECONDARY TITLES

AUTHOR

RENEHAN
RICHARDSON
ROY

ROY

ROY
SHEEHAN
TAKAYA
WARNER
WARNER

WATTS
WILLOUGHBY

ebook
ebook

BEST BINDING
TYPE

HC, PB, LIBRARY,
PRE-BOUND, (LIST
OTHER)

AVAILABILITY PRICE

IN-STOCK,
B/O, SPECIAL
ORDER, (LIST
OTHER)

ISBN




TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT
BID 9615
SECONDARY TITLES

BEST BINDING
TITLE AUTHOR TYPE AVAILABILITY PRICE ISBN

IN-STOCK,
HC, PB, LIBRARY, B/O, SPECIAL
PRE-BOUND, (LIST ORDER, (LIST

OTHER) OTHER)
WORLDMARK ENCYCLOPEDIA OF THE STATES ebook
HOOT (sound recording) HIAASSEN
COMPANY:
ADDRESS:
CITY STATE ZIP

PHONE FAX




TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT
MEDIA CENTER BOOKS
BID 9615

Addendum #1

Notice to all potential Bidders — No additional questions pertaining to the
above referenced bid specification have been received prior to the stated due
date for submission of questions.

Special Notice — The Troy School District MAY, at its sole discretion, award this
bid to separate vendors for purposes of purchasing elementary school level
books and secondary school level books. This decision, if made by the School
District, will have no change from the posted bid specifications (i.e. all bidders
MUST comply with the specification as stated regardless of the level of books
purchased).



Troy School District
Media Books
Bid 9615

ELEMENTARY TITLES

Draw 50 Cars, Trucks
Chains

Andalite's Gift
Invention

Deer Family

Stellaluna

Hurricane and Tornado
How to Draw People
Blue Skies, French Fries
Grace for President
Hundred Dresses
Fragile Things

Check It Out

Planets

Mr. Messy

Star of Fear

Story of Detroit Pistons
Crazy Like a Fox

| Spy Gold Challenger
Brisingr

Thunder Cake

Eve of Emperor

Great Lakes Ghost Ships
Unwilling Umpire
Vampire Vacation
White House

Ghost in First Row
Secret of Mask
Snakes

Guinness World Book

Follett GumbDrop Books Bound to Stay Bound
Binding  Availability Price ISBN Binding Availability  Price ISBN Binding Availability  Price ISBN

FollettBound FLR 32239VX 13.66 9780385246392 Prebound  Available 11.82  038519059X

HC FLR 13249XX 14.44 9781416905851  TB in stock 16.99 9781416905851  Prebound  Available 17.44 1416905855

FollettBound FLR 38793X5 9.86 9780590213042 Do Not Carry

HC FLR 05426U7 13.59 9780756610753 Prebound  Available 16.74 756610753

HC FLR 18100L8 13.56 9780937934975 Prebound  Available 16.74 937934976

HC FLR 24170B6 14.45 9780152802172 Prebound  Available 17.45 152802177

HC FLR 18423QX 13.59 9780756606909 Prebound  Available 16.74  075660690X

HC FLR 28153T0 15.95 9781592968091 LB in stock 14.95 9781592968091 Do Not Carry

FollettBound FLR 35720W7 9.66 9780440400646 Prebound  Available 10.00 440400643

HC FLR 28972V6 13.59 9780786839193 Prebound  Available 16.74 786839198

FollettBound FLR 34265W7 11.26 9780152052607 Prebound  Available 10.30 152051708

HC FLR 23418S7 22.90 9780060515225 Do Not Carry

FollettBound FLR 39545V5 11.26 9780152164010 Prebound  Available 10.30 152164006

HC FLR 17980VX 16.16 9780823421565 Prebound  Available 18.12 823421562

FollettBound FLR 37534X9 8.56 9780843174212 Do Not Carry

FollettBound FLR 2759275 13.66 9780802775887 Do Not Carry

HC FLR 21355S6 18.96 9781583414064 Do Not Carry

HC FLR 18039W7 15.26 9780823417193 Prebound  Available 17.42 823417190

HC FLR 33554T0 8.46 9780439787284 Prebound  Available 15.32 590042963

HC FLR 12985V3 23.38 9780375826726 Prebound  Available 24.80 375826726

FollettBound FLR 37690W5 12.56 9780698115811 Prebound  Available 11.34 399222316

HC FLR 04336WX 10.19 9780375837333 Prebound  Available 13.94 375837337

FollettBound FLR 37619V1 10.96 9781893699847 Do Not Carry

FollettBound FLR 34223X5 8.86 9780375813702 Prebound  Available 9.30 037591370X

FollettBound FLR 36273X6 8.86 9780375824791 Prebound  Available 9.50 375924795

FollettBound FLR 29079X9 9.66 9780375847219 Prebound  Available 9.75 375947213

FollettBound FLR 30561V8 9.66 9780807555675 Prebound  Available 16.02 807555665

FollettBound FLR 32834W4 9.66 9780807555651 Prebound  Available 16.04 807555649

HC FLR 10563L3 13.56 9781888153460 Prebound  Available 16.72 1888153466
Prebound  On Order 25.82 1904994504




Troy School District
Media Books
Bid 9615

ELEMENTARY TITLES

Chipper's Crazy Carnival

Hoot
SECONDARY TITLES

Chains

Andalite's Gift
Invention

Immigration

Hurricane and Tornado
Hundred Dresses
Fragile Things

Culture in NZ

Culture in Korea

Civil Wars in Africa
Story of Detroit Pistons
Famous Bridges
Hitler's Shadow
Stalingrad
Revolution/Genocide
California Gold Rush
Brisingr

Mythology

Encycl of Wars

Eve of Emporer Penguin
Great Lakes Ghost Ships
Saudi Royal Family
Pope John Paul Il
Treaty of Paris

Follett GumbDrop Books Bound to Stay Bound
Binding  Availability Price ISBN Binding Availability  Price ISBN Binding Availability  Price ISBN

FollettBound FLR 21728YX 9.96 9781893699779 Do Not Carry
CD FLR 4A620Q9 29.95 9780307206978 Do Not Carry
HC FLR 13249XX 14.44 9781416905851  TB in stock 16.99 9781416905851  Prebound  Available 17.44 1416905855
FollettBound FLR 38793X5 9.86 9780590213042 Do Not Carry
HC FLR 05426U7 13.56 9780756610753 Prebound  Available 16.74 756610753
HC FLR23992P7 21.96 97814403438072 Do Not Carry
HC FLR 18423QX 13.59 9780756606909 Prebound  Available 16.74 075660690X
FollettBound FLR 34265W7 11.26 9780152052607 Prebound  Available 10.30 152051708
HC FLR 23418S7 22.90 9780060515225 Do Not Carry
HC FLR 06250P5 20.50 9781410904713 Do Not Carry
HC FLR 13262P6 20.50 9781410904720 Do Not Carry
HC FLR 16521S8 24.95 9781590849552 LB in stock 24.95 9781590849552 Do Not Carry
HC FLR 2135556 18.96 9781583414064 Do Not Carry
FollettBound FLR 30376X6 15.86 9781404251373 LB in stock 17.95 9781404229372 Do Not Carry
HC FLR 24561N7 24.60 9780815412113 Do Not Carry

OUT OF PRINT LB in stock 10.50 9780791072301 Do Not Carry
HC FLR 34514H1 51.30 9780226519906 Do Not Carry
FollettBound FLR 39234W3 15.86 9781404251311 Prebound  Available 21.3 1404229345
HC FLR 12985V3 23.38 9780375826726 Prebound  Available 24.8 375826726
HC FLR 02061V9 13.59 9780756610791 Prebound  Available 16.74 756610796
HC FLR 15034Q8 299.96 9780816028511 Do Not Carry
HC FLR 04336WX 10.19 9780375837333 Prebound  Available 13.94 375837337
FollettBound FLR 37619V1 10.96 9781893699847 Do Not Carry
HC FLR 02875S3 29.96 9780791092187 LB in stock 9.00 9780791070635 Do Not Carry
HC FLR 12773S7 29.96 9780791092279 Do Not Carry
HC FLR 10576T7 34.96 9780791093528 Do Not Carry




Troy School District
Media Books
Bid 9615

ELEMENTARY TITLES

Clone a Sheep

Unwilling Umpire
Vampire's Vacation

White House White Out
Cuba

Fruits Basket

Ghost in First Row

Secret of Mask

People's Tycoon
Holocaust

Drunk Driving

Guinness World Book
Oxford Chinese Dictionary
Praeger Stress

UXL Encycl of Biomes
UXL Encycl of Diseases
Am Civil War

American Decades
Worldmark Encycl of States

Hoot

% to Retail
% to School Libraries
% to Public Libraries

PROCESSING FEES:

Follett GumbDrop Books Bound to Stay Bound
Binding  Availability Price ISBN Binding Availability  Price ISBN Binding Availability  Price ISBN
OUT OF PRINT Do Not Carry
FollettBound FLR 34223X5 8.86 9780375813702 Prebound  Available 9.3  037591370X
FollettBound FLR 36273X6 8.86 9780375824791 Prebound  Available 9.5 375924795
FollettBound FLR 29079X9 9.66 9780375847219 Prebound  Available 9.75 375947213
HC FLR 23075R3 34.22 9780761419655 Do Not Carry
PUBLISHER OUT OF STOCK Do Not Carry
FollettBound FLR 30561V8 9.66 9780807555675 Prebound  Available 16.02 807555665
FollettBound FLR 32834W4 9.66 9780807555651 Prebound  Available 16.04 807555649
FollettBound FLR39440V3 20.86 9780375707254 Do Not Carry
HC FLR 25561L5 21.96 9781575724362 Do Not Carry
HC FLR 08990U9 23.96 9780737735819 Do Not Carry
FollettBound FLR 20064Z1 12.86 9780553592566 Prebound  On Order 25.82 1904994504
PB FLR 04265Y2 15.95 9780199298532 Do Not Carry
HC FLR 18910W8 199.96 9780275991975 Do Not Carry
HC FLR 28408JX 189.96 9780787637323 Do Not Carry
HC FLR 02548K4 313.96 9781414430652 LB in stock 305.00 9781414430682 Do Not Carry
N/A Do Not Carry
N/A Do Not Carry
HC FLR 13862S3 253.96 9781414410586 Do Not Carry
CD FLR 4A620Q9 29.95 9780307206978 Do Not Carry
0 0 0
100 95 90
0 5 10




Troy School District

Media Books
Bid 9615
Follett GumbDrop Books Bound to Stay Bound
Binding  Availability Price ISBN Binding Availability  Price ISBN Binding Availability  Price ISBN
ELEMENTARY TITLES
Attached Spine Labels $ 011 $ 055 -
Attached Barcodes 0.11 0.57 -
Hot Spine Stamping n/a n/a $ 035
Kapco Covers on Paperbacks 2.49 n/a n/a
LaminateD/Attached Dust Jackets 0.59 - 0.55
Reading Program MARC tag - - 0.20 for label
Auto Processing Package 0.69 -
Downloadi MARC Records on Disk/CD $ 10.00
Titles Carried in Warehouse
% Trade 49 25
% Publisher Library 29 70
% Other Hardcover 22 5 100




Troy School District
Media Books
Bid 9615

ELEMENTARY TITLES

Draw 50 Cars, Trucks
Chains

Andalite's Gift
Invention

Deer Family

Stellaluna

Hurricane and Tornado
How to Draw People
Blue Skies, French Fries
Grace for President
Hundred Dresses
Fragile Things

Check It Out

Planets

Mr. Messy

Star of Fear

Story of Detroit Pistons
Crazy Like a Fox

| Spy Gold Challenger
Brisingr

Thunder Cake

Eve of Emperor

Great Lakes Ghost Ships
Unwilling Umpire
Vampire Vacation
White House

Ghost in First Row
Secret of Mask
Snakes

Guinness World Book

Capstone Publishers

Heinemann Raintree

Baker & Taylor

Binding Availability  Price ISBN Binding Availability  Price ISBN
Prebind in stock 13.72 833528017
HC in stock 9.68 1416905855
PB out of print 3.34 590213040
HC out of stock 9.11 789457687
Reinforced  in stock 15.15 937934976
Reinforced  in stock 12.24 152802177
HC in stock 9.11 075660690X
Reinforced  in stock 21.65 1592968090
Prebind in stock 10.36 833527347
Reinforced  in stock 11.51 786839198
Reinforced  in stock 11.52 152051708
HC in stock 26.95 60515228
Prebind in stock 12.08 833524569
Reinforced in stock 12.92 823421562
Prebind in stock 8.26 613971906
PB in stock 6.00 802775888
Library in stock 20.60 1583414061
Reinforced  in stock 12.20 823417190
Reinforced  in stock 10.07 590042963
HC in stock 15.68 375826726
Reinforced  in stock 12.23 399222316
HC in stock 6.83 375837337
PB Apply Direct 10.94 1893699846
Library in stock 9.11 037591370X
Library in stock 9.11 375924795
Library in stock 9.11 375947213
Reinforced  in stock 10.79 807555665
Reinforced  in stock 10.79 807555649
Reinforced  in stock 10.40 1888153963
HC out of print 16.50 1904994377




Troy School District
Media Books
Bid 9615

ELEMENTARY TITLES

Chipper's Crazy Carnival

Hoot
SECONDARY TITLES

Chains

Andalite's Gift
Invention

Immigration

Hurricane and Tornado
Hundred Dresses
Fragile Things

Culture in NZ

Culture in Korea

Civil Wars in Africa
Story of Detroit Pistons
Famous Bridges
Hitler's Shadow
Stalingrad
Revolution/Genocide
California Gold Rush
Brisingr

Mythology

Encycl of Wars

Eve of Emporer Penguin
Great Lakes Ghost Ships
Saudi Royal Family
Pope John Paul Il
Treaty of Paris

Capstone Publishers

Heinemann Raintree

Baker & Taylor

Binding Availability  Price ISBN Binding Availability  Price ISBN
unable to locate

Spoken
Word Audio in stock 17.07 307206971
HC in stock 9.68 1416905855
PB out of print 3.34 590213040
HC out of stock 9.11 756610753
Reinforced  in stock 22.63 1403438072
HC in stock 9.11 075660690X
Reinforced in stock 11.52 152051708
HC in stock 26.95 60515228

HC in stock 19.04 9781410904713  Reinforced in stock 21.09 1410904717

HC in stock 19.04 9781410904720  Reinforced in stock 21.09 1410904725
Library in stock 18.96 1590849558
Library in stock 20.60 1583414061
Library in stock 18.20 140422937X
HC in stock 28.95 815412118
Library out of print 22.80 791072304
HC in stock 47.50 226519902
Library in stock 18.20 1404229345
HC in stock 15.68 375826726
HC in stock 9.11 756610796
HC in stock 300.00 816028516
HC in stock 6.83 375837337
HC out of print 8.95 396057837
Library in stock 22.80 791092186
Library in stock 22.80 791092275
HC in stock 35.00 791093522




Troy School District
Media Books
Bid 9615

ELEMENTARY TITLES

Clone a Sheep

Unwilling Umpire
Vampire's Vacation

White House White Out
Cuba

Fruits Basket

Ghost in First Row

Secret of Mask

People's Tycoon
Holocaust

Drunk Driving

Guinness World Book
Oxford Chinese Dictionary
Praeger Stress

UXL Encycl of Biomes
UXL Encycl of Diseases
Am Civil War

American Decades
Worldmark Encycl of States

Hoot

% to Retail
% to School Libraries
% to Public Libraries

PROCESSING FEES:

Capstone Publishers

Heinemann Raintree

Baker & Taylor

Binding Availability  Price ISBN Binding Availability  Price ISBN

Reinforced  out of print 11.52 531146456
Library in stock 9.11 037591370X
Library in stock 9.11 375924795
Library in stock 9.11 375947213
Library in stock 32.52 761419659
PB in stock 6.69 1598160230
Reinforced in stock 10.79 807555665
Reinforced  in stock 10.79 8070555649
PB in stock 16.95 375707255
PB in stock 8.54 1588103757
Library in stock 26.37 737736216
HC out of print 16.50 1904994377
PB in stock 14.36 019929853X
HC in stock 200.00 275991970
HC in stock 196.00 787637327
HC in stock 314.00 1414430655

no bid

no bid

no bid
Spoken
Word Audio in stock 17.07 307206971

5 5
85 85 50
10 10




Troy School District

Media Books
Bid 9615
Capstone Publishers Heinemann Raintree Baker & Taylor
Binding Availability  Price ISBN Binding Availability  Price ISBN
ELEMENTARY TITLES
Attached Spine Labels 0 0 0.15
Attached Barcodes 0 0 1 free/unit
Hot Spine Stamping n/a n/a n/a
Kapco Covers on Paperbacks n/a n/a 1.99
LaminateD/Attached Dust Jackets n/a n/a 0.49
Reading Program MARC tag 0 0 MARC tag = Free

Reading
0.08 Program Label

Auto Processing Package
Downloadi MARC Records on Disk/C

Titles Carried in Warehouse
% Trade n/a n/a 17

% Publisher Library 100 100 12
% Other Hardcover n/a n/a 36



Troy School District
Media Books
Bid 9615

ELEMENTARY TITLES

Draw 50 Cars, Trucks
Chains

Andalite's Gift
Invention

Deer Family

Stellaluna

Hurricane and Tornado
How to Draw People
Blue Skies, French Fries
Grace for President
Hundred Dresses
Fragile Things

Check It Out

Planets

Mr. Messy

Star of Fear

Story of Detroit Pistons
Crazy Like a Fox

| Spy Gold Challenger
Brisingr

Thunder Cake

Eve of Emperor

Great Lakes Ghost Ships
Unwilling Umpire
Vampire Vacation
White House

Ghost in First Row
Secret of Mask
Snakes

Guinness World Book

PermaBound
Binding Availability  Price ISBN
Prebound  in stock 12.18 985246390
Prebound  in stock 16.77 1416905855
osl
Prebound  in stock 16.22 73459736
HC sp order 13.15 937934976
Prebound  in stock 16.97 152802177
Prebound in stock 16.22 1404239006
Library sp order 15.47 1592968090
Prebound  in stock 9.25 440400643
Prebound in stock 16.22 786839198
Prebound in stock 10.49 152052607
HC sp order 22.22 60515228
Prebound  in stock 10.00 152164014
Prebound  in stock 10.70 823421570
oP
Prebound in stock 12.18 802775888
Library in stock 18.40 1583414061
Prebound  in stock 16.93 823417190
Prebound in stock 14.73 590042963
Prebound  in stock 24.57 375826726
Prebound in stock 11.47 698115813
Prebound  in stock 13.07 375837337
Prebound in stock 9.80 1893699846
Prebound  in stock 8.50 375813705
Prebound in stock 9.50 375824790
Prebound  in stock 9.07 375847219
Prebound in stock 8.70 807555673
Prebound  in stock 8.70 87555657
Prebound  in stock 7.74 937934054
Prebound  in stock 11.61 553592564



Troy School District
Media Books
Bid 9615

ELEMENTARY TITLES

Chipper's Crazy Carnival

Hoot
SECONDARY TITLES

Chains

Andalite's Gift
Invention

Immigration

Hurricane and Tornado
Hundred Dresses
Fragile Things

Culture in NZ

Culture in Korea

Civil Wars in Africa
Story of Detroit Pistons
Famous Bridges
Hitler's Shadow
Stalingrad
Revolution/Genocide
California Gold Rush
Brisingr

Mythology

Encycl of Wars

Eve of Emporer Penguin
Great Lakes Ghost Ships
Saudi Royal Family
Pope John Paul Il
Treaty of Paris

PermaBound
Binding Availability  Price ISBN

Prebound in stock 9.25 1893699773

osl
Prebound  in stock 16.77 1416905855

oSl
Prebound  in stock 16.22 753459736
Library sp order 25.91 1403438072
Prebound in stock 16.22 1404239006
Prebound in stock 10.49 152052607
HC sp order 22.22 60515228
Library sp order 24.15 1410904717
Library sp order 24.15 1410904725
Library sp order 20.57 1590849558
Library in stock 18.40 1583414061
Library in stock 17.42 140422937X
HC sp order 23.87 815412118

oP
HC sp order 39.16 226519902
Library in stock 17.42 1404229345
Prebound in stock 24.57 375826726
Prebound in stock 16.22 789462885
HC sp order 247.35 816028516
Prebound in stock 13.07 375837337
Prebound  in stock 9.80 1893699846
Library in stock 29.10 791092186
Library in stock 29.10 791092275
Library in stock 33.95 791093522



Troy School District
Media Books
Bid 9615

ELEMENTARY TITLES

Clone a Sheep

Unwilling Umpire
Vampire's Vacation

White House White Out
Cuba

Fruits Basket

Ghost in First Row

Secret of Mask

People's Tycoon
Holocaust

Drunk Driving

Guinness World Book
Oxford Chinese Dictionary
Praeger Stress

UXL Encycl of Biomes
UXL Encycl of Diseases
Am Civil War

American Decades
Worldmark Encycl of States

Hoot

% to Retail
% to School Libraries
% to Public Libraries

PROCESSING FEES:

PermaBound
Binding Availability  Price ISBN
OoP
Prebound in stock 8.50 375813705
Prebound  in stock 8.50 375824790
Prebound in stock 9.07 375847219
Library sp order 27.11 761419659
Prebound in stock 12.76 1598160230
Prebound  in stock 8.70 807555673
Prebound in stock 8.70 807555657
Trade Paper sp order 13.97 375707255
Library sp order 25.91 1575724367
Library sp order 23.24 737735813
Prebound in stock 11.61 553592564
Trade Paper sp order 13.15 019929853X
HC sp order 197.88 275991970
HC sp order 161.60 787637327
HC sp order 310.67 1414430655
no bid
no bid
no bid
osl
0
99
1



Troy School District
Media Books
Bid 9615

ELEMENTARY TITLES

Attached Spine Labels

Attached Barcodes

Hot Spine Stamping

Kapco Covers on Paperbacks
LaminateD/Attached Dust Jackets
Reading Program MARC tag

Auto Processing Package
Downloadi MARC Records on Disk/(

Titles Carried in Warehouse
% Trade

% Publisher Library
% Other Hardcover

PermaBound
Binding Availability  Price ISBN

o

n/a
n/a

0O if applicable
0

27
73




Troy School District
Media Center Books
Bid 9615

COMPLIANCE AGREEMENT

Follett

Gum Drop
Books

Bound to Stay
Bound

Capstone
Publishers

Heinemann
Raintree

Baker & Taylor

PermaBound

COMPLIANCE

1

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Title orders filled
in 2 shipment
cycle. Initial fill
rates for new-
release, popular,
mainstream
materis is 85-90%
(delivered within
5-7 days after
receipt of order.
Backordered
items will be
shipped or
cancelled with 6-
days ARO.

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

MARC records
are available free
of charge for any
book cataloged
by Library of
Congress. Not all
titles have such
cataloging
available.

Yes




Gum Drop Bound to Stay Capstone Heinemann
Follett Books Bound Publishers Raintree Baker & Taylor PermaBound
COMPLIANCE
Records will be
provided for any
book cataloged
through Library of
Congress; data
derived from
MARC records do | MARC records do ?;'g?:l I;gcor ds
not contain not contain -
i : contain all key
review sources. review sources. oints. Not all
We provide We provide fecor d.s contain
MARC records MARC records )
5 Yes Yes Yes review sources or Yes
that exceed that exceed annotations
standards w/ full standards w/ full Grade IeveI.
table of contents table of contents rather than !
& a min. of three & a min. of three | . .
subject headings subject headings interest level will
J gs. ) gs. appear in MARC
information.
Reading level will
appear for any
titles designed by
Accelerated
Reader Program.
6 Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
7 Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
8 Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Vendor printouts | Vendor printouts
do not contain a do not contain a
symbol that symbol that
indicates a title is | indicates a title is
Accelerated Accelerated
Reader or Reader or
Reading Counts. | Reading Counts.
0, 0,
9 Yes Yes Yes 959% of all our 95% of all our Yes Yes

titles are
Accelerated
Reader and the
quizzes are
provided for
$1.50 ea. When
20 titles are
purchased

titles are
Accelerated
Reader and the
quizzes are
provided for
$1.50 ea. When
20 titles are
purchased




Gum Drop Bound to Stay Capstone Heinemann
Follett Books Bound Publishers Raintree Baker & Taylor PermaBound
COMPLIANCE
Provide “White Provide “White
Glove Service” Glove Service”
(emailed (emailed
confirmation of confirmation of
10 Yes Yes Yes PO and shipment | PO and shipment Yes Yes
tracking, tracking,
expected delivery | expected delivery
date date
Within School
Selection as
parameter or filer.
Reading level is
Collection Collection available for any
Development Development title categorized
provided by free provided by free by Accelerated
online Collection online Collection Reader or
Wiz™ analyst Wiz™ analyst Reading Counts.
11 Yes Yes Yes tool. Number of tool. Number of Grade Level Yes
pages and award | pages and award | appears, hot
winners are not winners are not interest level.
available as part available as part Page Count does
of searching of searching not appear as
parameters parameters searchable field.
14 review
sources are
available, may be
used as filters
12 Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
13 Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
14 Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
15 Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
16 Yes Yes Prebound Prebound Prebound Yes Yes
Hardback only Hardback only Hardback only




Follett Gum Drop Bound to Stay Capstone Heinemann Baker & Taylor PermaBound
Books Bound Publishers Raintree
COMPLIANCE
Vendor does not | Vendor does not
publish list apart publish list apart
from regular from regular
catalog. If catalog. If
requested, a list requested, a list
17 Yes Yes Yes of award books of award books Yes Yes
will be provided will be provided
from local rep. from local rep.
State standards State standards
available on available on
website website
B&T is a
wholesaling firm
and services both
18 Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes L|b(§1ry & Retall Yes
entities. Library
sales (K-12)
comprise approx.
50% of business
Title orders are Priority titles will
_ Contact Sales Qn paper ordgrs, Contact Contact filled as regeived. be keyed first on
What is S highlight/asterisk . . If TSD designates | order. If out of
C upport. Sales ST Customer Service | Customer Service .
procedure for Mark priority titles Representative priority titles. For via toll-free via toll-free some titles as stock, every effort
obtaining as “first choice” will personally online orders, number or via number or via priority titles, to get title in-
priority titles? s mark choice in . . those will be first | house asap
visit - email email .
Priority field filled from

requested lists.




Troy School District
Media Books
Bid 9615

Advanced Education Products: No Response
Gale Group/Thomson Gale: No Response
Ingram: No Bid

Mackin Library Media: No Response
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