REQUEST FOR

FAX: 248-823-4077

QUOTATION
o 9690 TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT
oA NOLATER THAN 1140 RANKIN, TROY, MICHIGAN 48083
8/24/10 3pm 248-823-4052

DATE

8/10/10

REQUEST FOR QUOTE — NOT AN ORDER

THIS FORM MUST BE UTILIZED WHEN RESPONDING TO THIS REQUEST
BID ENVELOPE ENCLOSED

THE RFQ NUMBER MUST APPEAR ON ALL QUOTATIONS AND RELATED CORRESPONDENCE, THIS IS NOT AN ORDER

Quantity

DESCRIPTION

UNIT PRICE

AMOUNT

Please supply us with your bid to furnish the Troy School District with MUSICAL
INSTRUMENTS

Copies of the bid are available at:
www.troy.k12.mi.us/purchasing/items_out_for_bid.htm (left column)
Bid recaps will be available at:

www.troy.k12.mi.us/purchasing/items_out_for_bid.htm (right column)

FACSIMILE BID IS NOT ACCEPTABLE

Bids will not be accepted if submitted after the deadline specified (local time) in the advertisement to bid or in the information to
bidders. The late submission of a bid makes the bid nonrepsonsive and is a material defect which shall not be waived by the
Board of Education. Delays in the mail will not be considered. All Late bids in the mail will be returned to the bidder unopened.

Proposal for the submission of alternatives by vendors will be accepted and reviewed. However, if any substitution or departure
is not clearly noted and described, it will be understood that the bid intends to exactly meet the specifications.

The Board of Education shall be the sole judge as to whether the proposed goods are “equal” or “approved”. Quotations must
be mailed or delivered to the Purchasing Office, 1140 Rankin, Troy, MI 48083 no later than 3 p.m. on the date shown above.
Michigan State Sales and Use Taxes and Federal Excise Taxes do not apply unless otherwise indicated. Exemption certificates

will be furnished when necessary. This request imposes no obligations on the buyer. The Board of Education reserves the right
to accept or reject any or all bids or to split awards by items or to accept bids, which will best serve the Board of Education.

THIS AREA MUST BE FILLED IN

DELIVERY TIME

PRICES FIRM FOR NAME OF COMPANY

TELEPHONE
NO.

TERMS

NO. & STREET

FAX #

FOB
DELIVERED

ALL DELIVERY CHARGES
MUST CITY, STATE & ZIP CODE

BE INCLUDED IN PRICES SHOWN

E-MAIL

CONTACT PERSON (PLEASE PRINT) SIGNATURE

DATE




Note: All bidders are specifically reminded that a completed Affidavit of Bidder
(Familial Disclosure) MUST be completed and submitted with the bid response.
Failure to include a completed copy will be grounds for disqualification of bid.
The Affidavit of Bidder is required to be notarized for construction bids only. All
others only require completion and signature.

AFFIDAVIT OF BIDDER

The undersigned, the owner or authorized officer of
(the “Bidder), pursuant to the familial disclosure requirement provided in the
(the “School District”) advertisement for construction bids, hereby
represent and warrant except as provided below, that no familial relationships exist
between the over(s) or any employee of
and any member of the Board of Education of the
School District or the Superintendent of the School District.

List any Familial Relationships:

BIDDER:
By:
Its:
STATE OF MICHIGAN )
COUNTY OF ))SS'
This instrument was acknowledged before meonthe _ day of , 2010,

by

,Notary Public

County, Michigan

My Commission Expires:

Acting in the County of:




TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT
MUSICAL INSTRUMENTS

BID 9690
[INTERNATIONAL ACADEMY EAST |
Unit Cost
Qty Item # Description Alternate for New
2 YTS-475 Yamaha YTS-475 Tenor Sax no
1 TBS-52 Yamaha TBS-52 Baritone Sax no
2 4/4 Lewis Kayser or comparable cello outfit
1 Selmer Model 1405 Eb Clarinet no
1 461867 Selmer 1430P Bb Bass Clarinet no
1 462101 Fox Bassoon Model 51 no
3 Holton H177 Professional Farkas no
4  YEP-321S YEP 321S Silver 4-Valve Euphonium no
2 482L  Jupiter 4 Valve BBb Tuba no
1 Selmer Model 120B Intermediate Oboe no
Shipping Charge
Delivery Address:
International Academy East
1291 Torpey
Troy, Ml 48083
[ELEMENTARY
Unit Cost Unit Cost
Qty Item # Description Alternate for New for Used
24 Gemeinhardt 72SP Flute no
24 Selmer CLSOL300R Clarinet no *:::::::::::::*
24 Bach TRSOL300 Trumpet no sfelelelelalely
24 Bach TBSOL310 Trombone no *::::::::::::f
24 Eastman Etude 1/2 Student Violin no :::::::::::::::
12 Eastman Etude 3/4 Student Violin no :*:*:*:*:*:*:*:
24 Selmer CL300/301 Clarinet no Teietalatelel
24 Bach TR300 Trumpet no :::::::::::::::
24 Bach TBSOL310/300 Trombone no *::::::::::::f
24 Eastman Signature 1/2 Student Violin no :::::::::::::::
12 Eastman Signature 3/4 Student Violin no Pt ettt

Shipping Charge
Delivery Address:
Troy School District Warehouse

1140 Rankin
Troy, Ml 48083

PLEASE NOTE : The UNIT price is required for each item. DO NOT ENTER A LUMP SUM TOTAL IN THE UNIT
COST COLUMN.



Troy School District
Musical Instruments

Bid 9690
Shar Products Co. A & G Central Music Midwest Musical Imports
Unit Cost  Unit Cost Unit Cost  Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
Qty Description Alt. NEW USED Total Alt. NEW USED Total Alt. NEW USED Total
International Academy East
2 Yamaha YTS-475 Tenor Sax no bid 1,645.00 3,290.00 1,599.00 3,198.00
1 Yamaha TBS-52 Baritone Sax no bid 3,548.00 3,548.00 3,448.00 3,448.00
Franz Hoffman
2 4/4 Lewis Kayser cello outfit Maestro SC251 880.00 1,760.00 | RothR121 450.00 900.00 -
1 Selmer 1405 Eb Clarinet no bid 606.00 606.00 590.00 590.00
1 Selmer 1430P Bb Bass Clarinet no bid 1,308.00 1,308.00 1,272.00 1,272.00
1 Fox Bassoon 51 no bid 3,400.00 3,400.00 3,425.00 3,425.00
3  Holton H177 Farkas no bid 2,619.00 7,857.00 2,449.00 7,347.00
4 YEP-321S Euphonium 4-valve no bid 1,395.00 5,580.00 1,363.00 5,452.00
2 Jupiter 4 Valve BBb Tuba no bid 2,635.00 5,270.00 2,539.00 5,078.00
1 Selmer 120B Oboe no bid 1,715.00 1,715.00 1,608.00 1,608.00
Shipping - - - -
Elementary - - -
24 Gemeinhardt 72SP Flute no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
24 Selmer CLSOL300R Clarinet no bid no bid CL301ATR 352.00 8,448.00
24 Bach TRSOL300 Trumpet no bid no bid 335.00 8,040.00
24 Bach TBSOL310 Trombone no bid no bid 301 384.00 9,216.00
Franz Hoffman
24 Eastman Etude Violin 1/2 Etude SV120 176.00 4,224.00 no bid no bid
Franz Hoffman
12 Eastman Etude Violin 3/4 Etude SV120 176.00 2,112.00 no bid no bid

Page 1 0of 8



Troy School District
Musical Instruments
Bid 9690

Qty Description
24  Selmer CL300/301 Clarinet
24 Bach TR300 Trumpet

24  Bach TBSOL310/300 Trombone

24  Eastman Signature Violin 1/2
12 Eastman Signature Violin 3/4
Shipping

TOTAL

Shar Products Co. A & G Central Music Midwest Musical Imports
Unit Cost  Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
NEW USED Total Alt. NEW USED Total Alt. NEW USED Total
no bid - no bid - no bid -
no bid - no bid - no bid -
no bid - no bid - no bid -
Franz Hoffman
Prelude HV120 159.00 3,816.00 no bid - no bid -
159.00 1,908.00 no bid - no bid -
13,820.00 33,474.00 57,122.00
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Troy School District
Musical Instruments

Bid 9690
Qty Description

International Academy East
2 Yamaha YTS-475 Tenor Sax
1 Yamaha TBS-52 Baritone Sax
2 4/4 Lewis Kayser cello outfit
1 Selmer 1405 Eb Clarinet
1 Selmer 1430P Bb Bass Clarinet
1 FoxBassoon 51
3  Holton H177 Farkas
4 YEP-321S Euphonium 4-valve
2 Jupiter 4 Valve BBb Tuba
1 Selmer 120B Oboe

Shipping

Elementary
24 Gemeinhardt 72SP Flute
24 Selmer CLSOL300R Clarinet
24 Bach TRSOL300 Trumpet
24 Bach TBSOL310 Trombone
24 Eastman Etude Violin 1/2
12 Eastman Etude Violin 3/4

Taylor Music Inc.

Interstate Music

National Educational Music Co.

Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost  Unit Cost
Alt. NEW USED Total Alt. NEW USED Total Alt. NEW USED Total
1,593.00 3,186.00 1,593.00 3,186.00 1,602.00 3,204.00
3,420.00 3,420.00 3,433.00 3,433.00 | vYBS52 3,455.00 3,455.00
Int'l Strings
no bid - 360L 459.00 918.00
575.00 575.00 575.00 575.00 572.00 572.00
1,215.00 1,215.00 1,240.00 1,240.00 1,233.00 1,233.00
3,399.00 3,399.00 3,499.00 3,499.00 3,513.00 3,513.00
2,414.00 7,242.00 2,480.00 7,440.00 2,469.00 7,407.00
1,355.00 5,420.00 1,352.00 5,408.00 1,358.00 5,432.00
2,579.00 5,158.00 2,630.00 5,260.00 2,497.00 4,994.00
1,595.00 1,595.00 1,628.00 1,628.00 1,617.00 1,617.00
2P 239.00 no bid 5,736.00 | |2sp 220.00 no bid 5,280.00 224.00 no bid 5,376.00
cL3o1 329.00 7,896.00 | cL301 327.00 7,848.00 | cL3o1 326.00 7,824.00
268.00 6,432.00 = TR300H2 330.00 7,920.00 | TR300H2 330.00 7,920.00
TROM301 268.00 6,432.00 | TB301 377.00 9,048.00 | TB301 376.00 9,024.00
no bid no bid - no bid
no bid no bid - no bid
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Troy School District
Musical Instruments

Bid 9690
Taylor Music Inc. Interstate Music National Educational Music Co.
Unit Cost  Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost  Unit Cost
Qty Description NEW USED Total Alt. NEW USED Total Alt. NEW USED Total
24  Selmer CL300/301 Clarinet no bid - - no bid -
24 Bach TR300 Trumpet no bid - - no bid -
24  Bach TBSOL310/300 Trombone no bid - - no bid -
24 Eastman Signature Violin 1/2 no bid - - no bid -
12 Eastman Signature Violin 3/4 no bid - - no bid -
Shipping
TOTAL 57,706.00 61,765.00 62,489.00
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Troy School District
Musical Instruments

Bid 9690
Sam Ash Quikship Brook Mays Music Northeast Music
Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
Qty Description Alt. NEW USED Total NEW USED Total NEW USED Total
International Academy East
2 Yamaha YTS-475 Tenor Sax 1,612.00 3,224.00 no bid 1,649.00 3,298.00
1 Yamaha TBS-52 Baritone Sax 3,462.00 3,462.00 no bid 3,549.00 3,549.00
2 4/4 Lewis Kayser cello outfit Roth R204 579.90 1,159.80 no bid no bid
1 Selmer 1405 Eb Clarinet 588.00 588.00 637.00 637.00 607.00 607.00
1 Selmer 1430P Bb Bass Clarinet 1,252.00 1,252.00 1,373.00 1,373.00 1,309.00 1,309.00
1 FoxBassoon 51 3,472.00 3,472.00 3,621.00 3,621.00 no bid
3 Holton H177 Farkas 2,469.00 7,407.00 2,750.00 8,250.00 2,625.00 7,875.00
4  YEP-321S Euphonium 4-valve 1,373.00 5,492.00 no bid 1,398.00 5,592.00
2 Jupiter 4 Valve BBb Tuba 2,529.00 5,058.00 no bid no bid
1 Selmer 120B Oboe 1,625.00 1,625.00 1,799.00 1,799.00 1,714.00 1,714.00
Shipping - - - -
Elementary - - -
6,360 /
24 Gemeinhardt 72SP Flute 25P 219.00 no bid 5,256.00 275.00 no bid 6,600.00 265.00 263.00 6,312
24 Selmer CLSOL300R Clarinet 332.00 7,968.00 363.00 8,712.00 no bid
24  Bach TRSOL300 Trumpet 337.00 8,088.00 368.00 8,832.00 355.00 8,520.00
24 Bach TBSOL310 Trombone 381.00 9,144.00 419.00 10,056.00 427.00 10,248.00
24 Eastman Etude Violin 1/2 189.00 4,536.00 no bid no bid
12 Eastman Etude Violin 3/4 189.00 2,268.00 no bid no bid

Page 5 of 8




Troy School District
Musical Instruments
Bid 9690

Sam Ash Quikshi

Unit Cost Unit Cost

Qty Description . NEW USED Total
24  Selmer CL300/301 Clarinet no bid -
24 Bach TR300 Trumpet no bid -
24  Bach TBSOL310/300 Trombone no bid -
24 Eastman Signature Violin 1/2 no bid -
12 Eastman Signature Violin 3/4 no bid -
Shipping
TOTAL 69,999.80

Brook Mays Music

Unit Cost Unit Cost

Northeast Music

Unit Cost Unit Cost
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NEW USED Total NEW USED Total
250.00 6,000.00 346.00 8,304.00
325.00 7,800.00 355.00 8,520.00
300.00 7,200.00 418.00 10,032.00
no bid - no bid
no bid - no bid
75,928 /
70,880.00 75,880



Troy School District
Musical Instruments
Bid 9690

Qty Description
International Academy East
2 Yamaha YTS-475 Tenor Sax
1 Yamaha TBS-52 Baritone Sax

4/4 Lewis Kayser cello outfit
Selmer 1405 Eb Clarinet
Selmer 1430P Bb Bass Clarinet
Fox Bassoon 51

Holton H177 Farkas

YEP-321S Euphonium 4-valve
Jupiter 4 Valve BBb Tuba
Selmer 120B Oboe

Shipping

BN PP WER R RN

Elementary

24  Gemeinhardt 72SP Flute
24 Selmer CLSOL300R Clarinet
24 Bach TRSOL300 Trumpet
24 Bach TBSOL310 Trombone

24 Eastman Etude Violin 1/2

12 Eastman Etude Violin 3/4

Washington Music Center

Marshall Music Co.

Unit Cost  Unit Cost Unit Cost  Unit Cost

Alt. NEW USED Total Alt. NEW USED Total
1,587.00 3,174.00 1,778.00 3,556.00
3,421.00 3,421.00 3,832.00 3,832.00

Eastman
Roth R204E4H 552.00 1,104.00 | Impresario 1,325.00 2,650.00
567.00 567.00 607.00 607.00
1,223.00 1,223.00 1,308.00 1,308.00
3,459.00 3,459.00 3,520.00 3,520.00
2,451.00 7,353.00 2,619.00 7,857.00
1,345.00 5,380.00 1,507.00 6,028.00
2,493.00 4,986.00 2,820.00 5,640.00
1,604.00 1,604.00 1,715.00 1,715.00
8,328/

25P 220.00 no bid 5,280.00 347.00 245.00 5,880
CL301 323.00 7,752.00 355.00 8,520.00
TR300H2 328.00 7,872.00 382.00 9,168.00
TB301 373.00 8,952.00 435.00 10,440.00
no bid 186.00 4,464.00
no bid 186.00 2,232.00
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Troy School District
Musical Instruments
Bid 9690

24
24
24

24
12

Description

Selmer CL300/301 Clarinet
Bach TR300 Trumpet

Bach TBSOL310/300 Trombone

Eastman Signature Violin 1/2
Eastman Signature Violin 3/4

Shipping

TOTAL

Washington Music Center

Marshall Music Co.

Unit Cost

Unit Cost  Unit Cost
Alt. NEW USED Total Alt. NEW

323.00 notavail 7,752.00

328.00 not avail 7,872.00

TB301 373.00 notavail 8,952.00
no bid
no bid

86,703.00

McCourt's Music: No Response
Melhart Music Center: No Response
Nick Rail Music: No Response
Southwest Strings: No Response
Suzuki: No Bid

Universal Melody Services: No Response
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Unit Cost
USED Total

255.00 6,120.00

275.00 6,600.00

295.00 7,080.00

155.00 3,720.00

155.00 1,860.00
105,245 /
102,797
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