REQUEST FOR
QUOTATION

No.

9687 TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT

DUE DATE

8/3/10

NO LATER THAN

3p.m. 248-823-4052
FAX: 248-823-4077

1140 RANKIN, TROY, MICHIGAN 48083

DATE

7/16/10

REQUEST FOR QUOTE — NOT AN ORDER

THIS FORM MUST BE UTILIZED WHEN RESPONDING TO THIS REQUEST
BID ENVELOPE ENCLOSED

THE RFQ NUMBER MUST APPEAR ON ALL QUOTATIONS AND RELATED CORRESPONDENCE, THIS IS NOT AN ORDER

Quantity

DESCRIPTION

UNIT PRICE

AMOUNT

Please supply us with your bid to furnish the Troy School District with REPLACEMENT
INFRARED WIRELESS MICROPHONE SYSTEMS

Copies of the bid are available at:
www.troy.k12.mi.us/purchasing/items_out_for_bid.htm (left column)
Bid recaps will be available at:

www.troy.k12.mi.us/purchasing/items_out_for_bid.htm (right column)

FACSIMILE BID IS NOT ACCEPTABLE

Bids will not be accepted if submitted after the deadline specified (local time) in the advertisement to bid or in the information to
bidders. The late submission of a bid makes the bid nonrepsonsive and is a material defect which shall not be waived by the
Board of Education. Delays in the mail will not be considered. All Late bids in the mail will be returned to the bidder unopened.

Proposal for the submission of alternatives by vendors will be accepted and reviewed. However, if any substitution or departure
is not clearly noted and described, it will be understood that the bid intends to exactly meet the specifications.

The Board of Education shall be the sole judge as to whether the proposed goods are “equal” or “approved”. Quotations must
be mailed or delivered to the Purchasing Office, 1140 Rankin, Troy, MI 48083 no later than 3 p.m. on the date shown above.
Michigan State Sales and Use Taxes and Federal Excise Taxes do not apply unless otherwise indicated. Exemption certificates

will be furnished when necessary. This request imposes no obligations on the buyer. The Board of Education reserves the right
to accept or reject any or all bids or to split awards by items or to accept bids, which will best serve the Board of Education.

THIS AREA MUST BE FILLED IN

DELIVERY TIME

PRICES FIRM FOR NAME OF COMPANY

TELEPHONE
NO.

TERMS

NO. & STREET

FAX #

FOB
DELIVERED

ALL DELIVERY CHARGES
MUST CITY, STATE & ZIP CODE

BE INCLUDED IN PRICES SHOWN

E-MAIL

CONTACT PERSON (PLEASE PRINT) SIGNATURE

DATE




Note: All bidders are specifically reminded that a completed Affidavit of Bidder
(Familial Disclosure) MUST be completed and submitted with the bid response.
Failure to include a completed copy will be grounds for disqualification of bid.
The Affidavit of Bidder is required to be notarized for construction bids only. All
others only require completion and signature.

AFFIDAVIT OF BIDDER

The undersigned, the owner or authorized officer of
(the “Bidder), pursuant to the familial disclosure requirement provided in the
(the “School District”) advertisement for construction bids, hereby
represent and warrant except as provided below, that no familial relationships exist
between the over(s) or any employee of
and any member of the Board of Education of the
School District or the Superintendent of the School District.

List any Familial Relationships:

BIDDER:
By:
Its:
STATE OF MICHIGAN )
COUNTY OF ))SS'
This instrument was acknowledged before meonthe _ day of , 2010,

by

,Notary Public

County, Michigan

My Commission Expires:

Acting in the County of:




Troy School District

Bid 9687

REPLACEMENT INFRARED WIRELESS MICROPHONE SYSTEMS

Troy School District is seeking to replace existing 700 MHz wireless microphone systems due to
FCC action. Bid is eqguipment only, no labor requested. All equipment must be new and
backed by a minimum five (5) year manufacturer’s warranty.

Quantities listed are base bid volume purchases. Bid response shall include unit price based on
this minimum quantity. Bidders shall indicate increases in unit price per unit should the

guantities dip below these minimums. Unit pricing may be used to add or deduct at the District’s
discretion. For the purpose of adding additional units, the unit price shall be valid to Troy
School District for one calendar year from the date of award.

Purchase is subject to Board of Education approval tentatively planned for August 17, 2010.

Quantity

ltem

UNIT COST

110

27

Lightspeed FP-100-R packages. Includes FP-100
two channel IR receiver, one IR sensor for FP-100,
50’ plenum rated coaxial cable with appropriate ends
to connect to sensor and FP-100, one Lightspeed
REDMIKE with compatible AA size NiMH battery, one
REDMIKE cradle charger with power adapter

Lightspeed REDCAT RC-V packages. Includes REDCAT
speaker/receiver system, one REDMIKE VC with volume
control, compatible AA size NiMH battery, one REDMIKE
cradle charger with power adapter

Lightspeed IR sensor compatible with FP-100 receiver
(spares inventory/special classroom configuration)

Lightspeed REDMIKE with compatible AA size NiMH
battery, one REDMIKE cradle charger with power
Adapter (unit price purposes only)

Lightspeed REDMIKE VC with volume control, compatible
AA size NiMH battery, one REDMIKE cradle charger with
power adapter (unit price purposes only)

Lightspeed REDMIKE cradle charger with power adapter
(unit price purposes only)

TOTAL Freight Charge

Delivery Address:
Technology Resource Center
TSD Services Building

4420 Livernois

Troy, Ml 48098

$

PLEASE NOTE: This Request for Quote requires the UNIT price of each item. DO NOT
ENTER A LUMP SUM TOTAL IN THE UNIT COST COLUMN.




TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT

BID3 9687

INFRARED WIRELESS MICROPHONES

Item Qty
Lightspeed FP-100-R package 110
Lightspeed REDCAT RC-V 27
Lightspeed IR sensor 5
Lightspeed REDMIKE 1
Lightspeed REDMIKE VC 1
Lightspeed REDMIKE cradle 1
Freight Charges 1

Broadcast Supply - NO BID
Advanced Lighting & Sound - NO BID
B+H Photo - NO BID

Aves Audio Visual Systems - NO BID

VSC, Inc. Troxell Communications
429.00 47,190.00 435.00 47,850.00 439.98
928.00 25,056.00 981.00 26,487.00 989.98
179.00 895.00 165.00 825.00 239.98
279.00 279.00 299.00 299.00 289.98
274.90 274.90 353.00 353.00 59.98
59.00 59.00 56.00 56.00 159.98
1,500.00 1,500.00 - - 1,551.98

75,253.90 75,870.00

Aprise Technology - No reply

AVI/ SPL - No reply

City Animation - No reply

Focus Camera - No reply

Gridworks Inc - No Reply

Jireh Supplies, Inc - No reply
Perimutter Purchasing Power - No reply
Photomart Cine Video Inc - No reply
Sound Planning Communications - No reply
Videotape Products - No reply
Washington Music - No reply

West LA Music - No reply

Business Services

48,397.80

26,729.46

1,199.90

289.98

59.98

159.98

1,551.98

78,389.08

Sound Engineering

449.62

997.52

167.02

245.12

296.82

62.52

1,410.00

49,458.20

26,933.04

835.10

245.12

296.82

62.52

1,410.00

79,240.80

Thalner Electronic Labs

490.00

515.00

112.00

207.00

207.00

58.00

250.00

53,900.00

13,905.00

560.00

207.00

207.00

58.00

250.00

69,087.00

NOTE: Alternate product
Teach Logic, bid by Thalner
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