REQUEST FOR
QUOTATION

No.

9684 TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT

DUE DATE

7/6/10

NO LATER THAN

3p.m. 248-823-4052
FAX: 248-823-4077

1140 RANKIN, TROY, MICHIGAN 48083

DATE

6/21/10

REQUEST FOR QUOTE — NOT AN ORDER

THIS FORM MUST BE UTILIZED WHEN RESPONDING TO THIS REQUEST
BID ENVELOPE ENCLOSED

THE RFQ NUMBER MUST APPEAR ON ALL QUOTATIONS AND RELATED CORRESPONDENCE, THIS IS NOT AN ORDER

Quantity

DESCRIPTION

UNIT PRICE

AMOUNT

Please supply us with your bid to furnish the Troy School District with REPLACEMENT
RF WIRELESS MICROPHONE SYSTEMS

Copies of the bid are available at:
www.troy.k12.mi.us/purchasing/items_out_for_bid.htm (left column)
Bid recaps will be available at:

www.troy.k12.mi.us/purchasing/items_out_for_bid.htm (right column)

FACSIMILE BID IS NOT ACCEPTABLE

Bids will not be accepted if submitted after the deadline specified (local time) in the advertisement to bid or in the information to
bidders. The late submission of a bid makes the bid nonrepsonsive and is a material defect which shall not be waived by the
Board of Education. Delays in the mail will not be considered. All Late bids in the mail will be returned to the bidder unopened.

Proposal for the submission of alternatives by vendors will be accepted and reviewed. However, if any substitution or departure
is not clearly noted and described, it will be understood that the bid intends to exactly meet the specifications.

The Board of Education shall be the sole judge as to whether the proposed goods are “equal” or “approved”. Quotations must
be mailed or delivered to the Purchasing Office, 1140 Rankin, Troy, MI 48083 no later than 3 p.m. on the date shown above.
Michigan State Sales and Use Taxes and Federal Excise Taxes do not apply unless otherwise indicated. Exemption certificates

will be furnished when necessary. This request imposes no obligations on the buyer. The Board of Education reserves the right
to accept or reject any or all bids or to split awards by items or to accept bids, which will best serve the Board of Education.

THIS AREA MUST BE FILLED IN

DELIVERY TIME

PRICES FIRM FOR NAME OF COMPANY

TELEPHONE
NO.

TERMS

NO. & STREET

FAX #

FOB
DELIVERED

ALL DELIVERY CHARGES
MUST CITY, STATE & ZIP CODE

BE INCLUDED IN PRICES SHOWN

E-MAIL

CONTACT PERSON (PLEASE PRINT) SIGNATURE

DATE




Note: All bidders are specifically reminded that a completed Affidavit of Bidder
(Familial Disclosure) MUST be completed and submitted with the bid response.
Failure to include a completed copy will be grounds for disqualification of bid.
The Affidavit of Bidder is required to be notarized for construction bids only. All
others only require completion and signature.

AFFIDAVIT OF BIDDER

The undersigned, the owner or authorized officer of
(the “Bidder), pursuant to the familial disclosure requirement provided in the
(the “School District”) advertisement for construction bids, hereby
represent and warrant except as provided below, that no familial relationships exist
between the over(s) or any employee of
and any member of the Board of Education of the
School District or the Superintendent of the School District.

List any Familial Relationships:

BIDDER:
By:
Its:
STATE OF MICHIGAN )
COUNTY OF ))SS'
This instrument was acknowledged before meonthe _ day of , 2010,

by

,Notary Public

County, Michigan

My Commission Expires:

Acting in the County of:




Troy School District
REPLACEMENT RF WIRELESS MICROPHONE SYSTEMS
Bid 9684

Troy School District is seeking to replace existing 700 MHz wireless microphone systems due to
FCC action. Bid is equipment only, no labor requested. Subject to Board of Education
approval tentatively planned for July 13, 2010 meeting.

Quantity Item UNIT COST

5 Azden 325ULH UHF Wireless Microphone Systems $
(Includes 35HT handheld microphone/transmitter, 35BT
body-pack transmitter, EX-503L electret condenser lavalier
microphone, 325UPR receiver & carrying case) Replaces
411UDR receiver, 41BT and 51BT transmitters.

4 Azden 325ULT Wireless Microphone Systems $
(Includes two 35BT body-pack transmitters, two EX-503L
electret condenser lavalier microphones, 325UPR receiver
& carrying case) Replaces 2000UPR transmitter,
10 BT transmitters.

Azden BC-29 AC/DC Power Supplies for 320UPR Receivers $

5 Sennheiser EW345 G3-B wireless microphone system $
(replaces EW345 G2 700 MHz equipment)

6 Sennheiser EW322 G3-B wireless microphone system $
(replaces EW322 G2 700 MHz equipment)

2 Sennheiser SK500 G3-B wireless transmitter $
(replaces SK500 G2 700 MHz equipment)

2 Sennheiser EM500 G3-B wireless receiver
(replaces EM500 G2 700 MHz equipment)

18 Sennheiser EW172G3 with CI1 instrument cable
Sennheiser SKM 100-835 G3 transmitter w/ 835 capsule
Sennheiser G3OMNIKITS including antennas

©“

B B B B

Sennheiser ASA1/NT active antenna splitter,
DC power distribution for G3, NT1-1 power supply,
eight (8) 20" BNC cables

4 Sennheiser BB25 25’ coax antenna cable $
Shure A13HD heavy duty black mic flange $
TOTAL Freight Charge $

Delivery Address:
Technology Resource Center
TSD Services Building

4420 Livernois

Troy, Ml 48098

PLEASE NOTE: This Request for Quote requires the UNIT price of each item. DO NOT
ENTER A LUMP SUM TOTAL IN THE UNIT COST COLUMN.




Troy School District
Replacement RF Wireless Microphone Systems

Bid 9684
Broadcast Supply
VSC Inc. Worldwide Aves A/V Systems Jireh Supplies
Qty Description Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total
5 Azden 325ULH 748.90 3,744.50 no bid no bid no bid
4 Azden 325ULT 698.40 2,793?60 no bid no bid no bid
9 Azden BC-29 32.99 296?91 no bid no bid no bid
5 Sennheiser EW345 G3-B - : 643.59 3,217.95 647.47 3,237.35 674.96 3,374.80
6 Sennheiser EW322 G3-B - : 607.84 3,647?04 613.72 3,682?32 637.46 3,824?76
2 Sennheiser SK500 G3-B - : 237.25 474?50 243.00 486?00 247.46 494?92
2 Sennheiser EM500 G3-B - : 429.05 858?10 425.00 850?00 449.96 899?92
18  Sennheiser EW172G3 - : 357.54 6,435?72 354.47 6,380?46 374.96 6,749?28
6 Sennheiser SKM 100-835-G3 - : 215.68 1,294?08 216.00 1,296?00 224.96 1,349?76
2 Sennheiser G3OMNIKIT8 - : 1,066.89 2,133?78 1,060.00 2,120?00 1,124.96 2,249?92
4 Sennheiser ASA1/NT - : 357.53 1,430?12 416.00 1,664?00 434.96 1,739?84
4 Sennheiser BB25 - : 20.58 82?32 18.50 74?00 87.72 350?88
4 Shure A13HD - : 10.24 40?96 12.00 48?00 no bid _
1 Freight 48.99 48?99 - - : 120.00 120?00
TOTAL $ 6,884.00 $ 19,614.57 $ 19,838.13 $ 21,154.08




Troy School District

Replacement RF Wireless Micro

Bid 9684

Qty Description
5 Azden 325ULH
4 Azden 325ULT

9 Azden BC-29

5 Sennheiser EW345 G3-B

6 Sennheiser EW322 G3-B

2 Sennheiser SK500 G3-B

2 Sennheiser EM500 G3-B

18 Sennheiser EW172G3

6 Sennheiser SKM 100-835-G3

2 Sennheiser G3OMNIKITS8

4 Sennheiser ASA1/NT

4 Sennheiser BB25

4 Shure A13HD

1 Freight

TOTAL

Videotape Products Troxell Communications B & H Photo West LA Music
Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total

718.00 3,590.00 733.00 3,665.00 725.00 3,625.00 675.00 3,375.00
637.00 2,548?00 670.00 2,680?00 662.00 2,648?00 620.00 2,480?00
16.00 144?00 25.00 225?00 25.00 225?00 22.00 198?00
593.81 2,969?05 646.00 3,230?00 674.00 3,370?00 690.00 3,450?00
560.82 3,364?92 610.00 3,660?00 633.00 3,798?00 655.00 3,930?00
217.72 435?44 239.00 478?00 247.00 494?00 260.00 520?00
395.87 791?74 430.00 860?00 449.00 898?00 465.00 930?00
329.89 5,938?02 362.00 6,516?00 374.00 6,732?00 390.00 7,020?00
197.93 1,187?58 217.00 1,302?00 224.00 1,344?00 235.00 1,410?00
989.69 1,979?38 1,077.00 2,154?00 1,124.00 2,248?00 1,050.00 2,100?00
380.82 1,523?28 416.00 1,664?00 337.00 1,348?00 390.00 1,560?00
15.41 61?64 21.00 84?00 19.00 76?00 19.00 76?00
10.00 40?00 12.00 48?00 8.00 32?00 9.00 36?00
50.00 50?00 - : - 20.00 20?00
$ 24,623.05 $ 26,566.00 $ 26,838.00 $ 27,105.00




Troy School District

Replacement RF Wireless Micro

Bid 9684

Qty Description
5 Azden 325ULH

4 Azden 325ULT
9 Azden BC-29
5 Sennheiser EW345 G3-B
6 Sennheiser EW322 G3-B
2 Sennheiser SK500 G3-B
2 Sennheiser EM500 G3-B
18  Sennheiser EW172G3
6 Sennheiser SKM 100-835-G3
2 Sennheiser G3OMNIKIT8
4 Sennheiser ASA1/NT

4 Sennheiser BB25

4 Shure A13HD
1 Freight

TOTAL

Perimutter Purchasing

Advanced Lighting &

Washington Music

Focus Camera Power Sound Center
Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total

728.94 3,644.70 746.29 3,731.45 765.00 3,825.00 739.00 3,695.00
668.94 2,675?76 679.00 2,716?00 670.00 2,680?00 679.00 2,716?00
24.58 221?22 23.00 207?00 25.00 225?00 26.50 238?50
667.94 3,339?70 678.00 3,390?00 675.00 3,375?00 699.95 3,499?75
629.94 3,779?64 639.00 3,834?00 645.00 3,870?00 659.95 3,959?70
244.94 489?88 248.50 497?00 260.00 520?00 259.00 518?00
444.94 889?88 449.75 899?50 449.00 898?00 469.00 938?00
370.94 6,676?92 369.00 6,642?00 380.00 6,840?00 389.00 7,002?00
222.94 1,337?64 225.00 1,350?00 230.00 1,380?00 237.00 1,422?00
1,110.94 2,221?88 1,119.00 2,238?00 1,125.00 2,250?00 1,165.00 2,330?00
429.94 1,719?76 429.00 1,716?00 450.00 1,800?00 454.00 1,816?00
19.94 79?76 17.75 71?00 24.00 96?00 19.95 79?80
9.94 39?76 9.75 39?00 12.00 48?00 10.95 43?80
$ 27,116.50 $ 27,330.95 $ 27,807.00 $ 28,258.55




Troy School District

Replacement RF Wireless Micro

Bid 9684

Qty Description
5 Azden 325ULH

4 Azden 325ULT
9 Azden BC-29
5 Sennheiser EW345 G3-B
6 Sennheiser EW322 G3-B
2 Sennheiser SK500 G3-B
2 Sennheiser EM500 G3-B
18  Sennheiser EW172G3
6 Sennheiser SKM 100-835-G3
2 Sennheiser G3OMNIKIT8
4 Sennheiser ASA1/NT

4 Sennheiser BB25

4 Shure A13HD
1 Freight

TOTAL

Thalner Electronic Labs

Gridworks Inc.

Aprisa Technology

Unit Cost Total
725.00 3,625.00
662.00 2,648?00

22.00 198?00
708.00 3,540?00
670.00 4,020?00
260.00 520?00
472.00 944?00
394.00 7,092?00
237.00 1,422?00

1,180.00 2,360?00
455.00 1,820?00

20.00 80?00

10.00 40?00

50.00 50?00

$ 28,359.00

Unit Cost

895.00

755.00

33.00

674.97

637.47

247.47

449.97

374.97

224.97

1,124.96

434.96

17.50

12.00

Total

4,475.00

3,020.00

297.00

3,374.85

3,824.82

494,94

899.94

6,749.46

1,349.82

2,249.92

1,739.84

70.00

48.00

$ 28,593.59

Alt

EW345G3-G

Unit Cost

748.88

663.38

27.38

716.88

677.78

262.68

477.98

398.58

238.98

1,194.88

462.48

21.68

10.48

Total

3,744.40

2,653.52

246.42

3,584.40

4,066.68

525.36

955.96

7,174.44

1,433.88

2,389.76

1,849.92

86.72

41.92

$ 28,753.38



Troy School District

Replacement RF Wireless Micro

Bid 9684

Qty Description
5 Azden 325ULH

4 Azden 325ULT
9 Azden BC-29
5 Sennheiser EW345 G3-B
6 Sennheiser EW322 G3-B
2 Sennheiser SK500 G3-B
2 Sennheiser EM500 G3-B
18  Sennheiser EW172G3
6 Sennheiser SKM 100-835-G3
2 Sennheiser G3OMNIKIT8
4 Sennheiser ASA1/NT

4 Sennheiser BB25

4 Shure A13HD
1 Freight

TOTAL

Sound Planning

Audio Visual Innovations

NBS-City Animation Photomart Cine Video Communications / AVI-SPL
Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total

775.00 3,875.00 769.00 3,845.00 785.35 3,926.75 758.24 3,791.20
710.00 2,840?00 703.00 2,812?00 674.61 2,698?44 692.31 2,769?24
25.00 225?00 24.00 216?00 20.34 183?06 23.08 207?72
735.00 3,675?00 748.00 3,740?00 762.75 3,813?75 758.39 3,791?95
690.00 4,140?00 707.00 4,242?00 720.94 4,325?64 996.57 5,979?42
245.00 490?00 273.00 546?00 280.24 560?48 264.16 528?32
490.00 980?00 498.00 996?00 508.50 1,017?00 480.30 960?60
410.00 7,380?00 415.00 7,470?00 423.75 7,627?50 400.25 7,204?50
245.00 1,470?00 248.00 1,488?00 254.25 1,525?50 240.13 1,440?78
1,215.00 2,430?00 1,248.00 2,496?00 1,271.25 2,542?50 1,200.18 2,400?36
470.00 1,880?00 482.00 1,928?00 491.55 1,966?20 464.28 1,857?12
20.00 80?00 18.00 72?00 19.78 79?12 18.69 74?76
10.00 40?00 9.00 36?00 9.04 36?16 6.71 26?84
- : - : - : 142.00 142?00
$ 29,505.00 $ 29,887.00 $ 30,302.10 $31,174.81




Troy School District

Replacement RF Wireless Micro

Bid 9684

Qty Description
5 Azden 325ULH

4 Azden 325ULT
9 Azden BC-29
5 Sennheiser EW345 G3-B
6 Sennheiser EW322 G3-B
2 Sennheiser SK500 G3-B
2 Sennheiser EM500 G3-B
18  Sennheiser EW172G3
6 Sennheiser SKM 100-835-G3
2 Sennheiser G3OMNIKIT8
4 Sennheiser ASA1/NT

4 Sennheiser BB25

4 Shure A13HD
1 Freight

TOTAL

Sound Engineering

Business Services

Unit Cost

826.35

754.49

34.15

767.93

725.27

290.37

511.94

429.65

265.78

1,279.90

495.19

25.83

14.52

1,221.67

Total

4,131.75

3,017.96

307.35

3,839.65

4,351.62

580.74

1,023.88

7,733.70

1,594.68

2,559.80

1,980.76

103.32

58.08

1,221.67

$ 32,504.96

Unit Cost

867.98

742.98

39.98

999.98

934.98

370.98

670.98

559.98

330.98

1,684.98

649.98

169.98

19.98

Total

4,339.90

2,971.92

359.82

4,999.90

5,609.88

741.96

1,341.96

10,079.64

1,985.88

3,369.96

2,599.92

679.92

79.92

$ 39,160.58

Complete Communications: No Bid
LVC Technologies: No Response

Sehi: No Response
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