
REQUEST FOR 
QUOTATION                 

No.       9718  TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT     

DUE DATE     NO LATER THAN 1140 RANKIN, TROY, MICHIGAN 48083     

8/3/11  3 p.m.   248-823-4052     

      FAX: 248-823-4077 DATE      7/20/11 
   REQUEST FOR QUOTE – NOT AN ORDER  

                    THIS FORM MUST BE UTILIZED WHEN RESPONDING TO THIS REQUEST       
                         BID ENVELOPE ENCLOSED           
                        

  THE RFQ NUMBER MUST APPEAR ON ALL QUOTATIONS AND RELATED CORRESPONDENCE, THIS IS NOT AN ORDER 
                       

Quantity       DESCRIPTION        UNIT PRICE  AMOUNT 
                 

  

 Please supply us with your bid to furnish the Troy School District with TRAINING 
ROOM SUPPLIES FOR ATHENS AND TROY HIGH SCHOOLS        

          

  

Copies of the bid are available at: 
 

www.troy.k12.mi.us/purchasing/items_out_for_bid.htm  (left column) 
 

Bid recaps will be available at: 
 

www.troy.k12.mi.us/purchasing/items_out_for_bid.htm  (right column) 
        

  FACSIMILE BID IS NOT ACCEPTABLE      
                 

  

Bids will not be accepted if submitted after the deadline specified (local time) in the advertisement to bid or in the information to 
bidders.  The late submission of a bid makes the bid nonrepsonsive and is a material defect which shall not be waived by the  
Board of Education. Delays in the mail will not be considered. All Late bids in the mail will be returned to the bidder unopened. 
      

 

Proposal for the submission of alternatives by vendors will be accepted and reviewed.  However, if any substitution or departure 
is not clearly noted and described, it will be understood that the bid intends to exactly meet the specifications. 
    

 

The Board of Education shall be the sole judge as to whether the proposed goods are “equal” or “approved”.   Quotations must 
be mailed or delivered to the Purchasing Office, 1140 Rankin, Troy, MI 48083 no later than 3 p.m. on the date shown above. 
Michigan State Sales and Use Taxes and Federal Excise Taxes do not apply unless otherwise indicated.  Exemption certificates 
will be furnished when necessary.  This request imposes no obligations on the buyer.  The Board of Education reserves the right 
to accept or reject any or all bids or to split awards by items or to accept bids, which will best serve the Board of Education.    

        

      THIS AREA MUST BE FILLED IN             

DELIVERY TIME PRICES FIRM FOR  NAME OF COMPANY     
TELEPHONE     
NO.    

                 
                  
TERMS       NO. & STREET      FAX #     
                        

FOB 
ALL DELIVERY CHARGES 
MUST    CITY, STATE & ZIP CODE      E-MAIL     

DELIVERED  BE INCLUDED IN PRICES SHOWN                 
CONTACT PERSON (PLEASE PRINT)   SIGNATURE      DATE    
                
                        



Note:  All bidders are specifically reminded that a completed Affidavit of Bidder 
(Familial Disclosure) MUST be completed and submitted with the bid response.  
Failure to include a completed copy will be grounds for disqualification of bid.  
The Affidavit of Bidder is required to be notarized for construction bids only.  All 
others only require completion and signature. 

AFFIDAVIT OF BIDDER 
 

 The undersigned, the owner or authorized officer of       
(the “Bidder), pursuant to the familial disclosure requirement provided in the   
   (the “School District”) advertisement for construction bids, hereby 
represent and warrant except as provided below, that no familial relationships exist 
between the over(s) or any employee of 
       and any member of the Board of Education of the 
School District or the Superintendent of the School District. 
 
 List any Familial Relationships: 
 
 
   
 BIDDER: 
 
      
  
 By:      
 
 Its:       
STATE OF MICHIGAN     ) 
                                             )ss. 
COUNTY OF     ) 
 
This instrument was acknowledged before me on the   day of   , 2011, 
by   . 
 
 
         
 
      ,Notary Public 
 
      County, Michigan 
 
   My Commission Expires:    
 
   Acting in the County of:    
 

 



TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT 
2011/12 TRAINING ROOM SUPPLIES - ATHENS 

BID 9718 
 
DEPT. 

Qty 

ATHENS HIGH TRAINING ROOM SUPPLIES 

 Description Alternate Unit Cost Total 

 ATHENS    

40 cs 1 ½ in x 15 yards coach tape  32044m no   

10 bxs 1 in x 10 yards zonas tape  32005m no   

20 cs 2 in x 7.5 yards pros choice elastic tape  94722 no   

10 bxs Bsn-jobst 2 in cover roll  35140 no   

8 rl Bsl-jobst leukotape p 1 ½ in x 15 yards  85580 no   

4 cs Medco foam underwrap  92120 no   

4 cs Foam underwrap cramer red  28036m no   

5 bxs Cramer heel and lace pads    3”x3”  28052m no   

2 btl Mastisol liquid adhesive 2oz  2605-85    

2 cs QDA  12170c no   

2 cs Co-flex 2in x 5 yards  032026 no   

2 cs Co-flex 3in x 5 yards  032027 no   

1 dz 3 in elastic bandage x 4 ½ yards  28003m    

4 dz 4 in elastic bandage x 4 ½ yards  28004m    
4 dz 6 in elastic bandage x 4 ½ yards  28011m    

5 dz 6 in DL elastic bandage x 10 yards  36330    

3 bx Flexicon conforming stretch 3 in nonsterile  25027m    

4 bx Non-adherent pads 3in x 4 in  29010m    

10 bg Non-sterile 4 x 4 sponges  33632m 
 

   

2 jars Spenco 2nd

 
 skin  1” squares  35650 no   

4 jars Spenco 2nd

 
 skin 3” cicles  35690 no   

6 bxs Bandaid ¾ in sheer  21007m    

6 bxs Bandaid 1in sheer  21008m 
 

   

1 bxs Sheer mini bandages 3/8 in  2618-47    

4 bxs Bandaid flexible fabric knuckle  22204m 
 
 

   



Qty  Description Alternate Unit Cost Total 

3 btl New skin liquid bandage  1oz liquid  69575    

4 Iso-quin gallon  54057m    

6 bx Flex Fab. Fingertip  22105M    

8 bx Sheer XL Bandaids  23002M    

4 bx Triple Antibiotic  36008M    

24 Flexible Fabric Strips 1” x 3” 2618-38    

4 bx Stiptik Swabpoules  65230    

3bx CalaGel 1/32 oz packets no   

4 bx  BioFreeze 5g packet  29214    

4 Histocryl Skin Adhesive 266262 No   

6 Gal Simple Green D  2667-11    

12 Sensitive eyes  66656    

4 bx Medi-Lyte 500  35007M    

1 Epipen Auto Injector  .3mg  P1244rx    

8 rl Classic Wrap  4” x 650’  86598    

2 Replacement Lead wires  5543-45    

12 Dura-Stick II  2x2 Electrodes  72003    

2 Exercise Bands Level 3 50 yd  A505-12    

2 Exercise Bands Level 4 50 yd  A505-13    

2 Exercise Bands Level 5 50yd.  A505-14    

2 btls 10 hour Insect Repellent 2 oz    

8 bx  Nitrile Gloves Large 2603-26    

2 Tuff Kit    

1gal Flex-All 45 7lb    

16 Arm slings ( 4-medium, 12-Large)    

6 One Step Splints 4”x 30”    

2 Shock shield 5/16” x 12” x 22”  No   

6 Moleskin  2”      

12 Tuli’s heel cups    



Qty  Description Alternate Unit Cost Total 

3 Instant Ice 3.5 oz Stream Spray    

4 10”x10” standard terry covers    

2 Neck contour terry covers 24”    

6 pr Heavy duty 9” bandage scissors    

12 pr 8” Pro-trainer scissors    

12 pr 4 ½” Lister bandage scissors    

6 Nail clippers    

2 Toenail clippers    

36 Bactine 4 oz    

4 tubes Cramer Strawberry Ointment 2.75oz No   

8 btl Hyrdrogen Peroxide 8oz    

2 No glare stick    

2 Rosin mixture 4.5oz    

12 cans Precise Hospital foam Cleaner 20 oz    

2 bx APAP Extra Strength Non-aspirin (500) (250/2’s) 
Pain Reliever    

2 bx Iprin (500 x 250/2’s)    

1 bx Diamode (50/1’s) Antidiarreal    

1 bx  Ditame(50/2’s) Pepto Bismol    

1 bx Dephen (200/1’s) Benedryl    

2 jrs Medikoff Drops 600/jar Cough Drops    

4 bx Medi-lyte Tablets 500 (250/2’s) 
    

2 Save –a-tooth 
    

4 bx Ice bags (Cramer 9/12 x 18”) 1500 count 
    

1 Adjustable Suspension Seat MFR #14-25 25”w 
    

2 The Stick (massage stick) 19 
    

2  Digital Thermometer (oral) 
    

2 Oral Thermometer Sheaths 
 

   

1 Reagent Test Strips (Multistix 10sg) 
    



 Quan. Description Alternate Unit Cost Total 

48 White Terry Cloth Towels 15”x25”    

1 cs Acclaim Facial Tissue    

1 bx Biohazard Bags 24”x24” 10 count    

4 bx Nitrile Gloves (Ansell micor touch) (L)    

2 Callus files    

1 Thunberbolt Pro BL Series Portable Storm Detector 
Mfr# TB-CRI 120MBL    

2 AT Soft sided kits jr.  Empty    

1  Super knee splint – medium    

1 Super knee splint -  large    

2 Rapid form vacuum splints (leg size)    

1 Plastalume finger splints kit 6ea of 9 sizes    

2 Adjustable extrication collar    

2 C collar (soft) medium    

2 C collar (soft) large    

6 pr Crutches – medium 42”-54”    

6 pr Crutches – adult 50”-62”    

2 sheet Super foam ¼” x21”x36”    

2 sheet Super foam 3/8” x 21x36”    

2 Ortho gel kit    

4 bgs Econoline blister pads ¼” foam    

5 Stability balls    

10  Agility dots    

2 Foam rollers    

2  Stop watches    



 
TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT 

2011/12 TRAINING ROOM SUPPLIES TROY HIGH 
BID 9718 

 
 
 
DEPT. 

  
TROY HIGH TRAINING ROOM SUPPLIES 

Qty.  Description Alternate Unit Cost Total 

40 cs J & J coach tape 1.5  32/roll/cs    

10 bx Zonas Porous Tape 1”    

5 cs Elastikon elastic tape 2”  24 roll/cs    

4 cs Elastikon elastic tape 1”  12 roll/cs    

10 cs Powerflex self-adhesive tape 2” black  24 roll/cs    

5 cs Cramer pre-wrap black   48 roll/cs    

10 bx Non adherent pads 3”x 4” 100/box    

5 jars 2nd   Skin squares  200/jar   

5 bx Triple antibiotic ointment 144 packets/box    

2 Nosebleed QR powder 4 applications    

10 bx Medicaine sting swabs     

1 gal Cavicide     

1 gal Lemocide    

1bx Medique Acetaminophen 500/box    

1bx Medique I-Prin 500/box    

1 Benadryll allergy dose box    

10 cs Flexiwrap 4” clear 6 rolls/cs no handle    

5 rolls Cramer heavy duty ice bags 1500/roll    

2 Whirlpool antiseptic powder 30gm unit dose    

2 Durastick E-stim electrodes 2x2 4/pack 10 packs    

3 Medco High Intensity pen light 6/pack    

1 Multistix 10SG    

10 Non-latex powder free exam gloves large    



 

Qty Description Alternate Unit Cost Total 

10 SAM Splint 36”    

5 Aluminum crutches large    

1 Mouthguards with helmet straps 100/bag    
3 Foam roller 6” half round 12” long    

8 Therabond loop yellow    

3 Therabond loop green    

8 Therabond loop red    

3 Portable water hose 50ft    

2 Stretch out strap    

2 Whirlpool thermometer    

5 Fingernail clippers    

5 Toenail clippers    

3 Foam cast cover 2/pack    

2 Flat shelf utility cart    

1 Transpore 1” transparent tape 12/cs    

2 Heel & Lace pads 2000/box    

4 BioFreeze 5gm packet 100/box    

10 Vionex Towelettes 50/box    

2 Legend 9 qt ice chest red    

1 Oral thermometer sheaths 50/box    

1 Prolene polypropylene blue monofilament sutures 4/0 
12/box    

2 Neoprene thigh sleeve black M    

2 Neoprene thigh sleeve black L    

2 Neoprene thigh sleeve black XL    



Troy School District
Bid 9718
Training Room Supplies

Unit Unit Unit
Qty Measure Cost Extended Cost Extended Cost Extended

Athens
coach tape 40 case 43.15       1,726.00  43.64       1,745.60    42.28       1,691.20  
zonas tape 10 box 10.10       101.00     10.13       101.30       10.28       102.80     
elastic tape 20 case 39.62       792.40     39.21       784.20       40.90       818.00     
cover roll 10 box 7.43         74.30       73.50       735.00       6.90         69.00       
leukotape 8 roll 5.61         44.88       5.74         45.92         5.30         42.40       
foam underwrap 4 case 28.02       112.08     29.99       119.96       29.90       119.60     
underwrap cramer red 4 case 28.86       115.44     29.99       119.96       27.90       111.60     
heel & lace pads 5 box 15.01       75.05       15.88       79.40         15.75       78.75       
Mastisol liquid adhesive 2 bottle 31.86       63.72       33.90       67.80         33.50       67.00       
QDA 2 case 65.05       130.10     5.67         11.34         88.95       177.90     
Co-flex 2in 2 case 35.36       70.72       36.00       72.00         32.50       65.00       
Co-flex 3in 2 case 31.53       63.06       32.11       64.22         28.95       57.90       
3: elastic bandage 1 dz 0.45         0.45         Alt 3.01         6.02           5.50         5.50         
4" elastic bandage 4 dz 0.58         2.32         Alt 4.07         20.35         6.80         27.20       
6" elastic bandage 4 dz 0.80         3.20         Alt 5.76         28.80         8.00         32.00       
6" DL elastic bandage 5 dz 2.55         12.75       Alt 34.45       344.50       27.30       136.50     
Flexicon conforming stretch 3 box 3.78         11.34       8.67         26.01         1.29         3.87         
non-adhesive pads 4 box 6.27         25.08       7.93         31.72         5.39         21.56       
non-sterile sponges 10 box 2.62         26.20       2.85         28.50         2.65         26.50       
2nd skin 1" squares 2 jar 13.62       27.24       15.67       31.34         13.95       27.90       
2nd skin 3" squares 4 jar 21.07       84.28       23.43       93.72         20.95       83.80       
3/4" Bandaids 6 box 3.03         18.18       1.00         6.00           1.15         6.90         
1" Bandaids 6 box 3.41         20.46       1.23         7.38           1.25         7.50         
mini bandages 1 box 0.71         0.71         0.84         0.84           0.70         0.70         
knuckle bandages 4 box 6.37         25.48       5.20         20.80         2.90         11.60       
liquid bandage 3 bottle 4.25         12.75       4.57         13.71         4.15         12.45       
Iso-quin 4 gallon 24.95       99.80       25.16       100.64       23.75       95.00       

Medco Supply Henry Schein, Inc United Health
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Troy School District
Bid 9718
Training Room Supplies

Unit Unit Unit
Qty Measure Cost Extended Cost Extended Cost Extended

Medco Supply Henry Schein, Inc United Health

finger tip bandages 6 box 6.07         36.42       5.46         32.76         2.85         17.10       
XL Bandaids 8 box 5.68         45.44       3.01         24.08         2.25         18.00       
Triple antibiotic 4 box 24.15       96.60       7.33         29.32         8.30         33.20       
flex fabric strips 24 box 1.92         46.08       2.21         53.04         1.55         37.20       
Stipik Swabpoules 4 box 31.07       124.28     53.64       214.56       40.50       162.00     
Calagel 1/32 oz 3 box 15.33       45.99       16.42       49.26         14.45       43.35       
Biofreeze 4 box 25.25       101.00     25.76       103.04       23.30       93.20       
Histocryl skin adhesive 4 box 23.08       92.32       Alt 317.07     317.07       no bid
simple green 6 gallon 108.98     653.88     Alt 10.94       65.64         no bid
sensitive eyes 12 box 3.44         41.28       3.71         44.52         3.40         40.80       
Medi-Lyte 4 box 12.42       49.68       13.52       54.08         12.19       48.76       
Epipen auto injector 1 pkg 100.69     100.69     93.74       93.74         99.50       99.50       
classic wrap 4" x 650' 8 roll 19.53       156.24     29.61       236.88       no bid
Lead wires 2 ea 18.20       36.40       19.40       38.80         no bid
Dura-stick II electrodes 12 ea 3.20         38.40       3.36         40.32         3.25         39.00       
exercise bands level 3 2 yd 23.02       46.04       56.54       113.08       67.90       135.80     
exercise bands level 4 2 yd 29.18       58.36       60.70       121.40       75.95       151.90     
exercise bands level 5 2 yd 31.49       62.98       64.81       129.62       81.90       163.80     
insect repellent 2 bottle 3.07         6.14         2.19         4.38           3.15         6.30         
Nitrile gloves 8 box 6.21         49.68       5.63         45.04         5.30         42.40       
Tuff kit 2 kit 42.03       84.06       39.12       78.24         no bid
Flex-all 1 gallon 59.73       59.73       65.20       65.20         55.40       55.40       
arm slings 16 ea 2.01         32.16       2.22         35.52         1.95         31.20       
one step splints 6 ea 92.52       555.12     Alt 98.48       98.48         no bid
shock shield 2 ea 45.45       90.90       no bid 41.50       83.00       
Moleskin 6 roll 12.22       73.32       22.41       134.46       11.95       71.70       
heel cups 12 box 4.24         50.88       4.97         59.64         5.20         62.40       
instant ice 3 ea 19.82       59.46       19.51       58.53         no bid
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Troy School District
Bid 9718
Training Room Supplies

Unit Unit Unit
Qty Measure Cost Extended Cost Extended Cost Extended

Medco Supply Henry Schein, Inc United Health

standard terry covers 4 ea 14.13       56.52       16.69       66.76         11.40       45.60       
neck contour covers 2 ea 13.40       26.80       12.16       24.32         12.40       24.80       
bandage scissors 6 ea 10.65       63.90       24.53       147.18       27.95       167.70     
8" pro-trainer scissors 12 ea 4.90         58.80       7.74         92.88         2.95         35.40       
4-1/2" bandage scissors 12 ea 1.10         13.20       12.74       152.88       1.05         12.60       
nail clippers 6 ea 0.27         1.62         Alt 2.94         2.94           0.29         1.74         
toenail clippers 2 ea 0.70         1.40         Alt 4.72         4.72           0.59         1.18         
Bactine 36 bottle 3.71         133.56     4.10         147.60       3.69         132.84     
Cramer ointment 4 tube discontinued no bid 6.90         27.60       
Hydrogen Peroxide 8 bottle 0.45         3.60         0.49         3.92           0.49         3.92         
no glare stick 2 ea 1.24         2.48         2.47         4.94           2.50         5.00         
Rosin mixture 2 ea 5.66         11.32       5.88         11.76         5.75         11.50       
foam cleaner 12 can 5.69         68.28       5.94         71.28         5.40         64.80       
non-aspirin pain reliever 2 box 10.67       21.34       9.35         18.70         9.50         19.00       
Iprin 2 box 9.50         19.00       15.49       30.98         9.50         19.00       
Diamode antidiarreal 1 box 16.87       16.87       8.48         8.48           7.90         7.90         
Pepto Bismol 1 box 6.25         6.25         6.80         6.80           6.60         6.60         
Benedryl 1 box 7.05         7.05         7.49         7.49           7.10         7.10         
cough drops 2 jar 23.31       46.62       25.08       50.16         16.50       33.00       
Medi-lyte tablets 4 box 12.42       49.68       13.52       54.08         12.19       48.76       
Save-a-Tooth 2 ea 10.31       20.62       10.94       21.88         9.95         19.90       
ice bags 4 box 60.80       243.20     63.47       253.88       55.90       223.60     
suspension seat 1 ea discontinued no bid no bid
massage stick 2 ea 21.43       42.86       24.94       49.88         no bid
digital thermometer 2 ea 2.33         4.66         2.85         5.70           2.20         4.40         
oral thermometer sheaths 2 box 1.92         3.84         2.49         4.98           1.65         3.30         
reagent test strips 1 box 58.52       58.52       43.43       43.43         40.70       40.70       
terry cloths 48 ea 6.90         331.20     Alt 28.30       113.20       no bid
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Troy School District
Bid 9718
Training Room Supplies

Unit Unit Unit
Qty Measure Cost Extended Cost Extended Cost Extended

Medco Supply Henry Schein, Inc United Health

facial tissue 1 box 24.64       24.64       Alt 1.00         30.00         16.95       16.95       
biohazard bags 1 box 0.99         0.99         12.57       12.57         0.88         0.88         
nitrile gloves 4 box 6.21         24.84       15.85       63.40         5.30         21.20       
callus files 2 ea 1.15         2.30         no bid 2.70         5.40         
portable storm detector 1 ea 351.61     351.61     357.30     357.30       no bid
AT soft sided kits 2 ea 72.12       144.24     107.46     214.92       47.90       95.80       
knee splint -medium 1 ea 23.48       23.48       no bid 20.95       20.95       
knee splint - large 1 ea 23.48       23.48       no bid 20.95       20.95       
vacuum splints 2 ea 204.28     408.56     203.61     407.22       181.95     363.90     
finger splints 1 kit 54.32       54.32       57.76       57.76         53.90       53.90       
extrication collar 2 ea 6.51         13.02       5.28         10.56         14.50       29.00       
C collar medium 2 ea 2.84         5.68         7.50         15.00         3.50         7.00         
C collar large 2 ea 2.84         5.68         7.50         15.00         3.50         7.00         
crutches - medium 6 pair 13.17       79.02       13.59       81.54         11.65       69.90       
crutches - adult 6 pair 13.17       79.02       13.59       81.54         11.65       69.90       
super foam 1/4" 2 sheet 27.02       54.04       29.65       59.30         24.90       49.80       
super foam 3/8" 2 sheet 34.25       68.50       37.59       75.18         31.90       63.80       
Ortho gel 2 kit 29.78       59.56       30.37       60.74         28.90       57.80       
blister pads 4 bag 7.18         28.72       2.10         8.40           5.80         23.20       
stability balls 5 ea 16.58       82.90       no bid no bid
agility dots 10 pkg 9.66         96.60       no bid no bid
foam rollers 2 ea 12.18       24.36       3.12         6.24           no bid
stop watches 2 ea 4.91         9.82         5.00         10.00         no bid

Athens Total 9,611.09 10,015.22 7,281.41

Troy High
coach tape 40 case 43.15       1,726.00  43.64       1,745.60    42.28       1,691.20  
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Troy School District
Bid 9718
Training Room Supplies

Unit Unit Unit
Qty Measure Cost Extended Cost Extended Cost Extended

Medco Supply Henry Schein, Inc United Health

zonas tape 10 box 10.10       101.00     10.13       101.30       10.28       102.80     
elastic tape 2" 5 case 53.52       267.60     54.10       270.50       53.50       267.50     
elastic tape 1" 4 case 14.46       57.84       14.76       59.04         14.40       57.60       
self adhesive tape 2" 10 case 25.48       254.80     25.89       258.90       25.90       259.00     
Cramer pre-wrap 5 case 28.86       144.30     29.99       149.95       27.90       139.50     
non adhesive pads 10 box 5.19         51.90       7.93         79.30         5.39         53.90       
2nd skin squares 5 jar 13.62       68.10       15.67       78.35         13.95       69.75       
triple antibiotic 5 box 7.23         36.15       7.33         36.65         8.30         41.50       
nosebleed QR powder 2 ea 5.22         10.44       Alt 8.84         8.84           no bid
medicaine sting swabs 10 box 1.76         17.60       2.93         29.30         2.50         25.00       
Cavicide 1 gallon 16.87       16.87       17.73       17.73         16.70       16.70       
lemocide 1 gallon 13.36       13.36       no bid no bid
Acetaminophen 1 box 10.67       10.67       9.35         9.35           5.60         5.60         
Medique 1 box 9.50         9.50         15.49       15.49         9.50         9.50         
Benadryll 1 box 7.05         7.05         7.49         7.49           15.40       15.40       
flexiwrap 4' ice bags 10 box 28.85       288.50     29.61       296.10       26.90       269.00     
ice bags 5 case 60.80       304.00     63.47       317.35       55.90       279.50     
antiseptic powder 2 pkg 62.05       124.10     no bid no bid
E-stim electrodes 2 ea 34.08       68.16       3.36         6.72           no bid
High intensity pen light 3 pkg 3.66         10.98       5.02         15.06         4.30         12.90       
Multistix 1 ea 58.52       58.52       43.43       43.43         40.70       40.70       
non-latex exam gloves 10 box 2.93         29.30       5.63         56.30         3.20         32.00       
Sam splint 10 ea 6.80         68.00       7.01         70.10         10.30       103.00     
Alum. Crutches 5 pair 13.17       65.85       13.59       67.95         11.65       58.25       
mouthguards 1 bag 35.50       35.50       35.35       35.35         no bid
foam roller 3 ea 2.38         7.14         3.12         9.36           4.50         13.50       
Therabond loop yellow 8 ea 2.36         18.88       no bid 2.09         16.72       
Therabond loop green 3 ea 3.00         9.00         no bid 2.69         8.07         
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Troy School District
Bid 9718
Training Room Supplies

Unit Unit Unit
Qty Measure Cost Extended Cost Extended Cost Extended

Medco Supply Henry Schein, Inc United Health

Therabond loop red 8 ea 2.83         22.64       no bid 2.49         19.92       
portable water hose 3 ea discontinued no bid no bid
stretch out wrap 2 ea 11.09       22.18       16.70       33.40         26.90       53.80       
whirlpool thermometer 2 ea 11.82       23.64       207.75     415.50       no bid
fingernail clippers 5 ea 0.27         1.35         Alt 2.94         2.94           0.29         1.45         
toenail clippers 5 ea 0.70         3.50         Alt 4.72         4.72           0.59         2.95         
foam cast cover 3 pkg 18.90       56.70       18.46       55.38         17.70       53.10       
utlity cart 2 ea 178.91     357.82     191.46     382.92       no bid
transparent tape 1" 1 case 13.66       13.66       14.73       14.73         12.75       12.75       
heel & lace pads 2 box 15.01       30.02       15.88       31.76         15.75       31.50       
Biofreeze 4 box 25.25       101.00     25.76       103.04       23.30       93.20       
Vionex towlettes 10 box 7.35         73.50       7.73         77.30         7.39         73.90       
ice chest 2 ea 18.09       36.18       29.02       58.04         17.95       35.90       
oral thermometer sheaths 1 box 2.01         2.01         2.49         2.49           1.65         1.65         
polypropylene sutures 1 box 79.11       79.11       no bid no bid
Neoprene thigh sleeve L 2 ea 4.70         9.40         10.12       20.24         5.70         11.40       
Neoprene thigh sleeve M 2 ea 4.70         9.40         10.12       20.24         5.70         11.40       
Neoprene thigh sleeve XL 2 ea 4.70         9.40         10.12       20.24         5.70         11.40       

Troy High Total 4,732.62 5,028.45  4,002.91
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Troy School District
Bid 9718
Training Room Supplies

Qty Measure

Athens
coach tape 40 case
zonas tape 10 box
elastic tape 20 case
cover roll 10 box
leukotape 8 roll
foam underwrap 4 case
underwrap cramer red 4 case
heel & lace pads 5 box
Mastisol liquid adhesive 2 bottle
QDA 2 case
Co-flex 2in 2 case
Co-flex 3in 2 case
3: elastic bandage 1 dz
4" elastic bandage 4 dz
6" elastic bandage 4 dz
6" DL elastic bandage 5 dz
Flexicon conforming stretch 3 box
non-adhesive pads 4 box
non-sterile sponges 10 box
2nd skin 1" squares 2 jar
2nd skin 3" squares 4 jar
3/4" Bandaids 6 box
1" Bandaids 6 box
mini bandages 1 box
knuckle bandages 4 box
liquid bandage 3 bottle
Iso-quin 4 gallon

Unit Unit Unit
Cost Extended Cost Extended Cost Extended

no bid 47.46       1,898.40  44.59       1,783.60  
no bid 11.20       112.00     10.46       104.60     
no bid 43.82       876.40     45.35       907.00     
no bid 7.44         74.40       7.09         70.90       
no bid 5.67         45.36       5.79         46.32       
no bid 31.69       126.76     no bid
no bid 31.69       126.76     no bid
no bid 17.35       86.75       23.59       117.95     
no bid 32.15       64.30       29.73       59.46       
no bid 48.04       96.08       9.25         18.50       
no bid 50.82       101.64     32.76       65.52       
no bid 42.35       84.70       29.21       58.42       
no bid 4.69         4.69         3.12         3.12         
no bid 6.11         24.44       3.72         14.88       
no bid 8.34         33.36       5.64         22.56       
no bid 70.20       351.00     30.60       153.00     
no bid 1.55         4.65         7.81         23.43       
no bid 5.71         22.84       5.37         21.48       
no bid 2.66         26.60       3.97         39.70       
no bid 16.27       32.54       15.24       30.48       
no bid 24.20       96.80       22.66       90.64       
no bid 1.19         7.14         1.07         6.42         
no bid 1.32         7.92         1.26         7.56         
no bid 0.99         0.99         1.35         1.35         
no bid 3.44         13.76       3.01         12.04       
no bid 4.49         13.47       4.38         13.14       
no bid 27.76       111.04     no bid

School Health Corp Moore Medical LLCSport Supply Group
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Troy School District
Bid 9718
Training Room Supplies

Qty Measure

finger tip bandages 6 box
XL Bandaids 8 box
Triple antibiotic 4 box
flex fabric strips 24 box
Stipik Swabpoules 4 box
Calagel 1/32 oz 3 box
Biofreeze 4 box
Histocryl skin adhesive 4 box
simple green 6 gallon
sensitive eyes 12 box
Medi-Lyte 4 box
Epipen auto injector 1 pkg
classic wrap 4" x 650' 8 roll
Lead wires 2 ea
Dura-stick II electrodes 12 ea
exercise bands level 3 2 yd
exercise bands level 4 2 yd
exercise bands level 5 2 yd
insect repellent 2 bottle
Nitrile gloves 8 box
Tuff kit 2 kit
Flex-all 1 gallon
arm slings 16 ea
one step splints 6 ea
shock shield 2 ea
Moleskin 6 roll
heel cups 12 box
instant ice 3 ea

Unit Unit Unit
Cost Extended Cost Extended Cost Extended

School Health Corp Moore Medical LLCSport Supply Group

no bid 3.46         20.76       2.73         16.38       
no bid 2.75         22.00       2.10         16.80       
no bid 9.89         39.56       1.21         4.84         
no bid 1.94         46.56       1.70         40.80       
no bid 30.88       123.52     no bid
no bid 20.65       61.95       14.23       42.69       
no bid 26.22       104.88     23.21       92.84       
no bid no bid no bid

41.98       251.88     15.02       90.12       no bid
no bid 3.40         40.80       3.18         38.16       
no bid 13.65       54.60       11.00       44.00       
no bid 69.67       69.67       65.00       65.00       
no bid no bid no bid
no bid no bid no bid
no bid 4.05         48.60       37.86       454.32     
no bid no bid no bid
no bid no bid no bid
no bid no bid no bid
no bid no bid 2.85         5.70         
no bid 7.53         60.24       4.05         32.40       
no bid no bid no bid
no bid 62.81       62.81       65.67       65.67       
no bid 3.25         52.00       3.23         51.68       
no bid no bid 6.26         37.56       
no bid 36.76       73.52       no bid
no bid 11.60       69.60       no bid
no bid 4.39         52.68       4.78         57.36       
no bid 22.17       66.51       28.89       86.67       
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Troy School District
Bid 9718
Training Room Supplies

Qty Measure

standard terry covers 4 ea
neck contour covers 2 ea
bandage scissors 6 ea
8" pro-trainer scissors 12 ea
4-1/2" bandage scissors 12 ea
nail clippers 6 ea
toenail clippers 2 ea
Bactine 36 bottle
Cramer ointment 4 tube
Hydrogen Peroxide 8 bottle
no glare stick 2 ea
Rosin mixture 2 ea
foam cleaner 12 can
non-aspirin pain reliever 2 box
Iprin 2 box
Diamode antidiarreal 1 box
Pepto Bismol 1 box
Benedryl 1 box
cough drops 2 jar
Medi-lyte tablets 4 box
Save-a-Tooth 2 ea
ice bags 4 box
suspension seat 1 ea
massage stick 2 ea
digital thermometer 2 ea
oral thermometer sheaths 2 box
reagent test strips 1 box
terry cloths 48 ea

Unit Unit Unit
Cost Extended Cost Extended Cost Extended

School Health Corp Moore Medical LLCSport Supply Group

no bid 14.54       58.16       13.58       54.32       
no bid 15.21       30.42       13.58       27.16       
no bid 8.36         50.16       6.35         38.10       

9.88         118.56     22.90       274.80     no bid
no bid 0.81         9.72         4.00         48.00       
no bid 0.28         1.68         0.33         1.98         
no bid 0.57         1.14         1.86         3.72         
no bid 3.54         127.44     3.35         120.60     
no bid no bid 8.71         34.84       
no bid 0.55         4.40         0.48         3.84         
no bid 2.34         4.68         1.67         3.34         
no bid 5.67         11.34       no bid
no bid 6.09         73.08       5.41         64.92       
no bid 8.55         17.10       4.71         9.42         
no bid 16.24       32.48       8.60         17.20       
no bid 9.00         9.00         15.29       15.29       
no bid 7.28         7.28         5.65         5.65         
no bid 7.99         7.99         6.21         6.21         
no bid 21.16       42.32       21.11       42.22       
no bid 13.65       54.60       11.00       44.00       
no bid 10.63       21.26       9.34         18.68       

58.98       235.92     62.61       250.44     61.24       244.96     
no bid no bid no bid
no bid no bid no bid
no bid 2.54         5.08         1.63         3.26         
no bid 2.18         4.36         1.56         3.12         
no bid 45.17       45.17       39.62       39.62       
no bid 7.62         365.76     no bid
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Troy School District
Bid 9718
Training Room Supplies

Qty Measure

facial tissue 1 box
biohazard bags 1 box
nitrile gloves 4 box
callus files 2 ea
portable storm detector 1 ea
AT soft sided kits 2 ea
knee splint -medium 1 ea
knee splint - large 1 ea
vacuum splints 2 ea
finger splints 1 kit
extrication collar 2 ea
C collar medium 2 ea
C collar large 2 ea
crutches - medium 6 pair
crutches - adult 6 pair
super foam 1/4" 2 sheet
super foam 3/8" 2 sheet
Ortho gel 2 kit
blister pads 4 bag
stability balls 5 ea
agility dots 10 pkg
foam rollers 2 ea
stop watches 2 ea

Athens Total

Troy High
coach tape 40 case

Unit Unit Unit
Cost Extended Cost Extended Cost Extended

School Health Corp Moore Medical LLCSport Supply Group

no bid 20.65       20.65       13.07       13.07       
no bid 0.69         0.69         no bid
no bid 7.53         30.12       4.05         16.20       
no bid 1.81         3.62         no bid
no bid 286.08     286.08     no bid
no bid 80.14       160.28     no bid
no bid no bid 6.56         6.56         
no bid no bid 6.56         6.56         
no bid 229.75     459.50     no bid
no bid 57.65       57.65       25.18       25.18       
no bid 13.13       26.26       5.03         10.06       
no bid 4.63         9.26         2.19         4.38         
no bid 4.63         9.26         2.19         4.38         
no bid 15.37       92.22       11.81       70.86       
no bid 15.37       92.22       11.81       70.86       
no bid 16.37       32.74       no bid
no bid 20.07       40.14       no bid
no bid 33.37       66.74       no bid
no bid 5.29         21.16       no bid

11.98       59.90       16.61       83.05       no bid
11.52       115.20     no bid no bid

no bid 12.59       25.18       no bid
18.48       36.96       3.75         7.50         no bid

818.42   8,639.35  5,903.50

31.88       1,275.20  47.46       1,898.40  44.59       1,783.60  
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Troy School District
Bid 9718
Training Room Supplies

Qty Measure

zonas tape 10 box
elastic tape 2" 5 case
elastic tape 1" 4 case
self adhesive tape 2" 10 case
Cramer pre-wrap 5 case
non adhesive pads 10 box
2nd skin squares 5 jar
triple antibiotic 5 box
nosebleed QR powder 2 ea
medicaine sting swabs 10 box
Cavicide 1 gallon
lemocide 1 gallon
Acetaminophen 1 box
Medique 1 box
Benadryll 1 box
flexiwrap 4' ice bags 10 box
ice bags 5 case
antiseptic powder 2 pkg
E-stim electrodes 2 ea
High intensity pen light 3 pkg
Multistix 1 ea
non-latex exam gloves 10 box
Sam splint 10 ea
Alum. Crutches 5 pair
mouthguards 1 bag
foam roller 3 ea
Therabond loop yellow 8 ea
Therabond loop green 3 ea

Unit Unit Unit
Cost Extended Cost Extended Cost Extended

School Health Corp Moore Medical LLCSport Supply Group

no bid 11.20       112.00     10.46       104.60     
no bid 59.80       299.00     no bid
no bid 16.03       64.12       no bid
no bid 29.54       295.40     27.59       275.90     
no bid 31.68       158.40     no bid
no bid 5.71         57.10       5.37         53.70       
no bid 16.27       81.35       15.24       76.20       
no bid 9.89         49.45       8.52         42.60       
no bid no bid 14.27       28.54       
no bid 1.76         17.60       1.86         18.60       
no bid 17.66       17.66       15.74       15.74       
no bid no bid no bid
no bid 14.81       14.81       4.71         4.71         
no bid 8.50         8.50         8.60         8.60         
no bid 7.06         7.06         6.71         6.71         

34.98       349.80     29.90       299.00     32.79       327.90     
58.98       294.90     62.61       313.05     61.24       306.20     

no bid no bid no bid
no bid 4.05         8.10         37.86       75.72       
no bid 4.45         13.35       3.11         9.33         
no bid 45.17       45.17       39.62       39.62       
no bid 5.08         50.80       4.05         40.50       
no bid 11.32       113.20     6.76         67.60       
no bid 15.37       76.85       11.81       59.05       

26.00       26.00       30.00       30.00       58.00       58.00       
no bid 12.96       38.88       no bid
no bid 7.85         62.80       no bid
no bid 9.74         29.22       no bid
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Troy School District
Bid 9718
Training Room Supplies

Qty Measure

Therabond loop red 8 ea
portable water hose 3 ea
stretch out wrap 2 ea
whirlpool thermometer 2 ea
fingernail clippers 5 ea
toenail clippers 5 ea
foam cast cover 3 pkg
utlity cart 2 ea
transparent tape 1" 1 case
heel & lace pads 2 box
Biofreeze 4 box
Vionex towlettes 10 box
ice chest 2 ea
oral thermometer sheaths 1 box
polypropylene sutures 1 box
Neoprene thigh sleeve L 2 ea
Neoprene thigh sleeve M 2 ea
Neoprene thigh sleeve XL 2 ea

Troy High Total

Unit Unit Unit
Cost Extended Cost Extended Cost Extended

School Health Corp Moore Medical LLCSport Supply Group

no bid 11.00       88.00       no bid
349.91     1,049.73  29.35       88.05       no bid

no bid 11.76       23.52       no bid
no bid no bid no bid
no bid 0.28         1.40         0.33         1.65         
no bid 0.57         2.85         1.86         9.30         
no bid 19.29       57.87       no bid
no bid 185.79     371.58     137.38     274.76     
no bid 174.00     174.00     7.16         7.16         
no bid 17.35       34.70       23.59       47.18       
no bid 26.22       104.88     23.21       92.84       
no bid 7.70         77.00       7.20         72.00       
no bid no bid no bid
no bid no bid 1.56         1.56         
no bid no bid no bid
no bid 5.00         10.00       no bid
no bid 5.00         10.00       4.78         9.56         
no bid 5.00         10.00       4.78         9.56         

2,995.63 5,215.12  3,928.99

BSN Sports - no response
MI First Aid and Safety - no response
Shoreline Sport Medicine - no response
Foley Medical Supply - no response
Dimmer Warren - no response
Flaghouse - no response
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