REQUEST FOR
QUOTATION

No. 9727 TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT
DUEDATE  NOLATERTHAN 1140 RANKIN, TROY, MICHIGAN 48083

3/12/12 3p.m. 248-823-4065

FAX: 248-823-4051 DATE 22812012

REQUEST FOR QUOTE - NOT AN ORDER

THIS FORM MUST BE UTILIZED WHEN RESPONDING TO THIS REQUEST
BID ENVELOPE ENCLOSED

THE RFQ NUMBER MUST APPEAR ON ALL QUOTATIONS AND RELATED CORRESPONDENCE, THIS IS NOT AN ORDER

Quantity DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE AMOUNT

Please supply us with your bid to furnish the Troy School District with TRASH CAN
LINERS

Copies of the bid are available at:
www.troy.k12.mi.us/purchasing/items_out_for_bid.htm (left column)
Bid recaps will be available at:

www.troy.k12.mi.us/purchasing/items_out_for_bid.htm (right column)

FACSIMILE BID IS NOT ACCEPTABLE

Bids will not be accepted if submitted after the deadline specified (local time) in the advertisement to bid or in the information to
bidders. The late submission of a bid makes the bid nonresponsive and is a material defect which shall not be waived by the
Board of Education. Delays in the mail will not be considered. All Late bids in the mail will be retumned to the bidder unopened.

Proposal for the submission of alternatives by vendors will be accepted and reviewed. However, if any substitution or departure
is not clearly noted and described, it will be understood that the bid intends to exactly meet the specifications.

The Board of Education shall be the sole judge as to whether the proposed goods are “equal” or “approved”. Quotations must
be mailed or delivered to the Purchasing Office, 1140 Rankin, Troy, M1 48083 no later than 3 p.m. on the date shown above.
Michigan State Sales and Use Taxes and Federal Excise Taxes do not apply unless otherwise indicated. Exemption certificates
will be furnished when necessary. This request imposes no obligations on the buyer. The Board of Education reserves the right
to accept or reject any or all bids or to split awards by items or to accept bids, which will best serve the Board of Education.

THIS AREA MUST BE FILLED IN

TELEPHONE
DELIVERY TIME PRICES FIRM FOR NAME OF COMPANY NO.
TERMS NO. & STREET FAX #
ALL DELIVERY CHARGES
FOB MUST CITY, STATE & ZIP CODE E-MAIL
DELIVERED  |BE INCLUDED IN PRICES SHOWN
CONTACT PERSON (PLEASE PRINT) SIGNATURE DATE




Note: All bidders are specifically reminded that a completed Affidavit of Bidder
(Familial Disclosure) MUST be completed and submitted with the bid response.
Failure to include a completed copy will be grounds for disqualification of bid.
The Affidavit of Bidder is required to be notarized for construction bids only. All
others only require completion and signature.

AFFIDAVIT OF BIDDER

The undersigned, the owner or authorized officer of
(the “Bidder), pursuant to the familial disclosure requirement provided in
the (the “School District”) advertisement for construction
bids, hereby represent and warrant except as provided below, that no familial
relationships exist between the owner(s) or any employee of
and any member of the Board of Education of
the School District or the Superintendent of the School District.

List any Familial Relationships:

BIDDER:

By:

Its:

STATE OF MICHIGAN )

)SS.
COUNTY OF )

This instrument was acknowledged before me on the __ day of ,
2012, by

,Notary
Public

County, Michigan

My Commission Expires:

Acting in the County of:




TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT
TRASH CAN LINERS- BID 9727

Product Specifications:

High Density Liner

22 Microns / 0.86 Mils

Size — 43 Inches by 48 Inches (56 Gallons)
Star Seal Bottom

Clear / Transparent

On average the district uses 1,200 cases (150 bags per case) annually. All
vendors will be required to provide a minimum of 3 bags as samples with bid.
The bags will be tested in-house to determine the following:

e Dry/Wet Load Capacity.

e How well they hold liquids.
e How well they perform under normal conditions (tears and impact).

Company Name:

Contact:

Address:

City: State: Zip:

Number of Bags per Case:

Unit Price per Case:

Please specify if there is a minimum order required, if there is additional freight
charges and timeline delivery once an order is placed?




Troy School District
Trash Can Liners

Bid #9727
# of bags | Unit Price
Vendor per case per Case [Samples Alternate
Interboro Packaging Corporation 150 $ 13.32 yes XH1E
Central Poly Corporation 150 $ 1340 yes A
Unipak Corporation 150 $ 14.20 yes HV
Interboro Packaging Corporation 150 $ 14.68 yes XH
Interboro Packaging Corporation 150 $ 16.48 yes XXH
Lower Huron Company 150 $ 16.49 yes North American Liner
Central Poly Corporation 150 $ 16.80 yes B
Unipak Corporation 150 $ 17.25 yes
Apac Paper & Packaging 150 $ 17.39 yes
Interboro Packaging Corporation 150 $ 18.20 yes Super Ex Heavy
Grand Traverse Industries 150 $ 18.26 yes
Lower Huron Company 150 $ 18.79 yes Colonial Bag
Colman Wolf Supply Company 150 $ 19.78 yes
Interboro Packaging Corporation 150 $ 19.84 yes Super XX Heavy
Base Plastics 150 $ 19.95 yes
AmeriSource 150 $ 20.76 yes
Hercules & Hercules 150 $ 20.79 yes
Karr Foods 150 $ 2127 yes
All American Poly 150 $ 2152 yes
Kellermeyer Company 150 $ 2175 yes
Staples Advantage 150 $ 2185 yes
Quality Transparent Bag Co 150 $ 2205 no
HP Products Inc 150 $ 2232 yes
Holley Management Inc. 150 $ 4150 yes

American Synergistics, Inc.
Courtesy Sanitary Supply
Dyna Pak Corporation
Grainger

Mister Chemical Ltd.

Office Express

Sheldon Supply Company

no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid




