

**RADIO/TV PROGRAM EQUIPMENT
 BID NO. 18-041**

Item	Description	Qty.	B & H Photo	Full Compass Systems
1	HD Camcorder and Kit	2 ea.	\$3,088.00	\$3,502.06
2	Camera Battery	2 ea.	\$248.00	\$320.76
3	DSLR Camera and Lens Kit-STM Lens	7 ea.	\$6,299.30	No Bid
4	DSLR Camera and Lens Kit-USM Lens	10 ea.	\$11,999.00	No Bid
5	DSLR Camera and Lens Kit	1 ea.	\$3,694.90	No Bid
6	Action Camera and Kit	3 ea.	\$1,197.00	No Bid
7	Gadget Bag	9 ea.	\$629.10	No Bid
8	Fluid Head with Tripod System	3 ea.	\$267.00	No Bid
9	LED Soft Panel Light Kit	1 ea.	\$1,650.00	No Bid
10	Fluid Head and Tripod with Bag	2 ea.	\$757.48	\$862.72
11	Canon EF 75-300mm f/4-5.6 III USM Lens	1 ea.	\$159.90	No Bid
12	8-Channel SDI/HDMI Switcher	2 ea.	\$1,696.00	\$1,735.28