REQUEST FOR
QUOTATION
No. 9411 TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT
DUE DATE NO LATER THAN 1140 RANKIN, TROY, MICHIGAN 48083
5-15-07 3pm. 248-823-4052
FAX: 248-823-4077

REQUISITION

DATE

REQUEST FOR QUOTE — NOT AN ORDER

THIS FORM MUST BE UTILIZED WHEN RESPONDING TO THIS REQUEST
BID ENVELOPE ENCLOSED

THE RFQ NUMBER MUST APPEAR ON ALL QUOTATIONS AND RELATED CORRESPONDENCE, THIS IS NOT AN ORDER

Quantity DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
Please supply us with your bid to furnish the Troy School District with BLEACHERS AND
BLEACHER PADS as per the attached specifications.
Copies of the bid are available at:
www.troy.k12.mi.us/purchasing/items_out for_bid.htm
Bid recaps will be available at:
troy.k12.mi.us/purchasing/index.htm
FACSIMILE BID IS NOT ACCEPTABLE

Bids will not be accepted if submitted after the deadline specified (local time) in the advertisement to bid or in the information to

bidders. The late submission of a bid makes the bid nonrepsonsive and is a material defect which shall not be waived by the

Board of Education. Delays in the mail will not be considered. All Late bids in the mail will be returned to the bidder unopened.

Proposal for the submission of alternatives by vendors will be accepted and reviewed. However, if any substitution or departure

is not clearly noted and described, it will be understood that the bid intends to exactly meet the specifications.

The Board of Education shall be the sole judge as to whether the proposed goods are “equal” or “approved”. Quotations must

be mailed or delivered to the Purchasing Office, 1140 Rankin, Troy, MI 48083 no later than 3 p.m. on the date shown above.

Michigan State Sales and Use Taxes and Federal Excise Taxes do not apply unless otherwise indicated. Exemption certificates

will be furnished when necessary. This request imposes no obligations on the buyer. The Board of Education reserves the right

to accept or reject any or all bids or to split awards by items or to accept bids, which will best serve the Board of Education.

THIS AREA MUST BE FILLED IN
TELEPHONE

DELIVERY TIME PRICES FIRM FOR NAME OF COMPANY NO.
TERMS NO. & STREET FAX #

ALL DELIVERY CHARGES
FOB MUST CITY, STATE & ZIP CODE E-MAIL
DELIVERED BE INCLUDED IN PRICES SHOWN
CONTACT PERSON (PLEASE PRINT) SIGNATURE DATE




AFFIDAVIT OF BIDDER

The undersigned, the owner or authorized officer of (the “Bidder),
pursuant to the familial disclosure requirement provided in the (the “School
District”) advertisement for construction bids, hereby represent and warrant except as provided below, that no
familial relationships exist between the over(s) or any employee of
and any member of the Board of Education of the School District or the

Superintendent of the School District.

List any Familial Relationships:

BIDDER:
By:
Its:
STATE OF MICHIGAN )
COUNTY OF ))SS'
This instrument was acknowledged before meonthe _ day of , 2007, by

, Notary Public

County, Michigan

My Commission Expires:

Acting in the County of:



Troy School District
Request for Proposal #9411
Bleachers & Bleacher Pads

The Troy School District is seeking qualified vendors for the construction of cement and gravel pads for
outdoor bleachers and the subsequent provision of bleachers and related installation. Various sized bleachers
are to be installed at three district building sites with specific locations within each site to be specified by the
district.

Prospective vendors are asked to bid on bleachers only, cement/gravel pads only, or complete package
(bleachers & pads). The district intends to award by site and is willing to split bids between categories to afford
the greatest economic savings to the district.

Anticipated bid award is June 21, 2007. All bidders MUST hold pricing until at least June 30, 2007.
Anticipated installation to occur in July or August of 2007 with completion of project no later than August 31,
2007,

The following specifications pertain to this project.

Cement Pads:
4” thick, 4000 PSI concrete over compacted 4” sand base. Work to include excavation of existing grass/dirt
and/or removal of existing pad with removal off site. Dimensions as follows:

3 Row Bleachers: 18 feet long X 6 feet wide
5 Row Bleachers: 18 feet long X 12 feet wide
10 Row Bleachers: 18 feet long X 22 feet wide

Gravel Pads:
6” thick compacted gravel (size 21AA) set flush with adjacent ground level. Work to include excavation of
existing grass/dirt and removal off site. Dimensions as follows

5 Row Bleachers: 18 feet long X 12 feet wide

Bleachers:

Combination of 3 row, 5 row and 10 row bleachers as designated by district. All bleachers to be anodized
aluminum construction, 10” aluminum seat planks with fluted non-skid surface. Understructure to be all
aluminum angles 6061-T6 Alloy. All bleachers to be 15 ft in length. All bleachers above 3 row must include
guard rails (include in base price). All bleachers installed on cement pads MUST include permanent securing to
cement base. Attachment of bleachers to be responsibility of bleacher installer.

Bleacher supplier must be able to completely install and service the bleacher units for a period of at least one
year following initial install at no charge to the District.



Troy School District
Request for Proposal #9411
Bleachers & Bleacher Pads

Athens High School
4333 John R
Troy, MI 48085

Qty 2 - 3 Row Bleachers — Tennis Courts
Cost PER Bleacher
Freight PER Bleacher
Installation PER bleacher

NO PAD REQUIRED

Qty 2 - 3 Row Bleachers — either side Varsity Baseball Field
Cost PER Bleacher
Freight PER Bleacher
Installation PER bleacher

NO PAD REQUIRED

Qty 1 - 3 Row Bleacher — Varsity Softball Field
Cost PER Bleacher
Freight PER Bleacher
Installation PER bleacher

NO PAD REQUIRED

Qty 1 - 5 Row Bleacher w/ Guard Rails — J.V. Softball Field
Cost PER Bleacher
Freight PER Bleacher
Installation PER bleacher

NO PAD REQUIRED

Qty 1 - 5 Row Bleacher w/ Guard Rails — J.V. Baseball Field
Cost PER Bleacher
Freight PER Bleacher
Installation PER bleacher

Cost Per CEMENT PAD




Athens High School
Continued

Qty 1 - 10 Row Bleachers w/ Guard Rails —Varsity Baseball Field

Cost PER Bleacher
Freight PER Bleacher
Installation PER bleacher

NO PAD REQUIRED

Qty 1 - 10 Row Bleachers w/ Guard Rails — Varsity Softball Field

Boulan Park Middle School
3570 Northfield Parkway
Troy, Ml 48084

Cost PER Bleacher
Freight PER Bleacher
Installation PER bleacher

NO PAD REQUIRED

Qty 1 - 5 Row Bleachers with Guard Rails —south side of track

Cost PER Bleacher
Freight PER Bleacher
Installation PER bleacher

Cost Per CEMENT PAD




Troy High School
4777 Northfield Parkway
Troy, M1 48098

Qty 1 - 3 Row Bleacher — J.V. Softball Field
Cost PER Bleacher
Freight PER Bleacher
Installation PER bleacher

NO PAD REQUIRED

Qty 3 - 3 Row Bleachers —Tennis Courts
Cost PER Bleacher
Freight PER Bleacher
Installation PER bleacher

Cost Per CEMENT PAD

Qty 1 - 5 Row Bleacher w/ Guard Rails — J.V. Softball Field
Cost PER Bleacher
Freight PER Bleacher
Installation PER bleacher

Cost Per CEMENT PAD

Qty 1 - 5 Row Bleacher w/ Guard Rails — J.V. Baseball Field
Cost PER Bleacher
Freight PER Bleacher
Installation PER bleacher

Cost Per CEMENT PAD
ALTERNATE: Cost per GRAVEL PAD
Qty 2 - 5 Row Bleachers w/ Guard Rails — Freshman Soccer Field
Cost PER Bleacher
Freight PER Bleacher

Installation PER bleacher

Cost Per GRAVEL PAD




TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT
Bid 9411 Bleachers & Bleacher Pads

Play Environments

Jennings of Michigan

TDS Contractors

Athens High School

Qty 2- 3 Row Bleachers - Tennis Courts

Cost PER Bleacher
Freight PER Bleacher
Installation PER Bleacher
NO PAD REQUIRED

Qty 2 - 3 Row bleachers - Varsity Baseball Field
Cost PER Bleacher
Freight PER Bleacher
Installation PER Bleacher
NO PAD REQUIRED

Qty 1 -3 Row Bleacher - Varsity Softball Field
Cost PER Bleacher
Freight PER Bleacher

Installation PER Bleacher
NO PAD REQUIRED

Qty 1 - 5 Row Bleacher w/ Guard Rails - J.V. Baseball Field
Cost PER Bleacher
Freight PER Bleacher
Installation PER Bleacher
NO PAD REQUIRED

Qty 1 - 5 Row Bleacher w/Guard Rails - J.V. Baseball Field
Cost PER Bleacher
Freight PER Bleacher
Installation PER Bleacher
Cost Per CEMENT PAD

Qty 1 - 10 Row Bleachers w/Guard Rails - Varsity Baseball Field

Cost PER Bleacher
Freight PER Bleacher
Installation PER Bleacher
NO PAD REQUIRED

Unit Extended
Cost Cost
773.00 1,546.00
48.00 96.00
389.00 778.00
2,420.00
773.00 1,546.00
48.00 96.00
389.00 778.00
2,420.00
773.00 773.00
48.00 48.00
389.00 389.00
1,210.00
2,455.00 2,455.00
50.00 50.00
616.00 616.00
3,121.00
2,455.00 2,455.00
50.00 50.00
616.00 616.00
No Bid -
3,121.00
5,398.00 5,398.00
50.00 50.00
1,184.00 1,184.00

6,632.00

Unit Extended
Cost Cost

965.00 1,930.00
50.00 100.00
450.00 900.00
2,930.00
965.00 1,930.00
50.00 100.00
450.00 900.00
2,930.00
965.00 965.00
50.00 50.00
450.00 450.00
1,465.00
2,735.00 2,735.00
70.00 70.00
750.00 750.00
3,555.00
2,735.00 2,735.00
70.00 70.00
750.00 750.00
1,500.00 1,500.00
5,055.00
6,020.00 6,020.00
140.00 140.00
1,500.00 1,500.00
7,660.00

Unit Extended

Cost Cost
1,975.00 1,975.00
1,975.00




TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT
Bid 9411 Bleachers & Bleacher Pads

Play Environments

Jennings of Michigan

TDS Contractors

Qt 1 - 10 Row Bleachers w/Guard Rails - Varsity Softball
Cost PER Bleacher
Freight PER Bleacher
Installation PER Bleacher
NO PAD REQUIRED

ATHENS TOTAL- Bleachers Only
ATHENS TOTAL- Cement Only
ATHENS TOTAL- All ltems

Boulan Park Middle School

Qty 1 - 5 Row Bleachers with Guard Rails
Cost PER Bleacher
Freight PER Bleacher
Installation PER Bleacher
Cost Per CEMENT PAD

BOULAN PARK TOTAL- Bleachers Only
BOULAN PARK TOTAL- Cement Only Only
BOULAN PARK TOTAL- All ltems

Troy High School

Qty 1 - 3 Row Bleacher - J.V. Softball field
Cost PER Bleacher
Freight PER Bleacher
Installation PER Bleacher
NO PAD REQUIRED

5,398.00 5,398.00
50.00 50.00
1,184.00 1,184.00
6,632.00
32,188.00
no bid
NA
2,455.00 2,455.00
50.00 50.00
616.00 616.00
No Bid -
3,121.00
__3.121.00
no bid
NA
773.00 773.00
48.00 48.00
389.00 389.00

1,210.00

6,020.00 6,020.00
140.00 140.00
1,500.00 1,500.00
7,660.00

37,415.00

1,500.00

38,915.00

2,735.00 2,735.00
70.00 70.00
750.00 750.00
1,500.00 1,500.00
5,055.00

_3,555.00

1,500.00

5,055.00

865.00 865.00
50.00 50.00
450.00 450.00
1,365.00

no bid
1,975.00
NA

1,975.00 1,975.00

no bid
1,975.00
NA




TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT
Bid 9411 Bleachers & Bleacher Pads

Play Environments

Jennings of Michigan

TDS Contractors

Qty 3 - 3 Row Bleachers - Tennis Courts
Cost PER Bleacher
Freight PER Bleacher
Installation PER Bleacher
Cost Per CEMENT PAD

Qty 1 - 5 Row Bleacher w/Guard Rails - J.V.. Baseball Field
Cost PER Bleacher
Freight PER Bleacher
Installation PER Bleacher
Cost Per CEMENT PAD

Qty 1 - 5 Row Bleacher w/Guard Rails - J.V. Baseball Field
Cost PER Bleacher
Freight PER Bleacher
Installation PER Bleacher
Cost Per CEMENT PAD

ALTERNATE: COST PER GRAVEL PALC

Qty 2 - 5 Row bleachers w/Guard Rails - Freshman Soccer Field

Cost PER Bleacher
Freight PER Bleacher
Installation PER Bleacher
Cost Per GRAVEL PAD

773.00

48.00
389.00
No Bid

2,455.00
50.00
616.00
No Bid

2,455.00
50.00
616.00
No Bid

NO BID

2,445.00
50.00
616.00
No Bid

2,319.00
144.00
1,167.00

3,630.00

2,455.00
50.00
616.00

3,121.00

2,455.00
50.00
616.00

3,121.00

4,890.00
100.00
1,232.00

6,222.00

865.00

50.00
450.00
750.00

2,735.00
70.00
750.00
1,500.00

2,735.00
70.00
750.00
1,500.00

1,645.00

2,845.00
70.00
750.00
1,500.00

2,595.00
150.00
1,350.00

2,250.00

6,345.00

2,735.00
70.00
750.00

1,500.00

5,055.00

2,735.00
70.00
750.00

1,500.00

5,055.00
1,645.00

5,690.00
140.00
1,500.00

3,000.00

10,330.00

2,575.00

1,720.00

1,720.00

1,404.00

2,808.00

7,725.00

7,725.00

1,720.00

1,720.00

1,720.00

1,720.00
1,404.00

5,616.00

5,616.00




TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT
Bid 9411 Bleachers & Bleacher Pads

Play Environments

Jennings of Michigan

TDS Contractors

TROY HIGH TOTAL- Bleachers Only
TROY HIGH TOTAL- Cement Only
TROY HIGH TOTAL- All Items (cement)
TROY HIGH TOTAL- All Items (gravel)

ALL SCHOOLS -BLEACHERS ONLY
ALL SCHOOLS - CEMENT ONLY
ALL SCHOOLS - ALL ITEMS (cement)

ALL SCHOOLS - ALL ITEMS (gravel)

23,526.00

no bid
NA
NA

58,835.00

NA

NA

NA

19,900.00
_8,250.00
28,150.00

28,295.00

60,870.00
11,250.00
72,120.00

65,515.00

no bid
13,973.00
NA
NA

no bid
17,923.00
NA

NA

H & J Engineering - Returned - Unable to Forward
H & H Enterprises - No Response
C.R. Equipment Sales, Inc. - No Response

Southern Bleacher Co. -
Engan Tooley Doyle & A
Piper School Equipment -



TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT
Bid 9411 Bleachers & Bleacher Pads

Ferdinandi & Son Cement

M.J. Chisholm Const

Genelli Concrete LLC

Athens High School

Qty 2- 3 Row Bleachers - Tennis Courts

Cost PER Bleacher
Freight PER Bleacher
Installation PER Bleacher
NO PAD REQUIRED

Qty 2 - 3 Row bleachers - Varsity Baseball Field
Cost PER Bleacher
Freight PER Bleacher
Installation PER Bleacher
NO PAD REQUIRED

Qty 1 -3 Row Bleacher - Varsity Softball Field
Cost PER Bleacher
Freight PER Bleacher

Installation PER Bleacher
NO PAD REQUIRED

Qty 1 - 5 Row Bleacher w/ Guard Rails - J.V. Baseball Field
Cost PER Bleacher
Freight PER Bleacher
Installation PER Bleacher
NO PAD REQUIRED

Qty 1 - 5 Row Bleacher w/Guard Rails - J.V. Baseball Field
Cost PER Bleacher
Freight PER Bleacher
Installation PER Bleacher
Cost Per CEMENT PAD

Qty 1 - 10 Row Bleachers w/Guard Rails - Varsity Baseball Field
Cost PER Bleacher
Freight PER Bleacher
Installation PER Bleacher
NO PAD REQUIRED

Unit Extended

Cost Cost

1,250.00 1,250.00
1,250.00

Unit Extended

Cost Cost

1,025.00 1,025.00
1,025.00

Unit Extended

Cost Cost
4,500.00 4,500.00
4,500.00




TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT
Bid 9411 Bleachers & Bleacher Pads

Ferdinandi & Son Cement

M.J. Chisholm Const

Genelli Concrete LLC

Qt 1 - 10 Row Bleachers w/Guard Rails - Varsity Softball
Cost PER Bleacher
Freight PER Bleacher
Installation PER Bleacher
NO PAD REQUIRED

ATHENS TOTAL- Bleachers Only
ATHENS TOTAL- Cement Only
ATHENS TOTAL- All ltems

Boulan Park Middle School

Qty 1 - 5 Row Bleachers with Guard Rails
Cost PER Bleacher
Freight PER Bleacher
Installation PER Bleacher
Cost Per CEMENT PAD

BOULAN PARK TOTAL- Bleachers Only
BOULAN PARK TOTAL- Cement Only Only
BOULAN PARK TOTAL- All ltems

Troy High School

Qty 1 - 3 Row Bleacher - J.V. Softball field
Cost PER Bleacher
Freight PER Bleacher
Installation PER Bleacher
NO PAD REQUIRED

no bid
1,250.00
NA

1,250.00 1,250.00

no bid
1,250.00
NA

no bid
1,025.00
NA

1,025.00 1,025.00

no bid

1,025.00

NA

no bid
4,500.00
NA

4,500.00 4,500.00

no bid
4,500.00
NA




TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT
Bid 9411 Bleachers & Bleacher Pads

Ferdinandi & Son Cement

M.J. Chisholm Const

Genelli Concrete LLC

Qty 3 - 3 Row Bleachers - Tennis Courts
Cost PER Bleacher
Freight PER Bleacher
Installation PER Bleacher
Cost Per CEMENT PAD

Qty 1 - 5 Row Bleacher w/Guard Rails - J.V.. Baseball Field
Cost PER Bleacher
Freight PER Bleacher
Installation PER Bleacher
Cost Per CEMENT PAD

Qty 1 - 5 Row Bleacher w/Guard Rails - J.V. Baseball Field
Cost PER Bleacher
Freight PER Bleacher
Installation PER Bleacher
Cost Per CEMENT PAD

ALTERNATE: COST PER GRAVEL PALC

Qty 2 - 5 Row bleachers w/Guard Rails - Freshman Soccer Field

Cost PER Bleacher
Freight PER Bleacher
Installation PER Bleacher
Cost Per GRAVEL PAD

1,000.00

1,250.00

1,250.00

No Bid

1,000.00

3,000.00

3,000.00

1,250.00

1,250.00

1,250.00

1,250.00

2,000.00

2,000.00

600.00

1,025.00

1,025.00

400.00

400.00

1,800.00

1,800.00

1,025.00

1,025.00

1,025.00

1,025.00
400.00

800.00

800.00

2,730.00

1,885.00

1,885.00

2,500.00

No Bid

8,190.00

8,190.00

1,885.00

1,885.00

1,885.00

1,885.00
2,500.00




TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT
Bid 9411 Bleachers & Bleacher Pads

Ferdinandi & Son Cement

M.J. Chisholm Const

Genelli Concrete LLC

TROY HIGH TOTAL- Bleachers Only
TROY HIGH TOTAL- Cement Only
TROY HIGH TOTAL- All Items (cement)
TROY HIGH TOTAL- All Items (gravel)

ALL SCHOOLS -BLEACHERS ONLY
ALL SCHOOLS - CEMENT ONLY
ALL SCHOOLS - ALL ITEMS (cement)

ALL SCHOOLS - ALL ITEMS (gravel)

no bid

NA
NA

no bid

10,000.00

NA

NA

7,500.00

no bid

4,650.00

NA
NA

no bid

6,700.00

NA

NA

no bid
11,960.00
NA
NA

no bid
20,960.00
NA

NA

No Response
ssoc. - No Response
- No Response

Inner City Builders - Disqualified - No Affidavit of Bidder




TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT
Bid 9411 Bleachers & Bleacher Pads

Leo's Concrete Inc.

Dimmer Warren

Dimmer Warren

Athens High School

Qty 2- 3 Row Bleachers - Tennis Courts

Cost PER Bleacher
Freight PER Bleacher
Installation PER Bleacher
NO PAD REQUIRED

Qty 2 - 3 Row bleachers - Varsity Baseball Field
Cost PER Bleacher
Freight PER Bleacher
Installation PER Bleacher
NO PAD REQUIRED

Qty 1 -3 Row Bleacher - Varsity Softball Field
Cost PER Bleacher
Freight PER Bleacher

Installation PER Bleacher
NO PAD REQUIRED

Qty 1 - 5 Row Bleacher w/ Guard Rails - J.V. Baseball Field
Cost PER Bleacher
Freight PER Bleacher
Installation PER Bleacher
NO PAD REQUIRED

Qty 1 - 5 Row Bleacher w/Guard Rails - J.V. Baseball Field
Cost PER Bleacher
Freight PER Bleacher
Installation PER Bleacher
Cost Per CEMENT PAD

Qty 1 - 10 Row Bleachers w/Guard Rails - Varsity Baseball Field
Cost PER Bleacher
Freight PER Bleacher
Installation PER Bleacher
NO PAD REQUIRED

Unit Extended
Cost Cost

2,952.00 2,952.00

2,952.00

Unit Extended
Cost Cost

Unit Extended
Cost Cost




TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT
Bid 9411 Bleachers & Bleacher Pads

Leo's Concrete Inc.

Dimmer Warren

Dimmer Warren

Qt 1 - 10 Row Bleachers w/Guard Rails - Varsity Softball
Cost PER Bleacher
Freight PER Bleacher
Installation PER Bleacher
NO PAD REQUIRED

ATHENS TOTAL- Bleachers Only
ATHENS TOTAL- Cement Only
ATHENS TOTAL- All ltems

Boulan Park Middle School

Qty 1 - 5 Row Bleachers with Guard Rails
Cost PER Bleacher
Freight PER Bleacher
Installation PER Bleacher
Cost Per CEMENT PAD

BOULAN PARK TOTAL- Bleachers Only
BOULAN PARK TOTAL- Cement Only Only
BOULAN PARK TOTAL- All ltems

Troy High School

Qty 1 - 3 Row Bleacher - J.V. Softball field
Cost PER Bleacher
Freight PER Bleacher
Installation PER Bleacher
NO PAD REQUIRED

no bid
2,952.00
NA

2,950.00 2,950.00

no bid
2,950.00
NA




TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT
Bid 9411 Bleachers & Bleacher Pads

Leo's Concrete Inc.

Dimmer Warren

Dimmer Warren

Qty 3 - 3 Row Bleachers - Tennis Courts
Cost PER Bleacher
Freight PER Bleacher
Installation PER Bleacher
Cost Per CEMENT PAD

Qty 1 - 5 Row Bleacher w/Guard Rails - J.V.. Baseball Field
Cost PER Bleacher
Freight PER Bleacher
Installation PER Bleacher
Cost Per CEMENT PAD

Qty 1 - 5 Row Bleacher w/Guard Rails - J.V. Baseball Field
Cost PER Bleacher
Freight PER Bleacher
Installation PER Bleacher
Cost Per CEMENT PAD

ALTERNATE: COST PER GRAVEL PALC

Qty 2 - 5 Row bleachers w/Guard Rails - Freshman Soccer Field

Cost PER Bleacher
Freight PER Bleacher
Installation PER Bleacher
Cost Per GRAVEL PAD

2,550.00 7,650.00

7,650.00

2,853.00 2,853.00

2,853.00

2,853.00 2,853.00

2,853.00
1,600.00 1,600.00

1,600.00 3,200.00

3,200.00




TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT
Bid 9411 Bleachers & Bleacher Pads

Leo's Concrete Inc.

Dimmer Warren

Dimmer Warren

TROY HIGH TOTAL- Bleachers Only
TROY HIGH TOTAL- Cement Only
TROY HIGH TOTAL- All Items (cement)
TROY HIGH TOTAL- All Items (gravel)

ALL SCHOOLS -BLEACHERS ONLY
ALL SCHOOLS - CEMENT ONLY
ALL SCHOOLS - ALL ITEMS (cement)

ALL SCHOOLS - ALL ITEMS (gravel)

no bid

16,556.00

NA
NA

no bid

22,458.00

NA

NA

Alternate 1 48,572.00
Brand: Outdoor Aluminum Co.
Cement work is not included.

NA

NA

Alternate 2
Brand: VPI Co.
Cement work is not included.

45,952.80

NA

NA






