
REQUEST FOR 
QUOTATION                REQUISITION   

No.       9396         TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT     

DUE DATE     NO LATER THAN     1140 RANKIN, TROY, MICHIGAN 48083     

2-15-07  3 p.m.   248-823-4052     

      FAX: 248-823-4077 DATE      2-12-07 
   REQUEST FOR QUOTE – NOT AN ORDER  

                    THIS FORM MUST BE UTILIZED WHEN RESPONDING TO THIS REQUEST       
                         BID ENVELOPE ENCLOSED           
                        

  THE RFQ NUMBER MUST APPEAR ON ALL QUOTATIONS AND RELATED CORRESPONDENCE, THIS IS NOT AN ORDER 
                       

Quantity       DESCRIPTION        UNIT PRICE  AMOUNT 

                 

  
 Please supply us with your faxed bid to furnish the Troy School District with 
ELEMENTARY SCHOOL FURNITURE per the attached specifications.        

          

  

Copies of the bid are available at: 
www.troy.k12.mi.us/purchasing/items_out_for_bid.htm 

 
Bid recaps will be available at: 

troy.k12.mi.us/purchasing/index.htm 
        

  NO SUBSTITUTIONS ACCEPTED      
                 

  

Bids will not be accepted if submitted after the deadline specified (local time) in the advertisement to bid or in the information to 
bidders.  The late submission of a bid makes the bid nonrepsonsive and is a material defect which shall not be waived by the  
Board of Education. Delays in the mail will not be considered. All Late bids in the mail will be returned to the bidder unopened. 
      

     

 

The Board of Education shall be the sole judge as to whether the proposed goods are “equal” or “approved”.   Michigan State 
Sales and Use Taxes and Federal Excise Taxes do not apply unless otherwise indicated.  Exemption certificates will be 
furnished when necessary.  This request imposes no obligations on the buyer.  The Board of Education reserves the right to 
accept or reject any or all bids or to split awards by items or to accept bids, which will best serve the Board of Education.    

        

      THIS AREA MUST BE FILLED IN             

DELIVERY TIME PRICES FIRM FOR  NAME OF COMPANY     
TELEPHONE     
NO.    

                 
                  
TERMS       NO. & STREET      FAX #     
                        

FOB 
ALL DELIVERY CHARGES 
MUST    CITY, STATE & ZIP CODE      E-MAIL     

DELIVERED  BE INCLUDED IN PRICES SHOWN                 
CONTACT PERSON (PLEASE PRINT)   SIGNATURE      DATE    
                
                        



AFFIDAVIT OF BIDDER 
 

 The undersigned, the owner or authorized officer of       (the 
“Bidder), pursuant to the familial disclosure requirement provided in the      
(the “School District”) advertisement for construction bids, hereby represent and warrant except 
as provided below, that no familial relationships exist between the over(s) or any employee of 
       and any member of the Board of Education of the School 
District or the Superintendent of the School District. 
 
 List any Familial Relationships: 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
      
 BIDDER: 
 
       
 
  
 By:       
 
 Its:        
 
STATE OF MICHIGAN     ) 
                                             )ss. 
COUNTY OF     ) 
 
This instrument was acknowledged before me on the   day of   , 2006, by  
 
  . 
 
 
         
 
      , Notary Public 
 
      County, Michigan 
 
   My Commission Expires:    
 
   Acting in the County of:    
 



TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT 
BID 9396 ELEMENTARY SCHOOL FURNITURE 

 
 

Qty. Description       Unit Price      Total Cost 
 
1 

 
Teacher’s Cabinet – Fleetwood 155018111 
48” x 72” x 22” Light Oak 

  

 
1 

 
Shelf Cabinet (12 shelves) – Fleetwood 
15160011112 – 48” x 72” x 22” Light Oak 

  

 
2 

 
Bookcase (6 shelves) – Fleetwood 1600935 
48” x 72” x 12” Light Oak 

  

 
10 

 
Tapezpoid Tables – 24” x 24” x 48” 
 

  

 
6 

 
Rectangular Tables – 30” x 60” 
 

  

 
2 

 
Horseshoe Tables – 60” x 66” 
 

  

 
1 

 
4’ x 6’ Free Standing Marker Board – with aluminum 
frame – Decker RA46C 
 

  

 
 

 
Freight Charges  
Delivery to: 
Troy School District  
Purchasing Dept. 
1140 Rankin 
Troy, MI 48083 
 

  

 
 

 
TOTAL 
 

  

 
 

SUBSTITUTIONS TO THE ABOVE WILL NOT BE ACCEPTABLE. 



Co. Great lakes Furniture & Supply Co. Top Seat Supply Co.Office Express
Terms: Net 30 Days Terms: Net 30 Terms: 
Firm: 90 Days Firm:  60 Days Firm: 30 Days

Qty. Description
1 Teacher’s Cabinet – Fleetwood 155018111 *Ironwood 2085 CLX 1,245.00  1,245.00      NO BID 1,000.00      1,000.00      

48” x 72” x 22” Light Oak

1 Shelf Cabinet (12 shelves) – Fleetwood *Ironwood 2077 CLX 1,475.00 1,475.00    NO BID 1,100.00    1,100.00    
15160011112 – 48” x 72” x 22” Light Oak

2 Bookcase (6 shelves) – Fleetwood 1600935 *Ironwood BC6CLNO 199.00     398.00         NO BID 400.00         400.00         
48” x 72” x 12” Light Oak

10  Tapezpoid Tables - 24" x 24" x 48" Royal Seating 2277C 162.95     1,629.50      108.00         1,080.00      90.00           900.00         

6 Rectangular Tables – 30” x 60” Royal Seating 2237A 159.95     959.70         127.00         762.00         108.00         648.00         

2 Horseshoe Tables – 60” x 66” Royal Seating 2270N 309.95     619.90         179.85         359.70         199.00         398.00         

1 4’ x 6’ Free Standing Marker Board – with aluminum 525.00     525.00         NO BID NO BID
frame – Decker RA46C

Freight Charges 235.64         299.00         
Delivery to:
Troy School District 
Purchasing Dept.
1140 Rankin
Troy, MI 48083

TOTAL
6,852.10      2,437.34      4,745.00      

*Must be together *All tables quoted are adjustable
legs, 1-1/4 MDF core, black 
armor edge, gray nebula 
laminate'

Corporate Express - No Response
Office Depot - No Response
Decker Inc. - No Response
Great Lakes Furniture Supply Inc. - No Response
School Specialty - No Response
Interior Environments - No Response

TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT
Bid 9396 Elementary School Furniture


