REQUEST FOR
QUOTATION
No. 9383 TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT
DUE DATE NO LATER THAN 1140 RANKIN, TROY, MICHIGAN 48083
1-4-07 3pm. 248-823-4052
FAX: 248-823-4077

REQUISITION

DATE  12-18-06

REQUEST FOR QUOTE — NOT AN ORDER

THIS FORM MUST BE UTILIZED WHEN RESPONDING TO THIS REQUEST
BID ENVELOPE ENCLOSED

THE RFQ NUMBER MUST APPEAR ON ALL QUOTATIONS AND RELATED CORRESPONDENCE, THIS IS NOT AN ORDER

Quantity DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
Please supply us with your bid to furnish the Troy School District with SCIENCE OFFICE
FURNITURE for Athens High School per the attached specifications.
Copies of the bid are available at:
www.troy.k12.mi.us/purchasing/items_out for bid.htm
Bid recaps will be available at:
troy.k12.mi.us/purchasing/index.htm
FACSIMILE BID IS NOT ACCEPTABLE

Bids will not be accepted if submitted after the deadline specified (local time) in the advertisement to bid or in the information to

bidders. The late submission of a bid makes the bid nonrepsonsive and is a material defect which shall not be waived by the

Board of Education. Delays in the mail will not be considered. All Late bids in the mail will be returned to the bidder unopened.

Proposal for the submission of alternatives by vendors will be accepted and reviewed. However, if any substitution or departure

is not clearly noted and described, it will be understood that the hid intends to exactly meet the specifications.

The Board of Education shall be the sole judge as to whether the proposed goods are “equal” or “approved”. Quotations must

be mailed or delivered to the Purchasing Office, 1140 Rankin, Troy, Ml 48083 no later than 3 p.m. on the date shown above.

Michigan State Sales and Use Taxes and Federal Excise Taxes do not apply unless otherwise indicated. Exemption certificates

will be furnished when necessary. This request imposes no obligations on the buyer. The Board of Education reserves the right

to accept or reject any or all bids or to split awards by items or to accept bids, which will best serve the Board of Education.

THIS AREA MUST BE FILLED IN
TELEPHONE

DELIVERY TIME PRICES FIRM FOR NAME OF COMPANY NO.
TERMS NO. & STREET FAX #

ALL DELIVERY CHARGES
FOB MUST CITY, STATE & ZIP CODE E-MAIL
DELIVERED BE INCLUDED IN PRICES SHOWN
CONTACT PERSON (PLEASE PRINT) SIGNATURE DATE




AFFIDAVIT OF BIDDER

The undersigned, the owner or authorized officer of (the
“Bidder), pursuant to the familial disclosure requirement provided in the
(the “School District”) advertisement for construction bids, hereby represent and warrant except
as provided below, that no familial relationships exist between the over(s) or any employee of

and any member of the Board of Education of the School
District or the Superintendent of the School District.

List any Familial Relationships:

BIDDER:
By:
Its:
STATE OF MICHIGAN )
COUNTY OF ))SS'
This instrument was acknowledged before meonthe _ day of , 2006, by

, Notary Public

County, Michigan

My Commission Expires:

Acting in the County of:



TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT
BID 9383 SCIENCE OFFICE FURNITURE
ATHENS HIGH SCHOOL

Qty. Description / Product — Hon Furniture Unit Cost Total Cost

17 | Pedestal “K” Partial Top BBF 28"H — 30723KQ

17 | Pedestal “K” Partial Top FF 2 8" H — 30823KQ

17 Full Clearance Stack-on w/o Doors 72W x 36-1/4 H
— 38244NQ

17 | 236" W x 16" H Flipper Doors w/lock for 72" W
Stack-on — 38249Q

17 38000 Series Modular Desk — 72" W 30" D 29-1/2"
H — 38935MQ

4 500 Series Lateral File 4-Drawer 36 W — 584LQ

17 | Task, Swivel, Pneumatic — 5901AB10T

2 Workstation w/grommet 30” x 36" — ED3036GQ

17 | 20 H Tackboard for 72 W Stack-on — T72

DELIVER TO:

ATHENS HIGH SCHOOL
4333 John R
Troy, Michigan 48085




TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT
Bid 9383 Science Office Furniture

CO.: Fisher Science Education
TERMS: Net 30 Days

CO.: Ergogenesis
TERMS: Net 30

CO.: Corporate Express
TERMS: Net 30

CO.: Office Express
TERMS: N/30

CO.: School Specialt
TERMS:

CO.: Office Depot
TERMS: Net 30

CO.: Commercial Concepts
Concepts & Furniture

Athens High School FIRM: 180 Days FIRM: FIRM: 60 Days FIRM: 120 Days FIRM: 90 Days FIRM: 30 Days TERMS: N/30
FIRM:90 Days
Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total
Qty Description Product — Hon Furniture Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
17 Pedestal “K” Partial Top BBF 28"H — 30723KQ NO BID NO BID 129.00  2,193.00 129.00  2,193.00 142.69  2,425.73 140.13 2,382.21 137.96 2,345.32
17 Pedestal “K” Partial Top FF 2 8" H — 30823KQ NO BID NO BID 129.00 2,193.00 129.00 2,193.00 142.69 2,425.73 140.31 2,385.27 137.96 2,345.32
17 Full Clearance Stack-on w/o Doors 72W x 36-1/4 H NO BID NO BID 201.00 3,417.00 204.00 3,468.00 225.74 3,837.58 221.69 3,768.73 218.48 3,714.16
—38244NQ
17 236" W x 16" H Flipper Doors w/lock for 72" W NO BID NO BID 114.00 1,938.00 114.75 1,950.75 126.18 2,145.06 123.91 2,106.47 122.10 2,075.70
Stack-on — 38249Q
17 38000 Series Modular Desk — 72" W 30" D 29-1/2" NO BID NO BID 244.00 4,148.00 |* 38935 239.00 4,063.00 269.00 4,573.00 299.15 5,085.55 269.45 4,580.65 265.49 4,513.33
H —38935MQ (B) MQ
4 500 Series Lateral File 4-Drawer 36 W — 584LQ NO BID NO BID 328.00 1,312.00 336.00 1,344.00 369.35 1,477.40 362.72 1,450.88 357.42 1,429.68
17 Task, Swivel, Pneumatic — 5901AB10T Svinyl chair 5- leg base 152.95 2,600.15 |* 423.00 7,191.00 71.00  1,207.00 66.75  1,134.75 76.62 1,302.54 76.62 1,302.54 74.14 1,260.38
S Tchr chair witilt, w/o arms 206.37 3,508.29
2 Workstation w/grommet 30" x 36" — ED3036GQ NO BID NO BID 128.00 256.00 135.00 270.00 141.78 283.56 139.21 278.43 137.19 274.38
17 20 H Tackboard for 72 W Stack-on — T72 NO BID NO BID 102.00 1,734.00 100.00 1,700.00 111.95 1,903.15 109.94 1,868.98 108.33 1,841.61
6,108.44 7,191.00 18,398.00 |*less expensive particle board 18,316.50 18,826.50 20,886.30 20,124.16 19,799.88

All shipping and freight charges are included in
pricing of each item
Anticipate delivery time 2-3 weeks ARO for these i

* Alternate: bodybilt task,
swivel, Pneumatic CO7
Includes Freight

top

Total Installation:
$3,000.00

Staples - No Response

Great lakes Furniture Supply Inc. - No Response
NBS - No Response

Architectural Systems Group - No Response
Great Lakes Furniture & Supply - No Response




