
REQUEST FOR 
QUOTATION                REQUISITION   

No.       9360         TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT     

DUE DATE     NO LATER THAN     1140 RANKIN, TROY, MICHIGAN 48083     

10-23-06  3 p.m.   248-823-4052     

      FAX: 248-823-4077 DATE      10-6-06 
   REQUEST FOR QUOTE – NOT AN ORDER  

                    THIS FORM MUST BE UTILIZED WHEN RESPONDING TO THIS REQUEST       
                         BID ENVELOPE ENCLOSED           
                        

  THE RFQ NUMBER MUST APPEAR ON ALL QUOTATIONS AND RELATED CORRESPONDENCE, THIS IS NOT AN ORDER 
                       

Quantity       DESCRIPTION        UNIT PRICE  AMOUNT 

                 

  
 Please supply us with your bid to furnish the Troy School District with WOOD SHOP 
EQUIPMENT per the attached specifications.        

          

  

Copies of the bid are available at: 
www.troy.k12.mi.us/purchasing/items_out_for_bid.htm 

 
Bid recaps will be available at: 

troy.k12.mi.us/purchasing/index.htm 
        

  FACSIMILE BID IS NOT ACCEPTABLE      
                 

  

Bids will not be accepted if submitted after the deadline specified (local time) in the advertisement to bid or in the information to 
bidders.  The late submission of a bid makes the bid nonrepsonsive and is a material defect which shall not be waived by the  
Board of Education. Delays in the mail will not be considered. All Late bids in the mail will be returned to the bidder unopened. 
      

 

Proposal for the submission of alternatives by vendors will be accepted and reviewed.  However, if any substitution or departure 
is not clearly noted and described, it will be understood that the bid intends to exactly meet the specifications. 
    

 

The Board of Education shall be the sole judge as to whether the proposed goods are “equal” or “approved”.   Quotations must 
be mailed or delivered to the Purchasing Office, 1140 Rankin, Troy, MI 48083 no later than 3 p.m. on the date shown above. 
Michigan State Sales and Use Taxes and Federal Excise Taxes do not apply unless otherwise indicated.  Exemption certificates 
will be furnished when necessary.  This request imposes no obligations on the buyer.  The Board of Education reserves the right 
to accept or reject any or all bids or to split awards by items or to accept bids, which will best serve the Board of Education.    

        

      THIS AREA MUST BE FILLED IN             

DELIVERY TIME PRICES FIRM FOR  NAME OF COMPANY     
TELEPHONE     
NO.    

                 
                  
TERMS       NO. & STREET      FAX #     
                        

FOB 
ALL DELIVERY CHARGES 
MUST    CITY, STATE & ZIP CODE      E-MAIL     

DELIVERED  BE INCLUDED IN PRICES SHOWN                 
CONTACT PERSON (PLEASE PRINT)   SIGNATURE      DATE    
                
                        



AFFIDAVIT OF BIDDER 
 

 The undersigned, the owner or authorized officer of       (the 
“Bidder), pursuant to the familial disclosure requirement provided in the      
(the “School District”) advertisement for construction bids, hereby represent and warrant except 
as provided below, that no familial relationships exist between the over(s) or any employee of 
       and any member of the Board of Education of the School 
District or the Superintendent of the School District. 
 
 List any Familial Relationships: 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
      
 BIDDER: 
 
       
 
  
 By:       
 
 Its:        
 
STATE OF MICHIGAN     ) 
                                             )ss. 
COUNTY OF     ) 
 
This instrument was acknowledged before me on the   day of   , 2006, by  
 
  . 
 
 
         
 
      , Notary Public 
 
      County, Michigan 
 
   My Commission Expires:    
 
   Acting in the County of:    
 



TROY SCHOOL DISTRICT 
BID 9360 WOOD SHOP EQUIPMENT 

 
           Alternate 
Qty. Description          Catalog #           Unit Price    Total Price 
  

Paxton Patterson Catalog Item Numbers 
   

 
1 

 
Woodworking Tool Locker with tools – 62-0046 

   

 
1 

 
Dewalt 12” Heavy Duty Double-Bevel Sliding 
Compound Miter – 49-5928 

   

 
6 

 
Locker Base Cabinets – 63-2484 

   

 
1 

 
Delta Combination 6” x 48” Belt Sander and 12” 
Disc Sander – 49-1100 

   

 
1 

 
Delta Midi Woodworking Lather – 49-5944 

   

 
1 

 
DeWalt 8-/2” Single Bevel Sliding Compound 
Miter Saw – 49-6232 

   

 
2 

 
Vermont American – High Speed Steel Forstner 
Bit Set – NS000579 

   

 
1 

 
Famag/Bormax Ultrafast Cutting F. Bit  5/16  
3.5”   ¾” – 10-0500 

   

 
1 

 
Famag/Bormax Ultrafast Cutting F. Bit  5/16  
3.5”   7/8” – 10-0502 

   

 
1 

 
Famag/Bormax Ultrafast Cutting F. Bit  5/16   
3.5”   1” – 10-0504 

   

 
1 

 
Famag/Bormax Ultrafast Cutting F. Bit  5/16  
3.5”  1-1/8”  - 10-0506 

   

 
1 

 
Famag/Bormax Ultrafast Cutting F. Bit  3/8   3.5”  
1-1/4”  - 10-0532 

   

 
1 

 
Famag/Bormax Ultrafast Cutting F. Bit  3/8   3.5”  
1-1/2”  - 10-0534  

   

 
1 

 
Famag/Bormax Ultrafast Cutting F. Bit   3/8  3.5”  
1-3/4”  -  10-0622 

   

 
1 

 
Famag/Bormax Ultrafast Cutting F. Bit  3/8   3.5”  
2”  - 10-0632 

   

 
 

 
SHIPPING 

   

 
 

 
TOTAL 

   



Troy School District CO:  Marsh Power Tools CO:  Glenn Wing Power Tools
Bid 9360 Terms: Net 30 Days Terms:  Net 30 Days

Firm:  90 days Firm:  90 days
Paxton Patterson Catalog #'s

Qty Description Alt. Catalog # Unit Price Total Alt. Catalog # Unit Price Total

1 Woodworking Tool Locker w/tools 62-0046 no bid no bid

1 Dewalt 12" Heavy Duty Dbl-Bevel Sliding Dewalt DW718 669.00$       669.00$      Dewalt DW718 690.00$       690.00$       
Compound Miter 49-5928 16" Sliding

6 Locker Base Cabinets 63-2484 no bid no bid

1 Delta Combination 6"x48" Belt Sander Delta 31-735B 1,500.00$    1,500.00$   Mfg 31-735B 1,695.00$    1,695.00$    
and 12" Disc Sander 49-1100

1 Delta Midi Woodworking Lather 49-5944 Delta LA200 330.00$       330.00$      Mfg LA-200 319.00$       319.00$       

1 DeWalt 8-/2" Single Bevel Sliding Compound Dewalt DW712 399.00$       399.00$      Mfg DW712 465.00$       465.00$       
Miter Saw 49-6232

2 Vermont American-High Speed Steel Hickory 16pc HSS 40.00$         80.00$        Bosch FB1600 249.00$       498.00$       
Forstner Bit Set NS000579 FBS-1016 16pc set

1 Famag/Bormax Ultrafast Cutting F. Bit Frevd Carbide Tip 16.00$         16.00$        no bid
5/16 3.5"  3/4"  10-0500 FC-005

1 Famag/Bormax Ultrafast Cutting F. Bit Frevd Carbide Tip 17.00$         17.00$        no bid
5/16 3.5"  7/8"  10-0502 FC-006

1 Famag/Bormax Ultrafast Cutting F. Bit Frevd Carbide Tip 19.00$         19.00$        no bid
5/16 3.5"  1"  10-0504 FC-007

1 Famag/Bormax Ultrafast Cutting F. Bit Frevd Carbide Tip 21.00$         21.00$        no bid
5/16  3.5"  1-1/8"  10-0506 FC-008

1 Famag/Bormax Ultrafast Cutting F. Bit Frevd Carbide Tip 22.00$         22.00$        no bid
3/8  3.5"  1-1/4"  10-0532 FC-009

1 Famag/Bormax Ultrafast Cutting F. Bit Frevd Carbide Tip 26.00$         26.00$        no bid
3/8  3.5"  1-1/2"  10-0534 FC-011

1 Famag/Bormax Ultrafast Cutting F. Bit Frevd Carbide Tip 29.00$         29.00$        no bid
3/8  3.5"  1-3/4"  10-0622 FC-013

1 Famag/Bormax Ultrafast Cutting F. Bit Frevd Carbide Tip 37.00$         37.00$        no bid
3/8  3.5"  2"  10-0632 FC-015

Shipping

Total 3,165.00$   3,667.00$    

Ameri-Source    NO BID



Troy School District
Bid 9360

Paxton Patterson Catalog #'s

Qty Description

1 Woodworking Tool Locker w/tools 62-0046

1 Dewalt 12" Heavy Duty Dbl-Bevel Sliding 
Compound Miter 49-5928

6 Locker Base Cabinets 63-2484

1 Delta Combination 6"x48" Belt Sander
and 12" Disc Sander 49-1100

1 Delta Midi Woodworking Lather 49-5944

1 DeWalt 8-/2" Single Bevel Sliding Compound
Miter Saw 49-6232

2 Vermont American-High Speed Steel
Forstner Bit Set NS000579

1 Famag/Bormax Ultrafast Cutting F. Bit
5/16 3.5"  3/4"  10-0500

1 Famag/Bormax Ultrafast Cutting F. Bit
5/16 3.5"  7/8"  10-0502

1 Famag/Bormax Ultrafast Cutting F. Bit
5/16 3.5"  1"  10-0504

1 Famag/Bormax Ultrafast Cutting F. Bit
5/16  3.5"  1-1/8"  10-0506

1 Famag/Bormax Ultrafast Cutting F. Bit
3/8  3.5"  1-1/4"  10-0532

1 Famag/Bormax Ultrafast Cutting F. Bit
3/8  3.5"  1-1/2"  10-0534

1 Famag/Bormax Ultrafast Cutting F. Bit
3/8  3.5"  1-3/4"  10-0622

1 Famag/Bormax Ultrafast Cutting F. Bit
3/8  3.5"  2"  10-0632

Shipping

Total

Ameri-Source    NO BID

CO:  Apex Pinnacle CO:  Butki Saw & Tool
Terms:  Net 30 Terms: Net 30 days
Firm:  60 days Firm:  60 days

Alt. Catalog # Unit Price Total Alt. Catalog # Unit Price Total

5,441.18$    5,441.18$       no bid

P/N DW718 841.51$       841.51$          Dewalt DW718 675.00$      675.00$      

470.59$       2,823.54$       no bid

P/N 31-7358 1,623.99$    1,623.99$       Industrial 31-735A 1,399.00$   1,399.00$   
or 31-300 799.00$      799.00$      

P/N LA200 350.92$       350.92$          Delta LA200K 349.00$      349.00$      
Lathe & STD

P/N DW718 511.00$       511.00$          Dewalt DW712 429.00$      429.00$      

70.59$         141.18$          Vermont American 245.00$      490.00$      
16 pc #14549

31.76$         31.76$            Bormax FBM64004 22.00$        22.00$        

34.71$         34.71$            Bormax FBM64008 23.00$        23.00$        

37.65$         37.65$            Bormax FBM64010 24.00$        24.00$        

37.65$         37.65$            Bormax FBM64013 24.00$        24.00$        

42.94$         42.94$            Bormax FBM64016 25.00$        25.00$        

50.29$         50.29$            Bormax FBM64020 31.00$        31.00$        

55.00$         55.00$            Bormax FBM64023 35.00$        35.00$        

60.00$         60.00$            Bormax FBM64028 45.00$        45.00$        

12,083.32$     3,571.00$   
or 2,971.00$   



Troy School District
Bid 9360

Paxton Patterson Catalog #'s

Qty Description

1 Woodworking Tool Locker w/tools 62-0046

1 Dewalt 12" Heavy Duty Dbl-Bevel Sliding 
Compound Miter 49-5928

6 Locker Base Cabinets 63-2484

1 Delta Combination 6"x48" Belt Sander
and 12" Disc Sander 49-1100

1 Delta Midi Woodworking Lather 49-5944

1 DeWalt 8-/2" Single Bevel Sliding Compound
Miter Saw 49-6232

2 Vermont American-High Speed Steel
Forstner Bit Set NS000579

1 Famag/Bormax Ultrafast Cutting F. Bit
5/16 3.5"  3/4"  10-0500

1 Famag/Bormax Ultrafast Cutting F. Bit
5/16 3.5"  7/8"  10-0502

1 Famag/Bormax Ultrafast Cutting F. Bit
5/16 3.5"  1"  10-0504

1 Famag/Bormax Ultrafast Cutting F. Bit
5/16  3.5"  1-1/8"  10-0506

1 Famag/Bormax Ultrafast Cutting F. Bit
3/8  3.5"  1-1/4"  10-0532

1 Famag/Bormax Ultrafast Cutting F. Bit
3/8  3.5"  1-1/2"  10-0534

1 Famag/Bormax Ultrafast Cutting F. Bit
3/8  3.5"  1-3/4"  10-0622

1 Famag/Bormax Ultrafast Cutting F. Bit
3/8  3.5"  2"  10-0632

Shipping

Total

Ameri-Source    NO BID

CO:  Midwest Technology CO:  Paxton/Patterson
Terms:    Net 30 days Terms:  Net 30 days
Firm:  90 days Firm:  90 days

Alt. Catalog # Unit Price Total Alt. Catalog Unit Price Total

MW-559240 3,695.00$    3,695.00$     4,301.25$     4,301.25$    

Dewalt DW718 717.00$       717.00$        758.00$        758.00$       
MW-243068

Flex Furn 4168 306.00$       1,836.00$     327.00$        1,962.00$    
MW-210826

Delta 31-735B 1,455.00$    1,455.00$     1,572.80$     1,572.80$    
MW-728035

Delta LA200 275.00$       275.00$        294.00$        294.00$       
MW-751488

Dew DW712 459.38$       459.38$        475.00$        475.00$       

Vermont Amer 47.87$         95.74$          60.00$          120.00$       
14547 BOO3711

no bid 16.49$          16.49$         

no bid 18.03$          18.03$         

Irwin 43016 15.60$         15.60$          19.52$          19.52$         
MW-483361

Irwin 43018 15.60$         15.60$          19.63$          19.63$         
BOO1202

Irwin 43020 15.90$         15.90$          22.31$          22.31$         
MW-483362

Irwin 43024 16.30$         16.30$          29.37$          29.37$         
MW-483363

Irwin 43028 17.20$         17.20$          32.13$          32.13$         
MW-483364

Irwin 43032 18.30$         18.30$          35.14$          35.14$         
MW-483365

8,632.02$     9,675.67$    



Troy School District
Bid 9360

Paxton Patterson Catalog #'s

Qty Description

1 Woodworking Tool Locker w/tools 62-0046

1 Dewalt 12" Heavy Duty Dbl-Bevel Sliding 
Compound Miter 49-5928

6 Locker Base Cabinets 63-2484

1 Delta Combination 6"x48" Belt Sander
and 12" Disc Sander 49-1100

1 Delta Midi Woodworking Lather 49-5944

1 DeWalt 8-/2" Single Bevel Sliding Compound
Miter Saw 49-6232

2 Vermont American-High Speed Steel
Forstner Bit Set NS000579

1 Famag/Bormax Ultrafast Cutting F. Bit
5/16 3.5"  3/4"  10-0500

1 Famag/Bormax Ultrafast Cutting F. Bit
5/16 3.5"  7/8"  10-0502

1 Famag/Bormax Ultrafast Cutting F. Bit
5/16 3.5"  1"  10-0504

1 Famag/Bormax Ultrafast Cutting F. Bit
5/16  3.5"  1-1/8"  10-0506

1 Famag/Bormax Ultrafast Cutting F. Bit
3/8  3.5"  1-1/4"  10-0532

1 Famag/Bormax Ultrafast Cutting F. Bit
3/8  3.5"  1-1/2"  10-0534

1 Famag/Bormax Ultrafast Cutting F. Bit
3/8  3.5"  1-3/4"  10-0622

1 Famag/Bormax Ultrafast Cutting F. Bit
3/8  3.5"  2"  10-0632

Shipping

Total

Ameri-Source    NO BID

CO:  SATCO Supply
Terms: Net 30 days
Firm:  30 days

Alt. Catalog # Unit Price Total

Shain/Shop-Bilt 4,035.00$       4,035.00$       
TC-10 Cabinet

DW718 687.45$          687.45$          

4168 w/number 269.00$          1,614.00$       
plates

31-735B 1,464.00$       1,464.00$       

LA200 281.47$          281.47$          

DW712 424.35$          424.35$          

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

8,506.27$       




