

**Bistro Small Equipment
Bid 17-028**

Item	Description	Qty.	Calico Industrial Supply, LLC	Clark Associates, Inc.	Index Restaurant Supply	US Foods
1	Creamer	80 ea.	No Bid	\$483.20	\$488.00	\$492.00
2	Sugar Packet Holder/Caddy	80 ea.	No Bid	\$479.20	\$596.00	\$604.80
3	Ramekin/Sauce Cup	240 ea.	No Bid	\$78.80	\$144.00	\$148.80
4	Pitcher, stainless steel	12 ea.	No Bid	No Bid	\$253.80	\$212.40
5	Beverage Server	12 ea.	No Bid	\$167.04	\$417.60	\$349.80
6	Flatware Rack	1 ea.	No Bid	\$9.04	\$18.25	\$16.05
7	Glass Pitcher	9 doz.	No Bid	\$414.18	\$318.60	\$255.42
8	Plate, China, 12"	13 doz.	No Bid	No Bid	\$970.45	\$907.27
9	Plate, China, 10-1/2"	13 doz.	No Bid	No Bid	\$596.05	\$628.16
10	Plate, China, 8-1/8"	15 doz.	No Bid	No Bid	\$437.25	\$311.10
11	Mug	18 doz.	No Bid	No Bid	\$589.50	\$429.66
12	Chafing Dish, Parts & Accessories	12 ea.	No Bid	\$993.60	\$967.20	\$898.56
13	Chafing Dish Cover	1 ea.	No Bid	\$41.40	\$40.30	\$37.80
14	Plate, China, 11", Marble	6 doz.	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,380.90	\$1,006.26
15	Plate, China, 8-1/4"	6 doz.	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,054.80	\$768.36
16	Plate, China, 11", Lava	1 doz.	No Bid	No Bid	\$202.30	\$147.34
17	Bus/Sheet Pan	60 ea.	\$298.80	\$183.00	\$339.00	\$293.40
18	Mixing Glass	8 cs.	No Bid	\$106.56	\$159.60	\$157.52
19	Glass Rack	15 ea.	\$714.75	\$417.75	\$452.25	\$501.15
20	Rack Dolly, soft gray	6 ea.	\$967.68	\$803.94	\$819.00	\$505.56
21	Hanger Valet Rack	3 ea.	\$1,044.00	\$404.97	\$447.90	\$420.36
22	Bun/Sheet Pan Rack	4 ea.	\$5,072.00	\$718.08	\$1,507.20	\$2,318.88
23	Plastic Food Carrier Insulated	6 ea.	\$1,425.84	\$872.10	\$1,226.10	\$1,100.76
24	Food Carrier Dolly	3 ea.	\$455.13	\$443.97	\$396.45	\$392.73
25	Knife Set	8 sets	No Bid	\$743.92	\$745.20	\$903.12
26	Dishwasher Rack, Peg/Combination	6 ea.	\$263.64	\$224.94	\$229.80	\$227.64
27	Cake Pan	24 ea.	\$46.56	\$56.16	\$33.60	\$32.64

**Bistro Small Equipment
Bid 17-028**

Item	Description	Qty.	Calico Industrial Supply, LLC	Clark Associates, Inc.	Index Restaurant Supply	US Foods
28	Pastry Ring	8 ea.	\$49.12	\$51.12	\$53.60	\$52.64
29	Metal Tart/Quiche Dish	48 ea.	\$184.32	\$342.72	\$117.60	\$144.48
30	Loaf Pan	14 ea.	No Bid	\$287.28	\$187.60	\$169.68
31	Scraper	3 cs.	\$11.61	21.24 ?	\$30.60	\$31.14
32	Mixing Bowl, Metal, 13 qt.	8 ea.	\$29.92	\$47.60	\$64.40	\$77.76
33	Mixing Bowl, Metal, 8 qt.	8 ea.	\$22.56	No Bid	\$49.60	\$52.80
34	Mixing Bowl, Metal 5 qt.	16 ea.	\$31.52	\$55.20	\$56.80	\$82.88
35	Mixing Bowl, 3 qt.	12 ea.	\$17.76	\$27.00	\$28.20	\$39.96
36	Mixing Bowl, 1-1/2 qt.	16 ea.	\$15.04	\$29.76	\$23.20	\$38.40
37	Mixing Bowl, 3/4 qt.	12 ea.	\$8.16	No Bid	\$13.20	\$17.04
38	Flatware Dishwasher Rack	1 ea.	\$24.64	\$17.70	\$20.95	\$21.18
39	Bus Box/Tub, yellow	12 ea.	\$166.32	\$89.16	\$147.00	\$153.24
40	Bus Box/Tub, green	12 ea.	\$166.08	\$89.16	\$147.00	\$153.24
41	Vegetable Peeler	2 ea.	\$5.44	\$3.38	\$7.30	\$6.84
42	Cake Knife	6 ea.	No Bid	\$76.86	\$67.50	\$85.68
43	Cake Saw	4 ea.	\$9.52	\$10.68	\$8.00	\$7.80
44	Bun Pan, 18 gauge aluminum alloy, 18'x26"	24 ea.	\$159.36	\$110.16	\$237.60	\$187.68
45	Bun Pan, perforateed stainless steel	10 ea.	\$82.40	\$52.70	\$147.00	\$103.80
46	Bun Pan, 18 gauge aluminum alloy, 18'x13"	24 ea.	\$113.76	\$84.00	\$163.20	\$135.36
47	Bread Knife	4 ea.	\$24.56	\$29.56	\$74.00	\$70.40
48	Baker's Spatula, offset 8"	8 ea.	\$113.12	No Bid	\$95.60	\$91.04
49	Baker's Spatula, offset 10"x1-3/4"	8 ea.	\$181.92	\$19.52	\$153.60	\$146.24
50	Baker's Spatula, 6"x2"	8 ea.	\$129.12	\$89.44	\$108.80	\$105.44
51	Pastry Brush, 2" wide	6 ea.	\$14.94	\$15.24	\$40.50	\$43.14
52	Pastry Brush, 1" wide	6 ea.	\$16.14	\$16.80	\$30.00	\$31.38
53	Cake Stand Cover	3 ea.	\$19.32	\$15.36	\$18.00	\$17.52
54	Cake Decorating Accessories	8 ea.	No Bid	No Bid	\$118.40	\$103.68

**Bistro Small Equipment
Bid 17-028**

Item	Description	Qty.	Calico Industrial Supply, LLC	Clark Associates, Inc.	Index Restaurant Supply	US Foods
55	Pastry Dough Cutting Wheel, multi-wheel	2 ea.	\$24.96	\$85.98	\$39.90	\$50.90
56	Pastry Dough Cutting Wheel, fluted	2 ea.	No Bid	\$13.78	\$17.60	\$15.42
57	Pastry Dough Cutting Wheel, lattice	2 ea.	No Bid	No Bid	\$27.50	\$9.86
58	Dough/Cookie Cutter	4 sets	No Bid	No Bid	\$85.60	\$75.12
59	Rack Cover	8 ea.	\$832.00	No Bid	\$731.20	\$665.12
60	Baker's Scale	1 ea.	\$547.98	\$457.99	\$524.00	\$520.05
61	Pizza Peel	2 ea.	\$33.88	\$28.52	\$30.00	\$29.36
62	Replacement Parts	4 sets	No Bid	No Bid	\$663.20	\$407.84
63	Cutting Board	2 ea.	No Bid	No Bid	\$164.00	\$139.78
64	Measuring Cup, 1 cup	14 ea.	\$48.58	\$20.86	\$44.80	\$44.10
65	Measuring Cup, 1 pint	14 ea.	\$90.58	\$25.48	\$83.30	\$82.04
66	Measuring Cup, 1 quart	8 ea.	\$58.16	\$23.12	\$53.60	\$52.64
67	Measuring Cup, 2 quart	14 ea.	\$139.72	\$68.60	\$128.80	\$126.98
68	Measuring Cup, 4 quart	14 ea.	\$151.76	\$110.88	\$139.30	\$137.76
69	Square Food Container, 12 qt.	8 ea.	\$98.24	\$99.04	\$98.40	\$88.08
70	Square Food Container, 18 qt.	1 ea.	\$21.77	\$15.30	\$20.40	\$16.31
71	Square Food Container, 22 qt.	4 ea.	\$91.36	\$91.96	\$100.80	\$80.76
72	Food Storage Container Cover, fits 2-4 qt.	1 ea.	\$1.64	\$1.03	\$1.90	\$1.34
73	Food Storage Container Cover, fits 6-8 qt.	1 ea.	\$1.94	\$1.18	\$2.10	\$1.62
74	Food Storage Container Cover, fits 12-22 qt.	8 ea.	\$22.96	\$17.92	\$22.80	\$19.04
75	Perforated Pan-Full Size	4 ea.	\$42.76	\$55.88	\$41.60	\$64.64
76	Steam Hotel Pan-Full Size, 4" D	4 ea.	\$61.04	\$49.32	\$59.00	\$69.52
77	Steam Hotel Pan-Full Size, 6" D	4 ea.	\$79.36	\$56.24	\$78.80	\$87.60
78	Steam Hotel Pan-Half Size, 4" D	4 ea.	\$35.32	\$30.00	\$34.00	\$40.36
79	Steam Hotel Pan-Half Size, 6" D	4 ea.	\$51.32	\$45.96	\$49.60	\$55.64
80	Steam Hotel Pan-Third Size, 4" D	4 ea.	\$28.48	\$22.76	\$28.40	\$32.88
81	Steam Hotel Pan-Third Size, 6" D	4 ea.	\$44.64	\$35.32	\$43.20	\$46.32

**Bistro Small Equipment
Bid 17-028**

Item	Description	Qty.	Calico Industrial Supply, LLC	Clark Associates, Inc.	Index Restaurant Supply	US Foods
82	Steam Table Pan-Sixth Size, 4" D	12 ea.	\$59.28	\$42.12	\$60.00	\$66.24
83	Steam Table Pan-Sixth Size, 6" D	12 ea.	\$86.88	\$60.00	\$86.40	\$90.48
84	Steam Hotel Pan-Ninth Size, 4" D	4 ea.	\$14.32	\$10.00	\$14.00	\$16.56
85	Tablespoon	4 cs.	No Bid	No Bid	\$21.40	\$16.08
86	Cutting Board, 15"x20"	30 ea.	\$256.20	\$258.90	\$249.00	\$339.90
87	Cutting Board, 12"x18"	42 ea.	\$259.14	\$261.24	\$249.90	\$303.24
88	Cutting Board, 18"x24"	8 ea.	\$101.92	\$266.32	\$290.00	\$281.12
89	Thermometer	12 ea.	No Bid	\$398.88	\$115.80	\$101.16
90	Paring Knife	2 cs.	\$5.16	\$4.80	\$21.70	\$21.08
91	Knife Sharpener	2 ea.	\$39.16	\$36.98	\$54.50	\$51.98
92	Spatula, 10"	24 ea.	\$41.76	\$33.60	\$140.40	\$145.68
93	Spatula, 13-1/2"	24 ea.	\$88.32	\$66.72	\$186.00	\$193.20
94	Spatula, 16-1/2"	6 ea.	\$23.04	\$17.58	\$60.00	\$62.46
95	Measuring Cup Set	8 ea.	\$19.60	\$21.92	\$67.20	\$31.68
96	Measuring Spoon Set	8 ea.	\$4.72	\$11.20	\$36.00	\$18.72
97	Cutting Board Plane	2 ea.	\$62.48	\$46.22	\$52.40	\$45.92
98	Wire Whip, piano, 12"	12 ea.	\$19.32	\$17.52	\$45.60	\$28.92
99	Wire Whip, french, 12"	12 ea.	\$23.76	\$34.08	\$51.60	\$30.60
100	Ladle, 1 oz.	12 ea.	\$9.84	\$14.76	\$31.20	\$21.36
101	Ladle, 2 oz.	12 ea.	\$11.76	\$19.32	\$32.40	\$29.64
102	Ladle, 4 oz.	12 ea.	\$16.56	\$29.40	\$43.80	\$29.64
103	Ladle, 8 oz.	12 ea.	\$23.64	\$40.32	\$54.00	\$39.60
104	Tong, 9-1/2"	24 ea.	\$26.64	\$40.80	\$112.80	\$29.52
105	Tong, 12"	24 ea.	\$34.56	\$44.40	\$128.40	\$46.56
106	Tongs, Utility	4 ea.	\$12.96	\$10.12	\$34.00	\$35.40
107	Poultry Shears	4 ea.	\$34.56	\$38.76	\$30.40	\$28.80
108	Condiment Dispenser	4 ea.	\$170.16	\$150.88	\$159.20	\$154.08

**Bistro Small Equipment
Bid 17-028**

Item	Description	Qty.	Calico Industrial Supply, LLC	Clark Associates, Inc.	Index Restaurant Supply	US Foods
109	Dishwasher Rack Accessories, gray	1 ea.	\$15.64	\$13.49	\$16.20	\$29.05
110	Open Dishwasher Rack	1 ea.	\$32.64	\$27.99	\$31.60	\$28.36
111	Dishwasher Rack Accessories, black	1 ea.	\$43.21	\$37.14	\$39.50	\$36.12
112	Dishwasher Rack Cover	4 ea.	\$108.80	\$93.52	\$108.00	\$107.00
113	Flatware Dishwasher Rack, half size basket	6 ea.	\$65.82	\$68.94	\$69.60	\$68.52
114	Flatware Dishwasher Rack, full size rack	6 ea.	\$113.10	\$98.94	\$99.60	\$98.34
115	Bussing Cart	3 ea.	\$328.11	No Bid	\$285.75	\$283.11
115a	Trash Container (for bussing cart)	3 ea.	\$133.92	No Bid	\$116.70	\$115.56
115b	Silverware Holder (for bussing cart)	3 ea.	No Bid	No Bid	\$67.20	\$66.45
116	Ice/Pom Tongs, 7-3/4 "	12 ea.	\$11.28	\$21.36	\$16.80	\$15.60
117	Ice/Pom Tongs, 6-1/2 "	12 ea.	\$10.08	\$10.08	\$12.60	\$11.40
118	Ladle, 15", 6 oz.	12 ea.	\$35.28	\$108.12	\$196.80	\$184.56
119	Serving Tongs, 12", wide	12 ea.	No Bid	No Bid	\$174.00	\$163.32
120	Solid Serving Spoon, 13-1/2"	12 ea.	\$16.08	No Bid	\$151.80	\$142.44
121	Solid Serving Spoon, 10"	12 ea.	\$14.16	No Bid	\$112.80	\$105.96
122	Slotted Serving Spoon, 13-1/2"	12 ea.	\$15.96	No Bid	\$151.80	\$142.44
123	Slotted Serving Spoon, 10"	12 ea.	\$14.28	No Bid	\$112.80	\$105.96
124	Pie/Cake Server	12 ea.	No Bid	No Bid	\$112.80	\$105.96
125	Serving Tongs, 12", ergonomic	12 ea.	No Bid	No Bid	\$148.20	\$139.08
126	Serving Board	60 ea.	No Bid	\$1,049.40	\$948.00	\$954.00
127	Serving Tray	3 ea.	No Bid	\$82.47	\$73.95	\$74.34
128	Serving & Display Tray, black	12 ea.	No Bid	\$329.88	\$295.80	\$311.16
129	Serving & Display Tray, white	12 ea.	No Bid	\$329.88	\$295.80	\$311.16
	Totals		\$555.99	\$7,240.89	\$2,526.75	\$10,243.27