

**MUSIC INSTRUMENTS**

**BID NO. 18-029**

<b>Item</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Qty.</b>	<b>B.A.C. Horn Dr., LLC</b>	<b>Meyer Music</b>	<b>Meyer Music Alt. 1</b>	<b>Nick Rail Music</b>	<b>REW Music</b>	<b>Shar Products Co.</b>	<b>Washington Music Center</b>	<b>West Music</b>
1	Cello, 3/4, Soft Case and Bow	5 ea.	No Bid	\$4,968.75		\$3,975.00	\$5,377.20	<b>\$5,495.00</b>	No Bid	No Bid
2	Cello Bow, 4/4 size 3	4 ea.	No Bid	\$1,430.00		\$1,140.00	\$562.32	<b>\$1,192.00</b>	No Bid	No Bid
3	Oboe	1 ea.	No Bid	\$2,535.00	<b>\$2,169.43</b>	\$2,215.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$2,078.60	No Bid
4	Bassoon	1 ea.	No Bid	\$5,123.95	<b>\$3,494.25</b>	\$3,570.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$3,347.95	No Bid
5	French Horn, Intermediate	3 ea.	No Bid	<b>\$7,143.75</b>		\$5,985.00	\$4,764.45	No Bid	\$6,739.95	No Bid
6	Digital Piano w/ Stand	1 ea.	No Bid	\$689.98		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	<b>\$611.99</b>
7	Baby Grand Piano	1 ea.	No Bid	<b>\$42,400.00</b>	\$24,995.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
8	Tuba	1 ea.	No Bid	<b>\$5,091.75</b>		\$4,300.00	\$3,567.16	No Bid	\$4,878.60	No Bid
9	Tenor/Alto Xylophone	2 ea.	No Bid	No Bid		<b>\$1,190.00</b>	\$1,620.00	No Bid	\$1,330.00	\$1,296.00
10	Alto Xylophone	3 ea.	No Bid	No Bid		<b>\$855.00</b>	\$1,395.00	No Bid	\$1,350.00	\$924.00
11	Soprano Xylophone	1 ea.	No Bid	No Bid		<b>\$310.00</b>	\$420.00	No Bid	\$345.00	\$336.00
12	Snare Drum	5 ea.	<b>\$3,250.00</b>	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
12a	Snare Carrier	5 ea.	<b>\$900.00</b>	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
12b	Snare Stand, 14"	5 ea.	<b>\$749.95</b>	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
12c	Snare Case	5 ea.	<b>\$569.95</b>	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
13	Marching Bass Drum, 14" x 18"	1 ea.	<b>\$447.53</b>	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
13a	Bass Drum Carrier	1 ea.	<b>\$180.00</b>	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
13b	Bass Drum Stand	1 ea.	<b>\$149.99</b>	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
13c	Bass Drum Case	1 ea.	<b>\$129.99</b>	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
14	Marching Bass Drum, 14" x 20"	1 ea.	<b>\$481.95</b>	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
14a	Bass Drum Carrier	1 ea.	<b>\$180.00</b>	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
14b	Bass Drum Stand	1 ea.	<b>\$149.99</b>	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
14c	Bass Drum Case	1 ea.	<b>\$151.99</b>	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
15	Marching Bass Drum, 14" x 22"	1 ea.	<b>\$564.57</b>	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
15a	Bass Drum Carrier	1 ea.	<b>\$180.00</b>	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
15b	Bass Drum Stand	1 ea.	<b>\$149.99</b>	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
15c	Bass Drum Case	1 ea.	<b>\$134.99</b>	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
16	Marching Bass Drum, 14" x 24"	1 ea.	<b>\$605.88</b>	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
16a	Bass Drum Carrier	1 ea.	<b>\$180.00</b>	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
16b	Bass Drum Stand	1 ea.	<b>\$149.99</b>	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
16c	Bass Drum Case	1 ea.	<b>\$154.99</b>	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
17	Marching Bass Drum, 26"	1 ea.	<b>\$674.73</b>	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
17a	Bass Drum Carrier	1 ea.	<b>\$180.00</b>	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
17b	Bass Drum Stand	1 ea.	<b>\$149.99</b>	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

**MUSIC INSTRUMENTS**

**BID NO. 18-029**

<b>Item</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Qty.</b>	<b>B.A.C. Horn Dr., LLC</b>	<b>Meyer Music</b>	<b>Meyer Music Alt. 1</b>	<b>Nick Rail Music</b>	<b>REW Music</b>	<b>Shar Products Co.</b>	<b>Washington Music Center</b>	<b>West Music</b>
17c	Bass Drum Case	1 ea.	\$161.99	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
18	Marching Tenor Drum	3 ea.	\$4,350.00	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
18a	Tenor Drum Carrier	3 ea.	\$540.00	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
18b	Tenor Drum Stand	3 ea.	\$449.97	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
18c	Tenor Drum Case	3 ea.	\$509.97	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	<b>Totals</b>		<b>\$16,478.40</b>	<b>\$54,635.50</b>	<b>\$5,663.68</b>	<b>\$2,355.00</b>	0	<b>\$ 6,687.00</b>	0	<b>\$611.99</b>