

**Middle School Athletic Sod Replacement**

**CSP#20-038CP**

**Bid Tabulation**

	<b>DKC Construction Group</b>	<b>Hellas</b>	<b>Maldonado Nursery &amp; Landscaping</b>	<b>Paragon Sports Constructors</b>	<b>RS3 Turf</b>	<b>Symmetry</b>
Proposal #A: Cele MS Turf Replacement	\$ 188,000.00		\$ 172,430.00	\$ 394,726.00	\$ 156,454.00	\$ 183,137.00
Proposal #B: Dessau MS Turf Replacement	\$ 247,000.00		\$ 136,926.00	\$ 378,038.00	\$ 156,454.00	\$ 183,137.00
Proposal #C: Kelly Lane MS Turf Replacement	\$ 180,000.00		\$ 167,625.00	\$ 348,391.00	\$ 156,454.00	\$ 183,137.00
Proposal #D: Park Crest MS Turf Replacement	\$ 228,000.00		\$ 197,735.00	\$ 415,789.00	\$ 230,334.00	\$ 270,587.00
Proposal #D: Park Crest Field Lighting Replacement	\$ 453,000.00	\$ 401,000.00	<b>NO BID</b>	<b>NO BID</b>	\$ 344,080.00	\$ 356,054.00
Proposal #E: Pflugerville MS Turf Replacement	\$ 180,000.00		\$ 165,774.00	\$ 348,391.00	\$ 156,454.00	\$ 183,137.00
Proposal #F: Westview Turf Replacement	\$ 200,000.00		\$ 140,572.00	\$ 319,248.00	\$ 156,454.00	\$ 183,137.00
Proposal #G Lump Sum Turf	\$ 1,223,000.00	\$ -	\$ 981,062.00	\$ 2,204,583.00	\$ 1,012,604.00	\$ 1,186,272.00
Proposal #G Field Lighting	\$ 453,000.00		<b>NO BID</b>	<b>NO BID</b>	\$ 344,080.00	\$ 356,054.00
Total Price	\$ 1,676,000.00				\$ 1,356,684.00	\$ 1,542,326.00
Alternates: NO ALTERNATES						
Craig Pruett	58	66	78	53	78	79
Michael Brooks	72	73	64	78	79	81
David Vesling	79	66	69	67	80	82
Total Evaluation Score	209	205	211	198	237	242
Average Evaluation Score	69.67	68.33	70.33	66.00	79.00	80.67