

**District Athletic Renovations**

**CSP#20-023CP**

**Bid Tabulation**

	<b>Hellas</b>	<b>NAVCON</b>	<b>Paragon</b>	<b>Symetry Turf</b>
Evaluator #1	73	89	61	86
Evaluator #2	82	93	65	88
Evaluator #3	Unavailable	Unavailabe	Unavailable	Unavailable
Average Evaluation Score	77.5	91	63	87
<b>Pricing</b>				
A. CMS Track Replacement	\$ 555,000.00	NO BID	\$ 821,302.00	\$ 360,800.00
B. CHS Locker Room Reno	NO BID	\$ 1,075,547.00	NO BID	
C. DMS Locker Room Reno	NO BID	\$ 574,297.00	NO BID	
C.2 DMS Track Replacement	\$ 505,000.00	NO BID	\$ 852,003.00	\$ 247,600.00
D. HHS Locker Room Reno	NO BID	\$ 1,186,850.00	NO BID	
E. KLMS Locker Room Reno	NO BID	\$ 566,525.00	NO BID	
E.2. KLMS Track Replacement	\$ 1,051,000.00	NO BID	\$ 1,582,069.00	\$ 755,700.00
F. PCMS Locker Room Reno	NO BID	\$ 576,708.00	NO BID	
F.2. PCMS Track Replacement	\$ 1,099,000.00	NO BID	\$ 1,674,853.00	\$ 792,200.00
G. PMS Locker Room Reno	NO BID	\$ 590,862.00	NO BID	
G.2. PMS Track Replacement	\$ 1,093,000.00	NO BID	\$ 1,591,388.00	\$ 770,600.00
H. WVMS Locker Room Reno	NO BID	\$ 571,802.00	NO BID	
H. 2. WVMS Track Replacement	\$ 416,000.00	NO BID	\$ 852,003.00	\$ 247,600.00
I. Lump Sum Locker Room	NO BID	\$ 4,672,544.00	NO BID	NO BID
I.2. Lump Sum Track Replacement	\$ 4,719,000.00	NO BID	\$ 7,373,618.00	\$ 3,174,500.00
<b>Unit Prices</b>				
A. 2'x4' Light fixtures, per unit	NO BID	\$ 78.00	NO BID	NO BID
B. 2'x2' acoustic ceiling tile, per unit	NO BID	\$ 8.55	NO BID	NO BID
C. T&S Metering Faucet B-0805-FO5, per unit	NO BID	\$ 425.00	NO BID	NO BID
D. Light Fixture Type A, Install per unit	NO BID	\$ 950.00	NO BID	NO BID
E. Light Fixture Type B, Install per unit	NO BID	\$ 425.00	NO BID	NO BID
F. Light Fixture Type C, Install per unit	NO BID	\$ 325.00	NO BID	NO BID
G. Light Fixture Type X, Install per unit	NO BID	\$ 325.00	NO BID	NO BID
H. Lav Faucet, Install per unit	NO BID	\$ 5,800.00	NO BID	NO BID
I. Plumbing Fixture, Type SH'B' install per unit	NO BID	\$ 5,800.00	NO BID	NO BID
J. Plumbing Fixture Type SH'D' install per unit	NO BID	\$ 5,800.00	NO BID	NO BID
K. Plumbing Fixture Type SH'F, install per unit	NO BID	\$ 5,800.00	NO BID	NO BID
L. Plumbing Fixture Type EWC'B', install per unit	NO BID	\$ 5,800.00	NO BID	NO BID
M. Plumbing Fixture Type EWC'C, install	NO BID	\$ -	NO BID	NO BID
<b>Alternates</b>				
A-1 CHS Locker Room Ceilings				
Base	NO BID	Included	NO BID	NO BID
Alternate A	NO BID	\$ 20,480.46	NO BID	NO BID
Alternate B	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
A-2 CHS Locker Room Restroom Ceilings	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Alternate	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
A-3 Locker Room Flooring	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
Alternate A	NO BID	\$ 59,787.21	NO BID	NO BID
Alternate B	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
A-4 Field House Weight Room Ceiling	NO BID	\$ 24,094.04	NO BID	NO BID

**District Athletic Renovations**

**CSP#20-023CP**

**Bid Tabulation**

	<b>Hellas</b>	<b>NAVCON</b>	<b>Paragon</b>	<b>Symetry Turf</b>
A-5 Coaches' Locker Room Ceiling	NO BID	\$ 19,364.34	NO BID	NO BID
A-6 Coaches' Locker Restroom	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
B-1 DMS Field Replacement	\$ 200,000.00		\$ 248,459.00	NO BID
B-2 DMS Locker Room Ceiling	NO BID	Included	NO BID	NO BID
Alternate A	NO BID	\$ 11,546.92	NO BID	NO BID
Alternate B	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
B-3 DMS Locker Room Flooring	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
Alternate A	NO BID	\$ 40,768.77	NO BID	NO BID
B-4 Single User Restrooms in PE Locker Rooms	NO BID	Included	NO BID	NO BID
Alternate A	NO BID	\$ 58,899.90	NO BID	NO BID
B-5 Accessible Showers	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
Alternate A	NO BID	\$ 81,866.69	NO BID	NO BID
B-6 Weight Room Ceiling	NO BID	\$ 11,300.92	NO BID	NO BID
B-7 Air Circulation Fans in Weight Room	NO BID	\$ 6,040.24	NO BID	NO BID
C-1 Locker Room Ceilings	NO BID	Included	NO BID	NO BID
Alternate A	NO BID	\$ 50,615.64	NO BID	NO BID
Alternate B	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
C-2 Locker Room Restroom Ceilings	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
C-3 Locker Room Shower Ceilings	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
C-4 Locker Room Flooring	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
Alternate A	NO BID	\$ 73,205.26	NO BID	NO BID
C-5 Field House Weight Room Ceiling	NO BID	\$ 21,957.90	NO BID	NO BID
C-6 Coaches' Locker Room				NO BID
Alternate A	NO BID	\$ 11,172.72	NO BID	NO BID
C-7 Coaches' Locker Room				NO BID
Alternate A	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
D.1 KLMS Athletic Field Replacement	\$ 194,000.00		\$ 233,521.00	NO BID
D.2 Locker Room Ceiling Base	NO BID	Included	NO BID	NO BID
Alternate A		\$ 15,035.94	NO BID	NO BID
Alternate B	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
D.3 Locker Room Flooring Base	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
Alternate A	NO BID	\$ 49,159.28	NO BID	NO BID
D-4 Single User Restrooms in PE Lockers Base	NO BID	Included	NO BID	NO BID
Alternate A	NO BID	\$ 54,780.29	NO BID	NO BID
D-5 Weight Room Flooring				
Alternate A	NO BID	\$ 33,418.84	NO BID	NO BID
D-6 Weight Room Ceiling Alternate A	NO BID	\$ 7,148.97	NO BID	NO BID
D-7 Coaches Locker Room Alternate A	NO BID	\$ 6,040.24	NO BID	NO BID
E-1 PCMS Sod	\$ 241,000.00		\$64,845 Fence Only Field Work in Base Bid Per Addendum	NO BID
E-2 Locker Room Ceiling, Base	NO BID	Included	NO BID	NO BID
Alternate A	NO BID	\$ 23,636.64	NO BID	NO BID
Alternate B	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
E-3 Locker Room Flooring, Base	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
Alternate A	NO BID	\$ 57,561.96	NO BID	NO BID
E-4 PE Locker Room Base	NO BID	Included	NO BID	NO BID
Alternate A	NO BID	\$ 66,004.38	NO BID	NO BID
E-5 Accessible Showers Base	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
Alternate A	NO BID	\$ 82,841.69	NO BID	NO BID
E-6 Weight Room Ceiling Alternate A	NO BID	\$ 6,702.02	NO BID	NO BID

**District Athletic Renovations**

**CSP#20-023CP**

**Bid Tabulation**

	<b>Hellas</b>	<b>NAVCON</b>	<b>Paragon</b>	<b>Symetry Turf</b>
E-7 Air Circulation Fans Alternate A	NO BID	\$ 6,040.24	NO BID	NO BID
E-8 Athletic Field Lighting, Base	\$ 28,000.00		NO BID	NO BID
Alternate A	\$ 373,000.00		NO BID	NO BID
F-1 Athletic Sod, Alternate A	\$ 192,200.00		\$ 223,521.00	NO BID
F-2 Locker Room Ceiling, Base	NO BID	Included	NO BID	NO BID
Alternate A	NO BID	\$ 16,110.01	NO BID	NO BID
Alternate B	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
F-3 Locker Room Flooring Base	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
Alternate A	NO BID	\$ 64,792.31	NO BID	NO BID
F-4 Single User Restroom Base	NO BID	Included	NO BID	NO BID
Alternate A	NO BID	\$ 67,329.68	NO BID	NO BID
F-5 Accessible Showers	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
Alternate A	NO BID	\$ 81,733.87	NO BID	NO BID
F-6 Air Circulation Fans, Weight Room	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
Alternate A	NO BID	\$ 6,040.24	NO BID	NO BID
G-1 Alternate A Athletic Sod	\$ 191,100.00		\$ 202,895.00	NO BID
G-2 Locker Room Ceiling Base	NO BID	Included	NO BID	NO BID
Alternate A	NO BID	\$ 18,347.10	NO BID	NO BID
Alternate B	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
G-3 Locker Room Flooring Base	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
Alternate A	NO BID	\$ 55,421.27	NO BID	NO BID
G-4 Single User Restroom Base	NO BID	Included	NO BID	NO BID
Alternate A	NO BID	\$ 66,023.46	NO BID	NO BID
G-5 Accessible Showers Base	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
Alternate A	NO BID	\$ 84,214.64	NO BID	NO BID
G-6 Air Circulation Fans Weight Room Base	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID
Alternate A	NO BID	\$ 6,040.24	NO BID	NO BID